City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: November 14, 2011
For: Promotional T-Shirts
Ad Wear & Specialty of [Alamo Tee's & Business Embroidery Christian's T-Shirts & |CreateMyTee Dunn Manufacturing  |Expressive T-Shirts [Heaven Sent Lands, Inc. Quality Print & Samy's Sign Shop
Texas Advertising Solutions Signs Co. dba Big Star Promotions & Design
Branding Apparel
6100000699 LS 8120 Westglen Dr. 12814 Cogburn Ave. 22919 High Top Dr. 24207 Post Oak View (4343 Concourse, Suite|1400 Goldmine Road |4009 Naco Perrin 5611 San Pedro 2731 Hereford St.  |402 Bradley 6900 San Pedro
330 Ave. Avenue
Item Description Estimated |Houston, San Antonio, Elmendorf, San Antonio, Ann Arbor, Monroe, San Antonio, San Antonio, St. Louis, San Antonio, San Antonio,
Quantity |[TX 77063 TX 78249 TX 78112 TX 78264 MI 48108 NC 28110 TX 78217 TX 78212 MO 63139 TX 78211 TX 78216
1 White T-Shirt
Gildan, Port & Co., Hanes, Jerzees,| Jerzees, Gildan,
100% Cotton Brand Name: Gildan Jerzees| Hanes, Jerzees| Gildan Gildan Fruit of the Loom Gildan Port & Co. Lofteez Tee Not Provided Not Provided
G200 100% Cotton 6.1| 2000G, PC61, 363M, 3931 Youth Style, 363B, 363M, 29M,|
Style #: oz| 2000B 363 M, 5250, 5450 G200, G200B| 5000 3931 B| 520, 363,5000]| PC61 20230 FL 6.1 0z|
Gildan, Port & Co., Hanes, Jerzees,| Jerzees, Gildan,
50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Brand Name: Gildan Jerzees| Hanes, Jerzees| Hanes, Jezees| Gildan Fruit of the Loom Gildan Port & Co. Gildan, Jerzees|
G800B Dryblend|
G800 50/50 Blend 5.6} 8000G, PC55. 29M, 5930 Youth style, PC55, PC55Y, 29B,|  50/50, 29M 5.6 07|
Style #: oz, 8000B 29M, 5170, 298] 5170, 29M| 8000 5930B 5170, 29M, 8000| 29M, 8000, 8000B| 50/50
Price Each for Youth XSmall - XLarge 3,000 $1.57| $1.61] $1.98 $3.63 $1.90 $2.10 $2.52 $2.00| $2.71 $1.65| $4.99
Price Total for Youth XSmall - XLarge $4,710.00] $4,830.00] $5,940.00] $10,890.00| $5,700.00] $6,300.00| $7,560.00| $6,000.00| $8,130.00| $4,950.00| $14,970.00|
Price Each for Adult Small - XLarge 3,000 $1.57| $1.58 $1.98 $3.75 $1.80 $2.20 $2.34] $1.75| $2.54]
Price Total for Adult Small - XLarge $4,710.00] $4,740.00) $5,940.00) $11,250.00| $5,400.00] $6,600.00) $7,020.00| $5,250.00| $7,620.00|
Price Each for Adult 2X-Large 1,600 $2.55) $2.50 $3.85) $4.92) $2.85 $3.75 $4.22 $3.61 $4.43]
Price Total for Adult 2X-Large $4,080.00) $4,000.00] $6,160.00) $7,872.00| $4,560.00) $6,000.00] $6,752.00| $5,776.00| $7,088.00|
Price Each for Adult 3X-Large 200 $2.55) $2.50 $3.95 $4.95 $2.85 $3.75 $4.33] $3.69| $4.55|
Price Total for Adult 3X-Large $510.00)| $500.00)| $790.00| $990.00| $570.00)| $750.00| $866.00| $738.00| $910.00|
Price Each for Adult 4X-Large 100 $2.55) $2.50 $3.98 $5.16) $3.35 $3.87 $4.58 $3.78 $4.79]
Price Total for Adult 4X-Large $255.00)| $250.00)| $398.00)| $516.00| $335.00)| $387.00)| $458.00| $378.00| $479.00|
Price Each for Adult 5X-Large 100 $2.55) $2.50 $3.98 $5.32 $3.35 $4.25 $4.72] $3.86 $5.01
Price Total for Adult 5X-Large $255.00)| $250.00)| $398.00)| $532.00| $335.00)| $425.00)| $472.00| $386.00| $501.00|
1 Color Imprint $0.60 $0.45 $0.75 $0.70 $0.35 $0.30 $0.25| $0.40 $0.75|
2 Color Imprint $0.85 $0.60 $0.88 $0.90 $0.40 $0.30 $0.35| $0.50 $1.05|
3 Color Imprint $1.05 $0.75 $0.99 $1.20 $0.45 $0.30 $0.45| $0.55| $1.25
4 Color Imprint $1.20 $0.90 $1.10 $1.40 $0.50 $0.30 $0.55| $0.60 $1.30|
2nd Location Imprint $0.60 $0.45 $0.75 $10.00| $0.50 $0.30/ color| $0.25| $0.40| $1.25|
$25/hr,
Art Charge per hour $0.00 $10.00 $10.00 $50.00)| $0.00| First 30 minutes Free $0.00 $0.00 $20.00|
Set Up Fee $0.00 $10.00 $15.00 $45.00| $0.00 $25/ logo| $0.00| $0.00| $0.00|
Delivery 7 Business Days| 7 Business Days 7 Business Days| 7 Business Days| 7 Business Days| 7 Business Days| 7 Business Days| 7 Business Days| 7 Business Days| 7 Business Days| 7 Business Days|

Line 1 Item Total

$14,520.00)

$14,570.00|

$19,626.00)

$32,050.00

$16,900.00)

$20,462.00)

$23,128.00

$18,528.00

$24,728.00

$4,950.00

$14,970.00
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: November 14, 2011
For: Promotional T-Shirts
Ad Wear & Specialty of [Alamo Tee's & Business Embroidery Christian's T-Shirts & |CreateMyTee Dunn Manufacturing  |Expressive T-Shirts [Heaven Sent Lands, Inc. Quality Print & Samy's Sign Shop
Texas Advertising Solutions Signs Co. dba Big Star Promotions & Design
Branding Apparel
6100000699 LS 8120 Westglen Dr. 12814 Cogburn Ave. 22919 High Top Dr. 24207 Post Oak View (4343 Concourse, Suite|1400 Goldmine Road |4009 Naco Perrin 5611 San Pedro 2731 Hereford St.  |402 Bradley 6900 San Pedro
330 Ave. Avenue
Item Description Estimated |Houston, San Antonio, Elmendorf, San Antonio, Ann Arbor, Monroe, San Antonio, San Antonio, St. Louis, San Antonio, San Antonio,
Quantity |[TX 77063 TX 78249 TX 78112 TX 78264 MI 48108 NC 28110 TX 78217 TX 78212 MO 63139 TX 78211 TX 78216
2 Light and Dark Colored T-Shirt
Gildan, Port & Co., Hanes, Jerzees,
100% Cotton Brand Name: Gildan Jerzees| Hanes, Jerzees| Hanes, Anvil Gildan Fruit of the Loom Gildan Jerzees| Lofteez Tee No Bid| No Bid|
G200 100% Cotton, 6.1 2000G, PC61, 363M, 3931 Youth Style
Style #: oz, 2000B 363M, 5250, 5450 4980, 5280, 779 5000 3931B 520, 363,5000]| 363M, 363B| 20230 FL 6.1 oz
Gildan, Port & Co., Fruit of the Loom, Hanes, Jerzees,
50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Brand Name: Gildan Jerzees| Hanes, Jerzees| Hanes| Gildan Gildan Gildan Jerzees| Gildan, Jerzees|
G800B Youth 5.6 oz
G800 50/50 Blend, 5.6 2000G, PC61, 363M,| Dryblend / 5.6 0z|
Style #: oz, 2000B 29M, 5170, 298B] 5930, 5370 8000 G800 5170, 29M, 8000 29B, 29M| 50/50 Heavyweight]
Price Each for Youth Xsmall - XLarge 8,000 $2.17| $1.77| $2.95) $4.54 $2.45) $3.10 $3.24] $2.74] $4.58|
Price Total for Youth XSmall - XLarge $17,360.00| $14,160.00| $23,600.00| $36,320.00| $19,600.00| $24,800.00| $25,920.00| $21,920.00| $36,640.00|
Price Each for Adult Small - XLarge 8,000 $2.17| $2.10 $2.95) $4.67| $2.15) $3.25 $3.52 $2.37 $3.36|
Price Total for Adult Small - XLarge $17,360.00| $16,800.00| $23,600.00] $37,360.00] $17,200.00| $26,000.00)| $28,160.00| $18,960.00| $26,880.00|
Price Each for Adult 2X-Large 1,000 $3.51 $3.35 $4.65 $6.15| $3.70 $5.00 $4.64 $4.73 $5.79
Price Total for Adult 2X-Large $3,510.00| $3,350.00| $4,650.00| $6,150.00| $3,700.00| $5,000.00| $4,640.00| $4,730.00| $5,790.00|
Price Each for Adult 3X-Large 500 $3.51 $3.35 $4.75 $6.15| $3.70 $5.00 $4.64 $4.84 $5.81]
Price Total for Adult 3X-Large $1,755.00| $1,675.00| $2,375.00| $3,075.00| $1,850.00| $2,500.00| $2,320.00| $2,420.00| $2,905.00|
Price Each for Adult 4X-Large 250 $3.51 $3.35) $4.85) $5.28 $4.50 $5.25) $5.75) $4.95 $6.18
Price Total for Adult 4X-Large $877.50| $837.50)| $1,212.50| $1,320.00| $1,125.00| $1,312.50| $1,437.50| $1,237.50| $1,545.00|
Price Each for Adult 5X-Large 250 $3.51 $3.35) $4.85) $6.25) $4.50 $5.35) $5.86 $5.07, $6.33
Price Total for Adult 5X-Large $877.50)| $837.50)| $1,212.50| $1,562.50| $1,125.00| $1,337.50| $1,465.00| $1,267.50| $1,582.50
$0.40 Light /
1 Color Imprint $0.60 $0.45 $0.75 $0.70 $0.25 $0.30 $0.25| $0.45 Dark| $0.75|
$0.50 Light /
2 Color Imprint $0.85 $0.60 $0.88 $0.90 $0.30 $0.30 $0.35| $0.55 Dark| $1.05
$0.55 Light /
3 Color Imprint $1.05 $0.75 $0.99 $1.20 $0.35 $0.30 $0.45| $0.60 Dark| $1.25
$0.60 Light /
4 Color Imprint $1.20 $0.90 $1.10 $1.40 $0.40 $0.30 $0.55| $0.65 Dark| $1.30
$0.40 Light /
2nd Location Imprint $0.60| $0.45) $0.75) $10.00| $0.35) $0.30 / color} $0.25) $0.45 Dark $1.25
$25/hr,
Art Charge per hour $0.00| $10.00 $10.00 $50.00| $0.00| First 30 minutes Free| $0.00 $0.00 $20.00|
Set Up Fee $0.00 $10.00 $15.00 $45.00| $0.00 $25/ logo| $0.00 $0.00| $0.00|
Delivery 7 Business Days| 7 Business Days| 7 Business Days| 7 Business Days| 7 Business Days| 7 Business Days| 7 Business Days| 7 Business Days| 7 Business Days| 7 Business Days| 7 Business Days|

Line 2 Item Total

$41,740.00|

$37,660.00)

$56,650.00)

$85,787.50)

$44,600.00]

$60,950.00]

$63,942.50)

$50,535.00

$75,342.50)

$0.00]

$0.00]
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: November 14, 2011
For: Promotional T-Shirts
Ad Wear & Specialty of [Alamo Tee's & Business Embroidery Christian's T-Shirts & |CreateMyTee Dunn Manufacturing  |Expressive T-Shirts [Heaven Sent Lands, Inc. Quality Print & Samy's Sign Shop
Texas Advertising Solutions Signs Co. dba Big Star Promotions & Design
Branding Apparel
6100000699 LS 8120 Westglen Dr. 12814 Cogburn Ave. 22919 High Top Dr. 24207 Post Oak View (4343 Concourse, Suite 1400 Goldmine Road [4009 Naco Perrin 5611 San Pedro 2731 Hereford St.  |402 Bradley 6900 San Pedro
330 Ave. Avenue
Item Description Estimated |Houston, San Antonio, Elmendorf, San Antonio, Ann Arbor, Monroe, San Antonio, San Antonio, St. Louis, San Antonio, San Antonio,
Quantity |[TX 77063 TX 78249 TX 78112 TX 78264 MI 48108 NC 28110 TX 78217 TX 78212 MO 63139 TX 78211 TX 78216
3 White T-Shirt (Tall)
100% Cotton Brand Name: Port & Company Port & Co. Port & Co. Port & Company| Port & Company Gildan Gildan, Port & Co. Port & Co. Gildan No Bid| No Bid|
PCB6IT 100% Cotton, 6.1 G200T 6.1 oz Ultra]
Style #: oz| PC61T) PC61T, PC54 PC61] G200T) 2000T, PC61T| PC6IT] Cotton|
No Brands available|
50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Brand Name: that meet specs| N/A No Bid! Gildan Port & Company Gildan No Bid| N/A| Port & Company|
Style #: N/A| N/A| No Bid| G800 PC55| G800T| No Bid| N/A| PC55YC 50/50|
Price Each for Adult Small - XLarge 100 $3.22| $3.09 $3.65) $4.68 $1.75) $4.00 $3.51 $3.39 $4.67
Price Total for Adult Small - XLarge $322.00)| $309.00| $365.00)| $468.00| $175.00| $400.00| $351.00| $339.00| $467.00|
Price Each for Adult 2X-Large 100 $5.41] $5.19 $5.70 $5.99 $3.65) $4.10 $2.48 $5.49 $4.67
Price Total for Adult 2X-Large $541.00| $519.00)| $570.00)| $599.00| $365.00)| $410.00| $248.00| $549.00| $467.00|
Price Each for Adult 3X-Large 100 $5.61 $5.40 $5.95) $8.62 $3.75) $4.25 $6.14] $5.70| $4.67
Price Total for Adult 3X-Large $561.00)| $540.00)| $595.00)| $862.00| $375.00)| $425.00)| $614.00| $570.00| $467.00|
Price Each for Adult 4X-Large 100 $5.81 $5.60) $6.15 $8.93 $3.85 $4.50 $6.36| $5.90 $5.41]
Price Total for Adult 4X-Large $581.00)| $560.00)| $615.00)| $893.00 $385.00)| $450.00)| $636.00 $590.00 $541.00
Price Each for Adult 5X-Large 100 No Bid| No Bid| $6.15) $11.86| $4.60 $6.00) $6.36) $25.00| $5.41]
Price Total for Adult 5X-Large $615.00)| $1,186.00| $460.00)| $600.00)| $636.00 $2,500.00| $541.00]
Price Each for Adult 6X-Large 100 No Bid| No Bid| $6.15) $13.17| $4.75) $6.50) $6.36) $27.00| $6.40
Price Total for Adult 6X-Large $615.00)| $1,317.00| $475.00| $650.00)| $636.00 $2,700.00| $640.00
1 Color Imprint $0.60| $0.45) $0.75 $0.70 $0.35) $0.30 $0.25| $0.50 $0.75|
2 Color Imprint $0.85) $0.60) $0.88 $0.90 $0.40 $0.30 $0.35 $0.55| $1.05|
3 Color Imprint $1.05) $0.75) $0.99 $1.20 $0.45) $0.30 $0.45| $0.60| $1.25|
4 Color Imprint $1.20 $0.90) $1.10 $1.40 $0.50 $0.30 $0.55| $0.65| $1.30
2nd Location Imprint $0.60) $0.45) $0.75) $10.00| $0.50 $0.30/ color $0.25| $0.50 $1.25)
$25/hr,
Art Charge per hour $0.00 $10.00 $10.00 $50.00| $0.00| First 30 minutes Free $0.00| $0.00| $20.00|
Set Up Fee $0.00 $10.00 $15.00 $45.00| $0.00 $25/ logo| $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Delivery 7 Business Days 7 Business Days 7 Business Days 7 Business Days| 7 Business Days 7 Business Days 7 Business Days| 7 Business Days| 7 Business Days| 7 Business Days| 7 Business Days|
Line 3 Item Total $2,005.00] $1,928.00] $3,375.00) $5,325.00] $2,235.00] $2,935.00) $3,121.00] $7,248.00] $3,123.00 $0.00) $0.00)
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: November 14, 2011
For: Promotional T-Shirts
Ad Wear & Specialty of [Alamo Tee's & Business Embroidery Christian's T-Shirts & |CreateMyTee Dunn Manufacturing  |Expressive T-Shirts [Heaven Sent Lands, Inc. Quality Print & Samy's Sign Shop
Texas Advertising Solutions Signs Co. dba Big Star Promotions & Design
Branding Apparel
6100000699 LS 8120 Westglen Dr. 12814 Cogburn Ave. 22919 High Top Dr. 24207 Post Oak View (4343 Concourse, Suite|1400 Goldmine Road |4009 Naco Perrin 5611 San Pedro 2731 Hereford St.  |402 Bradley 6900 San Pedro
330 Ave. Avenue
Item Description Estimated |Houston, San Antonio, Elmendorf, San Antonio, Ann Arbor, Monroe, San Antonio, San Antonio, St. Louis, San Antonio, San Antonio,
Quantity |[TX 77063 TX 78249 TX 78112 TX 78264 MI 48108 NC 28110 TX 78217 TX 78212 MO 63139 TX 78211 TX 78216
4 Light and Dark Colored T-Shirt (Tall)
100% Cotton Brand Name: Port & Company Port & Co. Port & Co. Port & Company| Port & Company Gildan Gildan, Port & Co. Port & Co. Gildan No Bid| No Bid|
PCB6IT 100% Cotton, 6.1 G200T Tall 6.1 oz
Style #: oz| PC6IT| PC61T, PC54 PC6IT| G200T) 2000T, PC61T| PC6IT] Ultra Cotton
No Brands available|
50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Brand Name: that meet specs| N/A No Bid! Gildan Port & Company No Bid! No Bid| N/A| Port & Company|
Style #: N/A| N/A| No Bid| G800 PC55T) No Bid| No Bid| N/A| PC55YC 50/50
Price Each for Adult Small - XLarge 100 $4.71] $4.52 $4.95 $4.00 $2.40 $5.00) $5.14 $4.82 $4.67
Price Total for Adult Small - XLarge $471.00| $452.00)| $495.00)| $400.00| $240.00| $500.00| $514.00| $482.00| $467.00|
Price Each for Adult 2X-Large 150 $7.04 $6.89 $7.15 $5.05) $4.95 $5.20 $7.83 $7.19] $5.93
Price Total for Adult 2X-Large $1,056.00) $1,033.50 $1,072.50] $757.50 $742.50| $780.00| $1,174.50| $1,078.50| $889.50
Price Each for Adult 3X-Large 200 $7.25) $7.13 $7.85) $7.85 $5.10 $5.20 $8.10| $7.53 $5.93
Price Total for Adult 3X-Large $1,450.00) $1,426.00) $1,570.00) $1,570.00| $1,020.00] $1,040.00| $1,620.00| $1,506.00| $1,186.00|
Price Each for Adult 4X-Large 200 $7.72| $7.42| $8.15 $9.10 $5.30) $5.75 $8.43 $7.72 $6.45|
Price Total for Adult 4X-Large $1,544.00| $1,484.00| $1,630.00| $1,820.00| $1,060.00| $1,150.00| $1,686.00| $1,544.00| $1,290.00|
Price Each for Adult 5X-Large 200 No Bid| No Bid| $8.15) $12.86| $6.00) $7.00 $8.43 $25.00| $6.45)
Price Total for Adult 5X-Large $1,630.00| $2,572.00| $1,200.00| $1,400.00| $1,686.00| $5,000.00| $1,290.00|
Price Each for Adult 6X-Large 150 No Bid| No Bid| $8.15) $13.99 $6.20) $7.50 $8.43 $27.00| $7.17|
Price Total for Adult 6X-Large $1,222.50] $2,098.50| $930.00)| $1,125.00| $1,264.50| $4,050.00| $1,075.50|
$0.50 Light /
1 Color Imprint $0.60| $0.45) $0.75 $0.70 $0.35) $0.30 $0.25| $0.60 Dark| $0.75|
$0.55 Light /
2 Color Imprint $0.85) $0.60| $0.88 $0.90 $0.40 $0.30 $0.35| $0.65 Dark| $1.05]
$0.60 Light /|
3 Color Imprint $1.05) $0.75) $0.99 $1.20 $0.45) $0.30 $0.45) $0.70 Dark $1.25
$0.75 Light /
4 Color Imprint $1.20 $0.90) $1.10 $1.40 $0.50 $0.30 $0.55| $0.90 Dark| $1.30
$0.40 Light /|
2nd Location Imprint $0.60 $0.45 $0.75 $10.00| $0.50 $0.30/ color $0.25| $0.50 Dark| $1.25
$25/hr,
Art Charge per hour $0.00 $10.00 $10.00 $50.00| $0.00| First 30 minutes Free $0.00| $0.00| $20.00|
Set Up Fee $0.00 $10.00 $15.00 $45.00| $0.00| $25/ logo| $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Delivery 7 Business Days 7 Business Days 7 Business Days 7 Business Days| 7 Business Days 7 Business Days 7 Business Days| 7 Business Days| 7 Business Days| 7 Business Days| 7 Business Days|
Line 4 Item Total $4,521.00| $4,395.50| $7,620.00| $9,218.00) $5,192.50| $5,995.00| $7,945.00| $13,660.50] $6,198.00) $0.00 $0.00)
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	Draft

