City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 7, 2011

For: Annual Contract for Ammunition Barney's Police Supplies GT Distributors, Inc. Precision Delta Corp.
218 Four Park Road PO Box 16080 PO Box 128
6100000280 SM Lafayette, Austin, Ruleville,
Estimated |LA 70507 TX 78761 MS 38771
Item Description Annual 337-896-3667 800-252-8310 662-756-2810
Quantity
1 Speer 155¢gr Gold Dot
Price per M 125,000 $0.00 $0.32 $0.30
Rounds per Case 0 1 1
Price Total $0.00 $40,000.00 $37,387.50
Manufacturer & No.: No Bid Speer 53961 Winchester RA40BA
2 Speer 155gr TMJ
Price per M 800,000 $0.00 $0.21 $0.19
Rounds per Case 0 1 1
Price Total $0.00 $168,000.00 $151,280.00
Manufacturer & No.: No Bid Speer 53957 Winchester USA40SW
3 Speer RHT (Frangible)
Price per M 10,000 $256.54 $0.37 $0.38
Rounds per Case 1000 1 1
Price Total $2,565.40 $3,700.00 $3,840.00
Manufacturer & No.: Remington FE40SW1 Speer 53375 Winchester RA4A0SF
4 Speer 115gr TMJ
Price per M 10,000 $256.54 $0.18 $0.16
Rounds per Case 1000 1 1
Price Total $2,565.40 $1,800.00 $1,610.00
Manufacturer & No.: Remington LLOMM11 Speer 53650 Winchester Q4172
5 Speer 124gr Gold Dot
Price per M 2,000 $319.37 $0.33 $0.31
Rounds per Case 1000 1 1
Price Total $638.74 $660.00 $620.20
Manufacturer & No.: Remington GSBOMMD Speer 53617 Winchester RA9BA
6 Speer 125¢gr Gold Dot
Price per M 2,000 $0.00 $0.33 $0.31
Rounds per Case 0 1 1
Price Total $0.00 $660.00 $626.00
Manufacturer & No.: No Bid Speer 53720 Winchester RA38B
7 Federal 55gr JSP
Price per M 10,000 $345.55 $0.48 $0.43
Rounds per Case 1000 1 1
Price Total $3,455.50 $4,800.00 $4,290.00
Manufacturer & No.: Remington R223R1 Federal T223A Winchester RA223R
8 Federal 55gr FMJ
Price per M 300,000 $277.49 $0.30 $0.31
Rounds per Case 1000 1 1
Price Total $83,247.00 $90,000.00 $91,800.00
Manufacturer & No.: Remington L223R3 Federal AE223 Winchester Q3131
9 Federal RHT (Frangible)
Price per M 5,000 $445.03 $0.64 $0.48
Rounds per Case 1000 1 1
Price Total $2,225.15 $3,200.00 $2,390.00
Manufacturer & No.: Remington LF223R5R Federal BC223NT5A Winchester RA223SF
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Federal 168gr BTHP

Price per M 20,000 $691.10 $0.73 $0.71
Rounds per Case 1000 1 1
Price Total $13,822.00 $14,600.00 $14,220.00
Manufacturer & No.: Remington RM308W7 Federal GM308M Winchester S308M
Federal 00 Buck

Price per M 15,000 $440.84 $0.42 $0.32
Rounds per Case 1000 1 1
Price Total $6,612.60 $6,300.00 $4,725.00
Manufacturer & No.: Remington SPL1200 Federal LE12700 Winchester RA1200
Federal Slug

Price Per M 10,000 $367.54 $0.42 $0.41
Rounds per Case 1000 1 1
Price Total $3,675.40 $4,200.00 $4,110.00
Manufacturer & No.: Remington SP12RS Federal LEB127RS Winchester RA12RS15
7.5 Birdshot

Price Per M 10,000 $256.54 $0.33 $0.22
Rounds per Case 1000 1 1
Price Total $2,565.40 $3,300.00 $2,243.00
Manufacturer & No.: Remington GC1217 Federal T1167.5 Winchester TRGT127
CTS Bean Bag

Price Per M 1,000 $0.00 $4.65 $0.00
Rounds Per Case 0 1 0
Price Total $0.00 $4,650.00 $0.00
Manufacturer & No.: No Bid| Defense Technology 3027 No Bid
CTS Breaching

Price Per 500 Rounds 500 $890.05 $5.50 $0.00
Rounds Per Case 1000 1 0
Price Total $445.03 $2,750.00 $0.00
Manufacturer & No.: Remington TB12-BK| Defense Technology 3105 No Bid
Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
Estimated Annual Total $121,817.62 $348,620.00 $319,141.70
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