City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened:  February 4, 2011
For: Rental of Sedans and Light Duty Pickups
Capps Van & Truck Rental |Enterprise Holdings, Inc.
A612a-11 LD 8555 John Carpenter Fwy |1505 Harry Wurzbach
e Dallas, San Antonio,
Item Description TX 75247 TX 78209
1 1/2 Ton Pick-Up Trucks, 2WD
I|Regular Cab
A|Rental - Flat Daily Rate No Bid No Bid
Additional Mileage Rate
B|Rental - Flat Weekly Rate No Bid No Bid
Additional Mileage Rate
C|Rental - Flat Monthly Rate $647.50 No Bid
Additional Mileage Rate $0.25 per mile over 2000
miles
Make & Model Offered Chevy 1500/2500
1l{Super or Extended Cab
A|Rental - Flat Daily Rate No Bid No Bid
Additional Mileage Rate
B|Rental - Flat Weekly Rate No Bid No Bid
Additional Mileage Rate
C|Rental - Flat Monthly Rate No Bid No Bid
Additional Mileage Rate
Make & Model Offered
1ll|Crew or Super Crew
A|Rental - Flat Daily Rate No Bid No Bid
Additional Mileage Rate
B|Rental - Flat Weekly Rate No Bid No Bid
Additional Mileage Rate
C|Rental - Flat Monthly Rate $827.50 No Bid
Additional Mileage Rate $0.25 per mile over 2000
miles|
Make & Model Offered Chevy 1500/2500
2 1/2 Ton Pick-Up Trucks 4WD
I|Regular Cab
A|Rental - Flat Daily Rate No Bid No Bid
Additional Mileage Rate
B|Rental - Flat Weekly Rate No Bid No Bid
Additional Mileage Rate
C|Rental - Flat Monthly Rate No Bid No Bid
Additional Mileage Rate
Make & Model Offered
1l|Super or Extended Cab
A|Rental - Flat Daily Rate No Bid No Bid
Additional Mileage Rate
B|Rental - Flat Weekly Rate No Bid No Bid
Additional Mileage Rate
C|Rental - Flat Monthly Rate No Bid No Bid
Additional Mileage Rate
Make & Model Offered
1ll|Crew or Super Crew
A|Rental - Flat Daily Rate No Bid No Bid
Additional Mileage Rate
B|Rental - Flat Weekly Rate No Bid No Bid
Additional Mileage Rate
C|[Rental - Flat Monthly Rate No Bid No Bid

Additional Mileage Rate
Make & Model Offered
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened:  February 4, 2011
For: Rental of Sedans and Light Duty Pickups
Capps Van & Truck Rental |Enterprise Holdings, Inc.
A612a-11 LD 8555 John Carpenter Fwy |1505 Harry Wurzbach
L Dallas, San Antonio,
ltem Description TX 75247 TX 78209
3 3/4 Ton Pickup Trucks, 2WD
I|[Regular Cab
A|Rental - Flat Daily Rate No Bid No Bid
Additional Mileage Rate
B|Rental - Flat Weekly Rate No Bid No Bid
Additional Mileage Rate
C|Rental - Flat Monthly Rate No Bid No Bid
Additional Mileage Rate
Make & Model Offered
Il|Super or Extended Cab
A|Rental - Flat Daily Rate No Bid No Bid
Additional Mileage Rate
B|Rental - Flat Weekly Rate No Bid No Bid
Additional Mileage Rate
C|Rental - Flat Monthly Rate No Bid No Bid
Additional Mileage Rate
Make & Model Offered
1ll|Crew or Super Crew
A|Rental - Flat Daily Rate No Bid $55.00
Additional Mileage Rate $0.20 per mile over 200,
miles|
B|Rental - Flat Weekly Rate No Bid $330.00
Additional Mileage Rate $0.20 per mile over 1400
miles
C|Rental - Flat Monthly Rate No Bid $1,210.00
Additional Mileage Rate $0.20 per mile over 3000
miles|
Make & Model Offered Ford F150C, Chevrolet
S15C, Dodge B15Q
4 3/4 Ton Pick-Up Trucks, 4WD
I|Regular Cab
A|Rental - Flat Daily Rate No Bid No Bid
Additional Mileage Rate
B|Rental - Flat Weekly Rate No Bid No Bid
Additional Mileage Rate
C|Rental - Flat Monthly Rate No Bid No Bid
Additional Mileage Rate
Make & Model Offered
1l|Super or Extended Cab
A|Rental - Flat Daily Rate No Bid No Bid
Additional Mileage Rate
B|Rental - Flat Weekly Rate No Bid No Bid
Additional Mileage Rate
C|Rental - Flat Monthly Rate No Bid No Bid
Additional Mileage Rate
Make & Model Offered
1l{Crew or Super Crew
A|Rental - Flat Daily Rate No Bid $75.00
Additional Mileage Rate $0.20 per mile over 200,
miles|
B|Rental - Flat Weekly Rate No Bid $375.00
Additional Mileage Rate $0.20 per mile over 1400
miles
C|Rental - Flat Monthly Rate No Bid $1,650.00
Additional Mileage Rate $0.20 per mile over 3000
miles|
Make & Model Offered Ford F250, Chevy 2500,
Dodge 2500
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened:  February 4, 2011
For: Rental of Sedans and Light Duty Pickups
Capps Van & Truck Rental |Enterprise Holdings, Inc.
A612a-11 LD 8555 John Carpenter Fwy |1505 Harry Wurzbach
e Dallas, San Antonio,
ltem Description TX 75247 TX 78209
5 Full Size Sport Utility Vehicles
l|Regular 2WD
A|Rental - Flat Daily Rate No Bid $79.00
Additional Mileage Rate $0.20 per mile over 200,
miles|
B|Rental - Flat Weekly Rate No Bid $474.00
Additional Mileage Rate $0.20 per mile over 1400
miles
C|Rental - Flat Monthly Rate No Bid $1,740.00
Additional Mileage Rate $0.20 per mile over 3000
miles|
Make & Model Offered Dodge Durango, Chevrolet
Tahoe, GM Yukon, Nissan|
Pathfinder
1Ijawp
A|Rental - Flat Daily Rate No Bid No Bid
Additional Mileage Rate
B|Rental - Flat Weekly Rate No Bid No Bid
Additional Mileage Rate
C|Rental - Flat Monthly Rate No Bid No Bid
Additional Mileage Rate
Make & Model Offered
6 Small Size Sport Utility Vehicles
l|Gasoline Powered
A|Rental - Flat Daily Rate No Bid $56.00
Additional Mileage Rate $0.20 per mile over 200,
miles|
B|Rental - Flat Weekly Rate No Bid $336.00
Additional Mileage Rate $0.20 per mile over 1400
miles
C|Rental - Flat Monthly Rate No Bid $1,232.00
Additional Mileage Rate $0.20 per mile over 3000
miles|
Make & Model Offered Jeep Cherokee, Chevrolet
Trail Blazer, Ford Explorer,
Ford Edge, Kia Sorrento,
Hyundai Santa Fe, Kia|
Sportage, Nissan Rogue
1I|Hybrid Powered
A|Rental - Flat Daily Rate No Bid No Bid
Additional Mileage Rate
B|Rental - Flat Weekly Rate No Bid No Bid
Additional Mileage Rate
C|Rental - Flat Monthly Rate No Bid No Bid
Additional Mileage Rate
Make & Model Offered
7 Mid-Size Sedan
I|Gasoline Powered
A|Rental - Flat Daily Rate No Bid $34.50!
Additional Mileage Rate $0.00 Unlimited|
B|Rental - Flat Weekly Rate No Bid $207.00
Additional Mileage Rate $0.00 Unlimited|
C|Rental - Flat Monthly Rate $647.50 $759.00
Additional Mileage Rate $0.25 per mile over 2000 $0.00 Unlimited|
miles
Make & Model Offered Ford Fusion / Toyota| Toyota Corolla, Hyundai
Camry Elentra, Nissan Sentra,

Ford Focus, Dodge Caliber,
Mazda 3, Chrysler 200,
Dodge Avenger, Hyundai
Sonata, Nissan Cube
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened:  February 4, 2011

For: Rental of Sedans and Light Duty Pickups
Capps Van & Truck Rental |Enterprise Holdings, Inc.
A612a-11 LD 8555 John Carpenter Fwy |1505 Harry Wurzbach
e Dallas, San Antonio,
ltem Description TX 75247 TX 78209

Il|Hybrid Powered
Rental - Flat Daily Rate No Bid No Bid
Additional Mileage Rate

>

B|Rental - Flat Weekly Rate No Bid No Bid
Additional Mileage Rate

C|Rental - Flat Monthly Rate No Bid No Bid
Additional Mileage Rate
Make & Model Offered

Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30
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