
City of San Antonio
Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 9, 2010
For:              A.M.E. Services, Inc. American Facility 

Services, Inc.
Frio Nevado Venture International Building 

Services
CBT Partners DBA Jani-
King of San Antonio

VF 23 Barreca Street 1325 Union Hill 
Industrial Court, Ste. A

1400 West Avenue 8204 N. Lamar Blvd. B-
16

1008 Central Parkway 
South

Item Description Estimated 
Square 
Footage

Norco,                          
LA 70079                      

Alpharetta,                       
GA 30004        

San Antonio,
TX  78201

Austin,
TX  78753

San Antonio,
TX  78232

1 Fleet Maintenance Cleaning (pricing per year) (pricing per year) (pricing per day) (pricing per month) (pricing per month)
Service Level 9 8,305
Price per Square Foot $0.3300 $2.8500 $0.0140 $0.0510 $0.0850

2 DCI Cleaning
Service Level 1 55,000
Price per Square Foot $0.580 $1.570 $0.006 $0.062 $0.046
Service Level 3 30,000
Price per Square Foot $5.310 $1.570 $0.008 $0.057 $0.044
Service Level 5 16,500
Price per Square Foot $0.570 $2.400 $0.009 $0.056 $0.097
Service Level 6 8,000
Price per Square Foot $1.140 $4.240 $0.005 $0.180 $0.170

3 SAPD Cleaning
Service Level 5 7,700
Price per Square Foot $0.570 $3.670 $0.007 $0.071 $0.097
Service Level 7 160
Price per Square Foot $0.250 $37.500 $0.253 $0.720 $0.066
Service Level 9 9,400
Price per Square Foot $0.330 $2.410 $0.019 $0.050 $0.085

4 Downtown Operations Cleaning
Service Level 7 10,928
Price per Square Foot $0.250 $1.980 $0.023 $0.033 $0.066

A1559-11

Janitorial Services for Various City Facilities
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City of San Antonio
Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 9, 2010
For:              A.M.E. Services, Inc. American Facility 

Services, Inc.
Frio Nevado Venture International Building 

Services
CBT Partners DBA Jani-
King of San Antonio

VF 23 Barreca Street 1325 Union Hill 
Industrial Court, Ste. A

1400 West Avenue 8204 N. Lamar Blvd. B-
16

1008 Central Parkway 
South

Item Description Estimated 
Square 
Footage

Norco,                          
LA 70079                      

Alpharetta,                       
GA 30004        

San Antonio,
TX  78201

Austin,
TX  78753

San Antonio,
TX  78232

A1559-11

Janitorial Services for Various City Facilities

5 Parks & Recreation Cleaning
Sector 1
Tobin 10,412 $0.570 $3.230 $0.007 $0.068 Std. .102 

Commander's House 5,684 $0.570 $2.320 $0.012 $0.068
Std. .102 

Summer .261

Granados 4,095 $0.570 $2.320 $0.014 $0.072
Std. .102 

Summer .306
San Fernando Gym 23,494 $0.570 $1.480 $0.006 $0.060 $0.102
Park Police #337 4,500 $0.570 $2.320 $0.007 $0.090 $0.102
Park Police #246 1,100 $0.570 $8.730 $0.044 $0.090 $0.135

6 Parks & Recreation Cleaning
Sector 2
Dawson 10,434 $0.570 $3.230 $0.006 $0.140 $0.102
Fairchild 3,030 $0.570 $2.320 $0.009 $0.130 $0.102
Dorie Miller 2,463 $0.570 $8.730 $0.011 $0.130 $0.102
Woodard 8,673 $0.570 $2.350 $0.006 $0.090 $0.102
Copernicus 13,923 $0.570 $3.230 $0.006 $0.072 $0.102
Lincoln 10,783 $0.570 $3.230 $0.006 $0.072 $0.102

Lion's Field 8,316 $0.570 $3.230 $0.008 $0.072
Std. .102 

Summer .180
Park Police - Old Seguin Road 1,600 $0.250 $8.730 $0.033 $0.072 $0.135

7 Parks & Recreation Cleaning
Sector 3
Denver Heights 11,782 $0.500 $3.230 $0.006 $0.078 $0.102
Harlandale 11,652 $0.500 $3.230 $0.006 $0.078 $0.102
Bode 8,062 $0.500 $2.350 $0.007 $0.082 $0.102
Southside Lions 5,222 $0.570 $3.230 $0.007 $0.082 $0.102
Father Roman 8,637 $0.500 $3.230 $0.006 $0.090 $0.102
S. Flores Facility 1,410 $0.250 $8.730 $0.019 $0.270 $0.102
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City of San Antonio
Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 9, 2010
For:              A.M.E. Services, Inc. American Facility 

Services, Inc.
Frio Nevado Venture International Building 

Services
CBT Partners DBA Jani-
King of San Antonio

VF 23 Barreca Street 1325 Union Hill 
Industrial Court, Ste. A

1400 West Avenue 8204 N. Lamar Blvd. B-
16

1008 Central Parkway 
South

Item Description Estimated 
Square 
Footage

Norco,                          
LA 70079                      

Alpharetta,                       
GA 30004        

San Antonio,
TX  78201

Austin,
TX  78753

San Antonio,
TX  78232

A1559-11

Janitorial Services for Various City Facilities

8 Parks & Recreation Cleaning
Sector 4
South San 10,550 $0.500 $3.230 $0.006 $0.063 $0.102
Ramirez 13,000 $0.570 $3.230 $0.004 $0.063 $0.102
Miller's Pond 11,950 $0.500 $3.230 $0.006 $0.063 $0.102
Normoyle 11,336 $0.500 $3.230 $0.006 $0.063 $0.102
Palm Heights 12,150 $0.500 $3.230 $0.006 $0.063 $0.102
San Juan Brady 13,300 $0.500 $3.230 $0.006 $0.063 $0.102

9 Parks & Recreation Cleaning
Sector 5
Meadowcliff 8,034 $0.570 $3.230 $0.006 $0.072 $0.102
Jean Yates 4,533 $0.570 $2.320 $0.008 $0.090 $0.102

Virginia Gill 3,300 $0.570 $2.320 $0.017 $0.090
Std. .102 

Summer .299
Berta Almaguer 4,924 $0.570 $2.320 $0.007 $0.090 $0.102
Woodlawn Lake Park Gym 16,145 $0.570 $1.780 $0.006 $0.063 $0.102
Ward 8,976 $0.570 $3.230 $0.007 $0.072 $0.102

10 Parks & Recreation Cleaning
Sector 6
Cuellar 16,090 $0.570 $1.780 $0.006 $0.072 $0.102
Garza 14,300 $0.570 $1.780 $0.006 $0.072 $0.102
Lou Hamilton 12,400 $0.570 $3.230 $0.006 $0.072 $0.102
Melendrez 8,350 $0.570 $3.230 $0.007 $0.081 $0.102
New Territories 2,088 $0.500 $2.320 $0.013 $0.180 $0.102
Park Police - Rochelle Rd. 1,600 $0.250 $0.600 $0.033 $0.135 $0.135
Park Police - Ira Lee 1,000 $0.250 $0.600 $0.048 $0.135 $0.135
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City of San Antonio
Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 9, 2010
For:              A.M.E. Services, Inc. American Facility 

Services, Inc.
Frio Nevado Venture International Building 

Services
CBT Partners DBA Jani-
King of San Antonio

VF 23 Barreca Street 1325 Union Hill 
Industrial Court, Ste. A

1400 West Avenue 8204 N. Lamar Blvd. B-
16

1008 Central Parkway 
South

Item Description Estimated 
Square 
Footage

Norco,                          
LA 70079                      

Alpharetta,                       
GA 30004        

San Antonio,
TX  78201

Austin,
TX  78753

San Antonio,
TX  78232

A1559-11

Janitorial Services for Various City Facilities

11 Parks & Recreation
Alternate #1 68,849 $0.650 $0.010 $0.034 $0.072 $0.008
Alternate #2a 167,947 $0.660 $0.020 $0.241 $0.072 $0.007
Alternate #2b 2,463 $0.660 $0.020 $0.521 $0.135 $0.053
Alternate #2c 10,783 $0.660 $0.020 $0.239 $0.077 $0.034
Alternate #2d 39,639 $0.690 $0.020 $0.214 $0.072 $0.025
Alternate #2e 7,012 $0.660 $0.020 $0.403 $0.081 $0.024
Alternate #3 74,935 $0.720 $0.000 $0.000 $0.072 $0.005

12 Carpet and Hard Surface Cleaning
Carpet Shampoo - Bonnett $0.090 $0.080 $0.060 $0.032 $0.100
Carpet Extraction $0.110 $0.120 $0.090 $0.090 $0.130
Carpet Deep Steam Cleaning $0.150 $0.120 $0.100 $0.090 $0.150
Hard Floor - Terrazzo $0.220 $0.100 $0.100 $0.090 $0.120
Hard Floor - VCT Tile $0.220 $0.120 $0.100 $0.090 $0.120
Hard Floor - Wood $0.300 $0.180 $0.100 $0.090 $0.120
Hard Floor - Ceramic $0.120 $0.120 $0.090 $0.090 $0.120

13 Additional Facilities
Service Level 1
Up to 50,000 sft $0.580 $0.700 $0.005 $0.077 $14.64 / hour
50,000 sft - 100,000 sft $0.580 $0.700 $0.005 $0.063 $14.64 / hour
over 100,000 sft $0.580 $0.700 $0.005 $0.059 $14.64 / hour

Service Level 2
Up to 50,000 sft $0.580 $0.700 $0.005 $0.077 $14.64 / hour
50,000 sft - 100,000 sft $0.580 $0.700 $0.005 $0.063 $14.64 / hour
over 100,000 sft $0.580 $0.700 $0.005 $0.059 $14.64 / hour

Service Level 3
Up to 50,000 sft $5.310 $0.700 $0.008 $0.063 $15.35 / hour
50,000 sft - 100,000 sft $5.310 $0.700 $0.008 $0.059 $15.35 / hour
over 100,000 sft $5.310 $0.700 $0.008 $0.056 $15.35 / hour
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City of San Antonio
Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 9, 2010
For:              A.M.E. Services, Inc. American Facility 

Services, Inc.
Frio Nevado Venture International Building 

Services
CBT Partners DBA Jani-
King of San Antonio

VF 23 Barreca Street 1325 Union Hill 
Industrial Court, Ste. A

1400 West Avenue 8204 N. Lamar Blvd. B-
16

1008 Central Parkway 
South

Item Description Estimated 
Square 
Footage

Norco,                          
LA 70079                      

Alpharetta,                       
GA 30004        

San Antonio,
TX  78201

Austin,
TX  78753

San Antonio,
TX  78232

A1559-11

Janitorial Services for Various City Facilities

Service Level 4
Up to 50,000 sft $1.340 $0.900 $0.008 $0.126 $0.211
50,000 sft - 100,000 sft $1.340 $0.900 $0.008 $0.117 $0.163
over 100,000 sft $1.340 $0.900 $0.008 $0.108 $0.161

Service Level 5
Up to 50,000 sft $0.570 $0.700 $0.008 $0.048 $0.097
50,000 sft - 100,000 sft $0.570 $0.700 $0.008 $0.045 $0.095
over 100,000 sft $0.570 $0.700 $0.008 $0.044 $0.091

Service Level 6
Up to 50,000 sft $1.140 $0.850 $0.005 $0.081 $0.170
50,000 sft - 100,000 sft $1.140 $0.850 $0.005 $0.077 $0.163
over 100,000 sft $1.140 $0.850 $0.005 $0.072 $0.155

Service Level 7
Up to 50,000 sft $0.250 $0.550 $0.005 $0.041 $0.066
50,000 sft - 100,000 sft $0.250 $0.550 $0.005 $0.041 $0.063
over 100,000 sft $0.250 $0.550 $0.005 $0.041 $0.060

Service Level 8
Up to 50,000 sft $0.410 $0.620 $0.005 $0.045 $0.093
50,000 sft - 100,000 sft $0.410 $0.620 $0.005 $0.045 $0.088
over 100,000 sft $0.410 $0.620 $0.005 $0.045 $0.083

Service Level 9
Up to 50,000 sft $0.330 $0.580 $0.008 $0.036 $0.085
50,000 sft - 100,000 sft $0.330 $0.580 $0.008 $0.036 $0.080
over 100,000 sft $0.330 $0.580 $0.008 $0.036 $0.077

14 All or None, Cleaning Only $0.580 $0.820 $0.005 $0.077 $0.093

Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 1.5% Net 10 Net 30 Net 30

Estimated Annual Total
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City of San Antonio
Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 9, 2010
For:              

VF

Item Description Estimated 
Square 
Footage

1 Fleet Maintenance Cleaning
Service Level 9 8,305
Price per Square Foot

2 DCI Cleaning
Service Level 1 55,000
Price per Square Foot
Service Level 3 30,000
Price per Square Foot
Service Level 5 16,500
Price per Square Foot
Service Level 6 8,000
Price per Square Foot

3 SAPD Cleaning
Service Level 5 7,700
Price per Square Foot
Service Level 7 160
Price per Square Foot
Service Level 9 9,400
Price per Square Foot

4 Downtown Operations Cleaning
Service Level 7 10,928
Price per Square Foot

A1559-11

Janitorial Services for Various City Facilities Member's Building 
Maintenance, LTD.

OJS Systems, Inc. Selrico Services, Inc. Three Sons Cleaning 
Service

11420 Ferrell Dr. #307 PO Box 2797 717 W. Ashby Place 712 Clover Creek

Farmers Branch,
TX  75234

Acworth,
GA  30102

San Antonio,                    
TX 78212

San Antonio,                   
TX 78245

(pricing per year) (pricing per year) (pricing per year) (pricing per day)

$1.5500 $1.0300 $0.9200 $0.0800

$1.170 $1.050 $2.240 No Bid

$1.650 $1.050 $2.170 No Bid

$2.680 $1.050 $0.920 $0.060

$2.410 $2.300 $1.810 No Bid

$2.680 $1.050 $0.920 No Bid

$0.290 $4.240 $0.920 $0.440

$1.550 $0.540 $0.920 $0.160

$0.290 $0.540 $0.920 No Bid
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City of San Antonio
Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 9, 2010
For:              

VF

Item Description Estimated 
Square 
Footage

A1559-11

Janitorial Services for Various City Facilities

5 Parks & Recreation Cleaning
Sector 1
Tobin 10,412

Commander's House 5,684

Granados 4,095
San Fernando Gym 23,494
Park Police #337 4,500
Park Police #246 1,100

6 Parks & Recreation Cleaning
Sector 2
Dawson 10,434
Fairchild 3,030
Dorie Miller 2,463
Woodard 8,673
Copernicus 13,923
Lincoln 10,783

Lion's Field 8,316
Park Police - Old Seguin Road 1,600

7 Parks & Recreation Cleaning
Sector 3
Denver Heights 11,782
Harlandale 11,652
Bode 8,062
Southside Lions 5,222
Father Roman 8,637
S. Flores Facility 1,410

Member's Building 
Maintenance, LTD.

OJS Systems, Inc. Selrico Services, Inc. Three Sons Cleaning 
Service

11420 Ferrell Dr. #307 PO Box 2797 717 W. Ashby Place 712 Clover Creek

Farmers Branch,
TX  75234

Acworth,
GA  30102

San Antonio,                    
TX 78212

San Antonio,                   
TX 78245

$0.960 $1.060 $0.920 No Bid

$2.250 $1.100 $2.470 No Bid

$2.800 $1.100 $3.070 No Bid
$0.840 $1.040 $0.920 No Bid
$1.780 $1.100 $0.920 No Bid
$0.840 $1.100 $0.920 No Bid

$0.950 $1.060 $0.920 No Bid
$1.240 $1.100 $0.920 No Bid
$1.340 $1.100 $0.920 No Bid
$0.980 $1.100 $0.920 No Bid
$0.930 $1.060 $0.920 No Bid
$0.950 $1.060 $0.920 No Bid

$0.990 $1.100 $1.980 No Bid
$0.170 $1.100 $0.920 No Bid

$0.940 $1.060 $0.920 No Bid
$0.940 $1.100 $0.920 No Bid
$0.990 $1.100 $0.920 No Bid
$0.840 $1.100 $0.920 No Bid
$0.980 $1.100 $0.920 No Bid
$0.840 $1.100 $0.920 No Bid
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City of San Antonio
Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 9, 2010
For:              

VF

Item Description Estimated 
Square 
Footage

A1559-11

Janitorial Services for Various City Facilities

8 Parks & Recreation Cleaning
Sector 4
South San 10,550
Ramirez 13,000
Miller's Pond 11,950
Normoyle 11,336
Palm Heights 12,150
San Juan Brady 13,300

9 Parks & Recreation Cleaning
Sector 5
Meadowcliff 8,034
Jean Yates 4,533

Virginia Gill 3,300
Berta Almaguer 4,924
Woodlawn Lake Park Gym 16,145
Ward 8,976

10 Parks & Recreation Cleaning
Sector 6
Cuellar 16,090
Garza 14,300
Lou Hamilton 12,400
Melendrez 8,350
New Territories 2,088
Park Police - Rochelle Rd. 1,600
Park Police - Ira Lee 1,000

Member's Building 
Maintenance, LTD.

OJS Systems, Inc. Selrico Services, Inc. Three Sons Cleaning 
Service

11420 Ferrell Dr. #307 PO Box 2797 717 W. Ashby Place 712 Clover Creek

Farmers Branch,
TX  75234

Acworth,
GA  30102

San Antonio,                    
TX 78212

San Antonio,                   
TX 78245

$0.95 $1.06 $0.92 No Bid
$0.84 $1.06 $0.92 No Bid
$0.94 $1.06 $0.92 No Bid
$0.95 $1.06 $0.92 No Bid
$0.94 $1.06 $0.92 No Bid
$0.93 $1.06 $0.92 No Bid

$0.990 $1.100 $0.920 No Bid
$1.110 $1.100 $0.920 No Bid

$1.210 $1.100 $3.590 No Bid
$0.840 $1.100 $0.920 No Bid
$0.910 $1.060 $0.920 No Bid
$0.970 $1.100 $0.920 No Bid

$0.840 $1.100 $0.920 No Bid
$0.840 $1.100 $0.920 No Bid
$0.840 $1.100 $0.920 No Bid
$0.980 $1.100 $0.920 No Bid
$0.840 $1.100 $0.920 No Bid
$0.170 $1.100 $0.920 No Bid
$0.170 $1.100 $0.920 No Bid
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City of San Antonio
Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 9, 2010
For:              

VF

Item Description Estimated 
Square 
Footage

A1559-11

Janitorial Services for Various City Facilities

11 Parks & Recreation
Alternate #1 68,849
Alternate #2a 167,947
Alternate #2b 2,463
Alternate #2c 10,783
Alternate #2d 39,639
Alternate #2e 7,012
Alternate #3 74,935

12 Carpet and Hard Surface Cleaning
Carpet Shampoo - Bonnett
Carpet Extraction
Carpet Deep Steam Cleaning
Hard Floor - Terrazzo
Hard Floor - VCT Tile
Hard Floor - Wood
Hard Floor - Ceramic

13 Additional Facilities
Service Level 1
Up to 50,000 sft
50,000 sft - 100,000 sft
over 100,000 sft

Service Level 2
Up to 50,000 sft
50,000 sft - 100,000 sft
over 100,000 sft

Service Level 3
Up to 50,000 sft
50,000 sft - 100,000 sft
over 100,000 sft

Member's Building 
Maintenance, LTD.

OJS Systems, Inc. Selrico Services, Inc. Three Sons Cleaning 
Service

11420 Ferrell Dr. #307 PO Box 2797 717 W. Ashby Place 712 Clover Creek

Farmers Branch,
TX  75234

Acworth,
GA  30102

San Antonio,                    
TX 78212

San Antonio,                   
TX 78245

$0.080 $1.060 $0.030 No Bid
$0.070 $1.000 $0.180 No Bid
$0.070 $1.100 $0.180 No Bid
$0.070 $1.080 $0.180 No Bid
$0.070 $1.060 $0.180 No Bid
$0.070 $1.100 $0.180 No Bid
$0.070 $1.060 $0.004 No Bid

$0.100 $0.068 $0.060 $0.250
$0.100 $0.138 $0.060 $0.250
$0.200 $0.140 $0.060 $0.250
$0.080 $0.260 $0.060 $0.250
$0.080 $0.250 $0.060 $0.250
$0.100 $0.390 $0.060 $0.250
$0.080 $0.270 $0.060 $0.250

$1.170 $1.100 $2.240 No Bid
$1.160 $1.070 $2.240 No Bid
$1.150 $1.000 $2.240 No Bid

$1.170 $1.100 $2.460 No Bid
$1.160 $1.070 $2.460 No Bid
$1.150 $1.000 $2.460 No Bid

$1.650 $1.080 $2.170 No Bid
$1.640 $1.070 $2.170 No Bid
$1.630 $0.980 $2.170 No Bid
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City of San Antonio
Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 9, 2010
For:              

VF

Item Description Estimated 
Square 
Footage

A1559-11

Janitorial Services for Various City Facilities

Service Level 4
Up to 50,000 sft
50,000 sft - 100,000 sft
over 100,000 sft

Service Level 5
Up to 50,000 sft
50,000 sft - 100,000 sft
over 100,000 sft

Service Level 6
Up to 50,000 sft
50,000 sft - 100,000 sft
over 100,000 sft

Service Level 7
Up to 50,000 sft
50,000 sft - 100,000 sft
over 100,000 sft

Service Level 8
Up to 50,000 sft
50,000 sft - 100,000 sft
over 100,000 sft

Service Level 9
Up to 50,000 sft
50,000 sft - 100,000 sft
over 100,000 sft

14 All or None, Cleaning Only

Payment Terms

Estimated Annual Total

Member's Building 
Maintenance, LTD.

OJS Systems, Inc. Selrico Services, Inc. Three Sons Cleaning 
Service

11420 Ferrell Dr. #307 PO Box 2797 717 W. Ashby Place 712 Clover Creek

Farmers Branch,
TX  75234

Acworth,
GA  30102

San Antonio,                    
TX 78212

San Antonio,                   
TX 78245

$2.220 $3.000 $2.120 No Bid
$2.210 $2.880 $2.120 No Bid
$2.200 $2.640 $2.120 No Bid

$2.680 $1.100 $0.920 $0.150
$2.670 $1.070 $0.920 No Bid
$2.650 $1.060 $0.920 No Bid

$2.410 $2.640 $1.810 No Bid
$2.400 $2.520 $1.810 No Bid
$2.390 $2.400 $1.810 No Bid

$0.290 $0.470 $0.920 $0.150
$0.280 $0.470 $0.920 No Bid
$0.270 $0.470 $0.920 No Bid

$0.600 $0.768 $0.830 No Bid
$0.590 $0.762 $0.830 No Bid
$0.580 $0.753 $0.830 No Bid

$1.550 $0.472 $0.920 $0.150
$1.540 $0.472 $0.920 No Bid
$1.530 $0.472 $0.920 No Bid

deduct $0.15 $1.100 No Bid No Bid

Net 30 .1 Net 10 Net 30 Net 30
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