City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 6, 2009
For: Recreational Games and Sports Equipment Cannon Sports Educator's Outlet Gregg United Sports Pyramid School Products |S&S Worldwide
A795-09 VF/IAA P. 0. Box 11179 P. O. Box 397 P. O. Box 970008 6510 North 54th Street 75 Mill Street
Estimated Burbank, CA Timnath, CO 80547 Boca Raton, FL 33497 Tampa, FL 33610 Colchester, CT 06415
Item Description Annual Quantity]
1 UNO Stacko Game 65 No Bid No Bid| No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price per package
Total Price
Brand & Item No.
2 Monopoly: SA Spurs Edition 165 No Bid No Bid| No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price per each
Total Price
Brand & Item No.
3 Chess and Checkers Set 110 No Bid No Bid
Price per pack $84.48 $77.14 $64.68
Total Price $9,292.80 $8,485.40 $7,114.80
Brand & Item No. Pressman 3312-12 Pressman 3312-12 Pressman W2636
4 Bingo Set with Spinner Card 75 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price per package $41.16 $40.28
Total Price $3,087.00 $3,021.00
Brand & Item No. Pressman 116512-12 Pressman 1165-12
5 Double-Nine Domino Set 70 No Bid No Bid
Price per package $39.00 $22.25 $33.60
Total Price $2,730.00 $1,557.50 $2,352.00
Brand & Item No. Pressman 162112-12 Educators # 10598 Pressman W2633
6 Giant 4 in a Row 80 No Bid No Bid
Price per package $84.84 $79.28 $81.00
Total Price $6,787.20 $6,342.40 $6,480.00
Brand & Item No. Pressman 102403-03 Pressman 1024-03 Pressman W8699
7 UNO Card Game 105 No Bid No Bid
Price per package $66.00 $65.14 $55.20
Total Price $6,930.00 $6,839.70 $5,796.00
Brand & Item No. CSS 21217/12 Mattel 42003| Milton Bradley W2040
8 Giant Playing Cards 60 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price per package $24.20 $8.52
Total Price $1,452.00 $511.20
Brand & Item No. Educator 105533 W8696
9 Playing Cards 635 No Bid No Bid
Price per each $0.78 $1.16 $0.56
Total Price $495.30 $736.60 $355.60
Brand & Item No. Csl 21215 Educators 10519 S&S GA30
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 6, 2009
For: Recreational Games and Sports Equipment Cannon Sports Educator's Outlet Gregg United Sports Pyramid School Products |S&S Worldwide
A795-09 VF/IAA P. 0. Box 11179 P. O. Box 397 P. O. Box 970008 6510 North 54th Street 75 Mill Street
Estimated Burbank, CA Timnath, CO 80547 Boca Raton, FL 33497 Tampa, FL 33610 Colchester, CT 06415
Item Description Annual Quantity]
10 |Connect 4 405 No Bid
Price per each $15.35 $16.78 $13.50 $13.20
Total Price $6,216.75 $6,795.90 $5,467.50 $5,346.00
Brand & Item No. CSI 21207 Educators 105416 Hasbro 01081 W2603
11  |Sorry Game 230 No Bid
Price per each $18.26 $19.64 $15.65 $15.20
Total Price $4,199.80 $4,517.20 $3,599.50 $3,496.00
Brand & Item No. Csl 21211 Hasbro 00390 Hasbro 00390 GA390
12 |Snakes and Ladders 195 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price per each $4.38 $2.45
Total Price $854.10 $477.75
Brand & Item No. CSI 2660 W8093
13 |Twister 200 No Bid
Price per each $15.44 $17.85 $14.30 $14.00
Total Price $3,088.00 $3,570.00 $2,860.00 $2,800.00
Brand & Item No. CSlI 21245 Hasbro 04645 Hasbro 04645 W7506
14 Monopoly 150 No Bid
Price per each $13.88 $16.78 $13.50 $14.10
Total Price $2,082.00 $2,517.00 $2,025.00 $2,115.00
Brand & Item No. CSl 21208 Educators 105441 Hasbro| GA9|
15 |Silly 6 Pins Game 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price per each $18.21
Total Price $455.25
Brand & Item No. Hasbro 41367
16 Memory Game - Spiderman and Friends Edition 140 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price per each $9.28 $14.50
Total Price $1,299.20 $2,030.00
Brand & Item No. Hasbro 53987 Hasbro 41367
17  |Are You Smarther than a Fifth Grader? 125 No Bid No Bid
Price per each $15.36 $18.21 $14.60
Total Price $1,920.00 $2,276.25 $1,825.00
Brand & Item No. CSI 40277000 Hasbro 40277 Hasbro 40277
18 |Taboo for Kids 105 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Price per each
Total Price
Brand & Item No.
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 6, 2009

For: Recreational Games and Sports Equipment Cannon Sports Educator's Outlet Gregg United Sports Pyramid School Products |S&S Worldwide
A795-09 VF/IAA P. 0. Box 11179 P. O. Box 397 P. O. Box 970008 6510 North 54th Street 75 Mill Street
Estimated Burbank, CA Timnath, CO 80547 Boca Raton, FL 33497 Tampa, FL 33610 Colchester, CT 06415
Item Description Annual Quantity]
19 LEGO Big Bulk Set 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price per each $37.00
Total Price $3,700.00
Brand & Item No. Lego LR626
20 [Careers Game 90 No Bid No Bid| No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price per each
Total Price
Brand & Item No.
21 Risk - Star Wars 90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price per each $22.00
Total Price $1,980.00
Brand & Item No. Hasbro 45086
22 Perfection 90 No Bid No Bid
Price per each $18.92 $15.70 $15.95
Total Price $1,702.80 $1,413.00 $1,435.50
Brand & Item No. Hasbro 04060 Hasbro 04060 W2605
23 Battleship 90 No Bid
Price per each $14.88 $17.85 $14.30 $14.40
Total Price $1,339.20 $1,606.50 $1,287.00 $1,296.00
Brand & Item No. CSI 21205 Hasbro 04730 Hasbro 14674 W2774
24  [Classroon K'NEX 105 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price per each $66.00 $64.10
Total Price $6,930.00 $6,730.50
Brand & Item No. Knex 78690 S&S LR1480
25 |Snap Together LaQ Building Set 90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price per each
Total Price
Brand & Item No.
26 |9 High Quality Value Priced Ballons, 144 per pack 270 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price per pack $3.90
Total Price $1,053.00
Brand & Item No. S&S SL2378|
27  |4" Water Balloons, 100 per pack 80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price per pack $5.10
Total Price $408.00
Brand & Item No. S&S SL3502
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 6, 2009
For: Recreational Games and Sports Equipment Cannon Sports Educator's Outlet Gregg United Sports Pyramid School Products |S&S Worldwide
A795-09 VF/IAA P. 0. Box 11179 P. O. Box 397 P. O. Box 970008 6510 North 54th Street 75 Mill Street
Estimated Burbank, CA Timnath, CO 80547 Boca Raton, FL 33497 Tampa, FL 33610 Colchester, CT 06415
Item Description Annual Quantity]
28 [Silver Before and After School Pack 115 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price per each $455.00 $362.02
Total Price $52,325.00 $41,632.30
Brand & Item No. US Games US1237924 S&S BD1
29 bSAFE, bFIT Fitness Program 40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price per each $133.00
Total Price $5,320.00
Brand & Item No. S&S W9099
30 Robic Step & Stride Pedometer Pack, 12 per pack 55 No Bid
Price per each $119.52 $89.30 $98.95 $112.00
Total Price $6,573.60 $4,911.50 $5,442.25 $6,160.00
Brand & Item No. Robic M307/12 & 78900 ROBIC M307| ROBIC M307| S&S W8476
31  [No-Knott Hoops 115 No Bid No Bid
Price per dozen $51.11 $59.88 $38.00
Total Price $5,877.65 $6,886.20 $4,370.00
Brand & Item No. ES Cramer 2105 Champion H3 S&S W5034002
32 [Pedometer Power Book 40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price per each $15.37
Total Price $614.80
Brand & Item No. S&S W8341
33 [Flag Football Belts 130 No Bid
Price per each $0.96 $0.72 $1.49 $1.0746*
Total Price $124.80 $93.60 $193.70 $139.70
Brand & Item No. CSI 2070 Champion FFB1 Champion FFB1YW S&S W3795
34 [Beach Balls, 20" 275 No Bid
Price per each $0.77 $0.61 $1.69 $1.45
Total Price $211.75 $167.75 $464.75 $398.75
Brand & Item No. CSI 2137 Champion 1B12 Champion 1B20| S&S W2394
35  [Nutri-cize Game 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price per each
Total Price
Brand & Item No.
36 [Monster Flying Disk, 24" Diameter 205 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Price per each
Total Price
Brand & Item No.
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 6, 2009
For: Recreational Games and Sports Equipment Cannon Sports Educator's Outlet Gregg United Sports Pyramid School Products |S&S Worldwide
A795-09 VF/IAA P. 0. Box 11179 P. O. Box 397 P. O. Box 970008 6510 North 54th Street 75 Mill Street
Estimated Burbank, CA Timnath, CO 80547 Boca Raton, FL 33497 Tampa, FL 33610 Colchester, CT 06415
Item Description Annual Quantity]
37 Plastic Whistles, 12 per pack 65 No Bid
Price per pack $3.24 $2.40 $4.68 $2.76
Total Price $210.60 $156.00 $304.20 $179.40
Brand & Item No. CSI113027-12] Champion 601 Champion 601 S&S W5896
38 Lanyard, 12 per pack 65 No Bid|
Price per pack $2.76 $2.40 $4.68 $2.88
Total Price $179.40 $156.00 $304.20 $187.20
Brand & Item No. CSI 1345-1350-12 Champion 126 Champion 126 S&S W5897
39 |Wilson Softplay Volleyball 30 No Bid| No Bid| No Bid|
Price per each $7.51 $7.69
Total Price $225.30 $230.70
Brand & Item No. Champion VR5 Tachikara TX5
40 |[Class Plus Pack 35 No Bid| No Bid| No Bid| No Bid| No Bid|
Price per pack
Total Price
Brand & Item No.
41  |Screamin' Orange Agility Ladder 30 No Bid| No Bid|
Pricer per each $52.67 $60.99 $72.00
Total Price $1,580.10 $1,829.70 $2,160.00
Brand & Item No. Champion AGL Champion AGL S&S W7883
42 |Screamin' Orange Training Hurdles, 6 per set 30 No Bid| No Bid| No Bid|
Price per set $21.89 $28.14
Total Price $656.70 $844.20
Brand & Item No. Champion PH6| Champion PH6-6
43 Fitness through Movement: Circuit Training Module 30 No Bid| No Bid| No Bid| No Bid| No Bid|
Price per each
Total Price
Brand & Item No.
44 |Quik-Fit for Kids Total Body Conditioning Program 30 No Bid No Bid| No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price per each
Total Price
Brand & Item No.
45 Basketball 70 No Bid| No Bid No Bid
Price per each $30.79 $33.00
Total Price $2,155.30 $2,310.00
Brand & Item No. Spalding 04075 S&S W5626001
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 6, 2009
For: Recreational Games and Sports Equipment Cannon Sports Educator's Outlet Gregg United Sports Pyramid School Products |S&S Worldwide
A795-09 VF/IAA P. 0. Box 11179 P. O. Box 397 P. O. Box 970008 6510 North 54th Street 75 Mill Street
Estimated Burbank, CA Timnath, CO 80547 Boca Raton, FL 33497 Tampa, FL 33610 Colchester, CT 06415
Item Description Annual Quantity]
46 Food Group Sorting Set 30 No Bid No Bid| No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price per set
Total Price
Brand & Item No.
47  |Weighted Bowling Pin Set 105 No Bid No Bid
Price per set $48.33 $28.99 $38.00
Total Price $5,074.65 $3,043.95 $3,990.00
Brand & Item No. Cramer 21071 Champion #BP10 S&S W2773
48 Hand Pump with hose, 12" 105 No Bid No Bid
Price per each $2.53 $2.39 $3.00
Total Price $265.65 $250.95 $315.00
Brand & Item No. CSI IP12] Champion #IP12 S&S W9247
49  |Spalding Basketball 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price per Each $30.79
Total Price $769.75
Brand & Item No. Spalding 04075
50 |Closed Reel 165' Measuring Tape 15 No Bid No Bid
Price per each $5.86 $6.42 $8.29
Total Price $87.90 $96.30 $124.35
Brand & Item No. CSI 58006 Champion F165 Champion F165
51 |White Field Marking Paint, 3 case pack 20 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price per each $155.46 $45.00
Total Price $3,109.20 $900.00
Brand & Item No. CSI4269/3 S&S W7856
52 [ClassPlus Baseball Glove Pack 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price per pack
Total Price
Brand & Item No.
53 |Tachikara Volley-Lite Volleyball 80 No Bid No Bid
Price per each $23.82 $20.69 $4.60
Total Price $1,905.60 $1,655.20 $368.00
Brand & Item No. Tachikara 61146 Tachikara SV-MNC| Spectrum W8330
54 Heavy Duty Mesh Equipment Bag 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Price per each
Total Price
Brand & Item No.

$3.70
$92.50
CSI 1302/13061/13062
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened:

For:

A795-09

April 6, 2009

Recreational Games and Sports Equipment

VFIAA

Item

Description

Estimated
Annual Quantity|

Cannon Sports

P.O.Box 11179

Burbank, CA

Educator's Outlet

P. O. Box 397

Timnath, CO 80547

Gregg United Sports

P. O. Box 970008

Boca Raton, FL 33497

Pyramid School Products

6510 North 54th Street

Tampa, FL 33610

S&S Worldwide

75 Mill Street

Colchester, CT 06415

55

56

57

58

59

60

61

62

63

64

ATEC Jet Baseball Pitchig Machine
Price per each

Total Price

Brand & Item No.

ATEC Jet Baseballs
Price per dozen
Total Price

Brand & Item No.

Mark V Basketball Scorebook
Price per each

Total Price

Brand & Item No.

V-Neck Referree Jersey, XL
Price per each

Total Price

Brand & Item No.

V-Neck Referree Jersey, XXL
Price per each

Total Price

Brand & Item No.

V-Neck Referee Jersey, XXXL
Price per each

Total Price

Brand & Item No.

Budget Possession Indicator
Price per each

Total Price

Brand & Item No.

Field Glove Adult Set, 9 gloves per set
Price per set

Total Price

Brand & Item No.

Batting Tees
Price per each
Total Price
Brand & Item No.

Catalog Discount

2

200

15

15

10

25

30

35

No Bid

No Bid

$4.25
$850.00
Mark V 191201

$19.34
$290.10
CSI11339

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$16.44
$575.40
CSI 03422

25%

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

15%

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$11.13
$389.55
Champion 90|

45%

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$16.29
$570.15
Champion 90|

15%

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

14%

*Price adjusted for evaluation purposes only.
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 6, 2009
For: Recreational Games and Sports Equipment Sator Sports Sportime Sport Supply Group, Inc. |Toledo Physcial Education|T.A.G. Sales LTD.
Dba BSN Sports Supply
A795-09 VF/AA 1536 W. 228th Street #B |3155 Northwoods Pkwy |P. O. Box 7726 P. O. Box 5618 411 Hunters Creek Dr.
Estimated Torrance, CA 90501 Norcross, GA 30071 Dallas, TX 75209 Toledo, OH 43613 New Braunfels, TX 78132
Item Description Annual Quantity]
1 UNO Stacko Game 65 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price per package $35.76
Total Price $2,324.40
Brand & Item No. MB 43535
2 Monopoly: SA Spurs Edition 165 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price per each
Total Price
Brand & Item No.
3 Chess and Checkers Set 110 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price per pack $6.32 $59.76
Total Price $695.20 $6,573.60
Brand & Item No. BSN NA636 Pressman 3312
4 Bingo Set with Spinner Card 75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price per package $33.36
Total Price $2,502.00
Brand & Item No. Pressman 1165
5 Double-Nine Domino Set 70 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price per package $2.48 $27.84
Total Price $173.60 $1,948.80
Brand & Item No. BSN 2552 Pressman 1621
6 Giant 4 in a Row 80 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price per package $62.22
Total Price $4,977.60
Brand & Item No. Pressman 1024
7 UNO Card Game 105 No Bid No Bid
Price per package $6.52 $7.00 $51.84
Total Price $684.60 $735.00 $5,443.20
Brand & Item No. A/S 1366222 BSN 4036 Mattel 42993
8 Giant Playing Cards 60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price per package $29.82
Total Price $1,789.20
Brand & Item No. RI #GACARJU
9 Playing Cards 635 No Bid No Bid
Price per each $15.69 $12.55 $0.48
Total Price $9,963.15 $7,969.25 $304.80
Brand & Item No. 1003317 BSN NAPC-1] RI #GAPLCAR
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 6, 2009
For: Recreational Games and Sports Equipment Sator Sports Sportime Sport Supply Group, Inc. |Toledo Physcial Education|T.A.G. Sales LTD.
Dba BSN Sports Supply
A795-09 VF/AA 1536 W. 228th Street #B |3155 Northwoods Pkwy |P. O. Box 7726 P. O. Box 5618 411 Hunters Creek Dr.
Estimated Torrance, CA 90501 Norcross, GA 30071 Dallas, TX 75209 Toledo, OH 43613 New Braunfels, TX 78132
Item Description Annual Quantity]
10 |Connect 4 405 No Bid No Bid
Price per each $16.39 $16.42 $12.83
Total Price $6,637.95 $6,650.10 $5,196.15
Brand & Item No. 1224136 BSN 4071 MB 04430
11  |Sorry Game 230 No Bid No Bid
Price per each $19.67 $22.00 $14.98
Total Price $4,524.10 $5,060.00 $3,445.40
Brand & Item No. 1224012 BSN 4042 HASBRO 0390
12 |Snakes and Ladders 195 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price per each $4.57
Total Price $891.15
Brand & Item No. Fundex #2660
13 |Twister 200 No Bid No Bid
Price per each $20.18 $18.06 $13.69
Total Price $4,036.00 $3,612.00 $2,738.00
Brand & Item No. Not Provided| BSN 4072 Hasbro 4645
14 Monopoly 150 No Bid No Bid
Price per each $17.21 $18.75 $12.83
Total Price $2,581.50 $2,812.50 $1,924.50
Brand & Item No. Not Provided| BSN 4034 Hasbro 0009
15 |Silly 6 Pins Game 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price per each
Total Price
Brand & Item No.
16 Memory Game - Spiderman and Friends Edition 140 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price per each $6.83
Total Price $956.20
Brand & Item No. Hasbro 53987
17  |Are You Smarther than a Fifth Grader? 125 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price per each $13.93
Total Price $1,741.25
Brand & Item No. Hasbro 40277
18 |Taboo for Kids 105 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Price per each
Total Price
Brand & Item No.
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 6, 2009
For: Recreational Games and Sports Equipment Sator Sports Sportime Sport Supply Group, Inc. |Toledo Physcial Education|T.A.G. Sales LTD.
Dba BSN Sports Supply
A795-09 VF/AA 1536 W. 228th Street #B |3155 Northwoods Pkwy |P. O. Box 7726 P. O. Box 5618 411 Hunters Creek Dr.
Estimated Torrance, CA 90501 Norcross, GA 30071 Dallas, TX 75209 Toledo, OH 43613 New Braunfels, TX 78132
Item Description Annual Quantity]
19 LEGO Big Bulk Set 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price per each
Total Price
Brand & Item No.
20 [Careers Game 90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price per each
Total Price
Brand & Item No.
21 Risk - Star Wars 90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price per each $20.89
Total Price $1,880.10
Brand & Item No. Hasbro 42332
22 Perfection 90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price per each $15.02
Total Price $1,351.80
Brand & Item No. Hasbro 04060
23 Battleship 90 No Bid No Bid
Price per each $17.21 $19.90 $13.67
Total Price $1,548.90 $1,791.00 $1,230.30
Brand & Item No. 1224154 BSN 4020 Hasbro 04730
24  [Classroon K'NEX 105 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price per each 53.48
Total Price $5,615.40
Brand & Item No. K'Nex 78690
25 |Snap Together LaQ Building Set 90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price per each $54.94
Total Price $4,944.60
Brand & Item No. Mindware 40044
26 |9 High Quality Value Priced Ballons, 144 per pack 270 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price per pack $7.59 $14.43
Total Price $2,049.30 $3,896.10
Brand & Item No. 1006830 RITAG # LSAST09
27 |4" Water Balloons, 100 per pack 80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price per pack $9.59
Total Price $767.20

Brand & Item No.

RI/TAG # LRWATBA
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 6, 2009
For: Recreational Games and Sports Equipment Sator Sports Sportime Sport Supply Group, Inc. |Toledo Physcial Education|T.A.G. Sales LTD.
Dba BSN Sports Supply
A795-09 VF/AA 1536 W. 228th Street #B |3155 Northwoods Pkwy |P. O. Box 7726 P. O. Box 5618 411 Hunters Creek Dr.
Estimated Torrance, CA 90501 Norcross, GA 30071 Dallas, TX 75209 Toledo, OH 43613 New Braunfels, TX 78132
Item Description Annual Quantity]
28  [Silver Before and After School Pack 115 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price per each $322.28 $335.97
Total Price $37,062.20 $38,636.55
Brand & Item No. Not Provided| US Games US1237924
29 bSAFE, bFIT Fitness Program 40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price per each
Total Price
Brand & Item No.
30 Robic Step & Stride Pedometer Pack, 12 per pack 55 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price per each $90.97
Total Price $5,003.35
Brand & Item No. Champion 1083903
31  [No-Knott Hoops 115 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price per dozen $48.35 $48.46
Total Price $5,560.25 $5,572.90
Brand & Item No. Sportime 1006241 USG 02160
32 [Pedometer Power Book 40 No Bid No Bid
Price per each $15.34 $14.21 $21.47
Total Price $613.60 $568.40 $858.80
Brand & Item No. 1018450 35679 SS w8341
33 [Flag Football Belts 130 No Bid
Price per each No Bid No Bid $1.46 $1.04
Total Price $189.80 $135.20
Brand & Item No. BSN 1149524 Champion FFB1
34 [Beach Balls, 20" 275 No Bid No Bid
Price per each $2.45 $0.96 $1.46
Total Price $673.75 $264.00 $401.50
Brand & Item No. Sportime 11004572 As Specified Champion 1B20
35  [Nutri-cize Game 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price per each $184.96 $303.97
Total Price $9,248.00 $15,198.50
Brand & Item No. As Specified US Games US1238235
36 [Monster Flying Disk, 24" Diameter 205 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Price per each
Total Price
Brand & Item No.
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 6, 2009
For: Recreational Games and Sports Equipment Sator Sports Sportime Sport Supply Group, Inc. |Toledo Physcial Education|T.A.G. Sales LTD.
Dba BSN Sports Supply
A795-09 VF/AA 1536 W. 228th Street #B |3155 Northwoods Pkwy |P. O. Box 7726 P. O. Box 5618 411 Hunters Creek Dr.
Estimated Torrance, CA 90501 Norcross, GA 30071 Dallas, TX 75209 Toledo, OH 43613 New Braunfels, TX 78132
Item Description Annual Quantity]
37 Plastic Whistles, 12 per pack 65
Price per pack $5.41 $2.39 $2.16 $6.48 $3.34
Total Price $351.65 $1,864.20* $140.40 $421.20 $217.10
Brand & Item No. Agora SA7400 Acme 1007804 BSN 3059 Champion 603BK Champion 601
38 Lanyard, 12 per pack 65 No Bid|
Price per pack $2.69 $2.18 $5.40 $3.64
Total Price $174.85 $141.70 $351.00 $236.60
Brand & Item No. Sportime 1024729 BSN MSCNYD Cannon Sports 100 Champion 126
39 |Wilson Softplay Volleyball 30 No Bid| No Bid| No Bid|
Price per each $7.08 $8.44
Total Price $212.40 $253.20
Brand & Item No. BSN 1014167 Champion VB6
40 |[Class Plus Pack 35 No Bid| No Bid| No Bid| No Bid|
Price per pack $456.63
Total Price $15,982.05
Brand & Item No. Gopher 01-932
41  |Screamin' Orange Agility Ladder 30 No Bid| No Bid| No Bid|
Pricer per each $23.02 $62.97
Total Price $690.60 $1,889.10
Brand & Item No. Agora SA-6580 Gopher 86-938
42  |Screamin' Orange Training Hurdles, 6 per set 30 No Bid| No Bid| No Bid| No Bid|
Price per set $62.97
Total Price $1,889.10
Brand & Item No. Gopher 68-820
43 Fitness through Movement: Circuit Training Module 30 No Bid| No Bid|
Price per each $30.54 $52.76 $48.63
Total Price $916.20 $1,582.80 $1,458.90
Brand & Item No. Not Provided Sportime 175270 Sportime 1-009942-171
44 |Quik-Fit for Kids Total Body Conditioning Program 30 No Bid No Bid
Price per each $161.29 $188.33 $187.32
Total Price $4,838.70 $5,649.90 $5,619.60
Brand & Item No. Not Provided USG 99834 Sportime 2-012798-171
45 Basketball 70 No Bid
Price per each $36.17 $33.68 $30.12 $24.97
Total Price $2,531.90 $2,357.60 $2,108.40 $1,747.90

Brand & Item No.

Not Provided|

Spalding LBTF1000WC

Spalding HCTF1000|

BSN MCX100XH

Page 12 of 14




City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 6, 2009
For: Recreational Games and Sports Equipment Sator Sports Sportime Sport Supply Group, Inc. |Toledo Physcial Education|T.A.G. Sales LTD.
Dba BSN Sports Supply
A795-09 VF/AA 1536 W. 228th Street #B |3155 Northwoods Pkwy |P. O. Box 7726 P. O. Box 5618 411 Hunters Creek Dr.
Estimated Torrance, CA 90501 Norcross, GA 30071 Dallas, TX 75209 Toledo, OH 43613 New Braunfels, TX 78132
Item Description Annual Quantity]
46 Food Group Sorting Set 30 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price per set $23.37
Total Price $701.10
Brand & Item No. DSS 817FGSS
47  |Weighted Bowling Pin Set 105 No Bid
Price per set $56.90 $61.48 $44.05 $33.97
Total Price $5,974.50 $6,455.40 $4,625.25 $3,566.85
Brand & Item No. Sportime 1005753 USG 1248050 Cramer 30714P Champion BP10
48 Hand Pump with hose, 12" 105
Price per each $2.18 $3.63 $2.42 $4.55 $2.67
Total Price $228.90 $381.15 $254.10 $477.75 $280.35
Brand & Item No. Agora SA-6330 Sportime 9" 11004699 Game Craft MSHNINFSY Martin Sports HP10 Champion IP12
49  |Spalding Basketball 25 No Bid
Price per Each $36.17 $33.68 $30.12 $24.97
Total Price $904.25 $842.00 $753.00 $624.25
Brand & Item No. Spalding 1003775 Spalding LBTF1000WC Spalding KKTF1000 BSN MCX100XH
50 |Closed Reel 165' Measuring Tape 15 No Bid
Price per each $20.68 $6.39 $10.47 $12.67
Total Price $310.20 $95.85 $157.05 $190.05
Brand & Item No. Agora SA-MT100 Macgregor MS7AP165| Champion Sports 22664 BSN MSTAP165
51 |White Field Marking Paint, 3 case pack 20 No Bid No Bid
Price per each $35.53 $104.52 $113.44
Total Price $710.60 $2,090.40 $2,268.80
Brand & Item No. SC-954 BSN 0792PAC BSN 0792PAC
52 [ClassPlus Baseball Glove Pack 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price per pack $1,471.00
Total Price $2,942.00
Brand & Item No. Gopher 02-037
53 |Tachikara Volley-Lite Volleyball 80 No Bid
Price per each $9.28 $23.98 $21.51 $33.87
Total Price $742.40 $1,918.40 $1,720.80 $2,709.60
Brand & Item No. 1029857 BSN 1050905 Tachikara SVMNC] BSN 1050905
54 Heavy Duty Mesh Equipment Bag 25 No Bid
Price per each $8.37 $5.03 $1.92 $5.14
Total Price $209.25 $125.75 $48.00 $128.50
Brand & Item No. Agora SA-CBHO01 Sportime 1030210 BSN SNBCNET] BSN SNBCNET
Draf’
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 6, 2009
For: Recreational Games and Sports Equipment Sator Sports Sportime Sport Supply Group, Inc. |Toledo Physcial Education|T.A.G. Sales LTD.
Dba BSN Sports Supply
A795-09 VF/AA 1536 W. 228th Street #B |3155 Northwoods Pkwy |P. O. Box 7726 P. O. Box 5618 411 Hunters Creek Dr.
Estimated Torrance, CA 90501 Norcross, GA 30071 Dallas, TX 75209 Toledo, OH 43613 New Braunfels, TX 78132
Item Description Annual Quantity]
55 |ATEC Jet Baseball Pitchig Machine 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price per each $96.32 $128.57
Total Price $192.64 $257.14
Brand & Item No. BSN ATEC4300| BSN ATEC4300
56 [ATEC Jet Baseballs 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price per dozen $20.94 $26.84
Total Price $83.76 $107.36
Brand & Item No. BSN ATEC4310| BSN ATEC4310
57 Mark V Basketball Scorebook 200 No Bid
Price per each $6.46 $4.64 $5.20 $1.67
Total Price $1,292.00 $928.00 $1,040.00 $334.00
Brand & Item No. A/S 1003962 BSN MSMARKBK| Mark V 8555 Champion BB1
58 V-Neck Referree Jersey, XL 15 No Bid No Bid
Price per each $15.80 $9.52 $18.59
Total Price $237.00 $142.80 $278.85
Brand & Item No. SC-2002 BSN 1157673 BSN 1157673
59 V-Neck Referree Jersey, XXL 15 No Bid No Bid
Price per each $16.80 $9.52 $19.39
Total Price $252.00 $142.80 $290.85
Brand & Item No. SC-2002 BSN 1157703 BSN 1157703
60 V-Neck Referee Jersey, XXXL 10 No Bid No Bid
Price per each $19.08 $9.52 $20.24
Total Price $190.80 $95.20 $202.40
Brand & Item No. SC-2002 BSN 1157710 BSN 1157710
61 Budget Possession Indicator 25 No Bid No Bid
Price per each $10.47 $9.40 $14.72
Total Price $261.75 $235.00 $368.00
Brand & Item No. BSN 1248395 Getz Corp. GL687| BSN 1248395
62 Field Glove Adult Set, 9 gloves per set 30 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price per set
Total Price
Brand & Item No.
63 Batting Tees 35 No Bid
Price per each $16.90 $9.12 $16.46 $18.74
Total Price $591.50 $319.20 $576.10 $655.90
Brand & Item No. Sportime 1007687 BSN BBBATTEE[ Champion Sports 06640 BSN BBATTEE
64 |Catalog Discount 7% 10% 10% 15% 5%

*Price adjusted for evaluation purposes only.
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