City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 22, 2013
For: Tractors and Mower Attachments Bid #1 Bid #2
Holt Agribusiness Bill's Tractor Bill's Tractor
6100002676 IM 3302 S.W.W.White Rd. {10865 Hwy 87 S 10865 Hwy 87 S
San Antonio, Adkins, Adkins,
Item Description Qty TX 78222 TX 78101 TX 78101
1 Turnkey Unit, Tractor, 4x4 with 15' 2
Batwing Mowing Deck Attachment and
Quick Change Loader Attachment
a Tractor 4x4
Price Each $87,812.14 $71,030.00 $61,868.00
b 15' Batwing Mowing Deck
Price Each $14,931.11 $17,326.00 $17,326.00
Total Price per Turnkey Unit $102,743.25 $88,356.00 $79,194.00
Item Total $205,486.50 $176,712.00 $158,388.00
Production Cut Off Date September 30, 2013 8/31/2013 8/31/2013
Last Day that the City Can Place the September 30, 2013 8/31/2013 8/31/2013
Order
Can the bidder provide the item at the bid No No No

price submitted after the production cut
off date?

Year, Make, Model Offered

Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include
PTO HP)

Specific Make & Model of Attachment

Warranty Provider

Warranty Provider Address

Warranty Specifics - Tractor

Warranty Specifics - Mower

Delivery

2014 Challenger
MT465D

AGCO Power 4.9L; 4
cyl; Tier 4i compliant;
100 PTO HP

Woods BW180XHD

AGCO / Woods / Holt|
Agribusiness

3302 S.W.W. White Rd.,
San Antonio, TX 78222

2 year, 2000 Hours total
machine & concurrent 4
yr, 4000 hour
powertrain

1 year total machine; 6
year gearbox; 10 year|
deck

180 days|

2013 New Holland
T6.155

New Holland T6.155 6T
Tier 4 95 PTO HP
Woods BW1800X

Bill's Tractor / Woods /|
New Holland

10865 Hwy 87 S,
Adkins, TX 78101

24 Months or 2000
Hours

10 year Deck Rust
Through / 6 year
Gearbox

180 days

2013 New Holland
T5.115

New Holland T5.115 6T
Tier 4A CEGR 98 PTO
HP

Woods BW1800X

Bill's Tractor / Woods /
New Holland

10865 Hwy 87 S,
Adkins, TX 78101

24 Months or 2000
Hours

10 year Deck Rust
Through / 6 year
Gearbox

180 days
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 22, 2013
For: Tractors and Mower Attachments Bid #1 Bid #2
Holt Agribusiness Bill's Tractor Bill's Tractor
6100002676 IM 3302 S.W.W.White Rd. |10865 Hwy 87 S 10865 Hwy 87 S
San Antonio, Adkins, Adkins,
Item Description Qty TX 78222 TX 78101 TX 78101
2 Turnkey Unit, Tractor, 4x4 with 7' Mowing 8
Deck Attachment and Quick Change
Loader Attachment
a Tractor 4x4
Price Each $87,812.14 $71,030.00 $61,868.00
b 7' Mowing Deck
Price Each $5,260.05 $5,932.00 $5,932.00
Total Price per Turnkey Unit $93,072.19 $76,962.00 $67,800.00
Item Total $744,577.52 $615,696.00 $542,400.00
Production Cut Off Date September 30, 2013 8/31/2013 8/31/2013
Last Day that the City Can Place the September 30, 2013 8/31/2013 8/31/2013
Order
Can the bidder provide the item at the bid No No No

price submitted after the production cut
off date?

Year, Make, Model Offered

Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include
PTO HP)

Specific Make & Model of Attachment

Warranty Provider

Warranty Provider Address

Warranty Specifics - Tractor

Warranty Specifics - Mower

Delivery

2014 Challenger
MT465D

AGCO Power 4.9L; 4
cyl; Tier 4i compliant;
100 PTO HP

Woods BB8400X

AGCO / Woods / Holt
Agribusiness

3302 S.W.W. White Rd.,
San Antonio, TX 78222

2 year, 2000 Hours total
machine & concurrent 4
yr, 4000 hour
powertrain

1 year total machine; 6
year gearbox; 10 year|
deck

180 days|

2013 New Holland
T6.155

New Holland T6.155 6T
Tier 4 95 PTO HP

Woods BB8400X

Bill's Tractor / Woods /|
New Holland

10865 Hwy 87 S,
Adkins, TX 78101

24 Months or 2000

Hours

6 yr Gearbox

180 days

2013 New Holland
T5.115

New Holland T5.115 6T
Tier 4A CEGR 98 PTO
HP

Woods BB8400X

Bill's Tractor / Woods /
New Holland

10865 Hwy 87 S,
Adkins, TX 78101

24 Months or 2000

Hours

6 yr Gearbox

180 days
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 22, 2013
For: Tractors and Mower Attachments Bid #1 Bid #2
Holt Agribusiness Bill's Tractor Bill's Tractor
6100002676 IM 3302 S.W.W.White Rd. |10865 Hwy 87 S 10865 Hwy 87 S
San Antonio, Adkins, Adkins,
Item Description Qty TX 78222 TX 78101 TX 78101
3 Turnkey Unit, Tractor, 4x4 with Mid- 1
Mount Boom Mower
a Tractor 4x4
Price Each $68,052.00 No Bid No Bid
b Mid-Mount Boom Mower
Price Each $62,559.00 No Bid No Bid
Total Price per Turnkey Unit $130,611.00
Item Total $130,611.00

Production Cut Off Date

Last Day that the City Can Place the
Order

Can the bidder provide the item at the bid
price submitted after the production cut
off date?

Year, Make, Model Offered

Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include
PTO HP)

Specific Make & Model of Attachment

Warranty Provider

Warranty Provider Address

Warranty Specifics - Tractor

Warranty Specifics - Mower

Delivery

N/A - In Stock Unit|

N/A

Yes

2013 Challenger
MT465B w/ 2013
Maverick 24' Boom

Caterpillar C4.4 Engine
95 PTO hp

Alamo Industrial 24"
Maverick w/ 60" Rotary
Head

AGCO & Holt
Agribusiness

3302 S.W.W. White Rd.,
San Antonio, TX 78222

2 year, 2000 Hours total
machine & concurrent 4
yr, 4000 hour
powertrain

1 year limited warranty|
against defects

180 days|
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 22, 2013
For: Tractors and Mower Attachments Bid #1 Bid #2
Holt Agribusiness Bill's Tractor Bill's Tractor
6100002676 IM 3302 S.W.W.White Rd. {10865 Hwy 87 S 10865 Hwy 87 S
San Antonio, Adkins, Adkins,
Item Description Qty TX 78222 TX 78101 TX 78101
4 Turnkey Unit, Tractor, 2WD with 7' 1
Mowing Deck Attachment
a Tractor 2WD
Price Each $84,009.97 $68,788.00 $60,943.00
b 7' Mowing Deck
Price Each $5,260.05 $5,932.00 $5,932.00
Total Price per Turnkey Unit $89,270.02 $74,720.00 $66,875.00
Item Total $89,270.02 $74,720.00 $66,875.00
Production Cut Off Date September 30, 2013 8/31/2013 8/31/2013
Last Day that the City Can Place the September 30, 2013 8/31/2013 8/31/2013
Order
Can the bidder provide the item at the bid No No No

price submitted after the production cut
off date?

Year, Make, Model

Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include
PTO HP)

Specific Make & Model of Attachment

Warranty Provider

Warranty Provider Address

Warranty Specifics - Tractor

Warranty Specifics - Mower

Delivery

2014 Challenger
MT465D

AGCO Power 4.9L; 4
cyl; Tier 4i compliant;
100 PTO HP

Woods BB8400X

AGCO / Woods / Holt
Agribusiness

3302 S.W.W. White Rd.,
San Antonio, TX 78222

2 year, 2000 Hours total
machine & concurrent 4
yr, 4000 hour
powertrain

1 year total machine; 6
year gearbox; 10 year|
deck

180 days|

2013 New Holland
T6.155

New Holland T6.155 6T
Tier 4 95 PTO HP
Woods BB8400X

Bill's Tractor / Woods /|
New Holland

10865 Hwy 87 S,
Adkins, TX 78101

24 Months or 2000

Hours

6 yr Gearbox|

180 days

2013 New Holland
T5.115

New Holland T5.115 6T
Tier 4A CEGR 98 PTO
HP

Woods BB8400X

Bill's Tractor / Woods /
New Holland

10865 Hwy 87 S,
Adkins, TX 78101

24 Months or 2000

Hours

6 yr Gearbox|

180 days
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 22, 2013
For: Tractors and Mower Attachments Bid #1 Bid #2
Holt Agribusiness Bill's Tractor Bill's Tractor
6100002676 IM 3302 S.W.W.White Rd. {10865 Hwy 87 S 10865 Hwy 87 S
San Antonio, Adkins, Adkins,
Item Description Qty TX 78222 TX 78101 TX 78101
5 Turnkey Unit, Tractor, 2WD with 7' 3
Mowing Deck Attachment and Quick
Change for Loader Attachment
a Tractor 2WD
Price Each $87,812.14 $71,030.00 $61,868.00
b 7' Mowing Deck
Price Each $5,260.05 $5,932.00 $5,932.00
Total Price per Turnkey Unit $93,072.19 $76,962.00 $67,800.00
Item Total $279,216.57 $230,886.00 $203,400.00
Production Cut Off Date September 30, 2013 8/31/2013 8/31/2013
Last Day that the City Can Place the September 30, 2013 8/31/2013 8/31/2013
Order
Can the bidder provide the item at the bid No No No

price submitted after the production cut
off date?

Year, Make, Model

Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include
PTO HP)

Specific Make & Model of Attachment

Warranty Provider

Warranty Provider Address

Warranty Specifics - Tractor

Warranty Specifics - Mower

Delivery

2014 Challenger
MT465D

AGCO Power 4.9L; 4
cyl; Tier 4i compliant;
100 PTO HP

Woods BB8400X

AGCO / Woods / Holt
Agribusiness

3302 S.W.W. White Rd.,
San Antonio, TX 78222

2 year, 2000 Hours total
machine & concurrent 4
yr, 4000 hour
powertrain

1 year total machine; 6
year gearbox; 10 year
deck

180 days|

2013 New Holland
T6.155

New Holland T6.155 6T
Tier 4 95 PTO HP
Woods BB8400X

Bill's Tractor / Woods /
New Holland

10865 Hwy 87 S,
Adkins, TX 78101

24 Months or 2000

Hours

6 yr Gearbox|

180 days

2013 New Holland
T5.115

New Holland T5.115 6T
Tier 4A CEGR 98 PTO
HP

Woods BB8400X

Bill's Tractor / Woods /
New Holland

10865 Hwy 87 S,
Adkins, TX 78101

24 Months or 2000

Hours

6 yr Gearbox|

180 days
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 22, 2013
For: Tractors and Mower Attachments Bid #1 Bid #2
Holt Agribusiness Bill's Tractor Bill's Tractor
6100002676 IM 3302 S.W.W.White Rd. {10865 Hwy 87 S 10865 Hwy 87 S
San Antonio, Adkins, Adkins,
Item Description Qty TX 78222 TX 78101 TX 78101
6 Turnkey Unit, Tractor, 2WD with 20' 2
Batwing Mowing Deck Attachment
a Tractor 2WD
Price Each $84,009.97 $68,788.00 $60,943.00
b 20' Batwing Mowing Deck
Price Each $25,782.59 $27,100.00 $27,100.00
Total Price per Turnkey Unit $109,792.56 $95,888.00 $88,043.00
Item Total $219,585.12 $191,776.00 $176,086.00
Production Cut Off Date September 30, 2013 8/31/2013 8/31/2013
Last Day that the City Can Place the September 30, 2013 8/31/2013 8/31/2013
Order
Can the bidder provide the item at the bid No No No

price submitted after the production cut
off date?

Year, Make, Model

Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include
PTO HP)

Specific Make & Model of Attachment

Warranty Provider

Warranty Provider Address

Warranty Specifics - Tractor

Warranty Specifics - Mower

Delivery

Payment Terms

2014 Challenger
MT465D

AGCO Power 4.9L; 4
cyl; Tier 4i compliant;
100 PTO HP

Woods BB8400X

AGCO / Woods / Holt
Agribusiness

3302 S.W.W. White Rd.,
San Antonio, TX 78222

2 year, 2000 Hours total
machine & concurrent 4
yr, 4000 hour
powertrain

1 year total machine; 6
year gearbox; 10 year|
deck

180 days|

Net 30

2013 New Holland
T6.155

New Holland T6.155 6T
Tier 4 95 PTO HP
Woods BW2400X

Bill's Tractor / Woods /
New Holland

10865 Hwy 87 S,
Adkins, TX 78101

24 Months or 2000
Hours

10 yr Deck Rust

Through / 6 yr Gearbox

180 days

Net 30

2013 New Holland
T5.115

New Holland T5.115 6T
Tier 4A CEGR 98 PTO
HP

Woods BW2400X

Bill's Tractor / Woods /
New Holland

10865 Hwy 87 S,
Adkins, TX 78101

24 Months or 2000
Hours

10 yr Deck Rust

Through / 6 yr Gearbox

180 days

Net 30

Total

$1,668,746.73

$1,289,790.00

$1,147,149.00

Page 6



	Draft_Tab

