
City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 25, 2013
For: Annual Contract for Copier & Printer Paper

Clampitt Paper Olmstead-Kirk Paper

6100002235 LS 3550 Ridgeside Dr. 8024 Exchange Dr., Ste. 400

Item Description Estimated 
Quantities

San Antonio,                               
Texas 78217

Austin,                                        
Texas 78754

1 #1 Grade Color Copy, Smooth 96 Brightness, White 1,000 Reams
A Recycled 8 1/2" x 11" Sub 60# text weight

Price Per Mil Recycled No Bid $13.88
Recycled Brand Name and Number Cougar
Post-Consumer Waste 10%
Non-Recycled 8 1/2" x 11" Sub 60# text weight
Price Per Mil $10.14 $10.31
Brand Name and Number Finch Opaque Accent Opaque

B Recycled 8 1/2" x 14" Sub 60# text weight
Price Per Mil Recycled No Bid No Bid
Recycled Brand Name and Number
Post-Consumer Waste
Non-Recycled 8 1/2" x 14" Sub 60# text weight
Price Per Mil No Bid $13.90
Brand Name and Number Accent Opaque

C Recycled 11" x 17" Sub 60# text weight
Price Per Mil Recycled No Bid $29.02
Recycled Brand Name and Number Cougar
Post-Consumer Waste 10%
Non-Recycled 11" x 17" Sub 60# text weight
Price Per Mil $20.28 $21.89
Brand Name and Number Finch Opaque Accent Opaque

D Recycled 12" x 18" Sub 60# text weight
Price Per Mil Recycled No Bid No Bid
Recycled Brand Name and Number
Post-Consumer Waste
Non-Recycled 12" x 18" Sub 60# text weight
Price Per Mil $23.05 $25.27
Brand Name and Number Finch Opaque Accent Opaque

E Recycled 13" x 19" Sub 60# text weight
Price Per Mil Recycled No Bid No Bid
Recycled Brand Name and Number
Post-Consumer Waste
Non-Recycled 13" x 19" Sub 60# text weight
Price Per Mil No Bid No Bid
Brand Name and Number

2 #1 Grade Color Copy Smooth 96 Brightness, White 1,000 Reams
A Recycled 8 1/2" x 11" Sub 28/70# text weight

Price Per Mil Recycled No Bid $16.21
Recycled Brand Name and Number Cougar
Post-Consumer Waste 10%
Non-Recycled 8 1/2" x 11" Sub 28/70# text weight
Price Per Mil $11.64 $12.02
Brand Name and Number Finch Opaque Accent Opaque

B Recycled 8 1/2" x 14" Sub 28/70# text weight
Price Per Mil Recycled No Bid No Bid
Recycled Brand Name and Number
Post-Consumer Waste
Non-Recycled 8 1/2" x 14" Sub 28/70# text weight
Price Per Mil No Bid No Bid
Brand Name and Number

C Recycled 11" x 17" Sub 28/70# text weight
Price Per Mil Recycled No Bid $33.86
Recycled Brand Name and Number Cougar
Post-Consumer Waste 10%
Non-Recycled 11" x 17" Sub 28/70# text weight
Price Per Mil $23.29 $25.51
Brand Name and Number Finch Opaque Accent Opaque

D Recycled 12" x 18" Sub 28/70# text weight
Price Per Mil Recycled No Bid $41.20
Recycled Brand Name and Number Cougar
Post-Consumer Waste 10%
Non-Recycled 12" x 18" Sub 28/70# text weight
Price Per Mil $26.90 No Bid
Brand Name and Number Finch Opaque

E Recycled 13" x 19" Sub 28/70# text weight
Price Per Mil Recycled No Bid No Bid
Recycled Brand Name and Number
Post-Consumer Waste
Non-Recycled 13" x 19" Sub 28/70# text weight
Price Per Mil No Bid No Bid
Brand Name and Number
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 25, 2013
For: Annual Contract for Copier & Printer Paper

Clampitt Paper Olmstead-Kirk Paper

6100002235 LS 3550 Ridgeside Dr. 8024 Exchange Dr., Ste. 400

Item Description Estimated 
Quantities

San Antonio,                               
Texas 78217

Austin,                                        
Texas 78754

3 White Wove Poly Window/No Window Envelopes 500 Boxes
A Recycled #10 (4 1/8" x 9 1/2") Sub 24 w/window

Price Per Mil Recycled No Bid No Bid
Recycled Brand Name and Number
Post-Consumer Waste
Non-Recycled #10 (4 1/8" x 9 1/2") Sub 24 w/window
Price Per Mil $17.29 $18.60
Brand Name and Number Mohawk Wove & National OKCO

B Recycled #9 (3 3/4" x 8 3/4") Sub 24 w/window
Price Per Mil Recycled No Bid No Bid
Recycled Brand Name and Number
Post-Consumer Waste
Non-Recycled #9 (3 3/4" x 8 3/4") Sub 24 w/window
Price Per Mil $19.06 $18.60
Brand Name and Number Mohawk Wove & National OKCO

C Recycled #10 (4 1/8" x 9 1/2") Sub 24 no/window
Price Per Mil Recycled No Bid No Bid
Recycled Brand Name and Number
Post-Consumer Waste
Non-Recycled #10 (4 1/8" x 9 1/2") Sub 24 no/window
Price Per Mil $20.17 $15.89
Brand Name and Number Mohawk Wove & National OKCO

D Recycled #9 (3 3/4" x 8 3/4") Sub 24 no/window
Price Per Mil Recycled No Bid No Bid
Recycled Brand Name and Number
Post-Consumer Waste
Non-Recycled #9 (3 3/4" x 8 3/4") Sub 24 no/window
Price Per Mil $16.31 $15.89
Brand Name and Number Mohawk Wove & National OKCO

4 Color Copy "Bright Hue", Assorted Colors 65 Reams
A Recycled 8 1/2" x 11" Sub 24/60# text weight

Price Per Mil Recycled $14.18 $17.75
Recycled Brand Name and Number Mohawk Brite Hue Astrobrights
Post-Consumer Waste 30% 30%
Non-Recycled 8 1/2" x 11" Sub 24/60# text weight
Price Per Mil No Bid $17.75
Brand Name and Number Astrobrights

B Recycled 8 1/2" x 14" Sub 24/60# text weight
Price Per Mil Recycled $18.05 $22.60
Recycled Brand Name and Number Mohawk Brite Hue Astrobrights
Post-Consumer Waste 30% 30%
Non-Recycled 8 1/2" x 14" Sub 24/60# text weight
Price Per Mil No Bid $22.60
Brand Name and Number Astrobrights

C Recycled 11" x 17" Sub 24/60# text weight
Price Per Mil Recycled $28.34 $35.54
Recycled Brand Name and Number Mohawk Brite Hue Astrobrights
Post-Consumer Waste 30% 30%
Non-Recycled 11" x 17" Sub 24/60# text weight
Price Per Mil No Bid $35.54
Brand Name and Number Astrobrights

D Recycled 12" x 18" Sub 24/60# text weight
Price Per Mil Recycled No Bid No Bid
Recycled Brand Name and Number
Post-Consumer Waste
Non-Recycled 12" x 18" Sub 24/60# text weight No Bid No Bid
Price Per Mil 
Brand Name and Number

E Recycled 13" x 19" Sub 24/60# text weight
Price Per Mil Recycled No Bid No Bid
Recycled Brand Name and Number
Post-Consumer Waste
Non-Recycled 13" x 19" Sub 24/60# text weight
Price Per Mil No Bid No Bid
Brand Name and Number

5 Color Copy "Bright Hue", Assorted Colors 1,000 Reams
A Recycled 8 1/2" x 11" 65# cover weight

Price Per Mil Recycled $28.06 $35.14
Recycled Brand Name and Number Mohawk Brite Hue Astrobrights
Post-Consumer Waste 30% 30%
Non-Recycled 8 1/2" x 11" 65# cover weight
Price Per Mil No Bid $35.14
Brand Name and Number Astrobrights
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 25, 2013
For: Annual Contract for Copier & Printer Paper

Clampitt Paper Olmstead-Kirk Paper

6100002235 LS 3550 Ridgeside Dr. 8024 Exchange Dr., Ste. 400

Item Description Estimated 
Quantities

San Antonio,                               
Texas 78217

Austin,                                        
Texas 78754

B Recycled 8 1/2" x 11" 65# cover weight
Price Per Mil Recycled $28.06 $35.14
Recycled Brand Name and Number Mohawk Brite Hue Astrobrights
Post-Consumer Waste 30% 30%
Non-Recycled 8 1/2" x 11" 65# cover weight
Price Per Mil No Bid $35.14
Brand Name and Number Astrobrights

C Recycled 11" x 17" 65# cover weight
Price Per Mil Recycled $56.11 $70.31
Recycled Brand Name and Number Mohawk Brite Hue Astrobrights
Post-Consumer Waste 30% 30%
Non-Recycled 11" x 17" 65# cover weight
Price Per Mil No Bid $70.31
Brand Name and Number Astrobrights

D Recycled 12" x 18" 65# cover weight
Price Per Mil Recycled No Bid No Bid
Recycled Brand Name and Number
Post-Consumer Waste
Non-Recycled 12" x 18" 65# cover weight
Price Per Mil No Bid No Bid
Brand Name and Number

E Recycled 13" x 19" 65# cover weight
Price Per Mil Recycled No Bid No Bid
Recycled Brand Name and Number
Post-Consumer Waste
Non-Recycled 13" x 19" 65# cover weight
Price Per Mil No Bid No Bid
Brand Name and Number

6 Vellum Finish, Assorted Colors 60 Reams
A Recycled 8 1/2" x 11" 67# cover weight

Price Per Mil Recycled $16.87 $19.78
Recycled Brand Name and Number Springhill Springhill Vellum Bristol
Post-Consumer Waste 10% 10%
Non-Recycled 8 1/2" x 11" 67# cover weight
Price Per Mil No Bid No Bid
Brand Name and Number

B Recycled 8 1/2" x 14" 67# cover weight
Price Per Mil Recycled No Bid No Bid
Recycled Brand Name and Number
Post-Consumer Waste
Non-Recycled 8 1/2" x 14" 67# cover text weight
Price Per Mil No Bid No Bid
Brand Name and Number

C Recycled 11" x 17" 67# cover weight
Price Per Mil Recycled $35.62 $41.58
Recycled Brand Name and Number Springhill Springhill Vellum Bristol
Post-Consumer Waste 10% 10%
Non-Recycled 11" x 17" 67# cover weight
Price Per Mil No Bid No Bid
Brand Name and Number

D Recycled 12" x 18" 67# cover weight
Price Per Mil Recycled No Bid No Bid
Recycled Brand Name and Number
Post-Consumer Waste
Non-Recycled 12" x 18" 67# cover weight
Price Per Mil No Bid No Bid
Brand Name and Number

E Recycled 13" x 19" 67# cover weight
Price Per Mil Recycled No Bid No Bid
Recycled Brand Name and Number
Post-Consumer Waste
Non-Recycled 13" x 19" 67# cover weight
Price Per Mil No Bid No Bid
Brand Name and Number

7 Linen Finish, Assorted Colors including White 60 Reams
A Recycled 8 1/2" x 11" Sub 70# text weight

Price Per Mil Recycled $27.10 $24.32
Recycled Brand Name and Number Howard Linen Royal Sundance Linen
Post-Consumer Waste 30% 30%
Non-Recycled 8 1/2" x 11" Sub 70# text weight
Price Per Mil No Bid No Bid
Brand Name and Number
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 25, 2013
For: Annual Contract for Copier & Printer Paper

Clampitt Paper Olmstead-Kirk Paper

6100002235 LS 3550 Ridgeside Dr. 8024 Exchange Dr., Ste. 400

Item Description Estimated 
Quantities

San Antonio,                               
Texas 78217

Austin,                                        
Texas 78754

B Recycled 8 1/2" x 14" Sub 70# text weight
Price Per Mil Recycled No Bid No Bid
Recycled Brand Name and Number
Post-Consumer Waste
Non-Recycled 8 1/2" x 14" Sub 70# text weight
Price Per Mil No Bid No Bid
Brand Name and Number

C Recycled 11" x 17" Sub 70# text weight
Price Per Mil Recycled $54.20 $49.01
Recycled Brand Name and Number Howard Linen Royal Sundance Linen
Post-Consumer Waste 30% 30%
Non-Recycled 11" x 17" Sub 70# text weight
Price Per Mil No Bid No Bid
Brand Name and Number

D Recycled 12" x 18" Sub 70# text weight
Price Per Mil Recycled No Bid $57.91
Recycled Brand Name and Number Royal Sundance Linen
Post-Consumer Waste 30%
Non-Recycled 12" x 18" Sub 70# text weight
Price Per Mil No Bid No Bid
Brand Name and Number

E Recycled 12 1/2" x 19" Sub 70# text weight
Price Per Mil Recycled No Bid No Bid
Recycled Brand Name and Number
Post-Consumer Waste
Non-Recycled 12 1/2" x 19" Sub 70# text weight
Price Per Mil No Bid No Bid
Brand Name and Number

F Recycled 8 1/2" x 11" Sub 80# cover weight
Price Per Mil Recycled $57.68 $51.96
Recycled Brand Name and Number Howard Linen Royal Sundance Linen
Post-Consumer Waste 30% 30%
Non-Recycled 8 1/2" x 11" Sub 80# cover weight
Price Per Mil No Bid No Bid
Brand Name and Number

G Recycled 8 1/2" x 14" Sub 80# cover weight
Price Per Mil Recycled No Bid No Bid
Recycled Brand Name and Number
Post-Consumer Waste
Non-Recycled 8 1/2" x 14" Sub 80# cover weight
Price Per Mil No Bid No Bid
Brand Name and Number

H Recycled 11" x 17" Sub 80# cover weight
Price Per Mil Recycled No Bid No Bid
Recycled Brand Name and Number
Post-Consumer Waste
Non-Recycled 11" x 17" Sub 80# cover weight
Price Per Mil No Bid No Bid
Brand Name and Number

I Recycled 12" x 18" Sub 80# cover weight
Price Per Mil Recycled No Bid $123.65
Recycled Brand Name and Number Royal Sundance Linen
Post-Consumer Waste 30%
Non-Recycled 12" x 18" Sub 80# cover weight
Price Per Mil No Bid No Bid
Brand Name and Number

J Recycled 13" x 19" Sub 80# cover weight
Price Per Mil Recycled No Bid $141.36
Recycled Brand Name and Number Royal Sundance Linen
Post-Consumer Waste 30%
Non-Recycled 13" x 19" Sub 80# cover weight
Price Per Mil No Bid No Bid
Brand Name and Number

8 #1 Grade White Digital Opaque or similar paper 500 Reams
A Recycled 8 1/2" x 11" Sub 60# text weight

Price Per Mil Recycled No Bid $13.83
Recycled Brand Name and Number Cougar Opaque
Post-Consumer Waste 10%
Non-Recycled 8 1/2" x 11" Sub 60# text weight
Price Per Mil $10.14 $10.31
Brand Name and Number Finch Opaque Accent Opaque
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 25, 2013
For: Annual Contract for Copier & Printer Paper

Clampitt Paper Olmstead-Kirk Paper

6100002235 LS 3550 Ridgeside Dr. 8024 Exchange Dr., Ste. 400

Item Description Estimated 
Quantities

San Antonio,                               
Texas 78217

Austin,                                        
Texas 78754

B Recycled 11" x 17" Sub 60# text weight
Price Per Mil Recycled No Bid $21.89
Recycled Brand Name and Number Cougar Opaque
Post-Consumer Waste 10%
Non-Recycled 11" x 17" Sub 60# text weight
Price Per Mil $20.38 $13.90
Brand Name and Number Finch Opaque Accent Opaque

C Recycled 12" x 18" Sub 60# text weight
Price Per Mil Recycled No Bid No Bid
Recycled Brand Name and Number
Post-Consumer Waste
Non-Recycled 12" x 18" Sub 60# text weight
Price Per Mil $23.05 $25.87
Brand Name and Number Finch Opaque Accent Opaque

D Recycled 8 1/2" x 11" Sub 70# text weight
Price Per Mil Recycled No Bid $16.21
Recycled Brand Name and Number Cougar Opaque
Post-Consumer Waste 10%
Non-Recycled 8 1/2" x 11" Sub 70# text weight
Price Per Mil $11.64 $12.02
Brand Name and Number Finch Opaque Accent Opaque

E Recycled 11" x 17" Sub 70# text weight
Price Per Mil Recycled No Bid $33.86
Recycled Brand Name and Number Cougar Opaque
Post-Consumer Waste 10%
Non-Recycled 11" x 17" Sub 70# text weight
Price Per Mil $23.29 $25.51
Brand Name and Number Finch Opaque Accent Opaque

F Recycled 12" x 18" Sub 70# text weight
Price Per Mil Recycled No Bid $41.20
Recycled Brand Name and Number Cougar Opaque
Post-Consumer Waste 10%
Non-Recycled 12" x 18" Sub 70# text weight
Price Per Mil $26.90 $29.47
Brand Name and Number Finch Opaque Accent Opaque

9 Economy Color Copy, White 300 Reams
A Recycled 11" x 17" Sub 80# text weight

Price Per Mil Recycled $24.78 $40.78
Recycled Brand Name and Number Pro Digital Cougar Opaque
Post-Consumer Waste 10% 10%
Non-Recycled 11" x 17" Sub 80# text weight
Price Per Mil No Bid $29.16
Brand Name and Number Accent Opaque

B Recycled 12" x 18" Sub 80# text weight
Price Per Mil Recycled $27.87 $47.09
Recycled Brand Name and Number Pro Digital Cougar Opaque
Post-Consumer Waste 10% 10%
Non-Recycled 12" x 18" Sub 80# text weight
Price Per Mil No Bid $33.70
Brand Name and Number Accent Opaque

C Recycled 13" x 19" Sub 80# text weight 
Price Per Mil Recycled $31.64 No Bid
Recycled Brand Name and Number Pro Digital
Post-Consumer Waste 10%
Non-Recycled 13" x 19" Sub 80# text weight
Price Per Mil No Bid No Bid
Brand Name and Number
Economy Color Copy Gloss, White 300 Reams

D Recycled 11" x 17" Sub 100# text weight
Price Per Mil Recycled $30.20 $30.00
Recycled Brand Name and Number Pro Digital Pro Digital
Post-Consumer Waste 10% 10%
Non-Recycled 11" x 17" Sub 100# text weight
Price Per Mil No Bid $36.40
Brand Name and Number Blazer

E Recycled 12" x 18" Sub 100# text weight
Price Per Mil Recycled $34.84 $27.68
Recycled Brand Name and Number Pro Digital Pro Digital
Post-Consumer Waste 10% 10%
Non-Recycled 12" x 18" Sub 100# text weight
Price Per Mil No Bid $42.10
Brand Name and Number Blazer
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 25, 2013
For: Annual Contract for Copier & Printer Paper

Clampitt Paper Olmstead-Kirk Paper

6100002235 LS 3550 Ridgeside Dr. 8024 Exchange Dr., Ste. 400

Item Description Estimated 
Quantities

San Antonio,                               
Texas 78217

Austin,                                        
Texas 78754

F Recycled 13" x 19" Sub 100# text weight 
Price Per Mil Recycled $39.02 $32.29
Recycled Brand Name and Number Pro Digital 

* 12 1/2" x 19"
Pro Digital

Post-Consumer Waste 10% 10%
Non-Recycled 13" x 19" Sub 100# text weight
Price Per Mil No Bid No Bid
Brand Name and Number
Economy Color Copy Gloss, White 500 Reams

G Recycled 11" x 17" Sub 80# cover weight
Price Per Mil Recycled $47.34 $46.86
Recycled Brand Name and Number Pro Digital Pro Digital
Post-Consumer Waste 10% 10%
Non-Recycled 11" x 17" Sub 80# cover weight
Price Per Mil No Bid $49.54
Brand Name and Number Blazer

H Recycled 12" x 18" Sub 80# cover weight
Price Per Mil Recycled $53.87 $53.33
Recycled Brand Name and Number Pro Digital Pro Digital
Post-Consumer Waste 10% 10%
Non-Recycled 12" x 18" Sub 80# cover weight
Price Per Mil No Bid $56.37
Brand Name and Number Blazer

I Recycled 13" x 19" Sub 80# cover weight 
Price Per Mil Recycled $62.90 $61.41
Recycled Brand Name and Number Pro Digital Pro Digital
Post-Consumer Waste 10% 10%
Non-Recycled 13" x 19" Sub 80# cover weight
Price Per Mil No Bid $64.09
Brand Name and Number Blazer
Economy Color Copy Gloss, White 500 Reams

J Recycled 11" x 17" Sub 100# cover weight 
Price Per Mil Recycled $58.76 $58.18
Recycled Brand Name and Number Pro Digital Pro Digital
Post-Consumer Waste 10% 10%
Non-Recycled 11" x 17" Sub 100# cover weight 
Price Per Mil No Bid $61.49
Brand Name and Number Blazer

K Recycled 12" x 18" Sub 100# cover weight 
Price Per Mil Recycled $67.73 $67.06
Recycled Brand Name and Number Pro Digital Pro Digital
Post-Consumer Waste 10% 10%
Non-Recycled 12" x 18" Sub 100# cover weight 
Price Per Mil No Bid $70.88
Brand Name and Number Blazer

L Recycled 13" x 19" Sub 100# cover weight 
Price Per Mil Recycled $82.71 $76.76
Recycled Brand Name and Number Pro Digital Pro Digital
Post-Consumer Waste 10% 10%
Non-Recycled 13" x 19" Sub 100# cover weight 
Price Per Mil No Bid $81.13
Brand Name and Number Blazer

10 Cast Coated: C1S White 50 Reams
A Recycled 8 1/2" x 11" 8 pt cover weight 

Price Per Mil Recycled $45.02 No Bid
Recycled Brand Name and Number Mohawk Color Copy Ultra Gloss
Post-Consumer Waste 30%
Non-Recycled 8 1/2" x 11" 8 pt cover weight 
Price Per Mil No Bid No Bid
Brand Name and Number

B Recycled 11" x 17" 8 pt cover weight 
Price Per Mil Recycled $89.99 No Bid
Recycled Brand Name and Number Mohawk Color Copy Ultra Gloss
Post-Consumer Waste 30%
Non-Recycled 11" x 17" 8 pt cover weight 
Price Per Mil No Bid No Bid
Brand Name and Number

C Recycled 12" x 18" 8 pt cover weight 
Price Per Mil Recycled $112.23 No Bid
Recycled Brand Name and Number Mohawk Color Copy Ultra Gloss
Post-Consumer Waste 30%
Non-Recycled 12" x 18" 8 pt cover weight 
Price Per Mil No Bid No Bid
Brand Name and Number
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 25, 2013
For: Annual Contract for Copier & Printer Paper

Clampitt Paper Olmstead-Kirk Paper

6100002235 LS 3550 Ridgeside Dr. 8024 Exchange Dr., Ste. 400

Item Description Estimated 
Quantities

San Antonio,                               
Texas 78217

Austin,                                        
Texas 78754

D Recycled 13" x 19" 8 pt cover weight 
Price Per Mil Recycled No Bid No Bid
Recycled Brand Name and Number
Post-Consumer Waste
Non-Recycled 13" x 19" 8 pt cover weight 
Price Per Mil No Bid No Bid
Brand Name and Number
Cast Coated: C1S White 50 Reams

E Recycled 8 1/2" x 11" 10 pt cover weight 
Price Per Mil Recycled $57.55 No Bid
Recycled Brand Name and Number Mohawk Color Copy Cover
Post-Consumer Waste 30%
Non-Recycled 8 1/2" x 11" 10 pt cover weight 
Price Per Mil No Bid $63.70
Brand Name and Number Chromolux

F Recycled 11" x 17" 10 pt cover weight 
Price Per Mil Recycled $115.11 No Bid
Recycled Brand Name and Number Mohawk Color Copy Cover
Post-Consumer Waste 30%
Non-Recycled 11" x 17" 10 pt cover weight 
Price Per Mil No Bid $127.42
Brand Name and Number Chromolux

G Recycled 12" x 18" 10 pt cover weight 
Price Per Mil Recycled $132.96 No Bid
Recycled Brand Name and Number Mohawk Color Copy Cover
Post-Consumer Waste 30%
Non-Recycled 12" x 18" 10 pt cover weight 
Price Per Mil No Bid $147.18
Brand Name and Number Chromolux

H Recycled 13" x 19" 10 pt cover weight 
Price Per Mil Recycled No Bid No Bid
Recycled Brand Name and Number
Post-Consumer Waste
Non-Recycled 13" x 19" 10 pt cover weight 
Price Per Mil No Bid No Bid
Brand Name and Number
Cast Coated: C2S White 50 Reams

I Recycled 8 1/2" x 11" 10 pt cover weight 
Price Per Mil Recycled No Bid No Bid
Recycled Brand Name and Number
Post-Consumer Waste
Non-Recycled 8 1/2" x 11" 10 pt cover weight 
Price Per Mil No Bid No Bid
Brand Name and Number

J Recycled 11" x 17" 10 pt cover weight 
Price Per Mil Recycled No Bid No Bid
Recycled Brand Name and Number
Post-Consumer Waste
Non-Recycled 11" x 17" 10 pt cover weight 
Price Per Mil No Bid No Bid
Brand Name and Number

K Recycled 12" x 18" 10 pt cover weight 
Price Per Mil Recycled No Bid No Bid
Recycled Brand Name and Number
Post-Consumer Waste
Non-Recycled 12" x 18" 10 pt cover weight 
Price Per Mil No Bid No Bid
Brand Name and Number

L Recycled 13" x 19" 10 pt cover weight 
Price Per Mil Recycled No Bid No Bid
Recycled Brand Name and Number
Post-Consumer Waste
Non-Recycled 13" x 19" 10 pt cover weight 
Price Per Mil No Bid No Bid
Brand Name and Number

11 #1 Grade Enamel Silk Finish, White 100 Reams
A Recycled 8 1/2" x 11" Sub 70# text weight

Price Per Mil Recycled No Bid No Bid
Recycled Brand Name and Number
Post-Consumer Waste
Non-Recycled 8 1/2" x 11" Sub 70# text weight
Price Per Mil No Bid No Bid
Brand Name and Number
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 25, 2013
For: Annual Contract for Copier & Printer Paper

Clampitt Paper Olmstead-Kirk Paper

6100002235 LS 3550 Ridgeside Dr. 8024 Exchange Dr., Ste. 400

Item Description Estimated 
Quantities

San Antonio,                               
Texas 78217

Austin,                                        
Texas 78754

B Recycled 11" x 17" Sub 70# text weight
Price Per Mil Recycled $22.03 No Bid
Recycled Brand Name and Number Pro Digital
Post-Consumer Waste 10%
Non-Recycled 11" x 17" Sub 70# text weight
Price Per Mil No Bid No Bid
Brand Name and Number

C Recycled 12" x 18" Sub 70# text weight
Price Per Mil Recycled No Bid No Bid
Recycled Brand Name and Number
Post-Consumer Waste
Non-Recycled 12" x 18" Sub 70# text weight
Price Per Mil No Bid No Bid
Brand Name and Number

D Recycled 8 1/2" x 11" Sub 80# text weight
Price Per Mil Recycled No Bid No Bid
Recycled Brand Name and Number
Post-Consumer Waste
Non-Recycled 8 1/2" x 11" Sub 80# text weight
Price Per Mil No Bid No Bid
Brand Name and Number

E Recycled 11" x 17" Sub 80# text weight
Price Per Mil Recycled $24.78 No Bid
Recycled Brand Name and Number Pro Digital
Post-Consumer Waste 10%
Non-Recycled 11" x 17" Sub 80# text weight
Price Per Mil No Bid No Bid
Brand Name and Number

F Recycled 12" x 18" Sub 80# text weight
Price Per Mil Recycled $27.87 $27.68
Recycled Brand Name and Number Pro Digital Pro Digital
Post-Consumer Waste 10% 10%
Non-Recycled 12" x 18" Sub 80# text weight
Price Per Mil No Bid No Bid
Brand Name and Number

G Recycled 8 1/2" x 11" Sub 100# text weight
Price Per Mil Recycled No Bid No Bid
Recycled Brand Name and Number
Post-Consumer Waste
Non-Recycled 8 1/2" x 11" Sub 100# text weight
Price Per Mil No Bid No Bid
Brand Name and Number

H Recycled 11" x 17" Sub 100# text weight
Price Per Mil Recycled $24.78 No Bid
Recycled Brand Name and Number Pro Digital
Post-Consumer Waste 10%
Non-Recycled 11" x 17" Sub 100# text weight
Price Per Mil No Bid No Bid
Brand Name and Number

I Recycled 12" x 18" Sub 100# text weight
Price Per Mil Recycled $39.02 $34.60
Recycled Brand Name and Number Pro Digital 

* 12 1/2" x 19"
Pro Digital

Post-Consumer Waste 10% 10%
Non-Recycled 12" x 18" Sub 100# text weight
Price Per Mil No Bid No Bid
Brand Name and Number

J Recycled 8 1/2" x 11" Sub 120# text weight
Price Per Mil Recycled No Bid No Bid
Recycled Brand Name and Number
Post-Consumer Waste
Non-Recycled 8 1/2" x 11" Sub 120# text weight
Price Per Mil No Bid No Bid
Brand Name and Number

K Recycled 11" x 17" Sub 120# text weight
Price Per Mil Recycled No Bid No Bid
Recycled Brand Name and Number
Post-Consumer Waste
Non-Recycled 11" x 17" Sub 120# text weight
Price Per Mil No Bid No Bid
Brand Name and Number

Prepared by Purchasing 4/23/2013 Page 8



City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 25, 2013
For: Annual Contract for Copier & Printer Paper

Clampitt Paper Olmstead-Kirk Paper

6100002235 LS 3550 Ridgeside Dr. 8024 Exchange Dr., Ste. 400

Item Description Estimated 
Quantities

San Antonio,                               
Texas 78217

Austin,                                        
Texas 78754

L Recycled 8 1/2" x 11" Sub 120# text weight
Price Per Mil Recycled No Bid No Bid
Recycled Brand Name and Number
Post-Consumer Waste
Non-Recycled 8 1/2" x 11" Sub 120# text weight
Price Per Mil No Bid No Bid
Brand Name and Number

M Recycled 12" x 18" Sub 120# text weight
Price Per Mil Recycled No Bid No Bid
Recycled Brand Name and Number
Post-Consumer Waste
Non-Recycled 12" x 18" Sub 120# text weight
Price Per Mil No Bid No Bid
Brand Name and Number

N Recycled 8 1/2" x 11" Sub 80# cover weight
Price Per Mil Recycled No Bid No Bid
Recycled Brand Name and Number
Post-Consumer Waste
Non-Recycled 8 1/2" x 11" Sub 80# cover weight
Price Per Mil No Bid No Bid
Brand Name and Number

O Recycled 11" x 17" Sub 80# cover weight
Price Per Mil Recycled No Bid No Bid
Recycled Brand Name and Number
Post-Consumer Waste
Non-Recycled 11" x 17" Sub 80# cover weight
Price Per Mil No Bid No Bid
Brand Name and Number

P Recycled 12" x 18" Sub 80# cover weight
Price Per Mil Recycled No Bid $53.33
Recycled Brand Name and Number Pro Digital
Post-Consumer Waste 10%
Non-Recycled 12" x 18" Sub 80# cover weight
Price Per Mil No Bid No Bid
Brand Name and Number

Q Recycled 8 1/2" x 11" Sub 100# cover weight
Price Per Mil Recycled No Bid No Bid
Recycled Brand Name and Number
Post-Consumer Waste
Non-Recycled 8 1/2" x 11" Sub 100# cover weight
Price Per Mil No Bid No Bid
Brand Name and Number

R Recycled 11" x 17" Sub 100# cover weight
Price Per Mil Recycled No Bid No Bid
Recycled Brand Name and Number
Post-Consumer Waste
Non-Recycled 11" x 17" Sub 100# cover weight
Price Per Mil No Bid No Bid
Brand Name and Number

S Recycled 12" x 18" Sub 100# cover weight
Price Per Mil Recycled No Bid $67.06
Recycled Brand Name and Number Pro Digital
Post-Consumer Waste 10%
Non-Recycled 12" x 18" Sub 100# cover weight
Price Per Mil No Bid No Bid
Brand Name and Number

T Recycled 8 1/2" x 11" Sub 120# cover weight
Price Per Mil Recycled No Bid No Bid
Recycled Brand Name and Number
Post-Consumer Waste
Non-Recycled 8 1/2" x 11" Sub 120# cover weight
Price Per Mil No Bid No Bid
Brand Name and Number

U Recycled 11" x 17" Sub 120# cover weight
Price Per Mil Recycled No Bid No Bid
Recycled Brand Name and Number
Post-Consumer Waste
Non-Recycled 11" x 17" Sub 120# cover weight
Price Per Mil No Bid No Bid
Brand Name and Number

V Recycled 12" x 18" Sub 120# cover weight
Price Per Mil Recycled No Bid No Bid
Recycled Brand Name and Number
Post-Consumer Waste
Non-Recycled 12" x 18" Sub 120# cover weight
Price Per Mil No Bid No Bid
Brand Name and Number
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 25, 2013
For: Annual Contract for Copier & Printer Paper

Clampitt Paper Olmstead-Kirk Paper

6100002235 LS 3550 Ridgeside Dr. 8024 Exchange Dr., Ste. 400

Item Description Estimated 
Quantities

San Antonio,                               
Texas 78217

Austin,                                        
Texas 78754

12 Classic Crest-Premier Text, Assorted Colors including White 100 Reams
A Recycled 8 1/2" x 11" Sub 70# text weight

Price Per Mil Recycled No Bid $31.75
Recycled Brand Name and Number Classic Crest
Post-Consumer Waste 30%
Non-Recycled 8 1/2" x 11" Sub 70# text weight
Price Per Mil No Bid No Bid
Brand Name and Number

B Recycled 11" x 17" Sub 70# text weight
Price Per Mil Recycled No Bid No Bid
Recycled Brand Name and Number
Post-Consumer Waste
Non-Recycled 11" x 17" Sub 70# text weight
Price Per Mil No Bid No Bid
Brand Name and Number

C Recycled 12" x 18" Sub 70# text weight
Price Per Mil Recycled No Bid No Bid
Recycled Brand Name and Number
Post-Consumer Waste
Non-Recycled 12" x 18" Sub 70# text weight
Price Per Mil No Bid No Bid
Brand Name and Number

D Recycled 8 1/2" x 11" Sub 80# text weight
Price Per Mil Recycled No Bid $36.30
Recycled Brand Name and Number Classic Crest
Post-Consumer Waste 30%
Non-Recycled 8 1/2" x 11" Sub 80# text weight
Price Per Mil $36.63 No Bid
Brand Name and Number Classic Crest

E Recycled 11" x 17" Sub 80# text weight
Price Per Mil Recycled No Bid No Bid
Recycled Brand Name and Number
Post-Consumer Waste
Non-Recycled 11" x 17" Sub 80# text weight
Price Per Mil No Bid No Bid
Brand Name and Number

F Recycled 12" x 18" Sub 80# text weight
Price Per Mil Recycled No Bid $85.33
Recycled Brand Name and Number Classic Crest
Post-Consumer Waste 30%
Non-Recycled 12" x 18" Sub 80# text weight
Price Per Mil $84.66 No Bid
Brand Name and Number Classic Crest

G Recycled 8 1/2" x 11" Sub 80# cover weight
Price Per Mil Recycled $68.05 $71.00
Recycled Brand Name and Number Classic Crest Classic Crest
Post-Consumer Waste 100% 30%
Non-Recycled 8 1/2" x 11" Sub 80# cover weight
Price Per Mil $65.25 $68.64
Brand Name and Number Classic Crest

H Recycled 11" x 17" Sub 80# cover weight
Price Per Mil Recycled No Bid No Bid
Recycled Brand Name and Number
Post-Consumer Waste
Non-Recycled 11" x 17" Sub 80# cover weight
Price Per Mil No Bid No Bid
Brand Name and Number

I Recycled 12" x 18" Sub 80# cover weight
Price Per Mil Recycled $157.24 $167.70
Recycled Brand Name and Number Classic Crest Classic Crest
Post-Consumer Waste 100% 30%
Non-Recycled 12" x 18" Sub 80# cover weight
Price Per Mil $154.65 $161.28
Brand Name and Number Classic Crest

J Recycled 8 1/2" x 11" Sub 100# cover weight
Price Per Mil Recycled No Bid $96.10
Recycled Brand Name and Number Classic Crest
Post-Consumer Waste 10%
Non-Recycled 8 1/2" x 11" Sub 100# cover weight
Price Per Mil No Bid $91.44
Brand Name and Number Classic Crest
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 25, 2013
For: Annual Contract for Copier & Printer Paper

Clampitt Paper Olmstead-Kirk Paper

6100002235 LS 3550 Ridgeside Dr. 8024 Exchange Dr., Ste. 400

Item Description Estimated 
Quantities

San Antonio,                               
Texas 78217

Austin,                                        
Texas 78754

K Recycled 11" x 17" Sub 100# cover weight
Price Per Mil Recycled No Bid No Bid
Recycled Brand Name and Number
Post-Consumer Waste
Non-Recycled 11" x 17" Sub 100# cover weight
Price Per Mil No Bid No Bid
Brand Name and Number

L Recycled 12" x 18" Sub 100# cover weight
Price Per Mil Recycled $208.98 $214.15
Recycled Brand Name and Number Classic Crest Classic Crest
Post-Consumer Waste 100% 30%
Non-Recycled 12" x 18" Sub 100# cover weight
Price Per Mil $205.75 $211.60
Brand Name and Number Classic Crest Classic Crest

M Recycled 8 1/2" x 11" Sub 110# cover weight
Price Per Mil Recycled $93.55 $105.91
Recycled Brand Name and Number Classic Crest Classic Crest
Post-Consumer Waste 100% 100%
Non-Recycled 8 1/2" x 11" Sub 110# cover weight
Price Per Mil $96.38 105.91
Brand Name and Number Classic Crest Classic Crest

N Recycled 11" x 17" Sub 120# cover weight
Price Per Mil Recycled No Bid No Bid
Recycled Brand Name and Number
Post-Consumer Waste
Non-Recycled 11" x 17" Sub 120# cover weight
Price Per Mil No Bid No Bid
Brand Name and Number

O Recycled 12" x 18" Sub 120# cover weight
Price Per Mil Recycled $272.08 No Bid
Recycled Brand Name and Number Classic Crest 

* 18" x 12", 130#
Post-Consumer Waste 30%
Non-Recycled 12" x 18" Sub 120# cover weight
Price Per Mil No Bid No Bid
Brand Name and Number

13 Color Copy Paper Assorted Colors 100 Reams
A Recycled 8 1/2" x 11" Sub 20# text weight

Price Per Mil Recycled $8.81 $9.40
Recycled Brand Name and Number Hammermill Hammermill
Post-Consumer Waste 30% 10%
Non-Recycled 8 1/2" x 11" Sub 20# text weight
Price Per Mil No Bid No Bid
Brand Name and Number

B Recycled 11" x 17" Sub 20# text weight
Price Per Mil Recycled $18.63 $19.80
Recycled Brand Name and Number Hammermill Hammermill
Post-Consumer Waste 30% 10%
Non-Recycled 11" x 17" Sub 20# text weight
Price Per Mil No Bid No Bid
Brand Name and Number

C Recycled 8 1/2" x 11" Sub 24/60# text weight
Price Per Mil Recycled $9.78 $10.39
Recycled Brand Name and Number Springhill Opaque Springhill Opaque
Post-Consumer Waste 30% 10%
Non-Recycled 8 1/2" x 11" Sub 24/60# text weight
Price Per Mil No Bid No Bid
Brand Name and Number

D Recycled 11" x 17" Sub 24/60# text weight
Price Per Mil Recycled $20.50 $22.04
Recycled Brand Name and Number Springhill Opaque Springhill Opaque
Post-Consumer Waste 30%
Non-Recycled 11" x 17" Sub 24/60# text weight
Price Per Mil No Bid No Bid
Brand Name and Number

14 Digital Carbonless Paper for High Speed Digital Printers, 2 part NCR 500 Reams
A 8 1/2" x 11" - reversed sequence, 20lb.

Price Per Mil $13.41 $39.20
Brand Name and Number Excel One Appleton NCR

B 8 1/2" x 14" - reversed sequence, 20lb.
Price Per Mil $17.16 $49.86
Brand Name and Number Excel One Appleton NCR
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 25, 2013
For: Annual Contract for Copier & Printer Paper

Clampitt Paper Olmstead-Kirk Paper
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Quantities

San Antonio,                               
Texas 78217

Austin,                                        
Texas 78754

C 9" x 11" - vertical perforation, reversed sequence 20 lb.
Price Per Mil $26.07 $39.83
Brand Name and Number Excel One Appleton NCR

D 8 1/2" x 11 1/2" - horizontal perforation, reversed sequence, 20lb.
Price Per Mil $25.58 $39.83
Brand Name and Number Excel One Appleton NCR
Digital Carbonless Paper for High Speed Digital Printers, 3 part NCR 500 Reams

E 8 1/2" x 11" - reversed sequence, 20lb.
Price Per Mil $15.14 $44.10
Brand Name and Number Excel One Appleton NCR

F 8 1/2" x 14" - reversed sequence, 20lb.
Price Per Mil $19.38 $56.00
Brand Name and Number Excel One Appleton NCR

G 9" x 11" - vertical perforation, reversed sequence 20 lb.
Price Per Mil $29.25 $44.75
Brand Name and Number Excel One Appleton NCR

H 8 1/2" x 11 1/2" - horizontal perforation, reversed sequence, 20lb.
Price Per Mil $28.70 $44.75
Brand Name and Number Excel One Appleton NCR
Digital Carbonless Paper for High Speed Digital Printers, 4 part NCR 200 Reams

I 8 1/2" x 11" - reversed sequence, 20lb.
Price Per Mil $16.18 $47.20
Brand Name and Number Excel One Appleton NCR

J 8 1/2" x 14" - reversed sequence, 20lb.
Price Per Mil $20.71 $59.90
Brand Name and Number Excel One Appleton NCR

K 9" x 11" - vertical perforation, reversed sequence 20 lb.
Price Per Mil $31.32 $47.80
Brand Name and Number Excel One Appleton NCR

L 8 1/2" x 11 1/2" - horizontal perforation, reversed sequence, 20lb.
Price Per Mil $30.72 $47.80
Brand Name and Number Excel One Appleton NCR
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