City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 28, 2013 Alternate Bid 1
For: Moving Services AARDYARK Keith Moving, Inc. |Abeco Contractting, Inc, Abeco Contractting, Inc, Graebel San Antonio Movers
DBA Modular Moving DBA Modular Moving
Concepts Concepts
6100002268 JF 11351 Wickwilde 315 E. Euclid 315 E. Euclid 6421 Roy Richards Dr
Estimated San Antonio, San Antonio, Schertz,
Item Description Annual TX 78023 TX 78212 TX 78212 TX 78154
Quantity
1 Labor & Equipment
A Supervisor rate
Normal business hour rate 820
Price per hour $28.00 $27.00 No Bid $29.00
Total price $22,960.00 $22,140.00 $23,780.00
Overtime hour rate 200
Price per hour $42.00 $40.50 No Bid $28.00
Total price $8,400.00 $8,100.00 $5,600.00
B Worker rate
Normal business hour rate 2,300
Price per hour $26.00 $23.50 No Bid $17.80
Total price $59,800.00 $54,050.00 $40,940.00
Overtime hour rate 580
Price per hour $39.00 $35.25 No Bid $17.75
Total price $22,620.00 $20,445.00 $10,295.00
C Cargo vehicle with driver
Normal business hour rate 1,280
Price per hour $53.00 $51.00 No Bid $42.00
Total price $67,840.00 $65,280.00 $53,760.00
Overtime hour rate 320
Price per hour $79.50 $64.00 No Bid $41.50
Total price $25,440.00 $20,480.00 $13,280.00
2 Material Cost
A Roll of Tape 50
Price per tape $0.98 $8.50 No Bid $1.00
Total price $49.00 $425.00 $50.00
B Quick set boxes
3.0 Box 50
Price per box $1.50 $2.50 No Bid $1.50
Total price $75.00 $125.00 $75.00
2 4.5 Box 50
Price per box $1.50 $2.75 No Bid $1.75
Total price $75.00 $137.50 $87.50
3 6.0 Box 50
Price per box $1.50 $3.80 No Bid $2.25
Total price $75.00 $190.00 $112.50
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 28, 2013 Alternate Bid 1
For: Moving Services AARDYARK Keith Moving, Inc. [Abeco Contractting, Inc, Abeco Contractting, Inc, Graebel San Antonio Movers
DBA Modular Moving DBA Modular Moving
Concepts Concepts
6100002268 JF 11351 Wickwilde 315 E. Euclid 315 E. Euclid 6421 Roy Richards Dr
Estimated [|Helotes, San Antonio, San Antonio, Schertz,
Item Description Annual [TX 78023 TX 78212 TX 78212 TX 78154
Quantity
C Non-static bubble wrap, per 200’ roll 1
Price per box $42.00 $37.29 No Bid $90.00
Total price $42.00 $37.29 $90.00
Payment Terms Net 30 1.5% 10 day, net 30 No Bid Net 30

Prepared by Purchasing 3/5/2013




	Sheet1

