
City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: October 5, 2012
For: COMPACT & HALF TON TRUCKS

Caldwell Country 
Chevrolet

Caldwell Country Ford Grande Truck Center Gunn Chevrolet Philpott Motors

6100001886 SC PO Box 27 PO Box 27 4562 IH 10 East 12602 IH 35 N 1400 Hwy. 69

Item Description  Qty
Caldwell,                       
TX 77836

Caldwell,                        
TX 77836

San Antonio,                  
TX 78219

San Antonio,              
TX 78233

Nederland,                     
TX 77627

1 Compact Pick-Up Truck, Extended Cab 4

Price Each $23,770.00 $19,283.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Item Total $95,080.00 $77,132.00
Make & Model & Year Offered 2012-2014 Chevrolet 

Colorado Ext. Cab 
SWB C515653

2013 Ford F150 Super 
Cab X1C SWB

Production Cut-Off Date December 31, 2013 April 2013
Last Day that the City Can Place the Order December 31, 2013 April 2013
Delivery 280 Days 120 Days

2 Full Size, 1/2 Ton Trucks, Extended Cab 2
Price Each NO BID $18,724.00 $19,287.00 $21,885.90 $19,363.92
Item Total $37,448.00 $38,574.00 $43,771.80 $38,727.84
Make & Model & Year Offered 2013 Ford F150 Super 

Cab X1C SWB
2013 X1C Ford F150 

Super Cab
2013 Chevrolet 

Silverado Ext. Cab
2013 Ford Ext. Cab

Production Cut-Off Date April 2013 February 1, 2013 June 2013 May 1, 2013
Last Day that the City Can Place the Order April 2013 December 31, 2012 January 10, 2013 May 1, 2013
Delivery 120 Days 75-90 Days 120 Days 60-90 Days

3 Full Size, 1/2 Ton Trucks, Extended Cab, 
Color Gray/Silver, Blue or Green Exterior

5

Price Each NO BID $18,844.00 $19,287.00 $21,885.90 Gray/Silver 
$22,140.90 Green/Blue

$19,363.92

Item Total $94,220.00 $96,435.00 $109,429.50 
Gray/Silver 

$110,704.50 
Green/Blue

$96,819.60

Make & Model & Year Offered 2013 Ford F150 Super 
Cab X1C SWB

2013 Ford F150 Super 
Cab

2013 Chevrolet 
Silverado Ext. Cab

2013 Ford Ext. Cab

Production Cut-Off Date April 2013 February 1, 2013 June 2013 May 1, 2013
Last Day that the City Can Place the Order April 2013 December 31, 2012 January 10, 2013 May 1, 2013
Delivery 120 Days 75-90 Days 120 Days 60-90 Days

4 Full Size, 1/2 Ton Trucks, Extended Cab, 
Color Black & White w/ Black Fiberglass 
Tonneau Cover

7

Price Each NO BID $21,225.00 $21,853.00 $23,635.90 $21,491.77
Item Total $148,575.00 $152,971.00 $165,451.30 $150,442.39
Make & Model & Year Offered 2013 Ford F150 Super 

Cab X1C SWB
2013 X1C Ford F150 

Super Cab
2013 Chevrolet Ext. 

Cab CC10753
2013 Ford Ext.Cab

Production Cut-Off Date April 2013 February 1, 2013 June 2013 May 1, 2013
Last Day that the City Can Place the Order April 2013 December 31, 2012 January 10, 2013 May 1, 2013
Delivery 120 Days 75-125 Days 120 Days 90-120 Days
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