
            City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 18, 2012

For: Food Service Supplies for Senior Services Division

All American Poly Central Poly Corp. Sanivac/Davis Mfg.

6100001518 DD 40 Turner Place 2400 Bedle Place 1023 Morales St.

Item Description Estimated
 Quantities

Piscataway,
NJ 08854

Linden,
NJ 07036

San Antonio, 
TX 78207

1 Nylon hairnets, large, dark brown, light weight
Price Per Case 50 No Bid $61.68 $14.80
Price Total $3,084.00 $740.00

Brand Name and Number Ammex #HN2413 Cellucap/HN400DBS
Number of Hairnets per Box 100 144
Number of Boxes per Case 10 N/A

2 General Purpose Disposable Polythene Gloves, Medium
Price Per Case 25 No Bid $34.84 $46.40
Price Total $871.00 $1,160.00

Brand Name and Number IBS #HYBF002 Food Service RR-G300m
Number of Gloves per Dispenser Box 100 1,000
Number of Dispenser Boxes per Case 10 10

3 General Purpose Disposable Polyethene Gloves, Large
Price Per Cases 50 No Bid $34.84 $46.40
Price Total $1,742.00 $2,320.00

Brand Name and Number IBS #HYBF003 Food Services RR-G3002
Number of Gloves per Dispencer Box 100 1,000
Number of Dispenser Boxes per Case 10 10

4 T-Shirt/Grocery Bags, White 8"x5"x18" , 6 mil gauge
Price Per Case 300 No Bid No Bid $24.30
Price Total $7,290.00
Brand Name and Number ELKAYCT1318
Number of Bags Per Case 1,000

5 Can Liners, 23"x10"x39", Super Tuff, White or Clear
Can liners, 33 gallon
Price Per Case 100 $17.93 $15.40 $18.80
Price Total $1,793.00 $1,540.00 $1,880.00
Brand Name and Number 231039 AAP Central Poly #CP231039N White Super Tuff RR-3339xHW
Number of Bags per Box 150 150 150
Number of Boxes per Case 1 1 1

6 Can liners, 22"x16"x58", Super Tuff, White and Clear
Can Liners, 58 Gallon
Price Per Case 200 $24.59 $14.80 $21.44
Price Total $4,918.00 $2,960.00 $4,288.00

Brand Name and Number 221658 AAP Central Poly #CP221658N White Super Tuff RR-3858xHW
Number of Bags per Box 100 100 100
Number of Boxes per Case 1 1 1

7 Cups, 8 oz, Styrofoam, White
Price Per Case 75 No Bid No Bid $20.01
Price Total $1,500.75

Brand Name and Number Dart 8J8
Number of Cups Per Case 1,000

8 Cups, 8 oz., Squat Foam, White
Price Per Case 125 No Bid No Bid $36.80
Price Total $4,600.00

Brand Name and Number 8SJ20
Number of Cups Per Case 1,000

9 Plates, 6", Single Compartment, White, Stryofoam
Price Per Case 20 No Bid No Bid $17.76
Price Total $355.20
Brand Name and Number Genpak 80600
Number of Plates per Sleeve 125
Number of Sleeves per Case 6
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10 Forks, Full Size, Plastic, Heavyweight, Clear
Price Per Case 20 No Bid No Bid $34.21
Price Total $684.20

Brande Name and Number Darnel Bistro DU-9120000
Number of Forks per Case 1,000

11 Spoons, Full Size, Plastic, Heavyweight, Clear

Price Per Case 20 No Bid No Bid $34.21
Price Total $684.20

Brand Name and Number Darnel Bistro Du 94210000
Number of Spoons per Case 1,000

12 Knives, Full Size, Plastic, Heavyweight, Clear

Price Per Case 20 No Bid No Bid $34.21
Price Total $684.20
Brand Name and Number Darnel Bistro DU 92210000
Number Knives per Case 1,000

13 Wrapped Cutlery Kit with Fork, Spoon, Knife and Napkin
Full Size
Price Per Case 3,250 No Bid No Bid $18.04
Price Total $58,630.00
Brand Name and Number AB-MK5
Number of Kits per Case 250

14 Disposable Napkins, White, 13"x12" open, 1-ply, Recycled

Price Per Case 125 No Bid No Bid $45.53
Price Total $5,691.25

Brand Name and Number Cascade 197-1837
Number of Packages per Case 13"x12"

18/334=6012 cs

15 Jumbo Straws, Translucent, Wrapped, 7 3/4"
Price Per Box 1,000 No Bid No Bid $60.24
Price Total $60,240.00

Brand Name and Number Primsource 76009731
Size 775 Jumbstraw Clear Paper

Wrapped

Number of Straws per Pack 500
Number of Packs per Box 24

16 Paper Towels, Kitchen, 2-ply, White 9"x11"
Price Per Case 50 No Bid $31.66 $22.36
Price Total $1,583.00 $1,118.00

Brand Name and Number Atlas #A585 Roses Bella Donna
Towel and Ply Size 2 Ply, 11x18, 86 Shts 9x11 2 Ply - 85 Sheet Roll
Number of Rolls per Case 30 30

17 Single FoldPaper Towels, 1-ply, 9 1/2"x10 1/4", Natural White
Price Per Case 100 No Bid $19.30 $19.74
Price Total $1,930.00 $1,974.00
Brand Name and Number Putney #P600 Brywest/Primesource 75004301
Towel and Ply Size 1 Ply, 9 1/4x10 1/4, 12-334 10.5x9.3
Number of Packs per Case 12 16
Number of Towels per Pack 334 250

Estimated Annual Total $6,711.00 $13,710.00 $153,839.80
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