City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: March 30, 2012
For: Medical Supplies
B & E Medical Supply & [Bound Tree Medical, LLC |Cardinal Health, Inc. Henry Schein, Inc. Midwest Medical Supply,
6100001197 VE Equipment, LLC 5000 Tuttle Crossing Blvd|7000 Cardinal Place (PO Box 3227 LLC
1933 Fredericksburg Rd [Dublin, OH 43016 Dublin, OH 43017 Irmo, SC 29063 13400 Lakefront Drive
Ste 106 Earth City, MO 63045
Item Description Estimated Qty. [San Antonio, TX 78201
A Specified ltems
1 Adult Disposable Resuscitator with Mask 2,280 Each
Price Per Unit $12.00 $9.24 $10.58 $9.06 $10.70
Line Total $27,360.00 $21,067.20 $24,122.40 $20,656.80 $24,396.00
MFR Name: AMBU SPUR AMBU SPUR AMBU SPUR AMBU SPUR AMBU SPUR
Product # 521 611 000 BTM 521611000 521 611 000 521 611 000 521 611 000
2 Airway, ColorBerman 40mm, Non-Sterile 500 Each
Price Per Unit $0.85 $0.15 $0.12 $0.14 $0.14
Line Total $425.00 $75.00 $60.00 $70.00 $70.00
MFR Name: Progressive Medical Teleflex Teleflex Teleflex Teleflex
Product # 12974 BTM 021001 121801 121801 TEL121801
Qty per Case: 5 50 50 100 50
3 Airway, ColorBerman 50mm, Non-Sterile 500 Each
Price Per Unit $0.85 $0.16 $0.12 $0.15 $0.14
Line Total $425.00 $80.00 $60.00 $75.00 $70.00
MFR Name: Progressive Medical Teleflex Teleflex Teleflex Teleflex
Product # 12975 BTM 76-121850EA 121850 121850 TEL121850
Qty per Case: 5 50 50 100 50
4 Airway, PVC Nasal, 14F, Single Use 650 Each
Price Per Unit $1.80 $2.40 $1.82 $2.52 $2.06
Line Total $1,170.00 $1,560.00 $1,183.00 $1,638.00 $1,339.00
MFR Name: Progressive Medical Teleflex Teleflex Teleflex Teleflex
Product # 51151 BTM 023314 123314 123314 TEL123314
Qty per Case: 5 10 10 100 10
5 Airway, Soft PVC Nasal, 16F, Single Use 650 Each
Price Per Unit $1.80 $2.40 $1.82 $2.52 $2.06
Line Total $1,170.00 $1,560.00 $1,183.00 $1,638.00 $1,339.00
MFR Name: Progressive Medical Teleflex Teleflex Teleflex Teleflex
Product # 51152 BTM 023316 123316 123316 TEL123316
Qty per Case: 5 10 10 100 10
6 Airway, Soft PVC Nasal, 18F, Single Use 400 Each
Price Per Unit $1.80 $2.40 $1.82 $2.52 $2.06
Line Total $720.00 $960.00 $728.00 $1,008.00 $824.00
MFR Name: Progressive Medical Teleflex Teleflex Teleflex Teleflex
Product # 51153 BTM 023318 123318 123318 TEL123318
Qty per Case: 5 10 10 100 10
7 Airway, Soft PVC Nasal, 20F, Single Use 400 Each
Price Per Unit $1.80 $2.33 $2.14 $2.27 $2.06
Line Total $720.00 $932.00 $856.00 $908.00 $824.00
MFR Name: Progressive Medical Teleflex Teleflex Teleflex Teleflex
Product # 51154 BTM 023320 123320 123320 TEL123320
Qty per Case: 5 10 10 100 10
8 Airway, Soft PVC Nsal, 24F, Single Use 400 Each
Price Per Unit $1.80 $2.33 $2.14 $2.27 $2.06
Line Total $720.00 $932.00 $856.00 $908.00 $824.00
MFR Name: Progressive Medical Teleflex Teleflex Teleflex Teleflex
Product # 51156 BTM 023324 123324 123324 TEL123324
Qty per Case: 5 10 10 100 10
9 Albuterol Sulfate Solution for Inhalation, Vials 10,250 Each
Price Per Unit $0.17 $0.1548 $0.13 $0.19 $0.16
Line Total $1,742.50 $1,586.70 $1,332.50 $1,947.50 $1,640.00
MFR Name: Nephron Pharm Nephron Pharm Nephron Pharm Nephron Pharm Nephron Pharm
Product # NDC 00487-950125 BTM 9501-25 NDC 00487-950125 487950125 NDC 00487-950125
Qty per Box: 25 25 25 25 25
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10 Alcohol, Isopropyl 70%, 16 oz Bottle 1560 Each
Price Per Unit $1.64 $1.79 $1.27 $0.97 $1.19
Line Total $2,558.40 $2,792.40 $1,981.20 $1,513.20 $1,856.40
MFR Name: McKesson Medline| Hydrox| Cumberland Swan Hydrox|
Product # 49176 BTM 201001 D0022 81043 HYDDO0022
Qty per Box: 12 12 12 12 12
11 Amiodarone Vial 50 mg/ml 2800 Each
Price Per Unit $1.55 $3.50 $1.39 $1.79 $1.70
Line Total $4,340.00 $9,800.00 $3,892.00 $5,012.00 $4,760.00
MFR Name: Bioniche Pharm Abraxis Bioscience Bioniche Pharm Mylan Bioniche Pharm
Product # NDC 674570015303 BTM 0616-03| NDC 674570015303 67457015303 674570-015303
12 Aneroid Sphygmomanometer, Adult Large 100 Each
Price Per Unit $7.00 $8.65 $22.41 $8.43 $5.70
Line Total $700.00 $865.00 $2,241.00 $843.00 $570.00
MFR Name: Medsource Int'l ADC| Mabis Healthcare| American Diagnostic Basic
Product # MS-BP200 BTM 2611-77624 75-100-021 776XZ MTH70002
13 Aneroid Sphygmomanometer, Adult 100 Each
Price Per Unit $6.25 $7.22 $12.48 $7.73 $5.70
Line Total $625.00 $722.00 $1,248.00 $773.00 $570.00
MFR Name: Medsource Int'l ADC| American Diagnostics American Diagnostic Basic
Product # MS-BP100 BTM H1648 776Z 7762 MTH70001
14 Aneroid Sphygmomanometer, Child 100 Each
Price Per Unit $5.75 $7.22 $22.41 $7.02 $5.70
Line Total $575.00 $722.00 $2,241.00 $702.00 $570.00
MFR Name: Medsource Int'l ADC Mabis Healthcare| American Diagnostic Basic
Product # MS-BP300 BTM 2611-77603 75-100-025 776CHS MTH70003
15 Aspirin, Adult, Chewable, 81 mg 267 Cases
Price Per Unit $0.88 $0.82 $54.00 $7.21 $9.36
Line Total $234.96 $2,627.28 $14,418.00 $1,925.07 $2,499.12
MFR Name: McKesson Capital Wholesale Wakon New World Import Gericare
Product # 555693 BTM 375016 1322395 OCA36 GER911-36
Qty per Case: 12 24 24 10 12
16 Baby Bunting, Sterilized Metalized 200 Each
Price Per Unit $5.54 $3.31 $4.61 $3.10 $2.43
Line Total $1,108.00 $662.00 $922.00 $620.00 $486.00
MFR Name: Moore Medical GAM Ind. Duromed GAM Primacare
Product # 43842 BTM 444006 40-06 4006 PRICS-6835
Qty per Case: 1 24 1 20 1
17 Bag Vomit Emesis Sickness 15,500 Each
Price Per Unit $0.38 $0.40 $0.44 $0.27 $0.41
Line Total $5,890.00 $6,200.00 $6,820.00 $4,185.00 $6,355.00
MFR Name: Medline Industries Frontline Innov Medline Medline Medline
Product # NON70600 BTM 1071-1000 NON70600 NON70600 MED NON70600
Qty per Case: 500 600 Not Specified 240 25
18 Bandage, Co-Flex, 2" x 5yd, Latex 180 Cases
Price Per Unit $37.20 $51.84 $41.04 $42.98 $21.24
Line Total $6,696.00 $9,331.20 $7,387.20 $7,736.40 $3,823.20
MFR Name: 3M Andover Healthcare 3M Medical Andover Coated Dukal
Product # 172312 BTM 12525BL CAH 25LFCP 5200BL-048 DUK8025DB
Qty per Case: 12 Not Specified 72 36 36
19 Bandage, Co-Flex, 3" x 5 yd, Latex 290 Cases
Price Per Unit $36.60 $40.32 $30.53 $35.55 $18.96
Line Total $10,614.00 $11,692.80 $8,853.70 $10,309.50 $5,498.40
MFR Name: 3M Andover Healthcare Andover Andover Coated Dukal
Product # 172313 BTM 1121-02402 5200BL-024 5300BL DUK8035DB
Qty per Case: 12 24 24 24 24
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20 Bandage, Triangular, 37" x 37" x 52" 4800 Each
Price Per Unit $0.37 $0.35790 $0.37 $0.30 $0.32
Line Total $1,776.00 $1,717.92 $1,776.00 $1,440.00 $1,536.00
MFR Name: McKesson Dukal Palm Tree Group Dukal Dukal
Product # 540284 BTM 276-TB37 Duct B40A CTB40 DUKTB37
Qty per Case: 72 240 240 240 240
21 Bandaid, Flexible Fabric 40 Cases
Price Per Unit $88.00 $46.80 $48.72 $44.21 $40.56
Line Total $3,520.00 $1,872.00 $1,948.80 $1,768.40 $1,622.40
MFR Name: McKesson Dynarex Derma Sciences Dynarex Dukal
Product # 466872 BTM F165200 15215 3612 Duk7609
Qty per Case: 24 24 120 24 24
22 Blades, Non-Plasic Disposable, Miller 0 60 Each
Price Per Unit $5.71 $3.81 $5.64 $4.28 $3.55
Line Total $342.60 $228.60 $338.40 $256.80 $213.00
MFR Name: SunMed SunMed Not Specified SunMed SunMed
Product # 5-5333-00 BTM 025330 5-5333-00 5-5333-00 SUN 5-5333-00
Qty per Case: 20 20 20 20 20
23 Blades, Non-Plasic Disposable,Miller 2 200 Each
Price Per Unit $5.71 $3.81 $5.86 $4.28 $3.55
Line Total $1,142.00 $762.00 $1,172.00 $856.00 $710.00
MFR Name: SunMed SunMed Not Specified SunMed SunMed
Product # 5-5333-02 BTM 025332 5-5333-02 5-5333-02 SUN 5-5333-02
Qty per Case: 20 20 20 20 20
24 Blades, Non-Plasic Disposable, Mac 2 500 Each
Price Per Unit $5.71 $3.81 $5.64 $4.28 $3.55
Line Total $2,855.00 $1,905.00 $2,820.00 $2,140.00 $1,775.00
MFR Name: SunMed SunMed Not Specified SunMed SunMed
Product # 5-5332-02 BTM 025302 5-5332-02 5-5332-02 SUN 5-5332-02
Qty per Case: 20 20 20 20 20
25 Blades, Non-Plasic Disposable, Mac 3 1,000 Each
Price Per Unit $5.71 $3.81 $5.79 $4.28 $3.55
Line Total $5,710.00 $3,810.00 $5,790.00 $4,280.00 $3,550.00
MFR Name: SunMed SunMed Not Specified SunMed SunMed
Product # 5-5332-03 BTM 025303 5-5332-03 5-5332-03 SUN 5-5332-03
Qty per Case: 20 20 20 20 20
26 Blades, Non-Plasic Disposable, Mac 4 1,780 Each
Price Per Unit $5.71 $3.81 $5.79 $4.28 $3.55
Line Total $10,163.80 $6,781.80 $10,306.20 $7,618.40 $6,319.00
MFR Name: SunMed SunMed Not Specified SunMed SunMed
Product # 5-5332-04 BTM 025304 5-5332-04 5-5332-04 SUN 5-5332-04
Qty per Case: 20 20 Not Specified 20 20
27 Blanket, Light Weight, Fleece, Orange 1200 Each
Price Per Unit $18.76 $8.22 $3.04 Delete $5.15
Line Total $22,512.00 $9,864.00 $3,648.00 $6,180.00
MFR Name: Taylor Healthcare Taylor Healthcare Taylor Healthcare Taylor Healthcare
Product # 60-OFB5080 BTM 3271-52915 60-OFB5080 TAY60-OFB5080
28 Blanket, Poly Yellow, 50" x 84" 13,750 Each
Price Per Unit $3.42 $2.80 $3.04 $4.33 $1.65
Line Total $47,025.00 $38,511.00 $41,800.00 $59,537.50 $22,687.50
MFR Name: Graham Medical Graham Medical Graham Medical MedSource Dukal
Product # 53382 BTM 351-53382 53382 MS-40525 Duk7303
Qty per Case: 25 25 25 10 50
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29 Burn Sheet, Blue, 60" x 96", Sterile 500 Each
Price Per Unit $1.16 $2.78 $1.48 $1.68 $2.19
Line Total $580.00 $1,390.00 $740.00 $840.00 $1,095.00
MFR Name: Medsource Int'l Dukal Allcare Inc. All Care Primacare
Product # MS-BS0033 BTM 276-7605EA B5100 BS100 PRIBD-3151
Qty per Case: 25 12 25 10 12
30 Canister, Quickdraw, Replacement 600 Each
Price Per Unit $16.95 $13.75 $0.55 $12.96 $13.10
Line Total $10,170.00 $8,250.00 $330.00 $7,776.00 $7,860.00
MFR Name: S-Scor Inc. Sscor S-Scor Inc. Motion S-Scor Inc.
Product # 2480 BTM 590522 NF2480 2480-20 PMP99915
Qty per Case: 1 20 20 10 20
31 Canister, Suction 800CC with Red Lid 500 Each
Price Per Unit $2.87 $2.70 $2.45 $1.94 $2.06
Line Total $1,435.00 $1,350.00 $1,225.00 $970.00 $1,030.00
MFR Name: Bemis Bemis Bemis Bemis Bemis
Product # 424410 BTM 592041 424410 424410 BEM424410
Qty per Case: 100 100 100 48 100
32 Cannula, Nasal Adult with 7 foot Supply 1,250 Each
Price Per Unit $0.26 $0.28920 $3.31 $0.19 $0.23
Line Total $325.00 $361.50 $4,137.50 $237.50 $287.50
MFR Name: Medsource Int'l Ventlab Care Fusion Ningbo Basic
Product # MS-24004 BTM 87-1107 002707 C0209 MTHMS-24004
Qty per Case: 50 50 25 50 50
33 Cannula, Nasal Adult, Conventional 17,000 Each
Price Per Unit $0.26 $0.24 $3.99 $0.19 $0.24
Line Total $4,420.00 $4,080.00 $67,830.00 $3,230.00 $4,080.00
MFR Name: Medsource Int'l Ventlab Care Fusion Ningbo Ventlab
Product # MS-24003 BTM 14645 1007-25 C0201 VEN1007
Qty per Case: 50 50 25 50 50
34 Catherter IV IAG Sterile, Green 36,000 Each
Price Per Unit $2.53 $2.18 $2.18 $2.05 $2.07
Line Total $91,080.00 $78,480.00 $78,480.00 $73,800.00 $74,520.00
MFR Name: Becton Dickinson Becton Dickinson Becton Dickinson Becton Dickinson Becton Dickinson
Product # 381444 BTM 355181 381444 381444 B/D 381444
35 Catherter IV IAG Sterile, Pink 36,400 Each
Price Per Unit $2.53 $2.18 $2.18 $2.05 $2.07
Line Total $92,092.00 $79,352.00 $79,352.00 $74,620.00 $75,348.00
MFR Name: Becton Dickinson Becton Dickinson Becton Dickinson Becton Dickinson Becton Dickinson
Product # 381433 BTM C012322 381433 381433 B/D 381433
36 Catherter IV IAG Sterile, Orange 20,000 Each
Price Per Unit $2.67 $2.32 $2.29 $2.16 $2.18
Line Total $53,400.00 $46,400.00 $45,800.00 $43,200.00 $43,600.00
MFR Name: Becton Dickinson Becton Dickinson Becton Dickinson Becton Dickinson Becton Dickinson
Product # 381467 BTM 355141 381467 381467 B/D 381467
37 Catherter IV IAG Sterile, Gray 10,000 Each
Price Per Unit $2.67 $2.32 $2.29 $2.16 $2.18
Line Total $26,700.00 $23,200.00 $22,900.00 $21,600.00 $21,800.00
MFR Name: Becton Dickinson Becton Dickinson Becton Dickinson Becton Dickinson Becton Dickinson
Product # 381454 BTM 355161 381454 381454 B/D 381454
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38 Collar Adjustable, Ace Perfit, Mini 600 Each
Price Per Unit $6.69 $4.75 $10.67 $4.39 $5.14
Line Total $4,014.00 $2,850.00 $6,402.00 $2,634.00 $3,084.00
MFR Name: Laerdal Medical Ambu Ambu Ambu Ambu
Product # 980020 BTM 260280 000-281-106 000-281-106 AMBO000-281-106
Qty per Case: 20 30 30 30 30
39 Collar Adjustable, Ace Perfit, Adult 9,300 Each
Price Per Unit $6.69 $4.47 $10.67 $4.39 $5.14
Line Total $62,217.00 $41,571.00 $99,231.00 $40,827.00 $47,802.00
MFR Name: Laerdal Medical Ambu Ambu Ambu Ambu
Product # 980010 BTM 260281 000-281-000 281000 AMBO000-281-000
Qty per Case: 50 30 30 30 30
40 Container, Disposable Sharps, 1 Quart 1,500 Each
Price Per Unit $1.95 $1.81 $2.23 $1.58 $1.63
Line Total $2,925.00 $2,715.00 $3,345.00 $2,370.00 $2,445.00
MFR Name: Kendall Healthcare Kendall Healthcare Kendall Healthcare Kendall Healthcare Kendall Healthcare
Product # 8900SA BTM 298900 8900SA 8900SA KEN8900SA
41 Container, Disposable Sharps, 5 Quart 640 Each
Price Per Unit $4.62 $4.27 $4.67 $3.73 $3.82
Line Total $2,956.80 $2,732.80 $2,988.80 $2,387.20 $2,444.80
MFR Name: Kendall Healthcare Kendall Healthcare Kendall Healthcare Kendall Healthcare Kendall Healthcare
Product # 85131 BTM 5810-8513 85131 85131 KEN85131
42 Cuff Blood Pressure, Adult 100 Each
Price Per Unit $3.37 $5.2360 $0.19 $5.34 $8.27
Line Total $337.00 $523.60 $19.00 $534.00 $827.00
MFR Name: Casmed Philips Welch Allyn Pal Medical Philips
Product # ST-2635-20 BTM M457A 305033135A M4575B PHLM4575B
Qty per Case: 20 10 20 1 1
43 Cuff Blood Pressure, Adult, Large 100 Each
Price Per Unit $3.78 $5.2360 $8.47 $5.34 $8.27
Line Total $378.00 $523.60 $847.00 $534.00 $827.00
MFR Name: Casmed Philips Philips Pal Medical Philips
Product # ST-3242-20 BTM M4577A M4577R M4577B PHLM4577B
Qty per Case: 20 10 10 1 1
44 Dressing, Multi-Trauma, Sterile 1,000 Each
Price Per Unit $0.47 $1.17 $1.70 $1.15 $0.95
Line Total $470.00 $1,170.00 $1,700.00 $1,150.00 $950.00
MFR Name: Medsource Int'l Dynarex Palm Tree Group Dukal Primacare
Product # MS-GZM001 BTM 9280 3050 3050 PRI WT-7705
Qty per Case: 25 Not Specified 25 10 48
45 Dressing, Veni Gard, IV Stablization 56,000 Each
Price Per Unit $0.30 $0.3614 $0.47 $0.45 $0.36
Line Total $16,800.00 $20,238.40 $26,320.00 $25,200.00 $20,160.00
MFR Name: Medsunline Conmed Con Med Con Med ConMed
Product # MTR-IV101 BTM 354431 705-4431 705-4431 CON705-4431
Qty per Case: 100 500 500 500 500
46 Envirocide, Surface, 1 gal Bottles 800 Each
Price Per Unit $6.34 $24.86 $20.88 $20.60 $11.90
Line Total $5,072.00 $19,888.00 $16,704.00 $16,480.00 $9,520.00
MFR Name: Metrex Metrex Metrex Viro Safetec
Product # 13-3300 BTM 200128 13 3300 13-3300 SAF24815
Qty per Case: 4 4 4 4 4
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47 Epinephrine Ampule Injection 1ml 750 Boxes
Price Per Unit $43.12 $29.25 No Bid $27.04 $38.25
Line Total $32,340.00 $21,937.50 $20,280.00 $28,687.50
MFR Name: Hospira Hospira Hospira Hospira
Product # 724101 BTM 0641142035 07241-01 ABBO7241-01
Qty per Box: 25 Not Specified 25 25
48 Extension Set 8" Standard Bore T-Port 38,900 Each
Price Per Unit $3.69 $2.33 $2.67 $2.77 $2.19
Line Total $143,541.00 $90,637.00 $103,863.00 $107,753.00 $85,191.00
MFR Name: B Braun B Braun B Braun B Braun B Braun
Product # 473443 BTM 355402 473443 473443 BBM473443
Qty per Case: 100 100 100 100 100
49 Gauze, Impregnated with Petrolatum Jelly 180 Boxes
Price Per Unit $9.46 $10.32 $10.10 $8.17 $7.85
Line Total $1,702.80 $1,857.60 $1,818.00 $1,470.60 $1,413.00
MFR Name: McKesson Kendall Kendall Kendall Derma Science
Product # 168436 BTM 150061K1 Not Specified 8884414600 AMADK20059
Qty per Case: 72 72 72 12/Box 72
50 Glove, Exam, Diamond Grip, Powderfree 10,150 Boxes
Price Per Unit $12.00 $10.03 $13.56 $9.85 $6.98
Line total $121,800.00 $101,804.50 $137,634.00 $99,977.50 $70,847.00
FDA 510 K Number Not Specified Not Specified Not Specified K980916 K990268
or FDA Device Listing Number
Qty per Box Not Specified 100 100 100 100
Number of Boxes per Case 10 10 10 10 10
51 Glove, Exam, NitriDerm EP, Small 800 Boxes
Price Per Unit $14.00 $12.94 No Bid $12.70 $12.45
Line total $11,200.00 $10,352.00 $10,160.00 $9,960.00
MFR Name: Innovative Healthcare Innovative Healthcare Innovative Healthcare Innovative Healthcare
Product # 189100 BTM 1015-18901 189100 INN189100
52 Glove, Exam, NitriDerm EP, Medium 1,700 Boxes
Price Per Unit $14.00 $12.94 No Bid $12.70 $12.45
Line total $23,800.00 $21,998.00 $21,590.00 $21,165.00
MFR Name: Innovative Healthcare Innovative Healthcare Innovative Healthcare Innovative Healthcare
Product # 189200 BTM 1015-18902 189200 INN189200
53 Glove, Exam, NitriDerm EP, Large 8,500 Boxes
Price Per Unit $15.00 $12.94 No Bic $12.70 $12.45
Line total $127,500.00 $109,990.00 $107,950.00 $105,825.00
MFR Name: Innovative Healthcare Innovative Healthcare Innovative Healthcare Innovative Healthcare
Product # 189300 BTM 1015-18903 189300 INN189300
54 Glove, Exam, NitriDerm EP, Extra Large 4,300 Boxes
Price Per Unit $15.00 $12.94 No Bid $12.70 $12.45
Line total $64,500.00 $55,642.00 $54,610.00 $53,535.00
MFR Name: Innovative Healthcare Innovative Healthcare Innovative Healthcare Innovative Healthcare
Product # 189350 BTM 1015-18904 189350 INN189350
55 Glucagon Emergency Kit 150 Each
Price Per Unit $173.86 $155.49 $127.47 $140.23 $156.00
Line Total $26,079.00 $23,323.50 $19,120.50 $21,034.50 $23,400.00
MFR Name: Eli Lilly Capital Wholesale Cardinal Pharma Eli Lilly Lilly
Product # 00002-803101 BTM 000002145001 CAH285890 741751 00002-803101
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56 Hand Sanitizer, 2 fl ounces 1,200 Each
Price Per Unit $0.90 $0.82 $3.39 $0.92 $0.75
Line Total $1,080.00 $984.00 $4,068.00 $1,104.00 $900.00
MFR Name: Safetec Safetec GoJo Safetec Safetec
Product # SAF17355 BTM 768-17355EA 9652-12 17355 SAF17355
Qty per Case: 24 24 12 12 24
57 Hand Sanitizer, 4 fl ounces 5,520 Each
Price Per Unit $1.34 $1.01 $1.68 $1.00 $1.07
Line Total $7,396.80 $5,575.20 $9,273.60 $5,520.00 $5,906.40
MFR Name: McKesson Central Solutions Purell Safetec Safetec
Product # 463152 BTM 11974 9651-24 17350 SAF17350
Qty per Case: 24 24 24 12 24
58 Hand Gel, Antiseptic, 4 fl ounces 480 Each
Price Per Unit $1.20 $2.41 $0.75 $0.99 $0.64
Line Total $576.00 $1,156.80 $360.00 $475.20 $307.20
MFR Name: McKesson Ecolab Healthcare Triad Safetec New World
Product # 463152 BTM 283-61430315EA 10-8604 17 NWIHS4
Qty per Case: 24 72 48 12 60
59 Handle, GreenLine Laryngoscope 30 Each
Price Per Unit $61.54 $45.32 $79.69 $37.57 $33.75
Line Total $1,846.20 $1,359.60 $2,390.70 $1,127.10 $1,012.50
MFR Name: SunMed SunMed Care Fusion SunMed SunMed
Product # 5-0236-09 BTM 792-5-0236-09 5-0236-09 5-0236-09 SUN5-0236-09
Qty per Case: 1 Not Specified Not Specified 1 1
60 Holder, Endotracheal, Pediatric 16 Packs
Price Per Unit $3.30 $3.00 No Bid $2.50 $63.75
Line Total $52.80 $48.00 $40.00 $1,020.00
MFR Name: Laerdal Laerdal Laerdal Laerdal
Product # 600-20000 BTM 020400 600-20000 LAE600-2000
61 Holder, Endotracheal, Adult 28 Packs
Price Per Unit $3.30 $3.00 No Bid $2.53 $63.75
Line Total $92.40 $84.00 $70.84 $1,785.00
MFR Name: Laerdal Laerdal Laerdal Laerdal
Product # 600-10000 BTM 020500 600-10000 LAE600-1000
62 Humidifier Kit, Care Fusion Airlife 180 Each
Price Per Unit $2.63 $2.05 $2.78 $2.07 $2.14
Line Total $473.40 $369.00 $500.40 $372.60 $385.20
MFR Name: Care Fusion Corp. Care Fusion Corp. Care Fusion Corp. Care Fusion Corp. Care Fusion Corp.
Product # 002620 BTM 022520 AL2702 2620 ALG002620
Qty per Case: 12 12 12 12 12
63 Infuser, Disposable Pressure 250 Cases
Price Per Unit $17.89 $376.25 No Bid $10.84 $187.50
Line Total $4,472.50 $94,062.50 $2,710.00 $46,875.00
MFR Name: Ethox Ethox Int. Mason Ventlab
Product # 4010 BTM 354010 MTM310 VENVC410
Qty per Case: 5 25 10 25
64 Infusion Pump, Infusomat Space ACM 57 Each
Price Per Unit $3,198.91 $2,117.65 $2,706.00 $2,210.48 $1,917.50
Line Total $182,337.87 $120,706.05 $154,242.00 $125,997.36 $109,297.50
MFR Name: B Braun B Braun B Braun B Braun B Braun
Product # 8713060U BTM 1850-30621 8713060U 8713060U BBM8713060U
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65 Infusomat Combi Lead 58 Each
Price Per Unit $215.73 $150.00 $141.18 $165.79 $125.00
Line Total $12,512.34 $8,700.00 $8,188.44 $9,615.82 $7,250.00
MFR Name: B Braun B Braun B Braun B Braun B Braun
Product # 8713133 BTM 1850-13387 8713133 8713133 BBM8713133
66 Injection, Sodium Chloride, 0.9%, 500ml 1,000 Cases
Price Per Unit $45.79 $18.96 $23.76 $0.93 $21.00
Line Total $45,790.00 $18,960.00 $23,760.00 $930.00 $21,000.00
MFR Name: Baxter Baxter Baxter Baxter Baxter
Product # 2B1323Q BTM 601323 2B1323Q 2B1323Q BAX2B1323Q
67 Injection, Sodium Chloride, 0.9%, 100ml| 10 Cases
Price Per Unit $189.34 $127.68 $123.33 $1.17 $119.00
Line Total $1,893.40 $1,276.80 $1,233.30 $11.70 $1,190.00
MFR Name: Baxter Baxter Baxter Baxter Baxter
Product # 2B1307 BTM 358437 2B1307 2B1307 BAX2B1307
68 Irrigation, Sodium Chloride, 0.9% 98 Cases
Price Per Unit $40.53 $13.56 $19.80 $1.65 $17.50
Line Total $3,971.94 $1,328.88 $1,940.40 $161.70 $1,715.00
MFR Name: Baxter Baxter Baxter Baxter Baxter
Product # 2F7124 BTM 607124 2F7124 2F7124 BAX2F7124
69 IV Solution Set 15,840 Each
Price Per Unit $2.42 $1.63 $0.02 $2.03 $1.25
Line Total $38,332.80 $25,819.20 $316.80 $32,155.20 $19,800.00
MFR Name: Baxter Baxter Baxter Baxter Baxter
Product # EMS3110 BTM 118-EMS3110EA EMS3110 EMS3110 BAXEMS3110
70 IV Administration Set, 60 drops/ml 1,392 Each
Price Per Unit $5.04 $157.58 $5.23 $5.53 $4.90
Line Total $7,015.68 $219,351.36 $7,280.16 $7,697.76 $6,820.80
MFR Name: B Braun B Braun B Braun B Braun B Braun
Product # 490042 BTM 490042 490042 490042 BBM490042
IV Administration Set, 15 drops/ml, with
71 injection site 1,392 Each
Price Per Unit $5.65 $4.48 $4.34 $4.13 $4.06
Line Total $7,864.80 $6,236.16 $6,041.28 $5,748.96 $5,651.52
MFR Name: B Braun B Braun B Braun B Braun B Braun
Product # 490031 BTM #1712-31049 490031 490031 BBM490031
IV Administration Set, 15 drops/ml, with two
72 injection sites 1,392 Each
Price Per Unit $5.85 $4.65 $4.51 $4.29 $4.22
Line Total $8,143.20 $6,472.80 $6,277.92 $5,971.68 $5,874.24
MFR Name: B Braun B Braun B Braun B Braun B Braun
Product # 490036 BTM 1712-36049 490036 490036 BBM490036
73 IV Administration Set, Add-on Set 1,392 Each
Price Per Unit $6.47 $4.36 $4.23 $4.46 $3.95
Line Total $9,006.24 $6,069.12 $5,888.16 $6,208.32 $5,498.40
MFR Name: B Braun B Braun B Braun B Braun B Braun
Product # 490030 BTM 1712-30049 490030 490030 BBM490030
74 IV Dedicated Pump Set 1,392 Each
Price Per Unit $6.08 $4.81 $4.53 $4.94 $4.36
Line Total $8,463.36 $6,695.52 $6,305.76 $6,876.48 $6,069.12
MFR Name: B Braun B Braun B Braun B Braun B Braun
Product # 362005 BTM 1712-20536 362005 362005 BBM362005
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75 Jelly, Sterile Lubricating, 2.7g/Packet 240 Boxes
Price Per Unit $6.59 $5.54 $26.59 $7.64 $5.78
Line Total $1,581.60 $1,329.60 $6,381.60 $1,833.60 $1,387.20
MFR Name: McKesson Dynarex Savage Labs PDI Dynarex
Product # 788485 BTM 14903 00281-0205-45 T00128 DYN1250
Qty per Case: 6 12 864 10 12
76 Lancet Surgilance Safety Grey 30,000 Each
Price Per Unit $0.14 $0.1523 $0.13 $0.11 $0.1125
Line Total $4,200.00 $4,569.00 $3,900.00 $3,300.00 $3,375.00
MFR Name: Medipurpose Inc. Medi Purpose Medipurpose Inc. Medipurpose Inc. Surgilance
Product # SLN200 BTM 782-SLN200BX B2800-15 SLN240 SURSLN200
Qty per Case: 15 15 Not Specified 10 15
7 Lice Bedding Spray, 5 ounces 200 Each
Price Per Unit $4.42 $5.88 $3.86 $9.95 $4.90
Line Total $884.00 $1,176.00 $772.00 $1,990.00 $980.00
MFR Name: Sunmark Amerisource Perrigo ADR Health Perrigo
Product # 49348-023787 BTM 0004-21 4538326 30 49348-023787
78 Lice Killing Shampoo, 4 ounces 100 Each
Price Per Unit $3.00 $5.78 $4.82 $10.78 $6.27
Line Total $300.00 $578.00 $482.00 $1,078.00 $627.00
MFR Name: Perrigo Co. Amerisource Perrigo Bayer Perrigo Co.
Product # 49348-044334 BTM 0116-03 2292639 014290 49348-044334
79 Nebulizer, Opti-Mist Il 4,250 Each
Price Per Unit $0.79 $1.04 $0.88 $0.89 $0.62
Line Total $3,357.50 $4,420.00 $3,740.00 $3,782.50 $2,635.00
MFR Name: Medsource Int'l Unomedical UNO Mada Teleflex
Product # MS-22883 BTM 2361-77505 775-E 5752 TEL1883
Qty per Case: 50 50 50 50 50
80 Needle, 18G 4,000 Each
Price Per Unit $0.04 $0.0905 $0.04 $0.04 $0.0235
Line Total $160.00 $362.00 $160.00 $160.00 $94.00
MFR Name: McKesson Kendall B. Braun Oxel B Braun
Product # 626567 BTM C490310 NF4665120 26420 BBM4665120-02
Qty per Case: 100 100 Not Specified 500 1000
81 Needle, 21G 9,600 Each
Price Per Unit $0.11 $0.2511 $0.16 $0.20 $0.201
Line Total $1,056.00 $2,410.56 $1,536.00 $1,920.00 $1,929.60
MFR Name: BD Owens & Minor Smiths Becton Dickinson B/D
Product # 412 BTM 1641-76521 ED2115-NO 305765 B/D305765
Qty per Case: 100 100 1000 500 1200
82 Nitrostat, .4 mg tablets, 100 tablets/bottle 540 Bottles
Price Per Unit $20.16 $18.48 $17.44 $16.35 $18.15
Line Total $10,886.40 $9,979.20 $9,417.60 $8,829.00 $9,801.00
MFR Name: Pfizer Capital Wholesale Pfizer Pfizer Pfizer
Product # 041824 BTM 0418-24 2994234 71041824 00071-041824
83 Non-Rebreating Mask, Adult 18,700 Each
Price Per Unit $0.81 $0.98 $1.41 $0.80 $0.67
Line Total $15,147.00 $18,326.00 $26,367.00 $14,960.00 $12,529.00
MFR Name: Medsource Int'l Teleflex Teleflex MedSource Ventlab
Product # MS-25060 BTM D6144 1060 MS-25060 VEN2102
Qty per Case: 50 50 50 50 50
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84 Nose Clip, Rubber 2,000 Each
Price Per Unit $0.30 $0.2532 $0.32 $0.35 $0.39
Line Total $600.00 $506.40 $640.00 $700.00 $780.00
MFR Name: Allied Healthcare Tidi Products A-M SY A-M SY A M Systems
Product # 64019 BTM 1410-90200 166000 166000 AMS166000
Qty per Bag: 100 100 100 100 100
85 Oximeter, TuffSat with OxyTip 5 Each
Price Per Unit $375.00 $569.62 $230.14 $324.40 $308.00
Line Total $1,875.00 $2,848.10 $1,150.70 $1,622.00 $1,540.00
MFR Name: Ohmeda Datex Ohmeda Smiths Medical GE Medical Smiths
Product # 6051-000-160 BTM A973100 3420YB 60510000/60 POR1000EN
86 Obstetrical Kit, Bagged 200 Each
Price Per Unit $4.30 $5.86 $2.11 $6.14 $3.89
Line Total $860.00 $1,172.00 $422.00 $1,228.00 $778.00
MFR Name: GAM Industries Dynarex Integrated Supply GAM Motion Med
Product # 40-01 BTM F1652BAG G590MATMA 650-4001-0000 MMD1723
87 Pack, Instant Cold Compress 12,500 Each
Price Per Unit $0.77 $0.2579 $0.24 $0.27 $0.29
Line Total $9,625.00 $3,223.75 $3,000.00 $3,375.00 $3,625.00
MFR Name: McKesson GAM Ind. CAH GAM Morrison
Product # 476732 BTM F03520 11440-900 612-00109824 MOR6600
Qty per Case: 24 24 16 24 24
88 Pack, Instant Disposable Heat 1,992 Each
Price Per Unit $0.75 $1.40 $0.46 $0.27 $0.32
Line Total $1,494.00 $2,788.80 $916.32 $537.84 $637.44
MFR Name: McKesson Cardinal Morrison GAM Mabis
Product # 526411 BTM 04-70204 6610 MDS 13-01 DMI612-0030-9824
Qty per Case: 24 24 24 24 24
89 Pad, Prep, Alcohol, Large 25,000 Each
Price Per Unit $0.00805 $0.0215 $0.02 $0.02 $0.0159
Line Total $201.25 $537.50 $500.00 $500.00 $397.50
MFR Name: McKesson Dynarex Tyco Coridien Dukal
Product # 191089 BTM F1654 5110 5033 DUK861
Qty per Box: 200 100 4000 20 100
90 Pad, Prep, Alcohol, Medium 60,000 Each
Price Per Unit $0.04720 $1.41* $0.01 $0.02 $0.0065
Line Total $2,832.00 $423.00 $600.00 $1,200.00 $390.00
MFR Name: McKesson Kendall Tyco Coridien Kendall
Product # 225940 BTM 605150 5140A 5750 KEN5150
Qty per Box: 100 200 20 20 200
91 Pad, Prep, Povidine lodine, Medium 50,000 Each
Price Per Unit $0.05 $0.0361 $0.04 $0.05 $0.0318
Line Total $2,500.00 $1,805.00 $2,000.00 $2,500.00 $1,590.00
MFR Name: Dynarex Dynarex Professional Disp PDI Dynarex
Product # DYN1108 BTM 609153 23405-001 B40600 DYN1108
Qty per Case: 100 100 1000 10/box 1000
92 Penlight with Pupil Gauge 1,218 Each
Price Per Unit $1.06 $0.74 $5.84 $0.55 $1.21
Line Total $1,291.08 $901.32 $7,113.12 $669.90 $1,473.78
MFR Name: Aaron Medical Aaron Medical Aaron Medical Aaron Medical Aaron Medical
Product # 66RN BTM K4036 66RN 66RN AAR66RN
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93 Peroxide Hydrogen 3%, 16 ounce Bottle 1,440 Each
Price Per Unit $0.75 $0.96 $0.54 $0.36 $0.568
Line Total $1,080.00 $1,382.40 $777.60 $518.40 $817.92
MFR Name: McKesson Amerisource Hydrox Cumberland Hydrox
Product # 142779 BTM 0113-16 D0012 87143 HYDDO0012
Qty per Case: 12 Not Specified 12 12 12
94 Seal, Pull-Tite Il, Red 40 Packs
Price Per Unit $20.67 $19.97 $18.66 $15.92 $18.00
Line Total $826.80 $798.80 $746.40 $636.80 $720.00
MFR Name: Health Care Logistics Health Care Logistics HCL Health Care Healthmark
Product # 7820 BTM 7820 7820 7820 HEA9393-RED
Qty per Case: 100/Bag 100/Pack Not Specified 10/Box 100/Pk
95 Seal, Pull-Tite II, Yellow 20 Packs
Price Per Unit $20.67 $19.97 $18.66 $15.92 $18.00
Line Total $413.40 $399.40 $373.20 $318.40 $360.00
MFR Name: Health Care Logistics Health Care Logistics HCL Health Care Healthmark
Product # 7813 BTM 7813 7813 7813 HEA9393-Yellow
Qty per Case: 100/Bag 100/Pack Not Specified 10/Box 100/Pk
96 Sensor, Integrated Wrap w/"H" Connector 20 Each
Price Per Unit $135.00 $128.21 No Bid $119.13 $108.00
Line Total $2,700.00 $2,564.20 $2,382.60 $2,160.00
MFR Name: DatexOhmeda DatexOhmeda Not Specified Smiths
Product # OXY-W4-H BTM OXY-W4H4 OXY-W4-H PDR3043
97 Shears, Medicut, 7 1/4", Neon Orange 300 Each
Price Per Unit $0.98 $1.92 $3.12 $0.87 $0.82
Line Total $294.00 $576.00 $936.00 $261.00 $246.00
MFR Name: Medsource Int'l ADC ADC MedSource Basic
Product # SH0080 BTM 4000053 320BK MS-SH0080 MTH60001
98 Sheet Drape, 3-Ply, 40" x 48", White 550 Cases
Price Per Unit $27.00 $20.00 $18.93 $14.54 $19.35
Line Total $14,850.00 $11,000.00 $10,411.50 $7,997.00 $10,642.50
MFR Name: McKesson Tidi Products Graham Medical Graham Medical Graham
Product # 216346 BTM 1460-30291 GM70302 300 GRA302
Qty per case: 100 100 100 100 100
99 Splint, Ankle/Foot, Air with Push/Pull Valves 600 Each
Price Per Unit $9.83 $8.50 $52.47 $7.52 $7.99
Line Total $5,898.00 $5,100.00 $31,482.00 $4,512.00 $4,794.00
MFR Name: Progressive Medical Mayflower DJO Mayflower Mayflower
Product # 13068 BTM 660025 03AL 703 MSC703
100 Splint, Full Arm, Air, Adult 200 Each
Price Per Unit $9.88 $9.81 No Bid $8.68 $9.10
Line Total $1,976.00 $1,962.00 $1,736.00 $1,820.00
MFR Name: Progressive Medical Mayflower Mayflower Mayflower
Product # 13069 BTM 660020 702 MSC702
101 Splint, Full Leg, Air, Adult 500 Each
Price Per Unit $13.23 $11.25 No Bid $9.96 $10.45
Line Total $6,615.00 $5,625.00 $4,980.00 $5,225.00
MFR Name: Progressive Medical Mayflower Mayflower Mayflower
Product # 13066 BTM 660023 705 MSC705
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102 Splint, Half Arm, Air, Adult 300 Each
Price Per Unit $9.14 $7.88 $79.98 $6.96 $7.30
Line Total $2,742.00 $2,364.00 $23,994.00 $2,088.00 $2,190.00
MFR Name: Progressive Medical Mayflower DJO Mayflower Mayflower
Product # 13064 BTM 660021 O05FML 701 MSC701
103 Splint, Half Leg, Air, Adult 300 Each
Price Per Unit $11.44 $9.81 $65.29 $8.68 $9.10
Line Total $3,432.00 $2,943.00 $19,587.00 $2,604.00 $2,730.00
MFR Name: Progressive Medical Mayflower DJO Mayflower Mayflower
Product # 13067 BTM 660024 01F-M 704 MSC704
104 Splint, Hand and Wrist, Air, Adult 300 Each
Price Per Unit $8.00 $7.27 $11.75 $6.03 $6.33
Line Total $2,400.00 $2,181.00 $3,525.00 $1,809.00 $1,899.00
MFR Name: Progressive Medical Mayflower DJO Mayflower Mayflower
Product # 13065 BTM 660022 OSWLL 700 MSC700
105 Splint, Economy, Wood, 15" Length 500 Each
Price Per Unit $2.64 $2.35 $1.93 $2.22 $2.00
Line Total $1,320.00 $1,175.00 $965.00 $1,110.00 $1,000.00
MFR Name: Progressive Medical Morrison Medical Morrison Morrison Primacare
Product # 14114 BTM 56-1815 1815 1815 PRI18-5116
106 Splint, Economy, Wood, 36" Length 500 Each
Price Per Unit $4.62 $4.23 $3.02 $3.65 $2.70
Line Total $2,310.00 $2,115.00 $1,510.00 $1,825.00 $1,350.00
MFR Name: Morrison Medical Morrison Medical Morrison Morrison Primacare
Product # 1836 BTM 56-1836 1836 1836 PRI18-5136
107 Sponge, General Use , 2x2, Nonwoven 112,000 Each
Price Per Unit $0.0044 0.97* $0.02 $0.02 $0.0029
Line Total $492.80 $543.20 $2,240.00 $2,240.00 $324.80
MFR Name: McKesson Morrison Medical Tyco Kendall Covidien Dukal
Product # 446034 BTM 080112 KC441400A 9132 DUK2102
Qty per Case: 20 40 8000 4000 4000
108 Sponge, General Use, 4x4, Nonwoven 200,000 Each
Price Per Unit $0.0043 2.37%** $0.03 $0.03 $0.0104
Line Total $850.00 $2,370.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $2,080.00
MFR Name: McKesson Dukal Tyro Kendall Covidien Dukal
Product # 446034 BTM 276-2104BG KC2556 9134 DUK2104
Qty per Case: 200 200/bag 4000 2000 2000
109 Stethoscope, Sprague Rappaport, 29" Length 140 Each
Price Per Unit $4.65 $7.04 $17.98 $6.04 $4.60
Line Total $651.00 $985.60 $2,517.20 $845.60 $644.00
MFR Name: Medsource ADC CAH Med Source Primacare
Product # STBK BTM *641BK 75-414-020 MS-STBK PRIDS-9295
110 Strap, Stretcher, Nylon, 5' Two-Piece 2,000 Each
Price Per Unit $10.95 $8.00 $6.53 $6.66 $6.88
Line Total $21,900.00 $16,000.00 $13,060.00 $13,320.00 $13,760.00
MFR Name: Progressive Medical Morrison Medical Morrison Morrison Morrison
Product # 14049 BTM 56-1200BK-9 NF1200 1200BK MOR1200BK/MA
111 Strap, Stretcher, Nylon, 4' Extension 100 Each
Price Per Unit $9.95 $6.67 $7.02 $8.87 $7.45
Line Total $995.00 $667.00 $702.00 $887.00 $745.00
MFR Name: Progressive Medical DMS Morrison Morrison Morrison
Product # 14161 BTM *1318X NF1218 1218BK MOR1218
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112 Stretcher, Soft, Titan, Black 15 Each
Price Per Unit $44.00 $36.49 $31.76 $188.06 $26.45
Line Total $660.00 $547.35 $476.40 $2,820.90 $396.75
MFR Name: Taylor Healthcare Taylor Healthcare Taylor Healthcare Taylor Healthcare Taylor Healthcare
Product # 44TT4080 BTM *44-MTT4080 44TT4080 44TT4080 TAY44TT4080
113 Stylette Disposable, Endotracheal Slick 10 Fr 1,650 Each
Price Per Unit $0.68 $3.26 $2.73 $2.99 $2.29
Line Total $1,122.00 $5,379.00 $4,504.50 $4,933.50 $3,778.50
MFR Name: Medsource Int'l Teleflex Teleflex Rusch Sun Med
Product # MS-ETS200 BTM 020404 1000R 1000R SUN9-0209-73
114 Stylette Disposable, Endotracheal Slick 8 Fr 700 Each
Price Per Unit $1.15 $3.26 $2.73 $2.99 $2.29
Line Total $805.00 $2,282.00 $1,911.00 $2,093.00 $1,603.00
MFR Name: Progressive Medical Teleflex Teleflex Rusch Sun Med
Product # 12997 BTM 020405 750 750 SUN9-0209-72
115 Syringe, Pre-filled, Naloxone Hcl 100 Cartons
Price Per Unit $19.75 $15.13 $200.01 $15.21 $169.00
Line Total $1,975.00 $1,513.00 $20,001.00 $1,521.00 $16,900.00
MFR Name: International Med Sys IMS Limited Card Pharma Intl Medication IMS
Product # 0548-3369-00 BTM 373369 Not Specified 548336900 IMS0548-336900
Qty per Box: 10 Not Specified 10 10 10
116 Syringe, Pre-filled, Saline 211,200 Each
Price Per Unit $0.65 $0.42 $0.39 $0.38 $0.40
Line Total $137,280.00 $88,704.00 $82,368.00 $80,256.00 $84,480.00
MFR Name: B Braun B Braun B Braun B Braun Kendall
Product # 513576 BTM 1921-13576 513576 513576 KEN8881570121
Qty per Case: 100 12 120 10 180
117 Syringe, Omnifix, 10cc 2,400 Each
Price Per Unit $0.098 $0.09 $0.09 $0.10 $0.081
Line Total $235.20 $216.00 $216.00 $240.00 $194.40
MFR Name: McKesson B Braun B Braun Terumo B Braun
Product # 626062 BTM 1633-10010 4617100V-02 55-10L BBM4617100V-02
Qty per Case: 100 12 Not Specified 10 1200
118 Syringe, Disposable, 30cc 5,120 Each
Price Per Unit $0.08 $0.359 $0.33 $0.32 $0.328
Line Total $409.60 $1,838.08 $1,689.60 $1,638.40 $1,679.36
MFR Name: McKesson Becton Dickinson BD Becton Dickinson B/D
Product # 629841 BTM G0863 BF309650 309650 B/D309650
Qty per Case: 100 160 160 10 160
119 Syringe, Omnifix, 5cc 6,000 Each
Price Per Unit $0.08 $0.08 $0.09 $0.10 $0.07
Line Total $480.00 $480.00 $540.00 $600.00 $420.00
MFR Name: McKesson B Braun B Braun Exel B Braun
Product # 626576 BTM 1633-05305 4617053V-02 26230 BBM4617053V-02
Qty per Case: 100 2000 Not Specified 10 2000
120 Syringe, Eclipse, 3cc 1,200 Each
Price Per Unit $0.23 $80.88 $0.27 $0.24 $0.247
Line Total $276.00 $97,056.00 $324.00 $288.00 $296.40
MFR Name: McKesson Becton Dickinson BD Becton Dickinson B/D
Product # 721370 BTM 305782 305782 305782 B/D305782
Qty per Case: 100 Not Specified 300 10 300
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Ste 106 Earth City, MO 63045
Item Description Estimated Qty. [San Antonio, TX 78201
121 Syringe, Tubercuin, 1cc 2,000 Each
Price Per Unit $0.45 $149.46 $0.37 $0.36 $0.373
Line Total $900.00 $298,920.00 $740.00 $720.00 $746.00
MFR Name: Becton Dickinson Becton Dickinson BD Becton Dickinson B/D
Product # 305946 BTM *305946 305946 305946 B/D305946
Qty per Case: 100 Not Specified 400 10 400
122 Tape, Surgical, 2" x 10 Yards 15,552 Each
Price Per Unit $1.65 $1.28 $1.11 $1.22 $1.35
Line Total $25,660.80 $19,906.56 $17,262.72 $18,973.44 $20,995.20
MFR Name: McKesson Dynarex Modepak Medical Dynarex Dynarex
Product # 455535 BTM F165632 CAHCAT2 3563 DYN3563
Qty per Case: 72 72 60 12 Boxes 72
123 Test Strips, Blood Glucose, Contour 7099C 2,770 Each
Price Per Unit $29.95 $21.79 $0.86 $0.39 $0.215
Line Total $82,961.50 $60,358.30 $2,382.20 $1,080.30 $595.55
MFR Name: Bayer Bayer Bayer Bayer Bayer
Product # 7099C 7099C 7099C 7099 7099C
124 Thermometer, Digital, Adtemp Il 3,250 Each
Price Per Unit $2.81 $3.54 $1.83 $3.17 $1.69
Line Total $9,132.50 $11,505.00 $5,947.50 $10,302.50 $5,492.50
MFR Name: McKesson ADC ADC ADI Mabis
Product # 508755 BTM 170002 412-00 413B-00 DMI15-691-000
125 Thermometer, Digital, Rectal 2,400 Each
Price Per Unit $4.39 $3.54 $1.17 $3.17 $2.84
Line Total $10,536.00 $8,496.00 $2,808.00 $7,608.00 $6,816.00
MFR Name: McKesson ADC Mabis ADI ADC
Product # 499744 BTM 066-413R 16811-SOUR 413R-00 AME413R-00
126 Tourniquet GRAFCO Disposable, Latex 2,300 Each
Price Per Unit $0.14 $0.07 $0.05 $0.16 $0.065
Line Total $322.00 $161.00 $115.00 $368.00 $149.50
MFR Name: McKesson Elastomer Shanghai Jini Graham Graham Field
Product # 553847 BTM 5633 B3060 4109 G/F4109
Qty per Case: 100 1000 250 250/Box 250/Box
127 Tourniquet GRAFCO Disposable, Latex Free 27,000 Each
Price Per Unit $0.15 $0.08 $0.09 $0.10 $0.065
Line Total $4,050.00 $2,160.00 $2,430.00 $2,700.00 $1,755.00
MFR Name: McKesson Elastomer Elastomer Inc. ADI Graham Field
Product # 464713 BTM 14762 PC260TIE 10920 G/F4109-1LF
Qty per Case: 250 Not Specified Not Specified 100 250/Box
128 Tube, Endotracheal (oral/nasal), 7.00mm 500 Each
Price Per Unit $1.25 $1.43 $6.47 $4.15 $1.66
Line Total $625.00 $715.00 $3,235.00 $2,075.00 $830.00
MFR Name: Medsource Int'l Smiths Medical Smiths Smiths Smiths
Product # Not Specified BTM 13410 100/102/070 100/100/070 POR100/102/70
Qty per Box: 10 Not Specified 10 10 10
129 Tube Endotracheal (oral/nasal), 8.0mm 1,000 Each
Price Per Unit $1.25 $1.43 $6.47 $3.89 $1.66
Line Total $1,250.00 $1,430.00 $6,470.00 $3,890.00 $1,660.00
MFR Name: Medsource Int'l Smiths Medical Smiths Smiths Smiths
Product # MS-23480 BTM 13412 102/102/080 100/100/080 POR100/102/080
Qty per Box: 10 Not Specified Not Specified 10 10
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: March 30, 2012
For: Medical Supplies
B & E Medical Supply & [Bound Tree Medical, LLC |Cardinal Health, Inc. Henry Schein, Inc. Midwest Medical Supply,
6100001197 VE Equipment, LLC 5000 Tuttle Crossing Blvd|7000 Cardinal Place (PO Box 3227 LLC
1933 Fredericksburg Rd [Dublin, OH 43016 Dublin, OH 43017 Irmo, SC 29063 13400 Lakefront Drive
Ste 106 Earth City, MO 63045
Item Description Estimated Qty. [San Antonio, TX 78201
130 Tube Endotracheal (oral/nasal), 5.0mm 400 Each
Price Per Unit $1.01 $1.43 $4.76 $2.22 $1.63
Line Total $404.00 $572.00 $1,904.00 $888.00 $652.00
MFR Name: Medsource Int'l Smiths Medical Smiths Smiths Smiths
Product # MS-23350 BTM 13420 100/103/050 100/101/050 POR100/103/050
Qty per Box: 10 Not Specified Not Specified 10 10
131 Deleted
132 Tubing, Suction, Connecting, 3/16" 1,000 Each
Price Per Unit $0.58 $0.56 $0.41 $0.67 $0.45
Line Total $580.00 $560.00 $410.00 $670.00 $450.00
MFR Name: McKesson Medline Cardinal Health Medline Dynarex
Product # 543531 BTM 325021 CENS56A DYND50216 DYN4682
Qty per Box: 50 50 50 50 50
133 Tubing, 7' Oxygen Supply 10,500 Each
Price Per Unit $0.64 $0.22 No Bid $0.36 $0.24
Line Total $6,720.00 $2,310.00 $3,780.00 $2,520.00
MFR Name: McKesson Ventlab Allied Ventlab
Product # 543531 BTM 87-3007EA 9115-0010 VEN3007
Qty per Box: 50 Not Specified 50 50
134 Valve, Whisperflow, 5.0cm 209 Each
Price Per Unit $9.80 $8.43 No Bid $9.43 $10.35
Line Total $2,048.20 $1,761.87 $1,970.87 $2,163.15
MFR Name: PMI Medical Philips Vital Signs Whisperflow
Product # 71040 BTM PHI820850700 9005B PMP71040

Estimated Annual Total

*Price per Box
**Price per Bag
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