City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: November 21, 2011
For: Flexible Base and Flexible Base for Stabilization
Martin Marietta Materials Vulcan Construction Material LP
6100001010 VS 5710 W. Hausman Rd., Suite 121 [P.O. Box 791550
Estimated San Antonio, San Antonio,
Item Description Qt TX 78249 TX 78279
Y- |210-208-4072
la Flexible Base Type A City Picked Up Material 10,000
Price Per Ton 6.25 5.00
Total 62,500.00 50,000.00
1b Flexible Base Type B City Picked Up Material 10,000
Price Per Ton No bid No bid
Total
1c Flexible Base Type C City Picked Up Material 10,000
Price Per Ton No bid No bid
Total
1d Flexible Base Type D City Picked Up Material 10,000
Price Per Ton 10.25 No bid
Total 102,500.00
le Flexible Base Type A JIT Jobsite north of Commerce 625
Price Per Ton 10.36 10.50
Total 6,475.00 6,562.50
1f Flexible Base Type B JIT Jobsite north of Commerce 625
Price Per Ton No bid No bid
Total
1g Flexible Base Type C JIT Jobsite north of Commerce 625
Price Per Ton No bid No bid
Total
1h Flexible Base Type D JIT Jobsite north of Commerce 625
Price Per Ton 14.36 No bid
Total 8,975.00
1l Flexible Base Type A JIT Jobsite south of Commerce 625
Price Per Ton 12.35 12.50
Total 7,718.75 7,812.50
1j Flexible Base Type B JIT Jobsite south of Commerce 625
Price Per Ton No bid No bid
Total
1k Flexible Base Type C JIT Jobsite south of Commerce 625
Price Per Ton No bid No bid
Total
1l Flexible Base Type D JIT Jobsite south of Commerce 625
Price Per Ton 16.35 No bid
Total 10,218.75
Flexible Base for Stabilization with Flexible Base
2a Type A City Picked Up Material 25
Price Per Ton 34.00 No bid
Total 850.00
Flexible Base for Stabilization with Flexible Base
2b Type B City Picked Up Material 25
Price Per Ton No bid No bid
Total
Flexible Base for Stabilization with Flexible Base
2c Type C City Picked Up Material 25
Price Per Ton No bid No bid
Total
Flexible Base for Stabilization with Flexible Base
2d Type D City Picked Up Material 25
Price Per Ton 44.00 No bid
Total 1,100.00
Flexible Base for Stabilization with Flexible Base
2e Type A JIT Jobsite north of Commerce 32
Price Per Ton 38.11 No bid
Total 1,219.52
Flexible Base for Stabilization with Flexible Base
2f Type B JIT Jobsite north of Commerce 32
Price Per Ton No bid No bid
Total

Page 1




City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation
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Item
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Flexible Base and Flexible Base for Stabilization

Description

VS

Estimated

Qty.

29

2h

2l

2

2k

2l

Flexible Base for Stabilization with Flexible Base
Type C JIT Jobsite north of Commerce

Price Per Ton

Total

Flexible Base for Stabilization with Flexible Base
Type D JIT Jobsite north of Commerce

Price Per Ton

Total

Flexible Base for Stabilization with Flexible Base
Type A JIT Jobsite south of Commerce

Price Per Ton

Total

Flexible Base for Stabilization with Flexible Base
Type B JIT Jobsite south of Commerce

Price Per Ton

Total

Flexible Base for Stabilization with Flexible Base
Type C JIT Jobsite south of Commerce

Price Per Ton

Total

Flexible Base for Stabilization with Flexible Base
Type D JIT Jobsite south of Commerce

Price Per Ton

Total

Payment Terms

32

32

32

32

32

32

Martin Marietta Materials

5710 W. Hausman Rd., Suite 121

San Antonio,
TX 78249
210-208-4072

No bid

48.11
1,539.52

40.10
1,283.20

No bid

No bid

50.10
1,603.20

Net 30

Vulcan Construction Material LP

P.O. Box 791550

San Antonio,
TX 78279

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

Net 30

Estimated Annual Total

205,982.94

64,375.00

JIT = Just In Time Delivery
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