Opened: January 4, 2012

City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Alternate Alternate
For: Custodial Paper Products Boritex, Inc. Boritex, Inc. D. C. Distributing Gulf Coast Paper |Gulf Coast Paper |K-Stone Supplies & [Richmond Paper  [Safeway Supply Sanivac/Davis
Co. Co. Repairs LLC Rolls, Inc. Inc. Mfg.Co.
DBA Richmond
Paper & Ink
6100000862 VF |P.O. Box 171088 P.O.Box 171088 [503 West Bedford |8655 NE Loop 410 (8655 NE Loop 410 (10718 Sentinnel St.|13111 Lookout Run {10841 Hillpoint Dr |1023 Morales St.
Est. |Arlington, Arlington, San Antonio, TX San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio,
Item Description Annual [TX 76003 TX 76003 78226 TX 78219 TX 78219 TX 78217 TX 78233 TX 78217 TX 78207
Quantit
1 TOILET TISSUE
A Recycled, White, GP13102 2,000
Price Per Case $32.50 $28.50 $22.24 $24.64 $24.99 No Bid $22.04 $24.19 $61.90
Price Total $65,000.00 $57,000.00 $44,480.00 $49,280.00 $49,980.00 $44,080.00 $48,380.00 $123,800.00
Brand Name Georgia Pacific Sunnycare, Roses Affex SCA Roses Vondrehle Georgia Pacific
Brand Number GP13102 5206 1145 JRT2M2 TJ1222A 1145 2212 13102
B Recycled, White, JRT902 2,000
Price Per Case $32.50 $21.50 $21.24 $19.86 $23.24 $25.37 $21.10 $23.10 No Bid
Price Total $65,000.00 $43,000.00 $42,480.00 $39,720.00 $46,480.00 $50,740.00 $42,200.00 $46,200.00
Brand Name Affex Sunnycare Roses Affex Merfin Clear Choice Roses SaniLux
Brand Number JRT902 5205 1149 JRT902 M172 RR-9210 1149 20306
C Recycled, Embossed, GP19881/01 2,500
Price Per Case $33.45 $32.20 $36.11 $36.11 No Bid $31.34 $34.71 $62.46
Price Total $83,625.00 $80,500.00 $90,275.00 $90,275.00 $78,350.00 $86,775.00 $156,150.00
Brand Name Georgia Pacific Baywest Georgia Pacific SCA Baywest Vondrehle Georgia Pacific
Brand Number GP19881/01 59890 GP19880/01 TM1616S 59890 5022 19881-01
D Non-Recycled, White, GP13718 1,500
Price Per Case $22.30 $31.86 $26.87 $28.05 No Bid No Bid $27.29 $36.27
Price Total $33,450.00 $47,790.00 $40,305.00 $42,075.00 $40,935.00 $54,405.00
Brand Name Georgia Pacific Georgia Pacific Affex SCA Vondrehle Georgia Pacific
Brand Number GP13718 Jumbo Jr. 13718 JRT2M1 TJO912A 2109 13718
E Recycled, White, GP19378 5,000
Price Per Case $34.70 $53.62 $31.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid $50.48
Price Total $173,500.00 $268,100.00 $156,500.00 $252,400.00
Brand Name Georgia Pacific Georgia Pacific Georgia Pacific Georgia Pacific
Brand Number GP19378 19378 19378 19378
2 PAPER TOWELS
A Non-Recycled, White, GP89460 5,000
Price Per Case $54.20 $51.05 $29.82 $48.99 No Bid $29.64 No Bid $51.79
Price Total $271,000.00 $255,250.00 $149,100.00 $244,950.00 $148,200.00 $258,950.00
Brand Name Georgia Pacific AB Platinum Roses Georgia Pacific Roses Georgia Pacific
Brand Number GP89460 Platinum 212 89460 212 89460
B [Recycled, White, C-Fold, Baywest 1,500
49500
Price Per Case $21.50 $18.50 $18.74 $17.37 $18.42 No Bid $18.76 $19.05 No Bid
Price Total $32,250.00 $27,750.00 $28,110.00 $26,055.00 $27,630.00 $28,140.00 $28,575.00
Brand Name Baywest Sunnycare Baywest Affex SCA Baywest National Tissue
Brand Number Ecosoft 49500 C-Fold 49500 CFB600 CB530 49500 611
C Bleached, M-Fold, Roses 203R 1,500
Price Per Case $19.50 $17.68 $16.94 $21.02 $17.77 $18.97 No Bid
Price Total $29,250.00 $26,520.00 $25,410.00 $31,530.00 $26,655.00 $28,455.00
Brand Name Roses Southwest| Gen SCA Clear Choice Roses Solaris
Brand Number 203R 1509 MB546A RR-8105 203 43513
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D Recycled, M-Fold, Baywest 48300 5,000
Price Per Case $19.50 $18.56 $16.94 No Bid $18.60 $20.49 No Bid
Price Total $97,500.00 $92,800.00 $84,700.00 $93,000.00 $102,450.00
Brand Name Baywest Baywest SCA Baywest Vondrehle
Brand Number 48300 48300 MB540A 48300 548-W

E Non-Recyled, Roll, Merfin 7850W 2,500
Price Per Case $53.98 $25.96 $46.51 No Bid No Bid $42.30 No Bid
Price Total $134,950.00 $64,900.00 $116,275.00 $105,750.00
Brand Name Merfin Boardwalk Merfin Clea
Brand Number 7850W 6254 7850W CL990W

F Recycled, C-Fold, GP20241 1,500
Price Per Case $21.80 $18.50 $17.37 $18.42 No Bid $18.54 $19.65 $41.67
Price Total $32,700.00 $27,750.00 $26,055.00 $27,630.00 $27,810.00 $29,475.00 $62,505.00
Brand Name Georgia Pacific Baywest Affex SCA Baywest Vondrehle Georgia Pacific
Brand Number GP20241 49300 CFB600 CB530 49300 524W 20241

G Non-Recycled, Z-Fold, GP20886 1,500
Price Per Case $26.50 $35.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $38.10
Price Total $39,750.00 $53,820.00 $57,150.00
Brand Name Georgia Pacific Georgia Pacific Georgia Pacific
Brand Number GP20886 20886 20886
TOILET SEAT COVERS AND

3 |DISPENSERS
Half-fold Seat Covers 200
Price Per Case $33.50 $25.30 $32.27 $27.60 $27.30 $26.40 $40.50
Price Total $6,700.00 $5,060.00 $6,454.00 $5,520.00 $5,460.00 $5,280.00 $8,100.00
Brand Name Rochester Midland Clear Choice Hospeco Clear Choice Roses Sierra Tough Guy
Brand Number 25177673 RR-SP5000R HG5000 RR-SP5000R 60101 TX-5000R 2VEX6

B Half-fold Seat Cover Dispenser 25
Price Per Case $6.25 $7.85 $11.15 $8.39 $10.17 $10.40 $8.00
Price Total $156.25 $196.25 $278.75 $209.75 $254.25 $260.00 $200.00
Brand Name Rochester Midland Rochester Midland Hospeco Rodchester| Hospeco Hospeco Tough Guy

Midland

Brand Number 50RA-A BRM-A2690 HG-1-2 RM-A2690 HG 1-2 HOSHG-1-2 2VEX8
BABY CHANGING TABLE LINE AND

4 STATION, HORIZONTAL

A Baby Changing Station, Horizontal 5
Price Per Each $237.38 $201.68 $184.14 $219.26 No Bid $203.35 No Bid $249.67
Price Total $1,186.90 $1,008.40 $920.70 $1,096.30 $1,016.75 $1,248.35
Brand Name Rubbermaid Hospeco Continental Hospeco Hospeco Rubbermaid
Brand Number RUB7818-88 67016 8252-H 67016 67016 7818-88

B Baby Changing Table Liner 25
Price Per Case $97.50 $37.68 $54.01 $55.72 No Bid $52.65 No Bid $77.38
Price Total $2,437.50 $942.00 $1,350.25 $1,393.00 $1,316.25 $1,934.50
Brand Name Rubbermaid KKP Continental Hospeco Hospeco Rubbermaid
Brand Number RUB7817 KB150-99 8255 67015 67015 320
Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 2% Net 10 2% Net 10 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
Estimated Annual Total
Estimated Total Award
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