
City Of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: November 18, 2011

For: Tractors, Trailers, Roll Off Hoists and Roll Off Containers

Freightliner of San Antonio, LTD Grande Truck Center Heil of Texas Reliance Truck & Equipment 
, LTD

Santex Truck Center, LTD VanGuard Truck Center of 
Austin

Wastequip Mfg. Co., LLC

6100000782 LS 8700 IH 10 East 4562 IH 10 East 503 Pop Gunn 7200 S. WW. White Rd. 1380 Ackerman Rd. 18001 IH 35 841 Meacham Road

Item Description  Qty
Converse,                                         
TX 78109

San Antonio,                          
TX 78232 

San Antonio,                          
TX 78219

San Antonio,                          
TX 78222

San Antonio,                          
TX 78219

Buda,                                     
TX 78610

Statesville,                             
NC 28677

1 Tractors, Minimum 48,000-lb. GVWR 24
Price Each: $89,240.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $97,530.00 $117,794.14 No Bid
Price Total: $2,141,760.00 $2,340,720.00 $2,827,059.36
Year, Make & Model Cab & Chassis: 2012-2013 Freightliner M2-106 2013 International 7500 2013 Mack GU813

Cab & Chassis Warranty: 1 year - unlimited miles 1 Year unlimited miles 1 Year unlimited mileage
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: Cummins ISC - 330 - 8.3L -

330HP/1,000 TQ
International MaxForce10

330HP
Mack MP7 345 HP

Engine Warranty: 2 years - 250K miles 2 years - 150,000 miles 2 year 250,000 miles
Specific Make & Model of Transmission Offered: Allison 3,000 RDS Allison 3,000 RDS Allison 3,000 RDS 6 speed
Transmission Warranty: 5 years - unlimited warranty 5 years - unlimited miles 5 years - unlimited miles

Diagnostic Software Licenses 2
Price Each: $0.00 $0.00 $2,000.00
Price Total: $0.00 $0.00 $4,000.00
Diagnostic Software Licenses Renewal, One (1) Year 2
Price Each: $0.00 $350.00 $0.00
Price Total: $0.00 $700.00 $0.00

Production Cut Off Date: March 31, 2012 April 30, 2012 February 15, 2012
Last Day for the City can place orders: February 1, 2012 April 30, 2012 February 15, 2012

Delivery 180 Days 180 Days 180 Days

2 Trailers, Rear Ejection, Horizontal Discharge 24
Price Each No Bid $67,448.00 $72,900.00 $69,320.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price Total $1,618,752.00 $1,749,600.00 $1,663,680.00
Make & Model 2012 Texoma 37 FT

Ejection Trailer
Warren, 3939-3 J & J SPO 53

Warranty: 1 Year 1 Year 1 Year

Production Cut Off Date: January 27, 2012 May 1, 2012 January 18, 2012
Last Day for the City can place orders: January 27, 2012 March 1, 2012 January 18, 2012

Delivery 180 Days 180 Days 180 Days

3 Roll Off Containers 16
Price Each: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $6,913.00
Price Total: $110,608.00
Make & Model: 40 YD XHD Brush Box
Warranty: 1 year

Production Cut Off Date:
Last Day for the City can place orders: March 1, 2012

March 1, 2012
Delivery 3-4 weeks

4 Cab and Chassis, Minimum 64,000 lbs. GVWR, with 
186" Cab to Axle AND Roll Off Tilt Frame Hoist with 
Tarp System, Mounted on Cab and Chassis

3

Price Each: $153,352.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $149,970.00 $164,781.89 No Bid
Price Total: $460,056.00 $449,910.00 $494,345.67
Year, Make & Model Cab & Chassis: 2012-2013 Freightliner 1145D 2013 International 7600 2013 Mack GU813

Warranty: 1 year unlimited 1 year unlimited miles 1 year unlimited mileage
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: Detroit Diesel - DD13 12.8L 450 HP 

1550 TQ
International MaxForce 13

475HP
Mack MP8 445HP

Engine Warranty: 2 years - unlimited miles (All) 5
years - 500K Major Components

2 Years 150,000 miles 2 Years 250,000 miles

Specific Make & Model of Transmission Offered: Allison 4500 RDS Allison 4500 RDS Allison RDS4500 6 speed
Transmission Warranty: 5 years unlimited miles 5 year unlimited miles 5 year unlimited miles

Diagnostic Software Licenses 2
Price Each: $0.00 $0.00 $2,000.00
Price Total: $0.00 $0.00 $4,000.00
Diagnostic Software Licenses Renewal, One (1) Year 2
Price Each: $0.00 $350.00 $0.00
Price Total: $0.00 $700.00 $0.00

Production Cut Off Date: March 31, 2012 April 30, 2012 February 15, 2012
Last Day for the City can place orders: February 1, 2012 April 30, 2012 February 15, 2012

Delivery 180 Days 90 - 180 Days 180 Days

Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
Total $2,601,816.00 $1,618,752.00 $1,749,600.00 $1,663,680.00 $2,792,030.00 $3,329,405.03 $110,608.00


	D

