Opened: October 26, 2011

City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Bid# 1

Bid # 2

For: Emergency Service All Purpose Vehicles Philpott Motors Tom Benson Caldwell Country Ford Caldwell Country Chevrolet
6100000681 JE 1400 U.S. Highway 69 9400 San Pedro Ave. P.O. Box 27 P.O. Box 28
Nederland, San Antonio, Caldwell, Caldwell,
Item Description Quantity |TX 77627 TX 78216 TX 77836 TX 77837
1 Police Package SUV 4
Price Each No Bid $29,849.25 No Bid $26,447.00
Price Total $119,397.00 $105,788.00
2012 Chevrolet PPV Tahoe
Make & Model & Year Offered: as per GM's Specs Chevrolet Tahoe PPV - 2012
Production Cut-Off Date: April 30, 2012 June 2012
Indicate the last day that the city can place orders
under this contract without missing the production cut-
off date: April 30, 2012 May 1, 2012
Bid Prices shall remain firm for all orders placed prior
to this cut-off date. In the event that city does not
award a contract prior to production cut-off date, can
bidder provide bid items, at the bid price submitted,
after the production cut-off date? No Yes
90 + 120 Days Going thru Kerr
Delivery Ind's 120 Days
3Yr/36K-5Yr- 100, 000
Warranty on Power Train 3Yr/ 36, 000 miles
2 Sport Utility Vehicle 8
Price Each $22,775.00 No Bid $24,786.00 No Bid
Price Total $182,200.00 $198,288.00
Make & Model & Year Offered: 2011 Ford Expedition 2012 Ford Expedition SSV UIF
Production Cut-Off Date: In stock May 1, 2012
Indicate the last day that the city can place orders
under this contract without missing the production cut- On stock May 1, 2012
Bid Prices shall remain firm for all orders placed prior
to this cut-off date. In the event that city does not
award a contract prior to production cut-off date, can
bidder provide bid items, at the bid price submitted,
after the production cut-off date? N/A Yes
Delivery 10 Days 120 Days
36/36,000 ml's Bumper to
Warranty Bumper 3Yr/ 36, 000 miles
3 Sport Utility Vehicle 6
Price Each $16,400.00 $22,126.25 $18,388.00 No Bid
Price Total $98,400.00 $132,757.50 $110,328.00
Ford Escape 4 Dr Sport Utility|
Make & Model & Year Offered: 2012 Ford Escape Chevrolet / Equinox / 2012 2012 UOC
Production Cut-Off Date: October 30, 2011 April 30, 2012 May 1, 2012
Indicate the last day that the city can place orders
under this contract without missing the production cut-
off date: 30 Days April 30, 2012 May 1, 2012
Bid Prices shall remain firm for all orders placed prior
to this cut-off date. In the event that city does not
award a contract prior to production cut-off date, can
bidder provide bid items, at the bid price submitted,
after the production cut-off date? October 30, 2011 No Yes
Delivery 60 Days 90 - 120 Days 120 Days
3Yr/36K-5Yr- 100, 000
Warranty 36/36, 000 Bumper to Bumper on Power Train 3Yr /36, 000 miles
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Opened: October 26, 2011

City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Bid # 1

Bid # 2

For: Emergency Service All Purpose Vehicles Philpott Motors Tom Benson Caldwell Country Ford Caldwell Country Chevrolet
6100000681 JF 1400 U.S. Highway 69 9400 San Pedro Ave. P.O. Box 27 P.O. Box 28
Nederland, San Antonio, Caldwell, Caldwell,
Item Description Quantity |TX 77627 TX 78216 TX 77836 TX 77837
4 Full Sized Extended SUV 1
Price Each No Bid $34,465.26 No Bid $32,644.00
Price Total $34,465.26 $32,644.00
Chevrolet 2500 (3/4) Suburban

Make & Model & Year Offered: Chevrolet / CC20906 / 2012 2012 CC20906

Production Cut-Off Date: April 2012 June 2012

Indicate the last day that the city can place orders

under this contract without missing the production cut-

off date: April 2012 May 1, 2012

Bid Prices shall remain firm for all orders placed prior

to this cut-off date. In the event that city does not

award a contract prior to production cut-off date, can

bidder provide bid items, at the bid price submitted,

after the production cut-off date? No Yes

Delivery 60 Days 120 Days
3Yr/36K-5Yr-100, 000

Warranty on Power Train| 3Yr/ 36, 000 miles

5 Police Package SUV 1

Price Each No Bid $28,129.25 No Bid $25,838.00

Price Total $28,129.25 $25,838.00
2012 Chevrolet PPV Tahoe

Make & Model & Year Offered: as per GM's Specs Chevrolet Tahoe PPV - 2012

Production Cut-Off Date: April 30, 2012 June 2012

Indicate the last day that the city can place orders

under this contract without missing the production cut-

off date: April 30, 2012 May 1, 2012

Bid Prices shall remain firm for all orders placed prior

to this cut-off date. In the event that city does not

award a contract prior to production cut-off date, can

bidder provide bid items, at the bid price submitted,

after the production cut-off date? No Yes

Delivery 90 - 120 Days 120 Days
3Yr/36K-5Yr- 100, 000

Warranty on Power Train 3Yr/ 36, 000 miles

Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30

Estimated Total $280,600.00 $314,749.01 $308,616.00 $164,270.00
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