
City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened:  August 17, 2011  Bid #1 Bid #2
For: Cooper Equipment 

Co.
Freightliner of San 
Antonio, Ltd.

Grande Truck Center RDO Equipment 
Company

RDO Equipment 
Company

Rush Truck Centers of 
Texas L.P. dba Rush 
Truck Centers of San 
Antonio

Santex Truck Center, 
Ltd.

6100000430 CE 17474 Judson Rd. 8700 IH 10 East 4562 IH 10 East 19275 N. IH 35 19275 N. IH 35 8810 IH 10 East 1380 Ackerman Rd.

Item Description Qty
San Antonio,                 
TX 78247

Converse,                     
TX 78109           

San Antonio,                 
TX 78219

New Braunfels,            
TX  78132-4877

New Braunfels,            
TX  78132-4877

San Antonio,              
TX 78219

San Antonio,                 
TX 78219

1 Minimum 35,000 lbs. GVWR, 7 CY Dump 
Truck

1

Price Each No Bid $84,402.00 $78,560.25 No Bid No Bid $91,697.75 $85,880.50
Item Total $84,402.00 $78,560.25 $91,697.75 $85,880.50
Year, Make & Model Cab & Chassis 2012/2013 Freightliner 

M2-106
2011 Ford F750 2012 Peterbilt 337 2012 International 

4300 4X2
Make & Model of Body Gallion 10' 7 Yard Davis TA 7-10 OX 6-7 Yard 10' 

Maverick
Davis 10' 7 Cubic 
Yard Dump Body

Specific Make & Model of Transmission 
Offered

Allison 3500 RDS Allison 3000 6-Speed Allison 3000 RDS-P 
Automatic

Allison 3500 RDS

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Includes SAE NET HP)

3.3L Cummins ISC 
270 -270HP/800 Tq.

Cummins ISB 325HP Paccar PX6 
325HP/2600 
750Tq./800

International 
MaxxForce DT 
270HP/860Tq.

Diagnostic Software Price Total $0.00 $0.00 $15,500.00 Not Provided
Diagnostic Software Renewal Total $0.00 $0.00 $575.00 Not Provided
Delivery 120-180 Days 150-180 Days 120 Days 95 Days
Last Day to Order at This Price 10/31/2011 10/21/2011 10/31/2011 11/30/2011
Production Cut Off Date 2/28/2012 10/17/2011 1/31/2012 12/31/2011

2 Cab & Chassis, Minimum 25,000 lbs. GVWR, 
Max GVWR 26,000, 18' Dump Body

1

Price Each No Bid No Bid $72,320.00 No Bid No Bid $85,422.94 $76,805.00
Item Total $72,320.00 $85,422.94 $76,805.00
Year, Make & Model Cab & Chassis 2011 Ford F750 2012 Peterbilt 330 2012 International 

4300M7 4X2
Make & Model of Body Davis H180-P4T OX 18Ft. Flat Dump 

Trash Body
Davis Custom 18' 

Dump Body
Specific Make & Model of Transmission 
Offered

Allison 2500 RDS 6-
Speed

Allison 2500 RDS-P 
Rugged Duty 

Automatic

Allison 2500 RDS

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Includes SAE NET HP)

Cummins ISB 250HP Paccar PX6 
260HP/660Tq.

International 
MaxxForce 7 300HP

Diagnostic Software Price Total $0.00 $15,500.00 Not Provided
Diagnostic Software Renewal Total $0.00 $575.00 Not Provided
Delivery 150-180 Days 120 Days 95 Days
Last Day to Order at This Price 10/21/2011 10/312011 11/30/2011
Production Cut Off Date 10/17/2011 1/31/2012 12/31/2011

3 Cab & Chassis, Minimum 35,000 lbs. GVWR, 
Fuel and Lube Body Truck

2

Price Each No Bid $151,349.00 $143,332.00 No Bid No Bid $161,022.27 $161,072.84
Item Total $302,698.00 $286,664.00 $322,044.54 $322,145.68

 Year, Make & Model Cab & Chassis 2012/2013 Freightliner 
M2 106

2011 Ford F750 2012 Peterbilt 337 2012 International 
4400 4X2

Make & Model of Body Niece Equipment FL 
1000

2011 CTE Single Axle 
Hydraulic Operated 

Fuel Lube Bed

Niece FL 1000 C.T.E. Hydraulic Fuel 
& Lube Body

 Specific Make & Model of Transmission 
Offered

Allison 3500 RDS Allison 3000 RDS 6-
Speed

Allison 3500 RDS-P 
Rugged Duty Series 

Automatic

Allison 3500 RDS

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Includes SAE NET HP)

Cummins ISC-
300HP/860 Tq.

Cummins ISB 
325HP/750Tq.

Paccar PX-8 300/2200 
860 @1400

International 
MaxxForce DT 300HP

Diagnostic Software Price Total $0.00 $0.00 $15,500.00 Not Provided
Diagnostic Software Renewal Total $0.00 $0.00 $575.00 Not Provided
Delivery 150-210 Days 180-260 Days 120 Days 95 Days
Last Day to Order at This Price 10/31/2011 10/21/2011 10/31/2011 11/30/2011
Production Cut Off Date 2/28/2012 10/17/2011 1/31/2012 12/31/2011

Medium & Heavy Duty Trucks
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened:  August 17, 2011  Bid #1 Bid #2
For: Cooper Equipment 

Co.
Freightliner of San 
Antonio, Ltd.

Grande Truck Center RDO Equipment 
Company

RDO Equipment 
Company

Rush Truck Centers of 
Texas L.P. dba Rush 
Truck Centers of San 
Antonio

Santex Truck Center, 
Ltd.

6100000430 CE 17474 Judson Rd. 8700 IH 10 East 4562 IH 10 East 19275 N. IH 35 19275 N. IH 35 8810 IH 10 East 1380 Ackerman Rd.

Item Description Qty
San Antonio,                 
TX 78247

Converse,                     
TX 78109           

San Antonio,                 
TX 78219

New Braunfels,            
TX  78132-4877

New Braunfels,            
TX  78132-4877

San Antonio,              
TX 78219

San Antonio,                 
TX 78219

Medium & Heavy Duty Trucks

4A Trailer, Min 60 Ton, Self Lifting, Detachable 
(RGN), Deck Length 108"

2

Price Each $94,370.00 No Bid No Bid $102,895.00 $102,895.00 No Bid No Bid
Item Total $188,740.00 $205,790.00 $205,790.00
Year, Make & Model Cab & Chassis 2011 Etnyre RTN 60 

TD3 Trailer
2011 Interstate Trailer 

Model 120SDGN/XD
2011 Interstate Trailer 

Model 120SDGN/XD

Delivery 240 Days 24-28 Weeks 180 Days
Last Day to Order at This Price December 2011 12/31/2011 12/31/2011
Production Cut Off Date January 2012 12/31/2011 12/31/2011

4B Trailer, Min 60 Ton, Self Lifting, Detachable 
(RGN), Deck Length 102"

1

Price Each $78,920.00 No Bid No Bid $69,295.00 $69,295.00 No Bid No Bid
Item Total $78,920.00 $69,295.00 $69,295.00
Year, Make & Model Cab & Chassis 2011 Etnyre RTN 60 

TD3 Trailer
2011 Interstate Trailer 

Model 120SDGN
2011 Interstate Trailer 

Model 120SDGN

Delivery 240 Days 16-18 Weeks 120 Days
Last Day to Order at This Price December 2011 12/31/2011 12/31/2011
Production Cut Off Date January 2012 12/31/2011 12/31/2011

5 Trailer, Min. 48,000 GVWR, Non Tilt Platform 1

Price Each No Bid No Bid No Bid $18,195.00 $22,895.00 No Bid No Bid
Item Total $18,195.00 $22,895.00
Year, Make & Model Cab & Chassis 2011 Interstate Trailer 

Model 40DLA
2011 Interstate Model 

50DLA
Delivery 6-8 Weeks 45 Days
Last Day to Order at This Price 12/31/2011 12/31/2011
Production Cut Off Date 12/31/2011 12/31/2011

6 Cab & Chassis, 6X4, Minimum 66,000 
GVWR with Minimum 10.5 Cubic Yard 
Cement Mixer

2

Price Each No Bid $143,910.00 $138,375.42 No Bid No Bid $146,783.95 No Bid
Item Total $287,820.00 $276,750.84 $293,567.90
Year, Make & Model Cab & Chassis 2012/2013 Freightliner 

114SD-Severe Duty
2012 Mack GU813 2012 Peterbilt 365

Make & Model of Body Beck Industrial- 10.5 
Yard Mixer

Beck 10.5 Yard Mixer Beck 10.5 Yard Beck 
Industrial Paving 

Mixer
Specific Make & Model of Transmission 
Offered

Allison 4500 RDS Mack TM308 8-Speed Fuller RTD-16908LL 
10-Speed

Specific Make & Model of Engine Detroit Diesel-DD13-
410HP/1450Tq.

Mack MP7 
395HP/1580 Tq.

ISX 11.9400V 
HP/1650 Tq.

Diagnostic Software Price Total $2,500.00 $750.00 $15,500.00
Diagnostic Software Renewal Total $2,500.00 $250.00 $575.00
Delivery 120-180 Days 210-275 Days 120 Days
Last Day to Order at This Price 10/31/2011 11/1/2011 10/31/2011
Production Cut Off Date 2/28/2012 3/15/2012 1/31/2012
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened:  August 17, 2011  Bid #1 Bid #2
For: Cooper Equipment 

Co.
Freightliner of San 
Antonio, Ltd.

Grande Truck Center RDO Equipment 
Company

RDO Equipment 
Company

Rush Truck Centers of 
Texas L.P. dba Rush 
Truck Centers of San 
Antonio

Santex Truck Center, 
Ltd.

6100000430 CE 17474 Judson Rd. 8700 IH 10 East 4562 IH 10 East 19275 N. IH 35 19275 N. IH 35 8810 IH 10 East 1380 Ackerman Rd.

Item Description Qty
San Antonio,                 
TX 78247

Converse,                     
TX 78109           

San Antonio,                 
TX 78219

New Braunfels,            
TX  78132-4877

New Braunfels,            
TX  78132-4877

San Antonio,              
TX 78219

San Antonio,                 
TX 78219

Medium & Heavy Duty Trucks

7 Cab & Chassis, Minimum 62,000 GVWR, 
102" Usable Cab to Axle Tractor

18

Price Each No Bid $108,997.00 $99,816.40 No Bid No Bid $121,676.71 $105,369.00
Item Total $1,961,946.00 $1,796,695.20 $2,190,180.78 $1,896,642.00
Year, Make & Model Cab & Chassis 2012/2013 Freightliner 

Coronado SD (Severe 
Duty)

2012 Mack CXU 613 2012 Peterbilt 384 2012 International 
7600

Specific Make & Model of Transmission 
Offered

Eaton Fuller RTLO-
16913A

Fuller RTLO-18913A Fuller RTLO-16913A 
13-Speed

Fuller RTLO-18913A

Specific Make & Model of Engine Cummins ISX 15 
485HP/1650Tq.

Mack MP8 505HP Paccar MX 
485HP/1650Tq.

Not Provided

Diagnostic Software Price Total $0.00 $750.00 $15,500.00 Not Provided
Diagnostic Software Renewal Total $0.00 $250.00 $575.00 Not Provided
Delivery 150-180 Days 150-210 Days 120 Days 180-220 Days
Last Day to Order at This Price 10/31/2011 11/1/2011 10/31/2011 11/1/2011
Production Cut Off Date 2/28/2012 3/15/2012 1/31/2012 12/1/2011

8 Cab & Chassis, Minimum 66,000 GVWR, 
102" Usable Cab to Axle Tractor

2

Price Each No Bid $126,793.00 $136,007.11 No Bid No Bid $140,749.67 $131,318.00
Item Total $253,586.00 $272,014.22 $281,499.34 $262,636.00
Year, Make & Model Cab & Chassis 2012/2013 Freightliner 

Coronado SD (Severe 
Duty)

2012 TD 713 2012 Peterbilt 367 2012 International 
5900

Specific Make & Model of Transmission 
Offered

Eaton Fuller RTLO-
18918B

RTLO-18918B Fuller RTLO-18918B 
18-Speed

Fuller RTLO 18918B

Specific Make & Model of Engine Cummins ISX 15 
500HP/1850Tq.

Mack MP10 525HP ISX 15 
500HP/1850Tq.

Warren

Diagnostic Software Price Total $0.00 $750.00 $15,500.00 N/A
Diagnostic Software Renewal Total $0.00 $250.00 $575.00 N/A
Delivery 120-180 Days 210-260 Days 120 Days 120-220 Days
Last Day to Order at This Price 10/31/2011 11/1/2011 10/31/2011 11/1/2011
Production Cut Off Date 2/28/2012 3/15/2012 1/31/2011 12/1/2011

Totals $267,660.00 $2,890,452.00 $2,783,004.51 $293,280.00 $297,980.00 $3,264,413.25 $2,644,109.18
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