
City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 22, 2011  
For: Light Duty Trucks Alternative 

Fuels
Caldwell Country Ford Grande Truck Center Philpott Motors

6100000293                                                LD P.O. Box 27 4562 IH 10 East 1400 Hwy 69

Item Description Qty
Caldwell,                     
TX 77836

San Antonio,                 
TX 78219

Nederland,                 
TX 77627

1A 3/4 Ton Truck, Regular Cab 3
Price Each $33,640.00 No Bid $28,942.30
Price Total $100,920.00 $86,826.90
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford F250 Reg 

Cab 4X2, F2A
2012 Ford F250

Propulsion System Type LPG Propane
Production Cut-Off Date Spring 2012 (April) May 2012
Last day order can be placed 
without missing cut-off date

Not Provided Not Provided

Can bidder provide bid items after 
cut-off date

Not Provided May 2012

Delivery 180 Days 120 Days

1B 3/4 Ton Truck, Regular Cab, 4X4, 
Tool Boxes w/Slide-out Cargo 
Tray & Cover

1

Price Each $37,920.00 No Bid $39,000.90
Price Total $37,920.00 $39,000.90
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford F250 Reg 

Cab 4X4, F2B
2012 Ford F250

Propulsion System Type LPG Propane
Production Cut-Off Date Spring 2012 (April) May 2012
Last day order can be placed 
without missing cut-off date

Not Provided May 2012

Can bidder provide bid items after 
cut-off date

Not Provided Yes

Delivery 180 Days 120 Days

1C 3/4 Ton Trucks, Extended Cab, 
Short Bed

10

Price Each $34,886.00 No Bid $31,390.30
Price Total $348,860.00 $313,903.00
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford F250 S/C 

SWB-X2A
2012 Ford F250

Propulsion System Type LPG Propane
Production Cut-Off Date Spring 2012 (April) May 2012
Last day order can be placed 
without missing cut-off date

Not Provided May 2012

Can bidder provide bid items after 
cut-off date

Not Provided Yes

Delivery 180 Days 120 Days
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 22, 2011  
For: Light Duty Trucks Alternative 

Fuels
Caldwell Country Ford Grande Truck Center Philpott Motors

6100000293                                                LD P.O. Box 27 4562 IH 10 East 1400 Hwy 69

Item Description Qty
Caldwell,                     
TX 77836

San Antonio,                 
TX 78219

Nederland,                 
TX 77627

1D 3/4 Ton Truck, Crew Cab, Short 
Bed

12

Price Each $37,600.00 No Bid No Bid
Price Total $451,200.00
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford F250 S/C 

SWB-X2A DSL
Propulsion System Type LPG
Production Cut-Off Date Spring 2012 (April)
Last day order can be placed 
without missing cut-off date

Not Provided

Can bidder provide bid items after 
cut-off date

Not Provided

Delivery 180 Days

1E 3/4 Ton Truck, Crew Cab, Short 
Bed, Toolbox

1

Price Each $37,600.00 No Bid $32,341.30
Price Total $37,600.00 $32,341.30
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford F250 Crew 

Cab -SWB-W2A
2012 Ford F250

Propulsion System Type LPG Propane
Production Cut-Off Date Spring 2012 (April) May 2012
Last day order can be placed 
without missing cut-off date

Not Provided May 2012

Can bidder provide bid items after 
cut-off date

Not Provided Yes

Delivery 180 Days 120 Days

1F 3/4 Ton Truck, Crew Cab, 4X4, 
Long Bed

3

Price Each $40,116.00 No Bid $38,610.90
Price Total $120,348.00 $115,832.70
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford F250 Crew 

Cab 4X4-W2B 
2012 Ford F250

Propulsion System Type LPG Propane
Production Cut-Off Date Spring 2012 (April) May 2012
Last day order can be placed 
without missing cut-off date

Not Provided May 2012

Can bidder provide bid items after 
cut-off date

Not Provided Yes

Delivery 180 Days 120 Days
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 22, 2011  
For: Light Duty Trucks Alternative 

Fuels
Caldwell Country Ford Grande Truck Center Philpott Motors

6100000293                                                LD P.O. Box 27 4562 IH 10 East 1400 Hwy 69

Item Description Qty
Caldwell,                     
TX 77836

San Antonio,                 
TX 78219

Nederland,                 
TX 77627

1G 3/4 Ton Truck, Crew Cab, 4X4 
Long Bed

2

Price Each $40,116.00 No Bid $33,045.00
Price Total $80,232.00 $66,090.00
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford F250 Crew 

Cab 4X4 -LWB-W2B
2012 Ford F250

Propulsion System Type LPG Propane
Production Cut-Off Date Spring 2012 (April) May 2012
Last day order can be placed 
without missing cut-off date

Not Provided May 2012

Can bidder provide bid items after 
cut-off date

Not Provided Yes

Delivery 180 Days 120 Days

2 3/4 Ton Cab & Chassis, Regular 
Cab, 56” Cab to Axle, SRW with 8 
Cages and 1 Storage 
Compartment Animal Control Unit 
Body

2

Price Each $58,500.00 No Bid No Bid
Price Total $117,000.00
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford F250 R/C - 

Animal -F2A
Propulsion System Type LPG
Production Cut-Off Date Spring 2012 (April)
Last day order can be placed 
without missing cut-off date

Not Provided

Can bidder provide bid items after 
cut-off date

Not Provided

Delivery 240 Days

3A 3/4 Ton Cab & Chassis, Regular 
Cab, 56” Cab to Axle chassis, 
SRW, Service Body W/Pipe Rack  

2

Price Each $43,186.00 No Bid No Bid
Price Total $86,372.00
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford F250 R/C - 

Utility -F2A 
Propulsion System Type LPG
Production Cut-Off Date Spring 2012 (April)
Last day order can be placed 
without missing cut-off date

Not Provided

Can bidder provide bid items after 
cut-off date

Not Provided

Delivery 240 Days
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 22, 2011  
For: Light Duty Trucks Alternative 

Fuels
Caldwell Country Ford Grande Truck Center Philpott Motors

6100000293                                                LD P.O. Box 27 4562 IH 10 East 1400 Hwy 69

Item Description Qty
Caldwell,                     
TX 77836

San Antonio,                 
TX 78219

Nederland,                 
TX 77627

3B 3/4 Ton Cab & Chassis, Regular 
Cab, 56” Cab to Axle chassis, 
SRW, Service Body w/Telescopic 
Roof and Ladder Rack    

2

Price Each $44,950.00 No Bid No Bid
Price Total $89,900.00
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford F250 R/C - 

Utility -F2A 
Propulsion System Type LPG
Production Cut-Off Date Spring 2012 (April)
Last day order can be placed 
without missing cut-off date

Not Provided

Can bidder provide bid items after 
cut-off date

Not Provided

Delivery 240 Days

3C 3/4 Ton Cab & Chassis, Regular 
Cab, 56” Cab to Axle chassis, 
SRW, Service Body  

2

Price Each $43,800.00 No Bid No Bid
Price Total $87,600.00
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford F250 R/C - 

Utility -F2A 
Propulsion System Type LPG
Production Cut-Off Date Spring 2012 (April)
Last day order can be placed 
without missing cut-off date

Not Provided

Can bidder provide bid items after 
cut-off date

Not Provided

Delivery 240 Days

4A Dodge Ram 3500, Cab & 
Chassis, 56” Cab to Axle, Crew 
Cab, SRW with KUV body, 
Bucket Seats    

4

Price Each No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price Total
Make, Model & Year 
Propulsion System Type
Production Cut-Off Date
Last day order can be placed 
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after 
cut-off date
Delivery
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 22, 2011  
For: Light Duty Trucks Alternative 

Fuels
Caldwell Country Ford Grande Truck Center Philpott Motors

6100000293                                                LD P.O. Box 27 4562 IH 10 East 1400 Hwy 69

Item Description Qty
Caldwell,                     
TX 77836

San Antonio,                 
TX 78219

Nederland,                 
TX 77627

4B Dodge Ram 3500 Truck, Crew 
Cab, 4X4, Long Bed, SRW, 
w/Camper Top and Front Bumper 
w/Winch, Bucket Seats     

1

Price Each No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price Total
Make, Model & Year 
Propulsion System Type
Production Cut-Off Date
Last day order can be placed 
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after 
cut-off date
Delivery

4C Dodge Ram 3500 Truck, Crew 
Cab, 4X4, Long Bed, SRW, 
w/Camper Top and Pull-Out Bed, 
Bucket Seats

2

Price Each No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price Total
Make, Model & Year 
Propulsion System Type
Production Cut-Off Date
Last day order can be placed 
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after 
cut-off date
Delivery

4D 1 Ton Truck, Crew Cab, Long 
Bed, DRW, Liftgate

1

Price Each $48,620.00 No Bid No Bid
Price Total $48,620.00
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford F350 Crew 

Cab N3C 
Propulsion System Type LPG
Production Cut-Off Date Spring 2012 (April)
Last day order can be placed 
without missing cut-off date

Not Provided

Can bidder provide bid items after 
cut-off date

Not Provided

Delivery 240 Days
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 22, 2011  
For: Light Duty Trucks Alternative 

Fuels
Caldwell Country Ford Grande Truck Center Philpott Motors

6100000293                                                LD P.O. Box 27 4562 IH 10 East 1400 Hwy 69

Item Description Qty
Caldwell,                     
TX 77836

San Antonio,                 
TX 78219

Nederland,                 
TX 77627

4E 1 Ton Truck, Crew Cab, 4X4, 
Long Bed, DRW, Toolbox    

1

Price Each $50,337.00 No Bid No Bid
Price Total $50,337.00
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford F350 4X4 

Crew Cab W3D 
Propulsion System Type LPG
Production Cut-Off Date Spring 2012 (April)
Last day order can be placed 
without missing cut-off date

Not Provided

Can bidder provide bid items after 
cut-off date

Not Provided

Delivery 240 Days

4F Dodge Ram 3500, Cab & 
Chassis, 56” Cab to Axle, Crew 
Cab, 4x4, SRW with KUV body, 
Bucket Seats

1

Price Each No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price Total
Make, Model & Year 
Propulsion System Type
Production Cut-Off Date
Last day order can be placed 
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after 
cut-off date
Delivery

5A 1 Ton Truck, Crew Cab, Long 
Bed, DRW, Toolbox

2

Price Each $45,330.00 No Bid No Bid
Price Total $90,660.00
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford F350 Crew 

Cab DRW - W3C 
Propulsion System Type LPG
Production Cut-Off Date Spring 2012 (April)
Last day order can be placed 
without missing cut-off date

Not Provided

Can bidder provide bid items after 
cut-off date

Not Provided

Delivery 180 Days
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 22, 2011  
For: Light Duty Trucks Alternative 

Fuels
Caldwell Country Ford Grande Truck Center Philpott Motors

6100000293                                                LD P.O. Box 27 4562 IH 10 East 1400 Hwy 69

Item Description Qty
Caldwell,                     
TX 77836

San Antonio,                 
TX 78219

Nederland,                 
TX 77627

5B 1 Ton Truck, Regular Cab, 4X4, 
Long Bed 

1

Price Each $44,337.00 No Bid No Bid
Price Total $44,337.00
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford F350 4X4 

Reg F3B 
Propulsion System Type LPG
Production Cut-Off Date Spring 2012 (April)
Last day order can be placed 
without missing cut-off date

Not Provided

Can bidder provide bid items after 
cut-off date

Not Provided

Delivery 180 Days

6A 1 Ton Cab & Chassis, Regular 
Cab, 60” Cab to Axle, SRW, 
Service Body w/Telescopic Roof 
and Ladder Rack

2

Price Each $53,440.00 No Bid No Bid
Price Total $106,880.00
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford F350 Reg 

60CA - SRW - F3E
Propulsion System Type LPG
Production Cut-Off Date Spring 2012 (April)
Last day order can be placed 
without missing cut-off date

Not Provided

Can bidder provide bid items after 
cut-off date

Not Provided

Delivery 240 Days

6B 1 Ton Cab & Chassis, Regular 
Cab, 60” Cab to Axle, SRW, 
Service Body w/Ladder Rack

1

Price Each $51,780.00 No Bid No Bid
Price Total $51,780.00
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford F350 Reg 

60CA - SRW - F3E
Propulsion System Type LPG
Production Cut-Off Date Spring 2012 (April)
Last day order can be placed 
without missing cut-off date

Not Provided

Can bidder provide bid items after 
cut-off date

Not Provided

Delivery 240 Days
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 22, 2011  
For: Light Duty Trucks Alternative 

Fuels
Caldwell Country Ford Grande Truck Center Philpott Motors

6100000293                                                LD P.O. Box 27 4562 IH 10 East 1400 Hwy 69

Item Description Qty
Caldwell,                     
TX 77836

San Antonio,                 
TX 78219

Nederland,                 
TX 77627

6C 1 Ton Cab & Chassis, Regular 
Cab, 60” Cab to Axle, SRW, 
Service Body W/Pipe Rack 

1

Price Each $52,900.00 No Bid No Bid
Price Total $52,900.00
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford F350 Reg 

60CA - SRW - F3E
Propulsion System Type LPG
Production Cut-Off Date Spring 2012 (April)
Last day order can be placed 
without missing cut-off date

Not Provided

Can bidder provide bid items after 
cut-off date

Not Provided

Delivery 240 Days

7A 1 Ton Truck, Crew Cab, 60” Cab 
to Axle, 4X4, DRW, 9’ Platform 
Body W/Tool boxes  

3

Price Each $55,919.00 No Bid No Bid
Price Total $167,757.00
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford F350 4X4 

Crew Cab W3H
Propulsion System Type LPG
Production Cut-Off Date Spring 2012 (April)
Last day order can be placed 
without missing cut-off date

Not Provided

Can bidder provide bid items after 
cut-off date

Not Provided

Delivery 240 Days

7B Minimum 19,500 GVWR, Regular 
Cab, 84” Cab to Axle, 4X4, DRW, 
14’ ft Platform Body W/Herbicide 
Sprayer  

2

Price Each No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price Total
Make, Model & Year 
Propulsion System Type
Production Cut-Off Date
Last day order can be placed 
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after 
cut-off date
Delivery
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 22, 2011  
For: Light Duty Trucks Alternative 

Fuels
Caldwell Country Ford Grande Truck Center Philpott Motors

6100000293                                                LD P.O. Box 27 4562 IH 10 East 1400 Hwy 69

Item Description Qty
Caldwell,                     
TX 77836

San Antonio,                 
TX 78219

Nederland,                 
TX 77627

7C 1 Ton Truck, Crew Cab, 60” Cab 
to Axle, DRW, W/ 9’ Stake Bed

1

Price Each $52,310.00 No Bid No Bid
Price Total $52,310.00
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford F350 Crew 

Cab W3G
Propulsion System Type LPG
Production Cut-Off Date Spring 2012 (April)
Last day order can be placed 
without missing cut-off date

Not Provided

Can bidder provide bid items after 
cut-off date

Not Provided

Delivery 240 Days

7D 1 Ton Truck, Regular Cab, 60” 
Cab to Axle, DRW, w/ 9' Stake 
Bed   

1

Price Each $48,337.00 No Bid No Bid
Price Total $48,337.00
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford F350 Reg 

Cab F3G
Propulsion System Type LPG
Production Cut-Off Date Spring 2012 (April)
Last day order can be placed 
without missing cut-off date

Not Provided

Can bidder provide bid items after 
cut-off date

Not Provided

Delivery 240 Days

7E 1 Ton Truck, Regular Cab, 60” 
Cab to Axle, DRW, w/ 9’ Stake 
Bed W/Liftgate

1

Price Each $51,400.00 No Bid No Bid
Price Total $51,400.00
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford F350 Reg 

Cab F3G
Propulsion System Type LPG
Production Cut-Off Date Spring 2012 (April)
Last day order can be placed 
without missing cut-off date

Not Provided

Can bidder provide bid items after 
cut-off date

Not Provided

Delivery 240 Days
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 22, 2011  
For: Light Duty Trucks Alternative 

Fuels
Caldwell Country Ford Grande Truck Center Philpott Motors

6100000293                                                LD P.O. Box 27 4562 IH 10 East 1400 Hwy 69

Item Description Qty
Caldwell,                     
TX 77836

San Antonio,                 
TX 78219

Nederland,                 
TX 77627

7F 1 Ton Truck, Regular Cab, 60” 
Cab to Axle, DRW, w/ 9' Platform 
Body, Tool Boxes

1

Price Each $51,800.00 No Bid No Bid
Price Total $51,800.00
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford F350 Reg 

F3G
Propulsion System Type LPG
Production Cut-Off Date Spring 2012 (April)
Last day order can be placed 
without missing cut-off date

Not Provided

Can bidder provide bid items after 
cut-off date

Not Provided

Delivery 240 Days

8 Minimum 15,000 lbs. GVWR, 84” 
Cab to Axle, Minimum 36ft. Aerial 
Vehicle with service body

1

Price Each No Bid $113,892.00 No Bid
Price Total $113,892.00
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford F550 with 

Terex Aerial Device
Propulsion System Type Chassis 6.7L V8 

Diesel with Hybrid-Hy 
Power Aerial Device 

Production Cut-Off Date Not determined at this 
time

Last day order can be placed 
without missing cut-off date

11/15/2011

Can bidder provide bid items after 
cut-off date

No

Delivery 210-260 Days

9 Step Van, Minimum 14,000 GVWR 1
Price Each $56,880.00 $82,975.00 No Bid
Price Total $56,880.00 $82,975.00
Make, Model & Year 2102 Ford E450 

Stepvan - Utilimaster 
E4K

2012 Ford E4K E450 

Propulsion System Type LPG 5.4L Gas with Azure 
Dynamics Parallel 

Hybrid Electric
Production Cut-Off Date Spring 2012 (April) Not determined at this 

time
Last day order can be placed 
without missing cut-off date

Not Provided 11/15/2011

Can bidder provide bid items after 
cut-off date

Not Provided No

Delivery 240 Days 150-215 Days
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 22, 2011  
For: Light Duty Trucks Alternative 

Fuels
Caldwell Country Ford Grande Truck Center Philpott Motors

6100000293                                                LD P.O. Box 27 4562 IH 10 East 1400 Hwy 69

Item Description Qty
Caldwell,                     
TX 77836

San Antonio,                 
TX 78219

Nederland,                 
TX 77627

10A Minimum 19,000 GVWR Cab & 
Chassis Truck with 84” Cab to 
Axle, Regular cab, 4x2, Dual Rear 
Wheels, with Service Body

1

Price Each $77,400.00 No Bid No Bid
Price Total $77,400.00
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford F550 Reg 

Cab - F5G
Propulsion System Type LPG
Production Cut-Off Date Spring 2012 (April)
Last day order can be placed 
without missing cut-off date

Not Provided

Can bidder provide bid items after 
cut-off date

Not Provided

Delivery 240 Days

10B Minimum 19,000 GVWR Cab & 
Chassis Truck with 60” Cab to 
Axle, Crew Cab, 4x2, Dual Rear 
Wheels, 9’ Flatbed 

2

Price Each $61,330.00 No Bid No Bid
Price Total $122,660.00
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford F550 Crew 

Cab W5G
Propulsion System Type LPG
Production Cut-Off Date Spring 2012 (April)
Last day order can be placed 
without missing cut-off date

Not Provided

Can bidder provide bid items after 
cut-off date

Not Provided

Delivery 240 Days

11 Minimum 13,000 GVWR, Van, 15 
passenger

1

Price Each $37,990.00 No Bid No Bid
Price Total $37,990.00
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford E350 Pass-

15 S3B
Propulsion System Type LPG
Production Cut-Off Date Spring 2012 (April)
Last day order can be placed 
without missing cut-off date

Not Provided

Can bidder provide bid items after 
cut-off date

Not Provided

Delivery 180 Days

Prepared by Purchasing 7/15/2011 Page 11



City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 22, 2011  
For: Light Duty Trucks Alternative 

Fuels
Caldwell Country Ford Grande Truck Center Philpott Motors

6100000293                                                LD P.O. Box 27 4562 IH 10 East 1400 Hwy 69

Item Description Qty
Caldwell,                     
TX 77836

San Antonio,                 
TX 78219

Nederland,                 
TX 77627

12 Minimum 13,000 GVWR, Van, 12 
passenger

5

Price Each $36,200.00 No Bid No Bid
Price Total $181,000.00
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford E350 Pass-

12 E3B
Propulsion System Type LPG
Production Cut-Off Date Spring 2012 (April)
Last day order can be placed 
without missing cut-off date

Not Provided

Can bidder provide bid items after 
cut-off date

Not Provided

Delivery 180 Days

13 Minimum GVWR 13,000 lbs. Van, 
Cargo

2

Price Each $34,827.00 No Bid No Bid
Price Total $69,654.00
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford E350 

Cargo - E3E
Propulsion System Type LPG
Production Cut-Off Date Spring 2012 (April)
Last day order can be placed Not Provided
Can bidder provide bid items after 
cut-off date

Not Provided

Delivery 180 Days

Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
Estimated Totals $2,920,654.00 $196,867.00 $653,994.80
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