City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 22, 2011 Bid 1 Bid 2 Bid 1 Bid 2
For: Light Duty Trucks Ancira Motor Company|Caldwell Country Ford |Grande Truck Center |Grande Truck Center |Grapevine Dodge, Grapevine Dodge, Gunn Chevrolet Philpott Motors
Chrysler, Jeep Chrysler, Jeep
6100000292 LD 10807 IH 10 West P.O. Box 27 4562 IH 10 East 4562 IH 10 East 2601 William D Tate |2601 William D Tate 12602 IH 35 North 1400 N. Hwy 69
Ave.
San Antonio, TX Caldwell, San Antonio, San Antonio, Grapevine, Grapevine, Live Oak, Nederland,
Item Description Qty [78230 TX 77836 TX 78219 TX 78219 TX 76051 TX 76051 TX 78233 TX 77627
1A 3/4 Ton truck, Regular Cab 3
Price Each No Bid| $19,088.00| $19,765.00| No Bid| $25,394.00 $22,869.00| $18,416.00| $18,266.30
Price Total $57,264.00] $59,295.00 $76,182.00] $68,607.00] $55,248.00] $54,798.90]
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford F250 Reg 2012 F2A Ford R/C 2012 Dodge Ram 2012 Dodge Ram 2011-12 Chey| 2012 Ford F250|
Cab 4X2, F2A Gas| F250 2500 2500 CC20903
Production Cut-Off Date Spring 2012 (April)| Not determined at this| 4/15/12] 4/15/12] 7/14/11] Not Provided|
time|
Last day order can be placed Not Provided| 12/31/2011 4/15/12] 4/15/12] Not Provided| 5-2012
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after Not Provided| No No No Not Provided| Yes|
cut-off date
Delivery 120 Days 90-120 Days| 60 Days| 60 Days| 75 Days| 90 Days|
1B 3/4 Ton Truck, Regular Cab, 4X4, 1
Diesel, Tool Boxes w/Slide-out
Cargo Tray & Cover
Price Each No Bid $33,116.00] $35,809.00] No Bid No Bid No Bid $31,160.00] $28,646.23]
Price Total $33,116.00| $35,809.00 $31,160.00| $28,646.23|
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford F250 Reg 2012 F2B Ford R/C]| Chev| 2012 Ford F250 S/C
Cab 4X4, F2B DSL| 4X4 F250
Production Cut-Off Date Spring 2012 (April)| Not determined at this| 7/14/11 5-2012
time
Last day order can be placed Not Provided,| 12/31/2011 Not Provided| 5-2012
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after Not Provided| No| Not Provided| Yes|
cut-off date
Delivery 120 Days| 90-120 Days| 75 Days| 90 Days|
1Cc 3/4 Ton Trucks, Extended Cab, 9
Short Bed
Price Each No Bid $20,940.00] $21,513.00] No Bid $24,854.00] $22,529.00] $20,114.00] $20,714.30]
Price Total $188,460.00] $193,617.00] $223,686.00] $202,761.00] $181,026.00] $186,428.70]
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford F250 S/C| 2012 X2A Ford F250] 2012 Dodge Ram 2012 Dodge Ram 2011-12 Chev| 2012 Ford F250 S/C
SWB-X2A Gas Super Cab 2500 Crew Cab 2500 Crew Cab CC20753
Production Cut-Off Date Spring 2012 (April)| Not determined at this| 04/15/12 04/15/12, 7/14/11 5-2012
time
Last day order can be placed Not Provided| 12/31/2011 04/15/12 04/15/12 Not Provided| 5-2012
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after Not Provided,| No| No| No| Not Provided| Yes|
cut-off date
Delivery 120 Days| 90-120 Days| 60 Days| 60 Days| 75 Days| 90 Days|
1D 3/4 Ton Trucks, Extended Cab, 1
Diesel, Short Bed
Price Each No Bid| $27,320.00| $28,085.00 No Bid| No Bid| $32,007.00| $27,237.00| $27,059.90|
Price Total $27,320.00) $28,085.00] $32,007.00] $27,237.00] $27,059.90]
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford F250 S/C| 2012 X2A Ford F250] 2012 Dodge Ram 2011-12 Chev| 2012 Ford F250 S/C|
SWB-X2A DSL Super Cab 2500 Crew Cab CC20753
Production Cut-Off Date Spring 2012 (April)| Not determined at this| 04/15/12 7/14/2011 5-2012
time|
Last day order can be placed Not Provided| 12/31/2011 04/15/12] Not Provided| 5-2012
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after Not Provided| No No Not Provided| Yes|
cut-off date
Delivery 120 Days| 90-120 Days 60 Days| 75 Days| 90 Days|
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 22, 2011 Bid 1 Bid 2 Bid 1 Bid 2
For: Light Duty Trucks Ancira Motor Company|Caldwell Country Ford |Grande Truck Center |Grande Truck Center |Grapevine Dodge, Grapevine Dodge, Gunn Chevrolet Philpott Motors
Chrysler, Jeep Chrysler, Jeep
6100000292 LD 10807 IH 10 West P.O. Box 27 4562 IH 10 East 4562 IH 10 East 2601 William D Tate |2601 William D Tate 12602 IH 35 North 1400 N. Hwy 69
Ave.
San Antonio, TX Caldwell, San Antonio, San Antonio, Grapevine, Grapevine, Live Oak, Nederland,
Item Description Qty [78230 TX 77836 TX 78219 TX 78219 TX 76051 TX 76051 TX 78233 TX 77627
1E 3/4 Ton Truck, Crew Cab, Short 8
Bed
Price Each No Bid $22,391.00] $23,265.00] No Bid $24,854.00] $22,087.00] $21,883.00] $21,665.30]
Price Total $179,128.00] $186,120.00] $198,832.00] $176,696.00] $175,064.00] $173,322.40]
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford F250 Crew| 2012 W2A Ford F250 2012 Dodge Ram 2012 Dodge Ram 2011-12 Chev| 2012 Ford F250 CC
Cab -SWB-W2A Gas Crew Cab| 2500 2500 CC20743
Production Cut-Off Date Spring 2012 (April)| Not determined at this| 4/15/12] 4/15/12] 7/14/11] 5-2012
time|
Last day order can be placed Not Provided| 12/31/2011 4/15/12] 4/15/12] Not Provided| 5-2012
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after Not Provided| No| No| No| Not Provided| Yes|
cut-off date
Delivery 120 Days| 90-120 Days| 60 Days| 60 Days| 75 Days| 90 Days|
1F 3/4 Ton Truck, Crew Cab, Diesel, 4
Short Bed
Price Each No Bid| $28,740.00| $29,233.00| No Bid| No Bid| $29,374.00| $31,508.00 $27,934.90|
Price Total $114,960.00 $116,932.00 $117,496.00 $126,032.00 $111,739.60
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford F250 Crew| 2012 W2A Ford F250 2012 Dodge Ram 2011-12 Chev| 2012 Ford F250 CC
Cab -SWB-W2A AS1 Crew Cab 2500 CK20743
Production Cut-Off Date Spring 2012 (April)| Not determined at this| 4/15/12] 7/14/11] 5-2012
time|
Last day order can be placed Not Provided| 12/31/2011 4/15/12| Not Provided| 5-2012
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after Not Provided| No| No| Not Provided| Yes|
cut-off date
Delivery 120 Days 90-120 Days| 60 Days| 75 Days| 90 Days|
1G 3/4 Ton Truck, Crew Cab, Short 1
Bed, Toolbox
Price Each No Bid $23,382.00] $23,769.00] No Bid $25,853.00] $23,330.00 $22,528.00] $22,445.70]
Price Total $23,382.00| $23,769.00| $25,853.00 $23,330.00| $22,528.00 $22,445.70|
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford F250 Crew| 2012 W2A Ford F250 2012 Dodge Ram 2012 Dodge Ram 2011-12 Chev| 2012 Ford F250 CC
Cab -SWB-W2A Gas Crew Cab| 2500 2500 CC20743
Production Cut-Off Date Spring 2012 (April)| Not determined at this| 4/15/12] 4/15/12] 7/14/11] 5-2012
time|
Last day order can be placed Not Provided| 12/31/2011 4/15/12] 4/15/12] Not Provided| 5-2012
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after Not Provided| No| No| No| Not Provided| Yes|
cut-off date
Delivery 120 Days| 90-120 Days| 60 Days| 60 Days| 75 Days| 90 Days|
1H 3/4 Ton Truck, Crew Cab, 4X4, 3
Long Bed
Price Each No Bid $25,253.00] $25,721.00] No Bid $27,516.00] $24,991.00] $24,550.00 $24,048.30]
Price Total $75,759.00| $77,163.00| $82,548.00 $74,973.00| $73,650.00| $72,144.90|
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford F250 Crew| 2012 W2B Ford F250 2012 Dodge Ram 2012 Dodge Ram 2011-12 Chev| 2012 Ford F250 CC
Cab - 4X4 -W2B Gas| Crew Cab 4X4 2500 2500 CK20943|
Production Cut-Off Date Spring 2012 (April)| Not determined at this| 4/15/12] 4/15/12] 7/14/11] 5-2012
time|
Last day order can be placed Not Provided| 12/31/2011 4/15/12] 4/15/12] Not Provided| 5-2012
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after Not Provided| No No No Not Provided| Yes|
cut-off date
Delivery 120 Days 90-120 Days| 60 Days| 60 Days| Not Provided 90 Days|
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 22, 2011 Bid 1 Bid 2 Bid 1 Bid 2
For: Light Duty Trucks Ancira Motor Company|Caldwell Country Ford |Grande Truck Center |Grande Truck Center |Grapevine Dodge, Grapevine Dodge, Gunn Chevrolet Philpott Motors
Chrysler, Jeep Chrysler, Jeep
6100000292 LD 10807 IH 10 West P.O. Box 27 4562 IH 10 East 4562 IH 10 East 2601 William D Tate |2601 William D Tate 12602 IH 35 North 1400 N. Hwy 69
Ave.
San Antonio, TX Caldwell, San Antonio, San Antonio, Grapevine, Grapevine, Live Oak, Nederland,
Item Description Qty [78230 TX 77836 TX 78219 TX 78219 TX 76051 TX 76051 TX 78233 TX 77627
11 3/4 Ton Truck, Crew Cab, Diesel, 2
4X4, Long Bed
Price Each No Bid $31,490.00] $31,993.00] No Bid No Bid $31,627.00] $31,949.00] $30,568.90]
Price Total $62,980.00| $63,986.00| $63,254.00| $63,898.00| $61,137.80|
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford F250 Crew| 2012 W2B Ford F250 2012 Dodge Ram 2011-12 Chev| 2012 Ford F250 CC
Cab - 4X4 -LWB W2B Crew Cab 4X4 2500 CK20943|
DSL
Production Cut-Off Date Spring 2012 (April)| Not determined at this| 4/15/12| 7/14/11 5-2012
time
Last day order can be placed Not Provided| 12/31/2011 4/15/12| Not Provided| 5-2012
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after Not Provided| No No Not Provided| Yes|
cut-off date
Delivery 120 Days| 90-120 Days| 60 Days| 75 days| 90 Days|
Jh) 3/4 Ton Truck, Regular Cab, 1
Camper Top, Strobe
Price Each No Bid| No Bid| $22,321.00| No Bid| No Bid| No Bid| No Bid| $20,701.30|
Price Total $22,321.00] $20,701.30]
Make, Model & Year 2102 F2A Ford F250| 2012 Ford F250 Reg
R/C Cab
Production Cut-Off Date Not determined at this 5-2012
time|
Last day order can be placed 12/31/2011 5-2012
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after No Yes|
cut-off date
Delivery 90-120 Days| 90 Days|
2 3/4 Ton Cab & Chassis, Regular 2
Cab, 56” Cab to Axle, SRW with 8
Cages and 1 Storage
Compartment Animal Control Unit
Body
Price Each No Bid| $40,575.00| $41,387.00| No Bid| No Bid| No Bid| No Bid| $39,584.30
Price Total $81,150.00] $82,774.00] $79,168.60)
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford F250 R/C -| 2012 F2A Ford w/| 2012 Ford F250 Cab &|
Animal -F2A Mavron Bod Chassis
Production Cut-Off Date Spring 2012 (April)| Not determined at this| 5-2012
time|
Last day order can be placed Not Provided| 11/15/2011 5-2012
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after Not Provided| No| Yes|
cut-off date
Delivery 180 Days| 180-250 Days| 120 Days|
3A 3/4 Ton Cab & Chassis, Regular 2
Cab, 56" Cab to Axle chassis,
SRW, Service Body W/Pipe Rack
Price Each No Bid| $27,961.00| $28,275.00| No Bid| No Bid| No Bid| $26,252.00 $26,873.30
Price Total $55,922.00] $56,550.00 $52,504.00] $53,746.60)|
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford F250 R/C - 2012 F2A Ford wi/| 2011-12 Chev| 2012 Ford F250 R/C
Utility -F2A| Service Body, w/ Pipe| CC20903
Rack|
Production Cut-Off Date Spring 2012 (April)| Not determined at this| 6/15/2011 5-2012
time
Last day order can be placed Not Provided| 11/15/2011 Not Provided| 5-2012
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after Not Provided| No Not Provided| Yes|
cut-off date
Delivery 180 Days 90-120 Days| 75 days 120 Days
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 22, 2011 Bid 1 Bid 2 Bid 1 Bid 2
For: Light Duty Trucks Ancira Motor Company|Caldwell Country Ford |Grande Truck Center |Grande Truck Center |Grapevine Dodge, Grapevine Dodge, Gunn Chevrolet Philpott Motors
Chrysler, Jeep Chrysler, Jeep
6100000292 LD 10807 IH 10 West P.O. Box 27 4562 IH 10 East 4562 IH 10 East 2601 William D Tate |2601 William D Tate 12602 IH 35 North 1400 N. Hwy 69
Ave.
San Antonio, TX Caldwell, San Antonio, San Antonio, Grapevine, Grapevine, Live Oak, Nederland,
Item Description Qty [78230 TX 77836 TX 78219 TX 78219 TX 76051 TX 76051 TX 78233 TX 77627
3B 3/4 Ton Cab & Chassis, Regular 2
Cab, 56" Cab to Axle chassis,
SRW, Service Body w/Telescopic
Roof and Ladder Rack
Price Each No Bid| $28,376.00| $27,923.00| No Bid| No Bid| No Bid| No Bid| $44,049.30|
Price Total $56,752.00) $55,846.00] $88,098.60)]
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford F250 R/C -| 2012 F2A Ford w/| 2012 Ford F250
Utility -F2A] Service Body Tele|
Roof
Production Cut-Off Date Spring 2012 (April)| Not determined at this| 5-2012
time
Last day order can be placed Not Provided| 11/15/2011 5-2012
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after Not Provided| No| Yes|
cut-off date
Delivery 180 Days| 90-120 Days| 120 Days|
3C 3/4 Ton Cab & Chassis, Regular 2
Cab, 56" Cab to Axle chassis,
SRW, Service Body
Price Each No Bid| $26,337.00| $26,413.00| No Bid| No Bid| No Bid| $24,682.00| $25,178.30
Price Total $52,674.00] $52,826.00) $49,364.00] $50,356.60)
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford F250 R/C -| 2012 F2A Ford w/| 2011-12 Chey| 2012 Ford F250
Utility -F2A| Service Body| CC20903
Production Cut-Off Date Spring 2012 (April)| Not determined at this| 7/14/2011 5-2012
time|
Last day order can be placed Not Provided| 11/15/2011 Not Provided| 5-2012
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after Not Provided| No Not Provided| Yes|
cut-off date
Delivery 180 Days| 90-150 Days| 75 days| 120 Days|
4A Dodge Ram 3500, Cab & 4
Chassis, 56" Cab to Axle, Crew
Cab, Diesel, SRW with KUV body,
Bucket Seats
Price Each $42,685.75 No Bid| No Bid| No Bid| No Bid| No Bid| No Bid| No Bid|
Price Total $170,743.00|
Make, Model & Year 2012 Dodge Ram
3500, Chassis & Cab)
4x2 Diesel SRW/KUV|
Bodyj
Production Cut-Off Date N/A|
Last day order can be placed Not Provided|
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after Not Provided|
cut-off date
Delivery 120 Days|
4B Dodge Ram 3500 Truck, Crew 1
Cab, Diesel, 4X4, Long Bed,
SRW, w/Camper Top and Front
Bumper w/Winch, Bucket Seats
Price Each $37,996.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price Total $37,996.00

Make, Model & Year

Production Cut-Off Date

Last day order can be placed
without missing cut-off date

Can bidder provide bid items after
cut-off date

Delivery

2012 Dodge Ram
3500 Crew Cab 4X4|
w/ Camper Top, Fr
Bumper w/ Winch
N/A|

Not Provided|

Not Provided|

120 Days|
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 22, 2011 Bid 1 Bid 2 Bid 1 Bid 2
For: Light Duty Trucks Ancira Motor Company|Caldwell Country Ford |Grande Truck Center |Grande Truck Center |Grapevine Dodge, Grapevine Dodge, Gunn Chevrolet Philpott Motors
Chrysler, Jeep Chrysler, Jeep
6100000292 LD 10807 IH 10 West P.O. Box 27 4562 IH 10 East 4562 IH 10 East 2601 William D Tate |2601 William D Tate 12602 IH 35 North 1400 N. Hwy 69
Ave.
San Antonio, TX Caldwell, San Antonio, San Antonio, Grapevine, Grapevine, Live Oak, Nederland,
Item Description Qty [78230 TX 77836 TX 78219 TX 78219 TX 76051 TX 76051 TX 78233 TX 77627
4c Dodge Ram 3500 Truck, Crew 2
Cab, Diesel, 4X4, Long Bed,
SRW, w/Camper Top and Pull-
Out Bed, Bucket Seats
Price Each $35,496.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price Total $70,992.00
Make, Model & Year 2012 Dodge Ram
3500 Crew Cab 4X4|
w/ Camper Top, Pull
Out Bed
Production Cut-Off Date N/A|
Last day order can be placed Not Provided|
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after Not Provided|
cut-off date
Delivery 120 Days|
4D 1 Ton Truck, Crew Cab, Diesel, 1
Long Bed, DRW, Liftgate
Price Each No Bid| $33,337.00| $33,495.00| No Bid| No Bid| $34,458.00 $33,546.00 $32,194.90|
Price Total $33,337.00] $33,495.00] $34,458.00] $33,546.00] $32,194.90]
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford F350 Crew| 2012 W3C Ford Crew 2012 Dodge Ram 2011-2012 Chev| 2012 Ford F350
Cab W3C| Cab DRW w/ Lift Gate 500 CC30943
Production Cut-Off Date Spring 2012 (April)| Not determined at this| 04/15/12 6/15/2011 5-2012
time
Last day order can be placed Not Provided| 11/15/2011 04/15/12| Not Provided| 5-2012
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after Not Provided| No| No| Not Provided| Yes|
cut-off date
Delivery 120-150 Days, 90-120 Days| 75 Days| 75 days 120 Days
4E 1 Ton Truck, Crew Cab, Diesel, 1
4X4, Long Bed, DRW, Toolbox
Price Each No Bid $35,216.00| $35,197.00| No Bid| No Bid| $34,561.00| $33,730.00| $40,286.66|
Price Total $35,216.00] $35,197.00] $34,561.00] $33,730.00] $40,286.66|
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford F350 4X4| 2012 W3D Ford Crew 2012 Dodge Ram 2011-12 Chey| 2012 Ford F350
Crew Cab W3D| Cab 4X4 w/ Tool Box| 3500 CK30943
Production Cut-Off Date Spring 2012 (April)| Not determined at this| 4/15/12| 7/14/11 5-2012
time
Last day order can be placed Not Provided| 11/15/2011 4/15/12] Not Provided| 5-2012
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after Not Provided| No| No| Not Provided| Yes|
cut-off date
Delivery 120 Days 90-120 Days| 60 Days| 75 days 120 Days
4F Dodge Ram 3500, Cab & 1
Chassis, 56" Cab to Axle, Crew
Cab, Diesel, 4x4, SRW with KUV
body, Bucket Seats
Price Each $43,444.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price Total $43,444.75

Make, Model & Year

Production Cut-Off Date

Last day order can be placed
without missing cut-off date

Can bidder provide bid items after
cut-off date

Delivery

2012 Dodge Ram
3500 Crew Cab
Chassis Diesel 4X4, W|
KUV Body|

N/A|

Not Provided|

No Provided|

120 Days|
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 22, 2011 Bid 1 Bid 2 Bid 1 Bid 2
For: Light Duty Trucks Ancira Motor Company|Caldwell Country Ford |Grande Truck Center |Grande Truck Center |Grapevine Dodge, Grapevine Dodge, Gunn Chevrolet Philpott Motors
Chrysler, Jeep Chrysler, Jeep
6100000292 LD 10807 IH 10 West P.O. Box 27 4562 IH 10 East 4562 IH 10 East 2601 William D Tate |2601 William D Tate 12602 IH 35 North 1400 N. Hwy 69
Ave.
San Antonio, TX Caldwell, San Antonio, San Antonio, Grapevine, Grapevine, Live Oak, Nederland,
Item Description Qty [78230 TX 77836 TX 78219 TX 78219 TX 76051 TX 76051 TX 78233 TX 77627
5A 1 Ton Truck, Crew Cab, Diesel, 2
Long Bed, DRW, Toolbox
Price Each No Bid| $30,776.00| $32,067.00| No Bid| No Bid| $31,625.00 $31,045.00| $30,752.50
Price Total $61,552.00] $64,134.00] $63,250.00 $62,090.00] $61,505.00
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford F350 Crew| 2012 Ford W3C Crew 2012 Dodge Ram 2011-12 Chev| 2012 Ford F350 CC
Cab DRW - W3C Cab w/ Tool Box| 3500 CC30943
Production Cut-Off Date Spring 2012 (April)| Not determined at this| 4/15/12| 7/14/11 5-2012
time
Last day order can be placed Not Provided| 11/15/2011 4/15/12| Not Provided| 5-2012
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after Not Provided| No| No| Not Provided| Yes|
cut-off date
Delivery 120 Days| 90-120 Days| 60 Days| 75 days| 90-120 days|
5B 1 Ton Truck, Regular Cab, Diesel, 1
4X4, Long Bed
Price Each No Bid| $29,717.00| $29,243.00| No Bid| No Bid| No Bid| $28,735.00 $27,825.90
Price Total $29,717.00] $29,243.00] $28,735.00] $27,825.90]
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford F350 4X4| 2012 F3B Ford F350 2011-12 Chey]| 2012 Ford F350
Reg F3B| R/C 4X4 CK30903
Production Cut-Off Date Spring 2012 (April)| Not determined at this| 6/15/2011] 5-2012
time|
Last day order can be placed Not Provided| 12/31/2011 Not Provided| 5-2012
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after Not Provided| No Not Provided| Yes|
cut-off date
Delivery 120 Days| 90-120 Days| 75 days| 90 Days|
B6A 1 Ton Cab & Chassis, Regular 2
Cab, 60" Cab to Axle chassis,
Diesel, SRW, Service Body
w/Telescopic Roof and Ladder
Rack
Price Each No Bid| $37,887.00 $36,861.00| No Bid| No Bid| No Bid| $36,840.00| $36,797.90|
Price Total $75,774.00] $73,722.00] $73,680.00] $73,595.80)
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford F350 Reg| 2012 F3E Ford F350 2011-12 Chev| 2012 Ford F350 CC
60CA - SRW - F3E| w/ Service Body, Tele| CK30903
Roof & Ladder Rack
Production Cut-Off Date Spring 2012 (April)| Not determined at this| 6/15/2011 5-2012
time
Last day order can be placed Not Provided| 11/15/2011 Not Provided| 5-2012
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after Not Provided,| No| Not Provided| Yes|
cut-off date
Delivery 180 Days 90-150 Days| 75 days 90-120 days|
6B 1Ton Cab & Chassis, Regular 1
Cab, 60" Cab to Axle chassis,
Diesel, SRW, Service Body
w/Ladder Rack
Price Each No Bid| $36,488.00| $35,816.00| No Bid| No Bid| No Bid $36,013.00| $35,517.90
Price Total $36,488.00] $35,816.00] $36,013.00] $35,517.90]
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford F350 Reg| 2012 F3E Ford F350] 2011-12 Chey| 2012 Ford F350
60CA - SRW - F3E]| w/ Service Body & CK30903
Ladder Rack
Production Cut-Off Date Spring 2012 (April)| Not determined at this| 7114/11 5-2012
time
Last day order can be placed Not Provided| 11/15/2011 Not Provided| 5-2012
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after Not Provided| No| Not Provided| Yes|
cut-off date
Delivery 180 Days| 90-150 Days| 75 days| 120 Days|
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 22, 2011 Bid 1 Bid 2 Bid 1 Bid 2
For: Light Duty Trucks Ancira Motor Company|Caldwell Country Ford |Grande Truck Center |Grande Truck Center |Grapevine Dodge, Grapevine Dodge, Gunn Chevrolet Philpott Motors
Chrysler, Jeep Chrysler, Jeep
6100000292 LD 10807 IH 10 West P.O. Box 27 4562 IH 10 East 4562 IH 10 East 2601 William D Tate |2601 William D Tate 12602 IH 35 North 1400 N. Hwy 69
Ave.
San Antonio, TX Caldwell, San Antonio, San Antonio, Grapevine, Grapevine, Live Oak, Nederland,
Item Description Qty [78230 TX 77836 TX 78219 TX 78219 TX 76051 TX 76051 TX 78233 TX 77627
6C 1 Ton Cab & Chassis, Regular 1
Cab, 60" Cab to Axle chassis,
Diesel, SRW, Service Body
W/Pipe Rack
Price Each No Bid $37,440.00 $37,279.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $36,483.00 $36,860.90
Price Total $37,440.00| $37,279.00 $36,483.00| $36,860.90
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford F350 Reg| 2012 F3E Ford F350 2011-12 Cheyv; 2012 Ford F350
B60CA - SRW - F3E|w/ Service Body & Pipe CK30903|
Rack
Production Cut-Off Date Spring 2012 (April)| Not determined at this| 6/15/2011] 5-2012
time|
Last day order can be placed Not Provided| 11/15/2011 Not Provided| 5-2012
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after Not Provided| No Not Provided| Yes|
cut-off date
Delivery 180 Days 90-150 Days| 75 days 120 Days
7A 1 Ton Truck, Crew Cab, 60" Cab 4
to Axle, Diesel, 4X4, DRW, 9'
Platform Body W/Tool boxes
Price Each No Bid $40,386.00 $41,735.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $41,339.90
Price Total $161,544.00] $166,940.00] $165,359.60]
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford F350 4X4| 2012 W3H Ford F350 2012 Ford F350
Crew Cab -176 - W3H Crew Cab 4X4 w/
Platform Body & Tool
Box|
Production Cut-Off Date Spring 2012 (April)| Not determined at this| 5-2012
time
Last day order can be placed Not Provided| 11/15/2011 5-2012
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after Not Provided| No| Yes|
cut-off date
Delivery 180 Days| 90-120 Days| 120 Days|
7B Minimum 19,500 GVWR, Regular 2
Cab, 84" Cab to Axle, Diesel, 4X4,
DRW, 14’ ft Platform Body
\W/Herbicide Sprayer
Price Each No Bid No Bid| $161,847.00 No Bid| No Bid| No Bid| No Bid No Bid
Price Total $323,694.00
Make, Model & Year 2012 F5H Ford w/|
Norstar Ind. Herbicide|
Sprayer|
Production Cut-Off Date Not determined at this|
time
Last day order can be placed 11/15/2011
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after No|
cut-off date
Delivery 180-250 Days|
7C 1 Ton Truck, Crew Cab, 60" Cab 1
to Axle, Diesel, DRW, W/ 9' Stake
Bed
Price Each No Bid $36,717.00 $37,577.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $39,340.00 $37,995.00
Price Total $36,717.00| $37,577.00| $39,340.00| $37,995.00|
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford F350 Crew| 2012 Ford W3G F350 2011-12 Cheyv; 2012 Ford F350
Cab -176 - W3G Crew Cab w/ Stake| CC31043
Bed|
Production Cut-Off Date Spring 2012 (April)| Not determined at this| 71411 5-2012
time|
Last day order can be placed Not Provided| 11/15/2011 Not Provided| 5-2012
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after Not Provided| No Not Provided| Yes|
cut-off date
Delivery 180 Days 90-120 Days| 75 days 120 Days
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 22, 2011 Bid 1 Bid 2 Bid 1 Bid 2
For: Light Duty Trucks Ancira Motor Company|Caldwell Country Ford |Grande Truck Center |Grande Truck Center |Grapevine Dodge, Grapevine Dodge, Gunn Chevrolet Philpott Motors
Chrysler, Jeep Chrysler, Jeep
6100000292 LD 10807 IH 10 West P.O. Box 27 4562 IH 10 East 4562 IH 10 East 2601 William D Tate |2601 William D Tate 12602 IH 35 North 1400 N. Hwy 69
Ave.
San Antonio, TX Caldwell, San Antonio, San Antonio, Grapevine, Grapevine, Live Oak, Nederland,
Item Description Qty [78230 TX 77836 TX 78219 TX 78219 TX 76051 TX 76051 TX 78233 TX 77627
7D 1 Ton Truck, Regular Cab, 60" 1
Cab to Axle, Diesel, DRW, w/ 9'
Stake Bed
Price Each No Bid $33,744.00] $34,613.00] No Bid No Bid No Bid $36,700.00] $33,184.00]
Price Total $33,744.00| $34,613.00| $36,700.00| $33,184.00|
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford F350 Reg| 2012 Ford F3G R/C w/| 2011-12 Cheyv; 2012 Ford F350
Cab 141 - F3G Stake Bed| CC31003
Production Cut-Off Date Spring 2012 (April)| Not determined at this| 71n411] 5-2012
time)|
Last day order can be placed Not Provided| 11/15/2011 Not Provided| 5-2012
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after Not Provided| No Not Provided| Yes|
cut-off date
Delivery 180 Days 90-120 Days| 75 days 120 Days
7E 1 Ton Truck, Regular Cab, 60" 1
Cab to Axle, Diesel, DRW, w/ 9’
Stake Bed Wi/Liftgate
Price Each No Bid| $36,186.00| $36,043.00| No Bid| No Bid| No Bid| $39,476.00| $35,233.00|
Price Total $36,186.00] $36,043.00] $39,476.00] $35,233.00]
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford F350 Reg| 2012 F3G Ford F350] 2011-12 Chey| 2012 Ford F350
Cab 141 - F3G w/ Stake Bed & Lift] CC31003
Gate|
Production Cut-Off Date Spring 2012 (April)| Not determined at this| 7/14/11 5-2012
time
Last day order can be placed Not Provided| 11/15/2011 Not Provided| 5-2012
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after Not Provided| No| Not Provided| Yes|
cut-off date
Delivery 180 Days| 90-120 Days| 75 days| 120 Days|
7F 1 Ton Truck, Regular Cab, 60" 1
Cab to Axle, Diesel, DRW, w/ 9'
Platform Body, Tool Boxes
Price Each No Bid| $36,427.00| $37,220.00| No Bid| No Bid| No Bid $37,499.00| No Bid
Price Total $36,427.00] $37,220.00] $37,499.00]
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford F350 Reg| 2012 F3G Ford F350] 2011-12 Chey|
Cab 141 - F3G|w/ Platform & Tool Box CC31003
Production Cut-Off Date Spring 2012 (April)| Not determined at this| 7/14/11
time
Last day order can be placed Not Provided| 11/15/2011 Not Provided|
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after Not Provided| No| Not Provided|
cut-off date
Delivery 180 Days| 90-120 Days| 75 days|
8 Minimum 15,000 Ibs. GVWR, 84" 1
Cab to Axle, Cab & Chassis,
Diesel, Minimum 36ft. Aerial
Vehicle with service body
Price Each No Bid| No Bid $83,977.00 $88,155.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price Total $83,977.00 $88,155.00

Make, Model & Year

Production Cut-Off Date

Last day order can be placed
without missing cut-off date

Can bidder provide bid items after
cut-off date

Delivery

2012 FAG Ford F450
w/ Utem Aerial

Not determined at this
time|

11/15/2011]

No

2012 FAG Ford F450
w/ Terex Bucket Aerial

Not determined at this
time|

11/15/2011]

No

180-250 Days;|

180-260 Days;
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 22, 2011 Bid 1 Bid 2 Bid 1 Bid 2
For: Light Duty Trucks Ancira Motor Company|Caldwell Country Ford |Grande Truck Center |Grande Truck Center |Grapevine Dodge, Grapevine Dodge, Gunn Chevrolet Philpott Motors
Chrysler, Jeep Chrysler, Jeep
6100000292 LD 10807 IH 10 West P.O. Box 27 4562 IH 10 East 4562 IH 10 East 2601 William D Tate |2601 William D Tate 12602 IH 35 North 1400 N. Hwy 69
Ave.
San Antonio, TX Caldwell, San Antonio, San Antonio, Grapevine, Grapevine, Live Oak, Nederland,
Item Description Qty [78230 TX 77836 TX 78219 TX 78219 TX 76051 TX 76051 TX 78233 TX 77627
9 Step Van, Minimum 14,000 1
GVWR
Price Each No Bid $37,447.00 $38,407.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $41,082.18
Price Total $37,447.00| $38,407.00| $41,082.18|
Make, Model & Year 2102 Ford E450| 2012 E4k Ford E450 2012 Ford E450]
Stepvan - Utilimaster| w/ Utilimaster Body]|
E4K]
Production Cut-Off Date Spring 2012 (April)| Not determined at this| 5-2012
time|
Last day order can be placed Not Provided| 11/15/2011 5-2012
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after Not Provided| No| Yes|
cut-off date
Delivery 180 Days| 150-240 Days| 160 Days|
10A Minimum 19,000 GVWR Cab & 1
Chassis Truck with 84" Cab to
Axle, Regular cab, 4x2, Dual Rear
Wheels, Diesel Engine with
Service Body
Price Each No Bid| $69,887.00 $68,239.00| No Bid| No Bid| No Bid| No Bid| $76,482.00|
Price Total $69,887.00 $68,239.00 $76,482.00
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford F550 Req| 2012 F5G Ford F550] 2012 Ford F550
Cab - 165 F5G w/ Service Bod!
Production Cut-Off Date Spring 2012 (April)| Not determined at this| 5-2012
time
Last day order can be placed Not Provided| 11/15/2011 5-2012
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after Not Provided| No| Yes|
cut-off date
Delivery 180 Days| 90-150 Days| 160 Days|
10B Minimum 19,000 GVWR Cab & 2
Chassis Truck with 60" Cab to
Axle, Crew Cab, 4x2, Dual Rear
\Wheels, Diesel Engine, 9' Flatbed
Price Each No Bid| $44,388.00| $43,767.00| No Bid| No Bid| No Bid| No Bid $41,837.90
Price Total $88,776.00 $87,534.00 $83,675.80
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford F550 Crew| 2012 W5G Ford F550 2012 Ford F550
Cab -176 W5G| Crew Cab w/ Flat Bed
Production Cut-Off Date Spring 2012 (April)| Not determined at this| 5-2012
time
Last day order can be placed Not Provided| 11/15/2011 5-2012
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after Not Provided| No| Yes|
cut-off date
Delivery 180 Days| 90-120 Days| 120 Days|
11 Minimum 13,000 GCWR, Van, 15 1
passenger
Price Each No Bid| $23,186.00| $24,753.00| No Bid| No Bid| No Bid| $24,642.00| $24,164.18|
Price Total $23,186.00 $24,753.00 $24,642.00 $24,164.18
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford E350 Pass-| 2012 S3B Ford 15 2011-12 Chey| 2012 Ford E350|
15 S3B| Pass Van| CG33706
Production Cut-Off Date Spring 2012 (April)| Not determined at this| 7/7/11 5-2012
time
Last day order can be placed Not Provided| 12/31/2011 Not Provided| 5-2012
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after Not Provided| No| Not Provided| Yes|
cut-off date
Delivery 120 Days| 90-120 Days| 75 days| 90 Days|
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 22, 2011 Bid 1 Bid 2 Bid 1 Bid 2
For: Light Duty Trucks Ancira Motor Company|Caldwell Country Ford |Grande Truck Center |Grande Truck Center |Grapevine Dodge, Grapevine Dodge, Gunn Chevrolet Philpott Motors
Chrysler, Jeep Chrysler, Jeep
6100000292 LD 10807 IH 10 West P.O. Box 27 4562 IH 10 East 4562 IH 10 East 2601 William D Tate |2601 William D Tate 12602 IH 35 North 1400 N. Hwy 69
Ave.
San Antonio, TX Caldwell, San Antonio, San Antonio, Grapevine, Grapevine, Live Oak, Nederland,
Item Description Qty [78230 TX 77836 TX 78219 TX 78219 TX 76051 TX 76051 TX 78233 TX 77627
12 Minimum 13,000 GCWR, Van, 12 5
passenger,
Price Each No Bid $21,986.00] $23,305.00] No Bid No Bid No Bid $20,043.00] $23,118.18]
Price Total $109,930.00] $116,525.00] $100,215.00] $115,590.90]
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford Pass-12 2012 E3B Ford 12| 2011-12 CG23406 2012 Ford E350]
E3B| Pass Van|
Production Cut-Off Date Spring 2012 (April)| Not determined at this| 71711 5-2012
time|
Last day order can be placed Not Provided| 12/31/2011 Not Provided| 5-2012
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after Not Provided| No Not Provided| Yes|
cut-off date
Delivery 120 Days| 90-120 Days| 75 days 90 Days|
13 Minimum GCWR 13,000 Ibs. Van, 2
Cargo
Price Each No Bid $20,227.00] $22,187.00] No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $20,690.18]
Price Total $40,454.00| $44,374.00| $41,380.36|
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford E350 Cargo| 2012 E3E Ford Cargo| 2012 Ford E350]
- E3E Van
Production Cut-Off Date Spring 2012 (April)| Not determined at this| 5-2012
time
Last day order can be placed Not Provided| 12/31/2011 5-2012
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after Not Provided| No| Yes|
cut-off date
Delivery 120 Days| 90-120 Days| 90 Days|
Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 2%-10, Net 30 2%-10, Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
Estimated Totals $323,175.75 $1,992,689.00 $2,463,875.00 $88,155.00] $607,101.00 $891,393.00 $1,439,860.00 $1,991,729.91
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