City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: March 16, 2011
For: Corrugated Polyethylene Pipe MLWN MLWN
ACT Pipe & Supply Municipal Water
Works Supply, L.P.
A499-11 VS 4719 Dodge Street 6959 State Hwy 276
Item Description Estimated |san Antonio, Royse City,
Quantity [Tx 78217 TX 75189
1 Non-Perforated Smooth Interior Corrugated
Polyethylene Pipe (20 Ft.Sections) & Fittings
Non Perforated Pipe
A |12" (305 mm) 500
Price per foot $4.46 $5.05
Total $2,230.00 $2,525.00
B 15" (381 mm) 100
Price per foot $6.03 $6.82
Total $603.00| $682.00
C  |18" (457 mm) 1,500
Price per foot $8.47 $8.44
Total $12,705.00] $12,660.00|
D 24" (610 mm) 1,000
Price per foot $13.26 $15.00)
Total $13,260.00] $15,000.00]
E 30" (762 mm) 400
Price per foot $21.32 $24.11
Total $8,528.00 $9,644.00]
F 36" (914 mm) 500
Price per foot $26.13 $29.55
Total $13,065.00) $14,775.00]
Sub Total $50,391.00] $55,286.00
Fittings Split Band Coupling
G 12" (305 mm) 12
Price each $6.22 $9.97,
Total $74.64 $119.64]
H 15" (381 mm) 12
Price each $10.35 $17.45
Total $124.20, $209.40
Price each
I 18" (457mm) 12
Price each $17.63 $20.77
Total $211.56| $249.24
J 24" (610 mm) 24
Price each $24.87 $29.08
Total $596.88| $697.92
K [30" (762 mm) 10
Price each $57.81 $69.80)
Total $578.10| $698.00|
L 36" (914 mm) 10
Price each $80.44 $95.36
Total $804.40| $953.60
Sub Total $2,389.78 $2,927.80)
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened:
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A499-11

March 16, 2011
Corrugated Polyethylene Pipe

VS

MLWN

MLWN

Item

Description

Tee

12" (305 mm)
Price each
Total

15" (381 mm)
Price each
Total

18" (457 mm)
Price each
Total

24" (610 mm)
Price each
Total

30" (762 mm)
Price each
Total

36" (914 mm)
Price each
Total

Sub Total

90 Deg. Miter Elbow

12" (305 mm)
Price each
Total

15" (381 mm)
Price each
Total

18" (457 mm)
Price each
Total

24" (610 mm)
Price each
Total

30" (762 mm)
Price each
Total

36" (914 mm)
Price each

Total

Sub Total

Estimated
Quantity

12

36

12

12

12

12

15

10

ACT Pipe & Supply
4719 Dodge Street

San Antonio,
TX 78217

$82.16|
$985.92,

$122.81
$736.86)

$172.27
$1,033.62

$266.34
$9,588.24]

$537.47
$6,449.64]

$723.03
$4,338.18

$23,132.46

$42.77|
$513.24]

$77.30
$927.60

$108.44
$1,301.28

$214.44
$3,216.60

$443.80
$4,438.00

$591.32
$3,547.92

$13,944.64]

Municipal Water
Works Supply, L.P.

6959 State

Royse City,
TX 75189

Hwy 276

$178.89
$2,146.68|

$272.39
$1,634.34]

$385.22
$2,311.32]

$748.47
$26,944.92,

$1,017.43
$12,209.16

$1,297.14
$7,782.84

$53,029.26

$54.65
$655.80

$97.64
$1,171.68|

$129.56
$1,554.72]

$232.21
$3,483.15]

$499.82
$4,998.20)

$671.08
$4,026.48|

$15,890.03
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: March 16, 2011
For: Corrugated Polyethylene Pipe MLWN MLWN
ACT Pipe & Supply Municipal Water
Works Supply, L.P.
A499-11 'S 4719 Dodge Street 6959 State Hwy 276
Item Description Estimated |san Antonio, Royse City,
Quantity |TX 78217 TX 75189
22.5 Deg. Elbow
Y 12" (305 mm) 6
Price each $35.26 $85.59
Total $211.56| $513.54]
z 15" (381 mm) 6
Price each $54.66 $146.49
Total $327.96| $878.94
AA  |18" (457 mm) 6
Price each $74.36 $176.87
Total $446.16| $1,061.22
AB  |24" (610 mm) 12
Price each $161.41 $300.54
Total $1,936.92, $3,606.48|
AC |30 (762 mm) 6
Price each $249.24 $633.19
Total $1,495.44] $3,799.14
AD  [36" (914 mm) 6
Price each $356.44 $819.13
Total $2,138.64] $4,914.78
Sub Total $6,556.68, $14,774.10
45 Deg. Elbow
AE 12" (305 mm) 6
Price each $48.56 $111.07|
Total $291.36| $666.42
AF 15" (381 mm) 6
Price each $66.99 $175.33
Total $401.94] $1,051.98
AG  |18" (457 mm) 6
Price each $89.25 $219.99
Total $535.50] $1,319.94
AH  |24" (610 mm) 12
Price each $182.27 $384.73
Total $2,187.24 $4,616.76|
Al [30" (762 mm) 6
Price each $283.85 $731.00
Total $1,703.10 $4,386.00
Al |36" (914 mm) 6
Price each $434.76 $1,013.48
Total $2,608.56) $6,080.88|
Sub Total $7,727.70 $18,121.98
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: March 16, 2011
For: Corrugated Polyethylene Pipe MLWN MLWN
ACT Pipe & Supply Municipal Water
Works Supply, L.P.
A499-11 'S 4719 Dodge Street 6959 State Hwy 276
Item Description Estimated |san Antonio, Royse City,
Quantity [Tx 78217 TX 75189
Filter Fabric 20' Length
AK 12" (305 mm) 500
Price per foot $0.74 no bid
Total $370.00]
AL 15" (381 mm) 200
Price per foot $0.84 no bid
Total $168.00,
AM  [18" (457 mm) 200
Price per foot $1.26 no bid|
Total $252.00]
AN |24" (610 mm) 100
Price per foot $1.63 no bid
Total $163.00]
Sub Total $953.00]
Total for Item 1 $105,095.26 $160,029.17
2 Oblong Perforated Corrugated Polyethylene Pipe
& Fittings (100 Foot Sections with filter fabric)
Oblong Perforated Pipe
A 12" (305 mm) 5,000
Price per foot $2.93 $3.23
Total $14,650.00] $16,150.00]
B 18" (457 mm) 25,000
Price per foot $4.60 $5.07
Total $115,000.00] $126,750.00]
Sub Total $129,650.00 $142,900.00
Split Band Coupling
C 12" (305 mm) 10
Price per foot $14.14 $9.97
Total $141.40, $99.70]
D 18" (457 mm) 50
Price per foot $23.39 $20.77
Total $1,169.50 $1,038.50)
Sub Total $1,310.90 $1,138.20)
Tee
E 12" (305 mm) 10
Price each $34.13 $178.89
Total $341.30] $1,788.90]
F 18" (457 mm) 20
Price each $47.78 $385.22
Total $955.60| $7,704.40)
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: March 16, 2011
For: Corrugated Polyethylene Pipe MLWN MLWN
ACT Pipe & Supply Municipal Water
Works Supply, L.P.
A499-11 'S 4719 Dodge Street 6959 State Hwy 276
Item Description Estimated |san Antonio, Royse City,
Quantity [Tx 78217 TX 75189
Sub Total $1,296.90 $9,493.30
Total for Item 2 $132,257.80 $153,531.50
Total for Items 1 & 2 $237,353.06 $313,560.67
Payment Terms 2% 10 Net 30
Total Estimated Total $237,353.06 $313,560.67
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