
City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: February 1, 2011  

For: Heavy Equipment Alamo Ag-Con 
Equipment Inc.

Asco, Inc. Briggs Equipment Closner Equipment 
Co., Inc.

Cooper Equipment Co. Equipment Depot Holt Cat

11-038 LD 2940 S. E. Loop 410 4146 IH 10 East 711 N. W.W. White 
Rd.

PO Box 917 17474 Judson Rd. 3935 IH 35 North PO Box 207916

Item Description QTY San Antonio,                
TX 78222

San Antonio,                 
TX 78219

San Antonio,            
TX 78219

Schertz,                         
TX 78154

San Antonio,               
TX 78247

San Antonio,                 
TX 78219

San Antonio,                 
TX 78220

1A Forklift, Minimum 8,000 lbs. 1
Price Per Each No Bid $42,445.00 $43,080.00 No Bid No Bid $42,498.00 No Bid
Price Total $42,445.00 $43,080.00 $42,498.00
Year, Make & Model Offered 2011 Doosan D35S3-

5SB
2011 Yale GP080VX 2011, Mitsubishi 

FG40N-GE
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Doosan DB58S 91Net 

hp
GM 4.3 Liter Gasoline 

Powered 97 HP
Nissan TB45K 97 HP

Delivery 90 Days 147 Days 126 Days
Production Cut-off Date Nov 11,2011 5/1/2011 2/28/2011
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date

No No Not Provided

1B Forklift, Minimum 6,000 lbs. LPG 2
Price Per Each No Bid $24,994.00 $29,410.00 No Bid No Bid $27,950.00 No Bid
Price Total $49,988.00 $58,820.00 $55,900.00
Year, Make & Model Offered 2011 Doosan G30E-

5LP
2011 Yale GLP060VX 2011 Mitsubishi 

FG30N-LE
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Doosan G420FE 53 

Net hp
GM 2.4 Liter LPG 

Powered 62 HP
Nissan K25, 58.7 HP

Delivery 90 Days 98 Days 90 Days
Production Cut-off Date Nov 11,2011 5/1/2011 2/28/2011
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date

 No No Not Provided

1C Forklift, Minimum 4,000 lbs. LPG 1
Price Per Each No Bid $20,749.00 $24,718.00 No Bid No Bid $22,274.00 No Bid
Price Total $20,749.00 $24,718.00   $22,274.00
Year, Make & Model Offered 2011 Doosan G20E-5L 2011 Yale GLP040VX   2011 Mitsubishi 

FG20N-LE
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Doosan G420FE 53 

HP Net
Mazda 2.2 Liter 51 HP   Nissan K21 50.3 HP

Delivery 90 Days 98 Days   90 Days
Production Cut-off Date Nov 11,2011 5/1/2011   2/28/2011
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date

No No   Not Provided

2 Loader, Skid Steer 2
Price Per Each $38,425.00 $34,498.00 $33,381.00 No Bid No Bid $34,081.41 $41,110.00
Price Total $76,850.00 $68,996.00 $66,762.00  $68,162.82 $82,220.00
Year, Make & Model Offered 2011 New Holland 

L225
2011 Case SR220 2011 Terex TSR-70  2011 New Holland 

L225 Skid Steer
Caterpillar 252 B-3

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered FPT/F5C E9454 4cyl 
Diesel, 76 SAE Net HP

Case 432T, 77 Net HP Perkins 804D 74 HP 
Turbocharged

 Fiat/FPT F5C E9454 4 
Cylinder Diesel, 76 Net 

HP

Cat C 3.4, 71 Net HP

Delivery 120 Days Not Provided 45 days  120 Days 30 days
Production Cut-off Date April 30, 2011 Not Provided 5/1/2011  8/2/2011 6/1/2011
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date

No Not Provided No  No Yes

3 Loader/Backhoe 1
Price Per Each No Bid $64,997.00 $64,056.00 No Bid No Bid $60,949.75 $64,561.00
Price Total $64,997.00 $64,056.00 $60,949.75 $64,561.00
Year, Make & Model Offered Case 580SN Terex TVP760 B-D 

Tractor Loader 
Backhoe

2011 B90B 4W.D. Caterpillar 416E

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Case 445T/M3 95 Net 
HP

Perkins 1104 D-T, 87 
HP Diesel

Fiat FPT 445TA/M3 4 
Cylinder Diesel 91 Net 

HP

Cat C 4.4, 81 Net HP

Delivery 60 Days 45 Days 130 Days 175 days
Production Cut-off Date Dec. 31, 2011 5/1/2011 6/2/2011 6/1/2011
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date

No No No No
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: February 1, 2011  

For: Heavy Equipment Alamo Ag-Con 
Equipment Inc.

Asco, Inc. Briggs Equipment Closner Equipment 
Co., Inc.

Cooper Equipment Co. Equipment Depot Holt Cat

11-038 LD 2940 S. E. Loop 410 4146 IH 10 East 711 N. W.W. White 
Rd.

PO Box 917 17474 Judson Rd. 3935 IH 35 North PO Box 207916

Item Description QTY San Antonio,                
TX 78222

San Antonio,                 
TX 78219

San Antonio,            
TX 78219

Schertz,                         
TX 78154

San Antonio,               
TX 78247

San Antonio,                 
TX 78219

San Antonio,                 
TX 78220

4 Loaders, Track, Minimum 3 CY Capacity 1
Price Per Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $228,168.00
Price Total    $228,168.00
Year, Make & Model Offered    Caterpillar 963D

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered    Cat C 6.6, 189 Net HP

Delivery    175 days
Production Cut-off Date    6/1/2011
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date

   No

5 Pad-foot Roller, Vibratory, Minimum 5 Ton 1

Price Per Each No Bid $82,981.00 No Bid $68,350.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price Total $82,981.00 $68,350.00
Year, Make & Model Offered 2011 Case SV280PF 2011 Dynapac 

CA134PD
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Cummins QSB 3.3 

C99, 99 Net HP
John Deere 5030 HF 
285 SAE Net 84 HP

Delivery 90 Days 90 Days
Production Cut-off Date Nov. 2011 12/31/2011
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date

No No

6 Roller, Combination Drum and Pneumatic, 
Vibratory, 4 Ton

1

Price Per Each No Bid No Bid No Bid $57,240.00 $49,520.00 No Bid No Bid
Price Total   $57,240.00 $49,520.00  
Year, Make & Model Offered   2011 Dynapac 

CC1300C
2011 Hamm HD13VT  

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered   Kubota V2203-M SAE 
Net 45 HP

Hatz 4W35T 40 HP  

Delivery   90 Days 60-180 Days  
Production Cut-off Date   12/31/2011 3/31/2011  
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date

  No Possible  

7 Hydraulic Excavator, Carrier Mounted, 6X4 1
Price Per Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price Total  
Year, Make & Model Offered  

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered  

Delivery  
Production Cut-off Date  
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date

 

8 Loader, Skid Steer, with Breaker Assembly 1
Price Per Each $37,370.00 $33,742.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $32,875.50 No Bid
Price Total $37,370.00 $33,742.00   $32,875.50
Year, Make & Model Offered 2011 New Holland 

L220
2011 Case SR175   2011 New Holland 

L218
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered ISM/N844LT 4cyl 

Diesel 57 SAE Net HP 
Case N844T/M3   ISM N844LT 4 

Cylinder Diesel 57 Net 
HP

Delivery 120 Days 90 Days   120 days
Production Cut-off Date April 30, 2011 Not Provided   8/2/2011
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date

No Not Provided   No
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: February 1, 2011  

For: Heavy Equipment Alamo Ag-Con 
Equipment Inc.

Asco, Inc. Briggs Equipment Closner Equipment 
Co., Inc.

Cooper Equipment Co. Equipment Depot Holt Cat

11-038 LD 2940 S. E. Loop 410 4146 IH 10 East 711 N. W.W. White 
Rd.

PO Box 917 17474 Judson Rd. 3935 IH 35 North PO Box 207916

Item Description QTY San Antonio,                
TX 78222

San Antonio,                 
TX 78219

San Antonio,            
TX 78219

Schertz,                         
TX 78154

San Antonio,               
TX 78247

San Antonio,                 
TX 78219

San Antonio,                 
TX 78220

9 Excavator, Compact 1
Price Per Each No Bid $34,982.00 $29,235.00 No Bid No Bid $36,495.42 $38,899.00
Price Total $34,982.00 $29,235.00  $36,495.42 $38,899.00
Year, Make & Model Offered 2011 Case CX36B 2011 TC Terex 

Compact Crawler ex.
 2010 New Holland 

E35B
Cat 303.5 D CR

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Yanmar 3TNV88-
BPYB 28.4 Net HP

Mitsubishi S4L, 32.5 
HP Diesel

 Yanmar 3TNV88-
BPYB, 28 Net HP

Mitsubishi S3Q2, 
30 Net HP

Delivery 75 Days 45 Days  90 Days 45 Days
Production Cut-off Date Not Provided 5/1/2011  5/2/2011 6/1/2011
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date

Not Provided No  No Yes

Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30

Estimated Total $114,220.00 $398,880.00 $286,671.00 $125,590.00 $49,520.00 $319,155.49 $413,848.00
No Bid: Romco Equipment Co.
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: February 1, 2011

For: Heavy Equipment

11-038 LD

Item Description QTY

1A Forklift, Minimum 8,000 lbs. 1
Price Per Each
Price Total
Year, Make & Model Offered

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered

Delivery 
Production Cut-off Date
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date

1B Forklift, Minimum 6,000 lbs. LPG 2
Price Per Each
Price Total
Year, Make & Model Offered

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered

Delivery 
Production Cut-off Date
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date

1C Forklift, Minimum 4,000 lbs. LPG 1
Price Per Each
Price Total
Year, Make & Model Offered

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered

Delivery 
Production Cut-off Date
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date

2 Loader, Skid Steer 2
Price Per Each
Price Total
Year, Make & Model Offered

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered

Delivery 
Production Cut-off Date
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date

3 Loader/Backhoe 1
Price Per Each
Price Total
Year, Make & Model Offered

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered

Delivery 
Production Cut-off Date
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date

Bid #1 Bid #2

RDO Equipment 
Company

RDO Equipment 
Company

Tractor City Waukesha-Pearce 
Industries, Inc.

19275 N. IH 35 19275 N. IH 35 2800 S.E. Loop 410 3740 S. E. Loop 410

New Braunfels,           
TX 78132-4877

New Braunfels,           
TX 78132-4877

San Antonio,               
TX 78222

San Antonio,                 
TX 78222

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
 
 

 

 
 
 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
 
 

 

 
 
 

No Bid No Bid    No Bid No Bid
 
 

 

 
 
 

$37,518.00 $34,650.00 $34,892.00 No Bid
$75,036.00 $69,300.00 $69,784.00

2011 John Deere 
Model 328D

2011 John Deere 
Model 326D

2011 John Deere 
326D

John Deere 5030 HT 
80 Net HP

John Deere 5030 HT 
70 SAE Net HP 

John Deere Power 
Tech E5030HT 70 Net

30-45 Days 30-45 Days 180 Days
12/1/2011 12/1/2011 3/30/2011

Yes Yes Yes

$71,750.00 $71,750.00 No Bid No Bid
$71,750.00 $71,750.00

2011 John Deere 
Model 310SJ

2011 John Deere 
Model 310SJ

John Deere 4045 
HT054, 93 SAE Net 

HP

John Deere 4045 
HT054 93 SAE Net HP

30-45 days 30-45 days
12/1/2011 12/1/2011

Yes Yes
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: February 1, 2011

For: Heavy Equipment

11-038 LD

Item Description QTY

4 Loaders, Track, Minimum 3 CY Capacity 1
Price Per Each
Price Total
Year, Make & Model Offered

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered

Delivery 
Production Cut-off Date
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date

5 Pad-foot Roller, Vibratory, Minimum 5 Ton 1

Price Per Each
Price Total
Year, Make & Model Offered

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered

Delivery 
Production Cut-off Date
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date

6 Roller, Combination Drum and Pneumatic, 
Vibratory, 4 Ton

1

Price Per Each
Price Total
Year, Make & Model Offered

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered

Delivery 
Production Cut-off Date
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date

7 Hydraulic Excavator, Carrier Mounted, 6X4 1
Price Per Each
Price Total
Year, Make & Model Offered

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered

Delivery 
Production Cut-off Date
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date

8 Loader, Skid Steer, with Breaker Assembly 1
Price Per Each
Price Total
Year, Make & Model Offered

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered

Delivery 
Production Cut-off Date
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date

Bid #1 Bid #2

RDO Equipment 
Company

RDO Equipment 
Company

Tractor City Waukesha-Pearce 
Industries, Inc.

19275 N. IH 35 19275 N. IH 35 2800 S.E. Loop 410 3740 S. E. Loop 410

New Braunfels,           
TX 78132-4877

New Braunfels,           
TX 78132-4877

San Antonio,               
TX 78222

San Antonio,                 
TX 78222

$231,500.00 $217,450.00 No Bid No Bid
$231,500.00 $217,450.00  

2010 John Deere 
755K

2010 John Deere 
755D

 

John Deere Power 
Tech PUX6068 - 190 

SAE Net HP

John Deere 6068H, 
181 SAE Net HP

 

90-120 Days 30-45 Days  
12/1/2011 3/1/2011  

Yes No  

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid $350,993.93
$350,994.93

Gradall XL4100 III 6x4

Detroit Diesel OM906, 
Tier III Compliant, 238 

Net HP

60-90 Days
2/25/2011

Maybe

No Bid $34,827.00 $29,839.00 No Bid
$34,827.00 $29,839.00

2011 John Deere 
Model 318D 

2011 John Deere 
318D

John Deere 4024 HT, 
58 SAE Net HP

John Deere Power 
Tech E4024HT, 58 Net 

HP
30-45 Days 180 Days

12/1/2011 3/30/2011
Yes Yes
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: February 1, 2011

For: Heavy Equipment

11-038 LD

Item Description QTY

9 Excavator, Compact 1
Price Per Each
Price Total
Year, Make & Model Offered

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered

Delivery 
Production Cut-off Date
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date

Payment Terms

Estimated Total
No Bid: Romco Equipment Co.

Bid #1 Bid #2

RDO Equipment 
Company

RDO Equipment 
Company

Tractor City Waukesha-Pearce 
Industries, Inc.

19275 N. IH 35 19275 N. IH 35 2800 S.E. Loop 410 3740 S. E. Loop 410

New Braunfels,           
TX 78132-4877

New Braunfels,           
TX 78132-4877

San Antonio,               
TX 78222

San Antonio,                 
TX 78222

No Bid $36,543.00 $34,887.00 $38,698.00
 $36,543.00 $34,887.00 $38,698.00
 2011 John Deere 

Model 35D
2011 John Deere 35D 2011, Komatsu 

PC35MR-3

 Yanmar 3TNU88, 28.6 
SAE Net HP

John Deere/Yanmar 
3TNV88, 28.6 Net 

Komatsu 3D88E-6, 
Net HP 29

 30-45 Days 180 Days 90 Days
 12/1/2011 3/30/2011 3/31/2011
 Yes Yes No

Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30

$378,286.00 $429,870.00 $134,510.00 $389,692.93
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