
City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 14, 2011
For: Annual Contract for Acrylic Waterborne Traffic Paint

Allstates Coatings Co. Centerline Supply Ennis Paint Inc. Glidden Professional Kwal Paint Pathmark Traffic 
Products

The Sherwin-Williams 
Company

The Sherwin-Williams 
Company

A328a-11 ATS 100 N Lee Dr. 1731 S. San Marcos       
#932

PO Box 404                    9115 Broadway 1011 S. Frio PO Box 1066 1001 Nebula Rd. 610 McCullough Ave.

Item Description Est Annual 
Qty

Gladewater,
TX  75647

San Antonio,
TX  78207

Ennis,                             
TX  75120                       

San Antonio,
TX  78217

San Antonio,
TX  78207

San Marcos,
TX  78667

Manchester,
GA  31816

San Antonio,
TX  78215

1 Acrylic Waterborne Traffic Paint      
A White High Traffic Paint 1500      

Price per 5 gallon pail gallons $45.30 $72.50 $45.645 No Bid $64.150 $70.95 $58.75 $52.75
Price per gallon $9.060 $14.50 $9.129 $12.830 $14.19 $11.75 $10.55
Total Per Gallon/Pail $13,590.00 $21,750.00 $13,693.50 $19,245.00 $21,285.00 $17,625.00 $15,825.00
Delivery 30 Days 14-21 Days 7-14 Days 14 Days 21 Days 30 Days 3 Days
Manufacturer Allstates Coatings Co. Aexcel Ennis Paint Comex Aexcel Sherwin Williams Sherwin Williams
Formula ALT-732 72W-A087 985301 T178007F 72W-A087 TM2248-20 TM2152

B
White High Traffic Paint 1500

 Price per 55 gallon drum gallons $488.95 $770.00 $470.36 No Bid $723.70 $751.30 $535.15 No Bid
Price per gallon $8.89 $14.00 $8.55 $13.16 $13.66 $9.73
Total Per Gallon/Drum $13,335.00 $21,000.00 $12,828.00 $19,737.27 $20,490.00 $14,595.00
Delivery 30 Days 14-21 Days 7-14 Days 14 Days 21 Days 30 Days
Manufacturer Allstates Coatings Co. Aexcel Ennis Paint Comex Aexcel Sherwin Williams
Formula Alt -732 72W-A087 985301 T178007D 72W-A087 TM2248-20

2 Acrylic Waterborne Traffic Paint
A Yellow Jet-Dry Traffic Paint 1800  

Price per 5 gallon pail gallons $45.60 $62.50 $45.485 $55.42 $74.85 $60.40 $59.40 $51.85
Price per gallon $9.12 $12.50 $9.10 $11.08 $14.97 $12.08 $11.880 $10.370
Total Per Gallon/Pail $16,416.00 $22,500.00 $16,374.60 $19,951.20 $26,946.00 $21,744.00 $21,384.00 $18,666.00
Delivery 30 Days 14-21 Days 7-14 Days Up to 21 Days 14 Days 21 Days 30 Days 3 Days
Manufacturer Allstates Coatings Co. Aexcel Ennis Paint Aexcel Comex Aexcel Sherwin Williams Sherwin Williams
Formula Alt -733 72Y-A056 985302 Not Specified T178004F 72Y-A056 TM2259-20 TM2153

B
Yellow Jet-Dry Traffic Paint 1800

 Price per 55 gallon drum gallons $492.25 $660.00 $468.60 $568.72 $794.75 $635.80 $611.60 No Bid
Price per gallon $8.950 $12.000 $8.520 $10.340 $14.450 $11.560 $11.120
Total Per Gallon/Drum $16,110.00 $21,600.00 $15,336.00 $18,612.65 $26,010.00 $20,808.00 $20,016.00
Delivery 30 Days 14-21 Days 7-14 Days Up to 21 Days 14 Days 21 Days 30 Days
Manufacturer Allstates Coatings Co. Aexcel Ennis Paint Aexcel Comex Aexcel Sherwin Williams
Formula Alt -733 72Y-A056 985302 Not Specified T178004D 72Y-A056 TM2259-27

3 Acrylic Waterborne Traffic Paint
A Black Jet-Dry Traffic Paint 2500  

Price per 5 gallon pail gallons $41.50 $63.75 $43.555 No Bid $83.95 $61.70 $59.15 $48.30
Price per gallon $8.30 $12.75 $8.71 $16.79 $12.34 $11.830 $9.660
Total Per Gallon/Pail $20,750.00 $31,875.00 $21,777.50 $41,975.00 $30,850.00 $29,575.00 $17,388.00
Delivery 30 Days 14-21 Days 7-14 Days 14 Days 21 Days 30 Days 3 Days
Manufacturer Allstates Coatings Co. Aexcel Ennis Paint Comex Aexcel Sherwin Williams Sherwin Williams
Formula Alt -731 72A-A018 985203 T178009F 72Y-A056 TM2221-20 TM221

B
Black Jet-Dry Traffic Paint 2500

 Price per 55 gallon drum gallons $446.60 $673.75 $447.370 $744.53 $880.95 $650.10 $550.00 No Bid
Price per gallon $8.120 $12.25 $8.134 $13.537 $16.017 $11.820 $10.000
Total Per Gallon/Drum $20,300.00 $30,625.00 $20,335.00 $33,842.27 $40,043.18 $29,550.00 $25,000.00
Delivery 30 Days 14-21 Days 7-14 Days Up to 21 Days 14 Days 21 Days 30 Days
Manufacturer Allstates Coatings Co. Aexcel Ennis Paint Aexcel Comex Aexcel Sherwin Williams
Formula Alt -731 72A-A018 985205 62247 T178009F 7ZA-A018 TM2221-27

4 Acrylic Waterborne Traffic Paint
A Blue Fast-Dry Traffic Paint 25

Price per 5 gallon pail gallons $52.95 $61.25 $46.440 $56.56 $83.95 $59.15 $65.60 $55.00
Price per gallon $10.59 $12.25 $9.29 $11.31 $16.79 $11.83 $13.120 $11.000
Total Per Gallon/Pail $264.75 $306.25 $232.20 $282.80 $419.75 $295.75 $328.00 $275.00
Delivery 30 Days 14-21 Days 7-14 Days Up to 21 Days 14 Days 21 Days 30 Days 3 Days
Manufacturer Allstates Coatings Co. Aexcel Ennis Paint Aexcel Comex Aexcel Sherwin Williams Sherwin Williams
Formula Alt -734 72A-A018 985205 20090 120Q382 72L-A002 TM2224-20 TM2224

B
Blue Fast-Dry Traffic Paint 55
Price per 55 gallon drum gallons $573.10 $646.25 $479.105 No Bid $880.95 $620.95 No bid No bid
Price per gallon $10.42 $11.75 $8.711 $16.017 $11.290
Total Per Gallon/Drum $573.10 $646.25 $479.105 $880.95 $620.95
Delivery 30 Days 14-21 Days 7-14 Days 14 Days 21 Days
Manufacturer Allstates Coatings Co. Aexcel Ennis Paint Comex Aexcel
Formula Not Specified 72L-A002 985205 120Q382 72L-A002
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 14, 2011
For: Annual Contract for Acrylic Waterborne Traffic Paint

Allstates Coatings Co. Centerline Supply Ennis Paint Inc. Glidden Professional Kwal Paint Pathmark Traffic 
Products

The Sherwin-Williams 
Company

The Sherwin-Williams 
Company

A328a-11 ATS 100 N Lee Dr. 1731 S. San Marcos       
#932

PO Box 404                    9115 Broadway 1011 S. Frio PO Box 1066 1001 Nebula Rd. 610 McCullough Ave.

Item Description Est Annual 
Qty

Gladewater,
TX  75647

San Antonio,
TX  78207

Ennis,                             
TX  75120                       

San Antonio,
TX  78217

San Antonio,
TX  78207

San Marcos,
TX  78667

Manchester,
GA  31816

San Antonio,
TX  78215

5 Acrylic Waterborne Traffic Paint
A Red Fast-Dry Traffic Paint 50

Price per 5 gallon pail gallons $55.00 $68.75 $54.83 $64.02 $83.95 $67.30 $71.50 $55.00
Price per gallon $11.00 $13.75 $10.97 $12.80 $16.79 $13.46 $14.300 $11.000
Total Per Gallon/Pail $550.00 $687.50 $548.30 $640.20 $839.50 $673.00 $715.00 $550.00
Delivery 30 Days 14-21 Days 7-14 Days Up to 21 Days 14 Days 21 Days 30 Days 3 Days
Manufacturer Allstates Coatings Co. Aexcel Ennis Paint Aexcel Comex Aexcel Sherwin Williams Sherwin Williams
Formula Alt -728 72R-A004 985204 43614 120Q381 72R-A004 TM2222-20 TM2222

B Red Fast-Dry Traffic Paint 55
Price per 55 gallon drum gallons $595.65 $728.75 $571.395 No Bid $880.95 $708.40 No bid No bid
Price per gallon $10.83 $13.25 $10.389 $16.017 $12.880
Total Per Gallon/Drum $595.65 $728.75 $571.395 $880.95 $708.40
Delivery 30 Days 14-21 Days 7-14 Days 14 Days 21 Days
Manufacturer Allstates Coatings Co. Aexcel Ennis Paint Comex Aexcel
Formula Alt -728 72R-A004 985204 120Q381 72R-A004

Estimated Total Per Gallon/Pail $51,570.75 $77,118.75 $52,626.10 $20,874.20 $89,425.25 $74,847.75 $69,627.00 $52,704.00
Estimated Total Per Gallon/Drum $50,913.75 $74,600.00 $49,549.50 $52,454.93 $87,552.35 $72,177.35 $59,611.00 $0.00

Estimated Annual Total $102,484.50 $151,718.75 $102,175.60 $73,329.13 $176,977.60 $147,025.10 $129,238.00 $52,704.00
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