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Letterhead, 8.5" X 11", Chadwick Bond or similar, artic white,
25% Cotton with Watermark of choice, One Sided, Two Color
ink Reflex Blue and Gold (Seal Only), tight registration w/o
bleeds

Price Per Box (500 sheets per box)

Total Price

Letterhead, 8.5" X 11, Chadwick Bond or similar, arctic white,
25% Cotton with Watermark of choice, One Sided, One Color
ink, Gold (Seal Only), tight registration w/o bleeds

Price Per Box (500 sheets per box)

Total Price

Letterhead, 8.5” X 11", Chadwick Bond or similar, arctic white,
25% Cotton with Watermark of choice, One Sided, One Color
ink to be determined by requestor, (w/City Seal), tight
registration w/o bleeds

Price Per Box (500 sheets per box)

Total Price

Letterhead, 8.5” X 11", Chadwick Bond or similar, arctic white,
25% Cotton with Watermark of choice, One Sided, Two Color

ink Reflex Blue and Gold Foil (Seal Only), tight registration w/o
bleeds

Price Per Box (500 sheets per box)

Total Price

Letterhead, 8.5” X 11", Chadwick Bond or similar, arctic white,
25% Cotton with Watermark of choice, One Sided, Two Color
ink to be determined by requestor, tight registration w/ bleeds

Price Per Box (500 sheets per box)
Total Price

Letterhead, 8.5” X 11", Chadwick Bond or similar, arctic white,
25% Cotton with Watermark of choice, One Sided, Two Color
ink to be determined by requestor, tight registration w/o bleeds|

Price Per Box (500 sheets per box)
Total Price

Letterhead, 8.5” X 11", Chadwick Bond or similar, arctic white,
25% Cotton with Watermark of choice, One Sided, One Color
ink to be determined by requestor, tight registration w/o bleeds|

Price Per Box (500 sheets per box)
Total Price

Notepads, 8.5” X 5.5”, 24 |Ib White bond, 92% brightness or
better, 50 sheets per pad, One Sided, Two Color ink Reflex
Blue and Gold (Seal Only), tight registration w/o bleeds
Price Per Pad (50 sheets per pad)

Total Price

Notepads, 8.5” X 5.5", 24 |b White bond, 92% brightness or
better, 50 sheets per pad, One Sided, One Color ink to be
determined by requestor, tight registration w/o bleeds

Price Per Pad (50 sheets per pad)

Total Price

Notepads, 8.5” X 5.5", 24 |b White bond, 92% brightness or
better, 50 sheets per pad, One Sided, Two Color ink to be
determined by requestor, tight registration w/ bleeds

Price Per Pad(50 sheets per pad)

Total Price

Notepads, 8.5” X 5.5”, 24 |Ib White bond, 92% brightness or
better, 50 sheets per pad, One Sided, Two Color ink Reflex
Blue and Gold Foil (Seal Only), tight registration w/o bleeds
Price Per Pad (50 sheets per pad)

Total Price
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$1,195.00
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 14, 2011
For: Supplemental Printing Services
Clear Visions Presto Printing Rush American
Printing, Inc.
121 Interpark Blvd., 2714 West Ave. 10912 Wye St.
A1285-11 CE Suite 801
ltem Description Estimated Annual |San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio,
Usage TX 78216 TX 78201 TX 78217
3a|Business Cards, 2" X 3.5", 80 Ib Bright White Cover, One
Sided, Flat Black ink, tight registration w/o bleeds
Price Per Box (250 per box) 400 No Bid $12.75 No Bid
Total Price $5,100.00
Price Per Box (500 per box) 500 No Bid $13.50! No Bid
Total Price $6,750.00
Price Per Box (1000 per box) 250 No Bid $15.00 No Bid
Total Price $3,750.00
b [Business Cards, 2" X 3.5", 80 Ib Bright White Cover, Two
Sided, Flat Black ink, tight registration w/o bleeds
Price Per Box (250 per box) 400 No Bid $17.75 No Bid
Total Price $7,100.00
Price Per Box (500 per box) 500 No Bid $18.50! No Bid
Total Price $9,250.00
Price Per Box (1000 per box) 250 No Bid $21.00 No Bid
Total Price $5,250.00
c|Business Cards, 2" X 3.5", 80 Ib Bright White Cover, One
Sided, Thermo graphic Black ink, tight registration w/o bleeds
Price Per Box (250 per box) 400 No Bid $12.75 No Bid
Total Price $5,100.00
Price Per Box (500 per box) 500 No Bid $13.50! No Bid
Total Price $6,750.00
Price Per Box (1000 per box) 250 No Bid $15.00 No Bid
Total Price $3,750.00
d|Business Cards, 2" X 3.5", 80 |b Bright White Cover, Two
Sided, Thermo graphic Black ink, tight registration w/o bleeds
Price Per Box (250 per box) 400 No Bid $17.75! No Bid
Total Price $7,100.00
Price Per Box (500 per box) 500 No Bid $18.50 No Bid
Total Price $9,250.00
Price Per Box (1000 per box) 250 No Bid $21.00! No Bid
Total Price $5,250.00
e|Business Cards, 2" X 3.5", 80 |b Bright White Cover, One
Sided, One Color ink (w/City Logo or Seal), tight registration
w/o bleeds
Price Per Box (250 per box) 400 No Bid $14.00 No Bid
Total Price $5,600.00
Price Per Box (500 per box) 500 No Bid $16.00! No Bid
Total Price $8,000.00
Price Per Box (1000 per box) 250 No Bid $19.00 No Bid
Total Price $4,750.00
f|Business Cards, 2" X 3.5", 80 Ib Bright White Cover, One
Sided, Two Color ink to be determined by requestor, tight
registration w/o bleeds
Price Per Box (250 per box) 400 No Bid $16.00! No Bid
Total Price $6,400.00
Price Per Box (500 per box) 500 No Bid $18.00 No Bid
Total Price $9,000.00
Price Per Box (1000 per box) 250 No Bid $21.00! No Bid
Total Price $5,250.00
g|Business Cards, 2" X 3.5", 80 |b Bright White Cover, One
Sided, Two Color ink to be determined by requestor, tight
registration w/ bleeds
Price Per Box (250 per box) 400 No Bid $18.00 No Bid
Total Price $7,200.00
Price Per Box (500 per box) 500 No Bid $19.50! No Bid
Total Price $9,750.00
Price Per Box (1000 per box) 250 No Bid $22.00 No Bid
Total Price $5,500.00

Page 2




City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 14, 2011
For: Supplemental Printing Services
Clear Visions Presto Printing Rush American
Printing, Inc.
121 Interpark Blvd., 2714 West Ave. 10912 Wye St.
A1285-11 CE Suite 801
ltem Description Estimated Annual |San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio,
Usage TX 78216 TX 78201 TX 78217
h|Business Cards, 2" X 3.5", 80 |b Bright White Cover, Two
Sided, One Color ink to be determined by requestor, tight
registration w/o bleeds
Price Per Box (250 per box) 400 No Bid $18.00! No Bid
Total Price $7,200.00
Price Per Box (500 per box) 500 No Bid $19.50 No Bid
Total Price $9,750.00
Price Per Box (1000 per box) 250 No Bid $22.00! No Bid
Total Price $5,500.00
i|Business Cards, 2" X 3.5", 80 Ib Bright White Cover, Two
Sided, Two Color ink to be determined by requestor, tight
registration w/o bleeds
Price Per Box (250 per box) 400 No Bid $19.00 No Bid
Total Price $7,600.00
Price Per Box (500 per box) 500 No Bid $20.50! No Bid
Total Price $10,250.00
Price Per Box (1000 per box) 250 No Bid $23.00 No Bid
Total Price $5,750.00
j|Business Cards, 2" X 3.5", 80 Ib Bright White Cover, Two
Sided, Two Color ink to be determined by requestor, tight
registration w/ bleeds
Price Per Box (250 per box) 400 No Bid $23.00! No Bid
Total Price $9,200.00
Price Per Box (500 per box) 500 No Bid $24.50 No Bid
Total Price $12,250.00
Price Per Box (1000 per box) 250 No Bid $27.00! No Bid
Total Price $6,750.00
k|Business Cards, 2" X 3.5", 80 Ib Bright White Cover, One
Sided, Flat Black ink, Gold (Seal Only), tight registration w/o
bleeds. City will provide Gold Seal shells
Price Per Box (250 per box) 400 No Bid $11.75 No Bid
Total Price $4,700.00
Price Per Box (500 per box) 500 No Bid $12.75! No Bid
Total Price $6,375.00
Price Per Box (1000 per box) 250 No Bid $14.50 No Bid
Total Price $3,625.00
I|{Business Cards, 2" X 3.5", 80 Ib Bright White Cover, One
Sided, Thermo graphic Black ink, Gold (Seal Only), tight
registration w/o bleeds. City will provide Gold Seal shells
Price Per Box (250 per box) 400 No Bid $11.75 No Bid
Total Price $4,700.00
Price Per Box (500 per box) 500 No Bid $12.75! No Bid
Total Price $6,375.00
Price Per Box (1000 per box) 250 No Bid $14.50 No Bid
Total Price $3,625.00
m|Business Cards, 2" X 3.5", 80 Ib Bright White Cover, Two
Sided, Flat Black ink, Gold (Seal Only), tight registration w/o
bleeds. City will provide Gold Seal shells
Price Per Box (250 per box) 400 No Bid $16.75! No Bid
Total Price $6,700.00
Price Per Box (500 per box) 500 No Bid $17.75 No Bid
Total Price $8,875.00
Price Per Box (1000 per box) 250 No Bid $19.50! No Bid
Total Price $4,875.00
n|Business Cards, 2" X 3.5", 80 |b Bright White Cover, Two
Sided, Thermo graphic Black ink, Gold (Seal Only), tight
registration w/o bleeds. City will provide Gold Seal shells
Price Per Box (250 per box) 400 No Bid $17.00 No Bid
Total Price $6,800.00
Price Per Box (500 per box) 500 No Bid $18.50! No Bid
Total Price $9,250.00
Price Per Box (1000 per box) 250 No Bid $21.50 No Bid
Total Price $5,375.00
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 14, 2011
For: Supplemental Printing Services
Clear Visions Presto Printing Rush American
Printing, Inc.
121 Interpark Blvd., 2714 West Ave. 10912 Wye St.
A1285-11 CE Suite 801
ltem Description Estimated Annual |San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio,
Usage TX 78216 TX 78201 TX 78217
4a|Envelopes #10, 24 Ib White Wove Envelopes. Color ink to be
determined by requestor, tight registration w/o bleeds.
Finished product must comply with USPS specifications
Price Per Box (500 per box) 100 No Bid $29.50! $39.60|
Total Price $2,950.00 $3,960.00
b|Envelopes, #10, 24 Ib. White Wove Envelopes. Two Color ink
to be determined by requestor, tight registration w/ bleeds.
Finished product must comply with USPS specifications
Price Per Box (500 per box) 100 No Bid No Bid $71.85
Total Price $7,185.00
c|Envelopes, #10, 24 Ib. White Wove Envelopes. Two Color ink
to be determined by requestor, tight registration w/o bleeds.
Finished product must comply with USPS specifications
Price Per Box (500 per box) 100 No Bid $34.50! $68.00|
Total Price $3,450.00 $6,800.00
d|Envelopes, #10, 24 Ib. White Wove Envelopes. Black ink,
Finished product must comply with USPS specifications
Price Per Box (500 per box) 50 No Bid $27.50 $31.15
Total Price $1,375.00 $1,557.50
5a|Business Reply or Courtesy Reply Postcards, 8.5x11 sheets,
finish size 4.25” X 5.5”, on 110 Ib index, smooth finish, bright
White, Side one, Full Color Process, tight registration w/o
bleeds, Side two, Black ink. Finished product must comply with
USPS specifications
Price Per Card 5,000 No Bid No Bid $0.450
Total Price $2,250.00
Price w/ Mail Merges 5,000 No Bid No Bid $0.650,
Total Price w/ Mail Merges $3,250.00
b|Business Reply or Courtesy Reply Postcards, 8.5x11 sheets,
finish size 4.25" X 5.5”, on 110 Ib index, smooth finish, bright
White, Side one, Black ink, tight registration w/o bleeds, Side
two, Black ink. Finished product must comply with USPS
specifications
Price Per Card 5,000 No Bid No Bid $0.135
Total Price $675.00|
Price w/ Mail Merges 5,000 No Bid No Bid $0.335
Total Price w/ Mail Merges $1,675.00
c|Business Reply or Courtesy Reply Postcards, 8.5x11 sheets,
finish size 5.5” X 8.5”, on 110 Ib index, smooth finish, bright
White, Side one, Four Color Process, with bleeds, Side two,
Black ink. Finished product must comply with USPS
specifications
Price Per Card 10,000 No Bid No Bid $0.558
Total Price $5,580.00
Price w/ Mail Merges 10,000 No Bid No Bid $0.758
Total Price w/ Mail Merges $7,580.00
d|Business Reply or Courtesy Reply Postcards, 8.5x11 sheets,
finish size 5.5” X 8.5”, on 110 Ib index, smooth finish, bright
White, Side one, Black ink, Side two, Black ink. Finished
product must comply with USPS specifications
Price Per Card 10,000 No Bid No Bid $0.150
Total Price $1,500.00
Price w/ Mail Merges 10,000 No Bid No Bid $0.350,
Total Price w/ Mail Merges $3,500.00
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 14, 2011
For: Supplemental Printing Services
Clear Visions Presto Printing Rush American
Printing, Inc.
121 Interpark Blvd., 2714 West Ave. 10912 Wye St.
A1285-11 CE Suite 801
ltem Description Estimated Annual |San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio,
Usage TX 78216 TX 78201 TX 78217
6a|Decals, 8.5x11 sheet, finish size 4.25” X 5.5”, 60 Ib Crack-n-
Peel White uncoated, One Sided, One Color PMS
Price Per Labels 2,500 No Bid $0.10 $0.235
Total Price $250.00 $587.50
b|Decals, 8.5x11 sheet, finish size 4.25” X 8.5, 60 Ib Crack-n-
Peel White uncoated, One Sided, One Color PMS
Price Per Labels 2,500 No Bid $0.15 $0.381
Total Price $375.00 $952.50|
c|Decals, 12x18 sheet, finish size 4.25” X 12", 60 Ib Crack-n-
Peel White uncoated, One Sided, One Color PMS
Price Per Labels 2,500 No Bid $0.20 $0.629
Total Price $500.00 $1,572.50
d|Decals, 8.5x11 sheet, finish size 4.25” X 5.5”, 60 Ib Crack-n-
Peel White uncoated, One Sided, Two Color PMS, tight
registration w/o bleeds
Price Per Labels 2,500 No Bid $0.17 $0.421
Total Price $425.00 $1,052.50
e|Decals, 8.5x11 sheet, finish size 4.25” X 8.5", 60 Ib Crack-n-
Peel White uncoated, One Sided, Two Color ink, to be
determined by requestor, tight registration w/o bleeds
Price Per Labels 2,500 No Bid $0.20 $0.695
Total Price $500.00 $1,737.50
f{Decals, 12x18 sheet, finish size 4.25” X 12", 60 Ib Crack-n-
Peel White uncoated, One Sided, Two Color ink, to be
determined by requestor, tight registration w/o bleeds
Price Per Labels 2,500 No Bid $0.25 $0.944,
Total Price $625.00 $2,360.00
g|Decals, Size to be determined by requestor, 8.5"x11" 60 Ib
Crack-n-Peel White uncoated, One Sided, Two Color ink, to be
determined by requestor, tight registration w/o bleeds
Price Per Sheet 2,500 No Bid $0.75 $0.631
Total Price $1,875.00 $1,577.50
h|Decals, Size to be determined by requestor, 8.5"x11" 60 Ib
Crack-n-Peel White uncoated, One Sided, One Color ink, to bg
determined by requestor, tight registration w/o bleeds
Price Per Sheet 2,500 No Bid $0.60 $0.572
Total Price $1,500.00 $1,430.00
i|Decals, Size to be determined by requestor, 8.5"x11" 60 Ib
Crack-n-Peel White uncoated, One Sided, Black ink, tight
registration w/o bleeds
Price Per Sheet 2,500 No Bid $0.55 $0.319
Total Price $1,375.00 $797.50|
j|Decals, Size to be determined by requestor, 8.5"x11" 60 Ib
Crack-n-Peel White uncoated, Two Sided, Black ink, tight
registration w/o bleeds
Price Per Sheet 2,500 No Bid No Bid $0.319
Total Price $797.50)
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 14, 2011
For: Supplemental Printing Services
Clear Visions Presto Printing Rush American
Printing, Inc.
121 Interpark Blvd., 2714 West Ave. 10912 Wye St.
A1285-11 CE Suite 801
ltem Description Estimated Annual |San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio,
Usage TX 78216 TX 78201 TX 78217
7a|Forms, 8.5” X 11" White 20 Ib Bond, One Sided, Black ink,
padded
Price Per Pad (50 per pad) 500 No Bid $1.50 $3.746
Total Price $750.00 $1,873.00
Price with Perforations 250 No Bid $1.75 $4.775
Total Price $437.50 $1,193.75
Price with Wrap Around Covers 100 No Bid No Bid $6.275
Total Price $627.50)
b|Forms, 8.5” X 11" White 20 |b Bond, Two Sided, Black ink, 50
per pad
Price Per Pad (50 per pad) 250 No Bid $2.50 $6.560,
Total Price $625.00 $1,640.00
Price with Perforations 250 No Bid $2.75 $8.356
Total Price $687.50 $2,089.00
Price with Wrap Around Covers 100 No Bid No Bid $10.381
Total Price $1,038.10
c|Forms, 8.5” X 11" White 20 Ib Bond, One Sided, Black ink plus
Two Colors to be determined by requestor, tight registration
w/o bleeds, and 50 per pad
Price Per Pad (50 per pad) 250 No Bid $3.00 $14.910|
Total Price $750.00 $3,727.50
Price with Perforations 250 No Bid $3.50 $18.440|
Total Price $875.00 $4,610.00
Price with Wrap Around Covers 100 No Bid No Bid $20.440|
Total Price $2,044.00
d|Forms, NCR, 8.5” X 11", 20 Ib, 2-Part, One Sided, Black ink
Price Per Set 5,000 No Bid $0.10 $0.102
Total Price $500.00 $510.00|
Price Per Set (with red number) 25,000 No Bid $0.16 $0.126
Total Price $4,000.00 $3,150.00
Price with Perforations 250 No Bid $0.22 $7.915
Total Price $55.00 $1,978.75
Price with Wrap Around Covers 100 No Bid No Bid $8.415
Total Price $841.50)
e|Forms, NCR, 8.5” X 11", 20 Ib, 3-Part, One Sided, and Black
ink
Price Per Set 5,000 No Bid $0.15 $0.187
Total Price $750.00 $935.00|
Price Per Set (with red number) 25,000 No Bid $0.24 $0.211
Total Price $6,000.00 $5,275.00
Price with Perforations 250 No Bid $0.33 $11.560|
Total Price $82.50 $2,890.00
Price with Wrap Around Covers 100 No Bid No Bid $12.060|
Total Price $1,206.00
f{Forms, NCR, 8.5" X 11", 20 Ib, 4-Part, One Sided, and Black
ink
Price Per Set 3,000 No Bid $0.20 $0.213
Total Price $600.00 $639.00|
Price Per Set (with red number) 1,500 No Bid $0.36 $0.237
Total Price $540.00 $355.50
Price with Perforations 250 No Bid $0.54 $13.400|
Total Price $135.00 $3,350.00
Price with Wrap Around Covers 100 No Bid No Bid $13.900
Total Price $1,390.00
g|Forms, NCR, 8.5" X 14", 20 Ib, 2-Part, One Sided, and Black
ink
Price Per Set 5,000 No Bid $0.12 $0.117
Total Price $600.00 $585.00|
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 14, 2011
For: Supplemental Printing Services
Clear Visions Presto Printing Rush American
Printing, Inc.
121 Interpark Blvd., 2714 West Ave. 10912 Wye St.
A1285-11 CE Suite 801
ltem Description Estimated Annual |San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio,
Usage TX 78216 TX 78201 TX 78217
Price Per Set (with red number) 25,000 No Bid $0.18 $0.141
Total Price $4,500.00 $3,525.00
Price with Perforations 250 No Bid $0.24 $7.60
Total Price $60.00 $1,900.00
Price with Wrap Around Covers 100 No Bid No Bid $8.10
Total Price $810.00|
h|Forms, NCR, 8.5” X 14", 20 Ib, 3-Part, One Sided, Black ink
Price Per Set 5,000 No Bid $0.18 $0.177
Total Price $900.00 $885.00
Price Per Set (with red number) 25,000 No Bid $0.30 $0.201
Total Price $7,500.00 $5,025.00
Price with Perforations 250 No Bid $0.36 $11.11
Total Price $90.00 $2,777.50
Price with Wrap Around Covers 100 No Bid No Bid $11.61
Total Price $1,161.00
i[Forms, NCR, 8.5" X 11", 20 Ib, 4-Part, One Sided, Black ink
Price Per Set 5,000 No Bid $0.24 $0.213
Total Price $1,200.00 $1,065.00
Price Per Set (with red number) 25,000 No Bid $0.42 $0.237
Total Price $10,500.00 $5,925.00
Price with Perforations 250 No Bid $0.60 $13.40,
Total Price $150.00 $3,350.00
Price with Wrap Around Covers 100 No Bid No Bid $13.90,
Total Price $1,390.00
8a|Copies, 8.5” X 11", White 20 Ib Copy Bond, One Sided, Black
Print
Price Per Copy 25,000 No Bid $0.05 $0.065
Total Price $1,250.00 $1,625.00
b|Copies, 8.5” X 11", White 20 Ib Copy Bond, One Sided, Black
Print, Collated and Stapled
Price Per Copy 50,000 No Bid No Bid $0.087
Total Price $4,350.00
c|Copies, 8.5" X 11", White 20 Ib Copy Bond, Two Sided, Black
Print
Price Per Copy 25,000 No Bid $0.08 $0.092
Total Price $2,000.00 $2,300.00
d|Copies, 8.5” X 11", White 20 Ib Copy Bond, Two Sided, Black
Print, Collated and Stapled
Price Per Copy 50,000 No Bid No Bid $0.123
Total Price $6,150.00
e|Full Color, 8.5” X 11", White 60 Ib Color Copy Gloss, One
Sided
Price Per Copy 5,000 No Bid $0.29 $0.395
Total Price $1,450.00 $1,975.00
f|Two Color, 8.5" X 11", White 60 Ib Color Copy Gloss, One
Sided
Price Per Copy 5,000 No Bid $0.29 $0.281
Total Price $1,450.00 $1,405.00
g|Two Color , 8.5" X 11", White 60 Ib Color Copy Gloss, Two
Sided
Price Per Copy 5,000 No Bid $0.34 $0.366
Total Price $1,700.00 $1,830.00
9a|Brochure, 8.5" X 11", White 80 Ib Color Copy Gloss, Two
Sided, Four Color Process on both sides, foldec
Price Per Brochure 15,000 $0.1024 $0.39 $0.435
Total Price $1,536.00 $5,850.00! $6,525.00
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 14, 2011
For: Supplemental Printing Services
Clear Visions Presto Printing Rush American
Printing, Inc.
121 Interpark Blvd., 2714 West Ave. 10912 Wye St.
A1285-11 CE Suite 801
ltem Description Estimated Annual |San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio,
Usage TX 78216 TX 78201 TX 78217
b|Brochure, 8.5 X 14", White 80 Ib Color Copy Gloss, Two
Sided, Four Color Process on both sides, foldec
Price Per Brochure 15,000 $0.1050 $0.41 $0.543
Total Price $1,575.00 $6,150.00 $8,145.00
c|Brochure, 11" X 17", White 80 Ib Color Copy Gloss, Two
Sided, Four Color Process on both sides, foldec
Price Per Brochure 15,000 $0.1214 $0.59 $0.593
Total Price $1,821.00 $8,850.00 $8,895.00
d|Brochure, 13" X 19", White 100 Ib Color Copy Gloss, Two
Sided, Four Color Process on both sides, foldec
Price Per Brochure 350,000 $0.0681 No Bid $0.693
Total Price $23,835.00 $242,550.00
Price with UV Coat 350,000 No Bid No Bid $0.795
Total Price $278,250.00
10a|Door Hanger, Finished Size 4.25" X 11", and White 100 |b
Cover Two Sided, Four Color Process, and Die Cut and
wrapped
Price Per Door Hanger 15,000 $0.1200 No Bid $0.313
Total Price $1,800.00 $4,695.00
Price with UV Coat 15,000 No Bid No Bid $0.393
Total Price $5,895.00
b|Door Hanger, Finished Size, 4.25" X 14", White 100 Ib Cover,
Two Sided, Four Color Process, Die Cut and wrapped
Price Per Brochure 15,000 $0.1413 No Bid $0.408
Price Total $2,119.50 $6,120.00
Price with UV Coat 15,000 No Bid No Bid $0.488
Price Total $7,320.00
c|Door Hanger, Finished Size 4.25" X 17", and White 100 Ib
Cover Two Sided, Four Color Process, and Die Cut and
wrapped
Price Per Brochure 15,000 No Bid No Bid $0.428
Price Total $6,420.00
Price with UV Coat 15,000 No Bid No Bid $0.508
Price Total $7,620.00
d|Door Hanger, Finished Size 4.25” X 11", White 100 Ib Cover,
Two Sided, Black ink, Die Cut and wrapped
Price Per Door Hanger 15,000 No Bid No Bid $0.147
Price Total $2,205.00
Price with UV Coat 15,000 No Bid No Bid $0.187
Price Total $2,805.00
e|Door Hanger, Finished Size 4.25" X 14", White 100 Ib Cover,
Two Sided, Black ink, Die Cut and wrapped
Price Per Door Hanger 15,000 No Bid No Bid $0.181
Price Total $2,715.00
Price with UV Coat 350,000 No Bid No Bid $0.221
Price Total $77,350.00
f|Door Hanger, Finished Size 4.25" X 17", White 100 Ib Cover,
Two Sided, Black ink, Die Cut and wrapped
Price Per Door Hanger 15,000 No Bid No Bid $0.183
Price Total $2,745.00
Price with UV Coat 350,000 No Bid No Bid $0.223
Price Total $78,050.00
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened:
For:

A1285-11

January 14, 2011
Supplemental Printing Services

CE

Item

Description

Estimated Annual
Usage

Clear Visions

121 Interpark Blvd.,
Suite 801

San Antonio,

TX 78216

Presto Printing

2714 West Ave.

San Antonio,
TX 78201

Rush American
Printing, Inc.

10912 Wye St.

San Antonio,
TX 78217

11a

o

o

o

@

—

12a

o

o

13a

o

o

o

Posters, Full Color, Wide Format Printing, White 100 Ib Gloss
cover, One Sided

Price Per Sq. Ft.

Price Total

Posters, Black & White, Wide Format Printing, White 100 Ib
Gloss cover, One Sided

Price Per Sq. Ft.

Price Total

Posters, Full Color, Wide Format Printing, Mounted onto
Coroplast, One Sided

Price Per Sq. Ft.

Price Total

Posters, Black & White, Wide Format Printing, Coroplast, One
Sided

Price Per Sq. Ft.

Price Total

Posters, Full Color, Wide Format Printing, White 100 Ib Gloss
cover, One Sided, Mounted onto foam boarc

Price Per Sq. Ft.

Price Total

Posters, Full Color, Wide Format Printing, Mounted onto
Coroplast, One Sided, Mounted on foam boarc

Price Per Sq. Ft.

Price Total

Banners, Full Color, Wide Format Printing, White Vinyl, One
Sided, with grommets

Price Per Sq. Ft.
Price Total

Banners, Black & White, Wide Format Printing, White Vinyl,
One Sided, with grommets

Price Per Sq. Ft.
Price Total

Banners, Full Color, Wide Format Printing, Vinyl other than
White, One Sided, with grommets

Price Per Sq. Ft.
Price Total

Booklet/Newsletter, Full Color, 11x17 80 Ib white gloss text,
duplex, collate, and staple, finish size 8.5x11

Price Per Copy

Price Total

Booklet/Newsletter, Black ink, 11x17 70-80 Ib white gloss text,
duplex, collate, and staple, finish size 8.5x11

Price Per Copy

Price Total

Booklet/Newsletter, Full Color, 8.5x11 70-80 Ib white gloss
text, duplex, collate, and staple, finish size 8.5x5.&

Price Per Copy

Price Total

Booklet/Newsletter, Black ink, 8.5x11 70-80 Ib white gloss text,
duplex, collate, and staple, finish size 8.5x5.5

Price Per Copy

Price Total

3,000

3,000

3,000

3,000

3,000

3,000

3,000

3,000

3,000

5,000

5,000

5,000

5,000

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$0.59

$2,950.00

$0.29

$1,450.00

$0.39

$1,950.00

$0.19

$950.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$0.831
$4,155.00

$0.343
$1,715.00

$0.611
$3,055.00

$0.300|
$1,500.00
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 14, 2011
For: Supplemental Printing Services
Clear Visions Presto Printing Rush American
Printing, Inc.
121 Interpark Blvd., 2714 West Ave. 10912 Wye St.
A1285-11 CE Suite 801
ltem Description Estimated Annual |San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio,
Usage TX 78216 TX 78201 TX 78217
14a|Set Up
Price Per Hour 10 No Bid No Bid $25.00|
Price Total $250.00|
b|Folding
Price Per Hour 10 No Bid No Bid $15.00|
Price Total $150.00|
c|Scoring
Price Per Hour 10 No Bid No Bid $15.00|
Price Total $150.00|
d|Numbering
Price Per Hour 10 No Bid No Bid $20.00|
Price Total $200.00|
e|Perforating
Price Per Hour 10 No Bid No Bid $20.00|
Price Total $200.00|
f|Collating
Price Per Hour 10 No Bid No Bid $15.00,
Price Total $150.00|
g|Die Cut
Price Per Hour 10 No Bid No Bid $35.00|
Price Total $350.00|
h|Cutting
Price Per Hour 10 No Bid $25.00 $15.00,
Price Total $250.00 $150.00|
i|Punching
Price Per Hour 10 No Bid No Bid $10.00|
Price Total $100.00|
j|Padding
Price Per Hour 10 No Bid $25.00 $15.00,
Price Total $250.00 $150.00|
k{Binding
Price Per Hour 10 No Bid No Bid $15.00,
Price Total $150.00|
1|Shrink Wrap
Price Per Hour 10 No Bid No Bid $15.00|
Price Total $150.00|
m|Inserting
Price Per Hour 10 No Bid No Bid $20.00|
Price Total $200.00|
n|Stapling
Price Per Hour 10 No Bid No Bid $15.00,
Price Total $150.00|
o|Graphics
Price Per Hour 10 No Bid $65.00 $40.00|
Price Total $650.00 $400.00|
p|UV Coating
Price Per Hour 10 No Bid No Bid $50.00|
Price Total $500.00|
g|Foil
Price Per Hour 10 No Bid No Bid $45.00|
Price Total $450.00|
r|[Embossing
Price Per Hour 10 No Bid No Bid $45.00,
Price Total $450.00|
Payment Terms Net 30! Net 30! Net 30
Estimated Annual Total $32,686.50 $396,937.50 $952,241.10
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