
City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 7, 2011
For: Lubricants

Freightliner of San 
Antonio, Ltd.

Genuine Parts 
Company

Sun Coast Resources, 
Inc.

A135a-11 LD P.O. 200410 6374 Rittiman Rd. 6922 Cavalcade

Item Description Estimated
Quantity

San Antonio,                 
TX 78220

San Antonio,                 
TX 78218

Houston,                      
TX 77028

1 Motor Oil, SAE 30
55 Gallon Drum price per gallon 1,850 No Bid $10.16 $10.20
Total Price $18,796.00 $18,870.00
Brand Name NAPA Premium Fleet 

Motor Oil Chevron Ursa

2 Motor Oil, 15W40 CJ-4 Valvoline Premium Blue GEO #70520
55 Gallon Drum price per gallon 1,000 $17.79 $13.77 No Bid
Total Price $17,790.00 $13,770.00
Brand Name Valvoline Premium 

Blue GEO #70520
Valvoline Premium 

Blue (NAPA #70505)

3 Rear Axle Lubricant SAE 75W140
Quart Bottle price per quart 300 No Bid $12.19 No Bid
Total Price $3,657.00
Brand Name  Valvoline SynPower 

Synthetic Gear Oil

4 Automatic Transmission Fluid Mercon LV
55 Gallon Drum price per gallon 800 No Bid $20.11 $15.50
Total Price $16,088.00 $12,400.00
Quart Bottle price per quart 200 No Bid $5.39 $4.00
Total Price $1,078.00 $800.00
Brand Name Valvoline Maxlife 

Dex/Merc ATF Chevron ATF+4

5 Automatic Transmission Fluid Mercon SP
55 Gallon Drum price per gallon 550 No Bid $19.10 $11.50
Total Price $10,505.00 $6,325.00
Quart Bottle price per quart 400 No Bid $4.93 $3.10
Total Price $1,972.00 $1,240.00
Brand Name Valvoline Mercon V 

ATF
Chevron Multi ATF

6 Automatic Transmission Fluid Mopar ATF 4
55 Gallon Drum price per gallon 2,500 No Bid $20.70 $11.50
Total Price $51,750.00 $28,750.00
Quart Bottle price per quart 200 No Bid $5.73 $3.10
Total Price $1,146.00 $620.00
Brand Name  Valvoline ATF+4 Chevron MV ATF

7 Mystik JT-6 Hi Temp Grease Material
120 lb.  Drum price per lb. 1,200 No Bid $1.42 $2.00
Total Price $1,704.00 $2,400.00
Brand Name Mystik JT-6 Hi Temp 

Grease
Mystik JT-6 Hi Temp

Delivery 3 Days 3 Days 3 Days

Payment Terms Net 30 2% 10 Days Net 30

 Estimated Total $17,790.00 $120,466.00 $71,405.00
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