
City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 3, 2011
For: Copier & Printer Paper

Clampitt Paper Co.

A173-11 DDG/CE 3550 Ridgeside Drive

Item Description Estimated 
Quantities

San Antonio,
TX  78217                   

1      a Color Copy, Smooth Brightness, white, 
8 1/2"x11", Sub 60# weight

1,000

Brand Name Finch
Price Per Mil $9.45
Price Total $9,450.00
Brand Name Recycled Finch
Price Per Mil Recycled $9.45
Post Consumer Material 10%

2       a Index, white, 8 1/2"x11", Sub 110# weight 1,500
Price Per Mil $22.85
Price Total $34,275.00
Brand Name Springhill

b Index, white, 8 1/2"x14", Sub 110# weight 100
Price Per Ream No Bid
Price Total
Brand Name

c Index, buff, 8 1/2"x11", Sub 110# weight 100
Price Per Mil $24.08
Price Total $2,408.00
Brand Name Springhill

d Index, canary, 8 1/2"x11", Sub 110# weight 100
Price Per Mil $24.08
Price Total $2,408.00
Brand Name Springhill

e Index, green, 8 1/2"x11", Sub 110# weight 100
Price Per Mil $24.08
Price Total $2,408.00
Brand Name Springhill

f Index, blue, 8 1/2"x11", Sub 110# weight 100
Price Per Mil $24.08
Price Total $2,408.00
Brand Name Springhill

g Index, pink, 8 1/2"x11", Sub 110# weight 300
Price Per Mil $24.08
Price Total $7,224.00
Brand Name Springhill 

h Index, salmon, 8 1/2"x11", Sub 110# weight 200
Price Per Mil $24.08
Price Total $4,816.00
Brand Name Springhill

i Index, white, 11"x17", Sub 110# weight 25
Price Per Mil $47.54
Price Total $1,188.50
Brand Name Springhill
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation
Opened: January 3, 2011
For: Copier & Printer Paper

Clampitt Paper Co.

A173-11 DDG/CE 3550 Ridgeside Drive

Item Description Estimated 
Quantities

San Antonio,
TX  78217                   

3      a Color Copy Smooth Brightness, White,
11"x17", Sub 70# weight

1,000

Brand Name Finch
Price Per Mil $22.02
Price Total $22,020.00
Brand Name Recycled Finch
Price Per Mil Recycled $22.02
Post Consumer Material 10%

4      a Chipboard, 8 1/2"x11", (.022) 960 sheets/ctn 20
Price Per Carton $29.50
Price Total $590.00
Brand Name Dallas Paper

b Chipboard, 8 1/2"x14", (.022) 760 sheets/ctn 20
Price Per Carton $29.50
Price Total $590.00
Brand Name Dallas Paper

c Chipboard, 11"x17", (.022) 480 sheets/ctn 20
Price Per Carton $29.50
Price Total $590.00
Brand Name Dallas Paper

5      a Poly Window Envelopes, #10, 1/8x9 1/2, Sub 
24, 500 per box

500

Brand Name Print Wove
Price Per Box *$8.48/$16.96
Price Total $4,240.00
Brand Name Recycled No Bid
Price Per Mil Recycled No Bid
Post Consumer Material No Bid

6      a Color Copy, assorted pastel colors, 8 1/2"x11", 
24/60# weight

300

Brand Name Springhill
Price Per Mil $10.31
Price Total $3,093.00
Brand Name Recycled Springhill
Price Per Mil Recycled $10.31
Post Consumer Material 30%

b Color Copy, assorted pastel colors, 11"x17", 
24/60# weight

300

Brand Name Springhill
Price Per Mil $21.47
Price Total $6,441.00
Brand Name Recycled Springhill
Price Per Mil Recycled $21.47
Post Consumer Material 30%
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation
Opened: January 3, 2011
For: Copier & Printer Paper

Clampitt Paper Co.

A173-11 DDG/CE 3550 Ridgeside Drive

Item Description Estimated 
Quantities

San Antonio,
TX  78217                   

7      a Color Copy "Bright hue", assorted colors, 8 
1/2"x11", 24/60# weight

65

Brand Name Brite Hue
Price Per Mil $13.05
Price Total $848.25
Brand Name Recycled Brite Hue
Price Per Mil Recycled $13.05
Post Consumer Material 30%

b Color Copy "Bright hue", assorted colors, 8 
1/2"x14", 24/60# weight

35

Brand Name Brite Hue
Price Per Mil $16.60
Price Total $581.00
Brand Name Recycled Brite Hue
Price Per Mil Recycled $16.60
Post Consumer Material 30%

c Color Copy "Bright hue", assorted colors, 
11"x17", 24/60# weight

35

Brand Name Brite Hue
Price Per Mil $26.08
Price Total $912.80
Brand Name Recycled Brite Hue
Price Per Mil Recycled $26.08
Post Consumer Material 30%

d Color Copy "Bright hue", assorted colors, 8 
1/2"x11", 65# cover weight

200

Brand Name Brite Hue
Price Per Mil $25.81
Price Total $5,162.00
Brand Name Recycled Brite Hue
Price Per Mil Recycled $25.81
Post Consumer Material 30%

e Color Copy "Bright hue", Assorted Colors, 8 
1/2"x14", 65# cover weight

200

Brand Name No Bid
Price Per Mil
Price Total
Brand Name Recycled
Price Per Mil Recycled
Post Consumer Material

f Color Copy "Bright hue", assorted colors, 
11"x17", 65# cover weight

200

Brand Name Brite Hue
Price Per Mil $51.62
Price Total $10,324.00
Brand Name Recycled Brite Hue
Price Per Mil Recycled $51.62
Post Consumer Material 30%
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation
Opened: January 3, 2011
For: Copier & Printer Paper

Clampitt Paper Co.

A173-11 DDG/CE 3550 Ridgeside Drive

Item Description Estimated 
Quantities

San Antonio,
TX  78217                   

8      a Vellum Finish, 8 1/2"x11", 80# weight 60
Brand Name Finch
Price Per Mil $9.45
Price Total $567.00
Brand Name Recycled Finch
Price Per Mil Recycled $9.45
Post Consumer Material 10%

b Vellum Finish, 8 1/2"x17", 80# weight 60
Brand Name Finch
Price Per Mil $18.90
Price Total $1,134.00
Brand Name Recycled Finch
Price Per Mil Recycled $18.90
Post Consumer Material 10%

c Linen Finish, 8 1/2"x11", White 80# text weight 60
Brand Name Howard
Price Per Mil $55.70
Price Total $3,342.00
Brand Name Recycled Howard
Price Per Mil Recycled $55.70
Post Consumer Material 30%

d Linen Finish, 11"x17", White 80# text weight 60
Brand Name Howard
Price Per Mil $124.77
Price Total $7,486.20
Brand Name Recycled Howard
Price Per Mil Recycled $124.77
Post Consumer Material 30%

9 Copy Paper, white, 8 1/2"x11", three hole 
punch, Sub 20# weight

3,200

Price Per Mil $6.89
Price Total $22,048.00
Brand Name Boise

10 Color Copy Opaque Paper, 8 1/2"x11", smooth 
finish one side, Sub 60# weight

1,000

Price Per Mil $9.45
Price Total $9,450.00
Brand Name Finch

11 Color Copy Assorted Colors, 8 1/2" x 11", Sub 
20# weight

1,000

Price Per Mil $8.34
Price Total $8,340.00
Brand Name Hammermill Fore
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation
Opened: January 3, 2011
For: Copier & Printer Paper

Clampitt Paper Co.

A173-11 DDG/CE 3550 Ridgeside Drive
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San Antonio,
TX  78217                   

12     a Color Copy, Smooth 96 Brightness, 8 1/2"x11", 
70# weight

1,000

Price Per Mil $11.01
Price Total $11,010.00
Brand Name Finch

b Color Copy Gloss, 17"x11", 100# cover weight 1,000

Price Per Mil $49.68
Price Total $49,680.00
Brand Name ProDigital

c Color Copy Gloss, 17"x11", 80# cover weight 1,000

Price Per Mil $40.02
Price Total $40,020.00
Brand Name ProDigital

d Color Copy Gloss, 17"x11", 100# text weight 1,000

Price Per Mil $25.98
Price Total $25,980.00
Brand Name ProDigital

e Color Copy Gloss, 17"x11", 80# text weight 1,000
Price Per Mil $21.31
Price Total $21,310.00
Brand Name ProDigital

13     a Digital Carbonless Paper for High Speed 
Digital Printers, 2 part, 8 1/2"x11", reversed 
sequence, black image, 20-22 lb.

300

Price Per Mil $13.69
Price Total $4,107.00
Brand Name Excel One

b Digital Carbonless Paper for High Speed 
Digital Printers, 2 part, 8 1/2"x14", reversed 
sequence, black image, 20-22 lb.

100

Price Per Mil $17.41
Price Total $1,741.00
Brand Name Excel One

c Digital Carbonless Paper for High Speed 
Digital Printers, 3 part, 8 1/2"x11", reversed 
sequence, black image, 20-22 lb.

600

Price Per Mil $15.46
Price Total $9,276.00
Brand Name Excel One
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation
Opened: January 3, 2011
For: Copier & Printer Paper

Clampitt Paper Co.

A173-11 DDG/CE 3550 Ridgeside Drive

Item Description Estimated 
Quantities

San Antonio,
TX  78217                   

d Digital Carbonless Paper for High Speed 
Digital Printers, 3 part, 8 1/2"x14", reversed 
sequence, black image, 20-22 lb.

100

Price Per Mil $19.66
Price Total $1,966.00
Brand Name Excel One

e Digital Carbonless Paper for High Speed 
Digital Printers, 4 part, 8 1/2"x11", reversed 
sequence, black image, 20-22 lb.

200

Price Per Mil $16.52
Price Total $3,304.00
Brand Name Excel One

f Digital Carbonless Paper for High Speed 
Digital Printers, 4 part, 8 1/2"x14", reversed 
sequence, black image, 20-22 lb.

50

Price Per Mil $21.01
Price Total $1,050.50
Brand Name Excel One

Payment Terms 2% 10 Days
Estimated Annual Total $343,789.25
*Prices adjusted for evaluation purposes.
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