City of San Antonio Draft Bid Evaluation

Opened: December 28, 2010
For: Advertising Signage for the Alamodome and San
Antonio Convention Center
Aetna Sign Group, Ltd. Digital Banner Plus LLC General Sign Co. Ideal Signs
A1549-10 DDG 300 Austin Hwy. 7107-A Eckhert Rd. 900 Buena Vista 79 Eastview Dr.
Ste. 100 Ste. 101
Tt Descrintion Estimated |San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Georgetown,
em P Quantity |TX 78209 TX 78238 TX 78207 TX 78626
| Alamodome
1 Plaza Level Signage
a 6'x12’ Wall Display, Framed stretched vinyl sign 6
Price each $1,177.98 $327.00 $432.00 $450.00
Price total $7,067.88 $1,962.00 $2,592.00 $2,700.00
b 10'x20" Walll Display, Framed stretched vinyl sign 2
Price each $2,305.50 $845.00 $1,200.00 $925.00
Price total $4,611.00 $1,690.00 $2,400.00 $1,850.00
c Column Wrap, Surface Wall Vinyl 4
Price each $1,332.19 $416.00 $650.00 $275.00
Price total $5,328.76 $1,664.00 $2,600.00 $1,100.00
d Mast Wrap, Surface Wall Vinyl 4
Price each $3,565.26 $832.00 $650.00 $1,000.00
Price total $14,261.04 $3,328.00 $2,600.00 $4,000.00
Subtotal $31,268.68 $8,644.00 $10,192.00 $9,650.00
2 Club & Upper Level Signage
a 6'x12" Wall Display, Framed stretched vinyl sign 19
Price each $1,177.98 $327.00 $432.00 $450.00
Price total $22,381.62 $6,213.00 $8,208.00 $8,550.00
b 8'x16’ Wall Display, Framed stretched vinyl sign 8
Price each $1,635.02 $563.00 $768.00 $660.00
Price total $13,080.16 $4,504.00 $6,144.00 $5,280.00
c Mast Wrap, Surface wall vinyl applied to concrete 4
walls
Price each $3,565.26 $832.00 $650.00 $1,000.00
Price total $14,261.04 $3,328.00 $2,600.00 $4,000.00
Subtotal $49,722.82 $14,045.00 $16,952.00 $17,830.00
3 Inner Bowl!
a 3’ 6"x16’ Facia Display Sign 6
Price each $1,065.75 $364.00 $896.00 $192.00
Price total $6,394.50 $2,184.00 $5,376.00 $1,152.00
b Video Screen Ad Panel static messages 28'x5’ 6
Price each $1,613.85 $910.00 $1,540.00 $1,000.00
Price total $9,683.10 $5,460.00 $9,240.00 $6,000.00
c Video Screen Ad Panel static messages 12'x12’ 6
Price each $1,775.96 $936.00 $1,584.00 $1,000.00
Price total $10,655.76 $5,616.00 $9,504.00 $6,000.00
d 4'x7' LCD Wall 6
Price each No Bid $182.00 $100.00 No Bid
Price total $1,092.00 $600.00
e 4’7" LCD Wall 6
Price each No Bid $182.00 $100.00 No Bid
Price total $1,092.00 $600.00
f  |Ribbon boards (digital file) 4
Price each No Bid $435.00 $100.00 No Bid
Price total $1,740.00 $400.00
Subtotal $26,733.36 $17,184.00 $25,720.00 $13,152.00
4 Event Based Signage
a 40’ x 40' NW Corner Window Graphic (Outside) 1
Price each $25,114.00 $9,885.00 $10,400.00 $5,000.00
Price total $25,114.00 $9,885.00 $10,400.00 $5,000.00
b 40’ x 40’ Window Graphic (Outside) 1
Price each $25,114.00 $9,885.00 $10,400.00 $5,000.00
Price total $25,114.00 $9,885.00 $10,400.00 $5,000.00
c 59'x25' NW Corner (Outside) 1
Price each $23,247.13 $9,145.00 $9,587.50 $5,000.00
Price total $23,247.13 $9,145.00 $9,587.50 $5,000.00
d Column Wrap (Inside) 4
Price each $1,332.19 $416.00 $650.00 $275.00
Price total $5,328.76 $1,664.00 $2,600.00 $1,100.00
e Mast Wrap (Plaza Level) 1
Price each $3,565.26 $832.00 $650.00 $1,000.00
Price total $3,565.26 $832.00 $650.00 $1,000.00
Subtotal $82,369.15 $31,411.00 $33,637.50 $17,100.00
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Evaluation

Opened: December 28, 2010
For: Advertising Signage for the Alamodome and San
Antonio Convention Center
Aetna Sign Group, Ltd. Digital Banner Plus LLC General Sign Co. Ideal Signs
A1549-10 DDG 300 Austin Hwy. 7107-A Eckhert Rd. 900 Buena Vista 79 Eastview Dr.
Ste. 100 Ste. 101
It D it Estimated |San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Georgetown,
em escription Quantity |TX 78209 TX 78238 TX 78207 TX 78626
5 Dominance - Plaza Level Only
a 6'x12" Wall Display framed stretched vinyl sign 4
Price each $1,177.98 $327.00 $432.00 $450.00
Price total $4,711.92 $1,308.00 $1,728.00 $1,800.00
b 10'x20" Walll Display framed stretched vinyl sign 4
Price each $2,305.50 $845.00 $1,200.00 $925.00
Price total $9,222.00 $3,380.00 $4,800.00 $3,700.00
Subtotal $13,933.92 $4,688.00 $6,528.00 $5,500.00
6 Individual Pricing
a 6'x12" Wall Display framed stretched vinyl sign 4
Price each $1,177.98 $327.00 $432.00 $450.00
Price total $4,711.92 $1,308.00 $1,728.00 $1,800.00
b 8'x16’ Wall Display framed stretched vinyl sign 4
Price each $1,635.02 $563.00 $768.00 $660.00
Price total $6,540.08 $2,252.00 $3,072.00 $2,640.00
c 10'x20" Wall Display framed stretched vinyl sign 4
Price each $2,305.50 $845.00 $1,200.00 $925.00
Price total $9,222.00 $3,380.00 $4,800.00 $3,700.00
d Dome Mast Banner 1116'x16’ 4
Price each $85,079.04 $92,500.00 $107,136.00 $53,568.00
Price total $340,316.16 $370,000.00 $428,544.00 $214,272.00
e Video Screen Panel static message 28'x5’ 4
Price each $1,613.85 $910.00 $1,540.00 $1,000.00
Price total $6,455.40 $3,640.00 $6,160.00 $4,000.00
f Video Screen Panel static message 12'x12’ 4
Price each $1,775.96 $936.00 $1,584.00 $1,000.00
Price total $7,103.84 $3,744.00 $6,336.00 $4,000.00
g 3'6” x 16’ Facia Signage 4
Price each $1,065.75 $364.00 $896.00 $192.00
Price total $4,263.00 $1,456.00 $3,584.00 $768.00
Subtotal $378,612.40 $385,780.00 $454,224.00 $231,180.00
Il San Antonio Convention Center
1 5' Backlits 21
Price each $198.65 $225.00 $280.00 $95.00
Price total $4,171.65 $4,725.00 $5,880.00 $1,995.00
2 7' Backlits 4
Price each $276.95 $420.00 $448.00 $140.00
Price total $1,107.80 $1,680.00 $1,792.00 $560.00
3 Dpass units with 70" LCD screens 3
Price each No Bid $349.00 $100.00 No Bid
Price total $1,047.00 $300.00
4 Glassfire screens (digital file) 2
Price each No Bid $175.00 $100.00 No Bid
Price total $350.00 $200.00
Subtotal $5,279.45 $7,802.00 $8,172.00 $2,555.00
1] San Antonio Convention Center
1 1/4" Clear Acrylic with pressure sensitive vinyl applied
to back (reverse print) with 2 holes drilled on top only
a West Street 43" x 62" 5
Price each $390.05 $183.00 $384.00 $209.00
Price total $1,950.25 $915.00 $1,920.00 $1,045.00
b East Street 43" x 62" 9
Price each $390.05 $185.00 $384.00 $209.00
Price total $3,510.45 $1,665.00 $3,456.00 $1,881.00
c East Street Large 43" x 84" 3
Price each $611.90 $248.00 $512.00 $286.00
Price total $1,835.70 $744.00 $1,536.00 $858.00
d East Concourse 43" x 62" 3
Price each $390.05 $185.00 $384.00 $209.00
Price total $1,170.15 $555.00 $1,152.00 $627.00
e Ballroom C Level 43" x 62" 1
Price each $390.05 $183.00 $512.00 $209.00
Price total $390.05 $183.00 $512.00 $209.00
f Ballroom C Level 43" x 84" 1
Price each $611.90 $248.00 $512.00 $286.00
Price total $611.90 $248.00 $512.00 $286.00
Subtotal $9,468.50 $4,310.00 $9,088.00 $4,906.00
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Evaluation

Opened: December 28, 2010
For: Advertising Signage for the Alamodome and San
Antonio Convention Center
Aetna Sign Group, Ltd. Digital Banner Plus LLC General Sign Co. Ideal Signs
A1549-10 DDG 300 Austin Hwy. 7107-A Eckhert Rd. 900 Buena Vista 79 Eastview Dr.
Ste. 100 Ste. 101
It D it Estimated |San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Georgetown,
em escription Quantity |TX 78209 TX 78238 TX 78207 TX 78626
2 Main Lobby Street Level - Static Displays
a 5’ Edgelight on Soffit & Main Entrances & Exits 15
Price each $198.65 $225.00 $280.00 No Bid
Price total $2,979.75 $3,375.00 $4,200.00
b 7' Edgelight next to Business Center 15
Price each $276.95 $420.00 $448.00 No Bid
Price total $4,154.25 $6,300.00 $6,720.00
Subtotal $7,134.00 $9,675.00 $10,920.00 $0.00
3 Street Level - Static Displays
a 7' Edgelight outside Theatre lobby 4
Price each $276.95 $420.00 $448.00 No Bid
Price total $1,107.80 $1,680.00 $1,792.00
b 5’ Edgelight by Registration C 4
Price each $198.65 $225.00 $280.00 No Bid
Price total $794.60 $900.00 $1,120.00
c 5' Edgelight by Registration C 4
Price each $198.65 $225.00 $280.00 No Bid
Price total $794.60 $900.00 $1,120.00
d 5' Edgelight by Registration A 4
Price each $198.65 $225.00 $280.00 No Bid
Price total $794.60 $900.00 $1,120.00
e 5’ Edgelight by Registration B 4
Price each $198.65 $225.00 $280.00 No Bid
Price total $794.60 $900.00 $1,120.00
f 5’ Edgelight on Soffit by Registration C 4
Price each $198.65 $225.00 $280.00 No Bid
Price total $794.60 $900.00 $1,120.00
g Convention Displays 6'x3’ 4
Price each $290.00 $270.00 $384.00 $54.00
Price total $1,160.00 $1,080.00 $1,536.00 $216.00
Convention Displays, 5'x3’
Price each 4 $290.00 $270.00 $384.00 $45.00
Price total $1,160.00 $1,080.00 $1,536.00 $180.00
Convention Displays, 4'x3’
Price each 4 $290.00 $270.00 $384.00 $36.00
Price total $1,160.00 $1,080.00 $1,536.00 $144.00
Subtotal $8,560.80 $9,420.00 $12,000.00 $540.00
4 Concourse & Ballroom Level - Static Displays
a Recharging Workstations w/Edgelight 6
Price each No Bid $180.00 $280.00 No Bid
Price total $1,080.00 $1,680.00
b 5’ Edgelight on Soffit by Registration C 6
Price each $198.65 $225.00 $280.00 No Bid
Price total $1,191.90 $1,350.00 $1,680.00
c 5’ Edgelight on Concourse next to Escalator 6
Price each $198.65 $225.00 $280.00 No Bid
Price total $1,191.90 $1,350.00 $1,680.00
d 7' Edgelight on Ballroom Level next to Elevators 6
Price each $276.95 $420.00 $448.00 No Bid
Price total $1,661.70 $2,520.00 $2,688.00
e 5’ Edgelight on Ballroom Level next to Elevators 6
Price each $198.65 $225.00 $280.00 No Bid
Price total $1,191.90 $1,350.00 $1,680.00
Subtotal $5,237.40 $7,650.00 $9,408.00 $0.00
Terms Net 30 2% 10 days 2% 10 days Net 30
Estimated Annual Total $618,320.48 $500,609.00 $596,841.50 $302,413.00
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