City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: October 25, 2010
For: Emergency Vehicle Truck Parts & Service
Frazer, Ltd. Hall-Mark Fire Siddons Fire Apparatus
A770-11 LD |P.O. Box 5000 1590 E. Hwy 121, Suite |5511 Binz-Engleman Rd.
500
Item Description Bellaire, Lewisville, Kirby,
TX 77402-5000 TX 75056 TX 78219
1 Wheeled Coach Ambulance Parts & Service
A|Parts Discount
1|Percent of discount offered No Bid No Bid Cost Plus 20-50%
2|Product Identification (manufacturer) WHC-Mfg Part Number,
ie: WHC-1234
3| Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) Actual Cost to Siddons
Fire Apparatus (SFA)
4(Price Schedule Number N/A
5|Date of Price Schedule Most Current
6|Price schedule column on which discount is based (i.e., N/A
distributor, net, wholesale, etc.)
B|Labor and Service
1|Labor rate for service per hour No Bid No Bid $86.00
2|Mileage charge per mile $0.41
3|Delivery 10 Days
2 E-One Fire Truck Parts & Service
Al|Parts Discount
1|Percent of discount offered No Bid 2.5% Cost Plus 20-50%)
2|Product Identification (manufacturer) Manufacturer] EON-Mfg Part Number,
ie: EON-1234
3| Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) Not Provided| Actual Cost to Siddons|
Fire Apparatus (SFA)
4(Price Schedule Number Not Provided N/A
5|Date of Price Schedule Not Provided Most Current
6|Price schedule column on which discount is based (i.e., N/A
distributor, net, wholesale, etc.) No Provided
B|Labor and Service
1|Labor rate for service per hour No Bid $99.00 M-F| $86.00
$148.50 After Hours &
Saturday|
$198.00 Sundays &
Holidays
2|Mileage charge per mile $99.00 per hour $0.41
3|Delivery 2 Days 10 Days
3 Ferrara Fire Truck Parts & Service
Al|Parts Discount
1|Percent of discount offered No Bid Plus 25%) Cost Plus 20-50%)
2|Product Identification (manufacturer) Manufacturer] FER-Mfg Part Number,
ie: FER-1234
3| Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) Not Provided| Actual Cost to Siddons|
Fire Apparatus (SFA)
4|Price Schedule Number Not Provided N/A
5|Date of Price Schedule Not Provided Most Current
6|Price schedule column on which discount is based (i.e., N/A
distributor, net, wholesale, etc.) Not Provided
B|Labor and Service
1|Labor rate for service per hour No Bid $99.00 M-F| $86.00
$148.50 After Hours &
Saturday|
$198.00 Sundays &
Holidays
2|Mileage charge per mile $99.00 per hour $0.41
3|Delivery 2 Days 10 Days
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: October 25, 2010
For: Emergency Vehicle Truck Parts & Service
Frazer, Ltd. Hall-Mark Fire Siddons Fire Apparatus
A770-11 LD |P.O. Box 5000 1590 E. Hwy 121, Suite |5511 Binz-Engleman Rd.
500
Item Description Bellaire, Lewisville, Kirby,
TX 77402-5000 TX 75056 TX 78219
4 Pierce Fire Truck Parts & Service
AlParts Discount
1|Percent of discount offered No Bid Plus 25%) Cost Plus 20-50%)
2|Product Identification (manufacturer) Manufacturer| PIE-Mfg Part Number, ie:
PIE-1234]
3| Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) Not Provided| Actual Cost to Siddons|
Fire Apparatus (SFA)
4(Price Schedule Number Not Provided N/A
5|Date of Price Schedule Not Provided Most Current
6|Price schedule column on which discount is based (i.e., N/A
distributor, net, wholesale, etc.) Not Provided
B|Labor and Service No Bid
1|Labor rate for service per hour $99.00 M-F $86.00
$148.50 After Hours &
Saturday]
$198.00 Sundays &
Holidays
2|Mileage charge per mile $99.00 per hour $0.41
3|Delivery 2 Days 10 Days
5 Spartan Fire Truck Parts & Service
Al|Parts Discount
1|Percent of discount offered No Bid 2.5% Cost Plus 20-50%)
2|Product Identification (manufacturer) Manufacturer| SPA-Mfg Part Number,
ie: SPA-1234
3| Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) Not Provided| Actual Cost to Siddons|
Fire Apparatus (SFA)
4|Price Schedule Number Not Provided N/A
5|Date of Price Schedule Not Provided Most Current
6|Price schedule column on which discount is based (i.e., N/A
distributor, net, wholesale, etc.) No Provided
B|Labor and Service No Bid
1|Labor rate for service per hour $99.00 M-F| $86.00
$148.50 After Hours &
Saturday|
$198.00 Sundays &
Holidays
2|Mileage charge per mile $99.00 per hour $0.41
3|Delivery 2 Days 10 Days
6 Frazer Ambulance Parts & Service
Al|Parts Discount
1|Percent of discount offered 3% No Bid Cost Plus 20-50%)
2|Product Identification (manufacturer) Frazer, Ltd. Part ID FRA-Mfg Part Number,
ie: FRA-1234
3| Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) Distributor Actual Cost to Siddons
Fire Apparatus (SFA)
4|Price Schedule Number 2010 N/A
5|Date of Price Schedule 10/25/10 Most Current
6|Price schedule column on which discount is based (i.e., N/A
distributor, net, wholesale, etc.) Price
B|Labor and Service
1|Labor rate for service per hour $60.00 No Bid $86.00
2|Mileage charge per mile $2.25 $0.41
3|Delivery 3 Days 10 Days
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: October 25, 2010
For: Emergency Vehicle Truck Parts & Service
Frazer, Ltd. Hall-Mark Fire Siddons Fire Apparatus
A770-11 LD |P.O. Box 5000 1590 E. Hwy 121, Suite |5511 Binz-Engleman Rd.
500
Item Description Bellaire, Lewisville, Kirby,
TX 77402-5000 TX 75056 TX 78219
7 American LaFrance Fire Truck Parts & Service
AlParts Discount
1|Percent of discount offered No Bid Plus 25%) Cost Plus 20-50%)
2|Product Identification (manufacturer) Manufacturer]  ALF-Mfg Part Number,
ie: ALF-1234]
3| Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) Not Provided| Actual Cost to Siddons|
Fire Apparatus (SFA)
4|Price Schedule Number Not Provided N/A
5|Date of Price Schedule Not Provided Most Current
6|Price schedule column on which discount is based (i.e., N/A
distributor, net, wholesale, etc.) Not Provided
B|Labor and Service
1|Labor rate for service per hour No Bid $99.00 M-F| $86.00
$148.50 After Hours &
Saturday|
$198.00 Sundays &
Holidays
2|Mileage charge per mile $99.00 per hour $0.41
3|Delivery 2 Days 10 Days
8 KME Fire Truck Parts & Service
Al|Parts Discount
1|Percent of discount offered No Bid Plus 25%) Cost Plus 20-50%)
2|Product Identification (manufacturer) Manufacturer] KME-Mfg Part Number,
ie: KME-1234]
3| Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) Not Provided| Actual Cost to Siddons|
Fire Apparatus (SFA)
4|Price Schedule Number Not Provided N/A
5|Date of Price Schedule Not Provided Most Current
6|Price schedule column on which discount is based (i.e., N/A
distributor, net, wholesale, etc.) Not Provided
B|Labor and Service
1|Labor rate for service per hour No Bid $99.00 M-F| $86.00
$148.50 After Hours &
Saturday|
$198.00 Sundays &
Holidays
2|Mileage charge per mile $99.00 per hour $0.41
3|Delivery 2 Days 10 Days
Payment Terms 2% Net 10 Net 30 Net 30
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