City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 27, 2010
For: Presort Mail & Standard (A) Flat Mail Services
Pitney Bowes Presort
Services, Inc.
A366-11 LD |4401 Freidrich Ln.
Ste. 211
Item Description Austin,
TX 78744
1 First Class Automated Letter - Mail
Bar-Coded Discount
loz $0.357
20z $0.482
30z $0.607
Vendor's Fees $0.01712
loz $0.01712
20z $0.01712
30z
Guaranteed Read Rate 100%
2 Handsort/Rejects
Vendor's Fee $0.00
3 First Class Non Automated Letter - Mail
Bar-Coded Discount
loz $0.414
20z $0.539
30z $0.664
Vendor's Fees
loz $0.00
20z $0.00
30z $0.00
4 Pre-sort Flat Mail, Under 13 oz
loz $0.542
20z $0.712
30z $0.882
40z $1.052
50z $1.222
6 0z $1.392
70z $1.562
8 0z $1.732
90z $1.902
10 oz $2.072
11 0z No Bid
12 oz No Bid
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 27, 2010
For: Presort Mail & Standard (A) Flat Mail Services
Pitney Bowes Presort
Services, Inc.
A366-11 LD |4401 Freidrich Ln.
Ste. 211
Item Description ?;J(St%?M
Vendor's Fees
loz $0.078
20z $0.078
30z $0.078
40z $0.078
50z $0.078
6 0z $0.078
70z $0.078
8oz $0.078
90z $0.078
10 0z $0.078
11 0z No Bid
12 oz No Bid
5 Pre-sort Standard A Flat Mail, Under 13 oz*
loz $0.558
20z $0.558
30z $0.558
$0.725 per 1b./$0.408
40z per piece
$0.725 per 1b./$0.408
50z per piece
$0.725 per 1b./$0.408
6 0z per piece
$0.725 per 1b./$0.408
70z per piece
$0.725 per 1b./$0.408
80z per piece
$0.725 per 1b./$0.408
90z per piece
$0.725 per 1b./$0.408
10 oz per piece
$0.725 per 1b./$0.408
11 0z per piece
$0.725 per 1b./$0.408
12 oz per piece
Vendor's Fees
loz $0.06
20z $0.06
30z $0.06
40z $0.06
50z $0.06
6 0z $0.06
70z $0.06
80z $0.06
90z $0.06
10 oz $0.06
1loz $0.06
12 0z $0.06
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 27, 2010

For: Presort Mail & Standard (A) Flat Mail Services
A366-11 LD
Item Description

Pitney Bowes Presort
Services, Inc.

4401 Freidrich Ln.
Ste. 211

Austin,

TX 78744

6 First Class Pre-Sort Letter - Mail

loz
20z
30z

Vendor's Fees
loz
20z
30z

Bar-Coded Discount

7 Automated Post-Card

Vendor's Rate
Vendor's Fee

8 Non-Automated Post-Card

Vendor's Rate
Vendor's Fee

Payment Terms

$0.357
$0.482
$0.607

$0.01712
$0.01712
$0.01712

$0.218
$0.01621

$0.245
$0.00

Net 30
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