
1-29-·81 NM:ck 

AN ORDINANCE 5334 4 

AMENDING ORDINANCE NO. 53288 CALLING THE REGULAR 
MUNICIPAL ELECTION AND A BOND ELECTION TO BE 
HELD ON APRIL 4, 1981, IN THE CITY OF SAN ANTONIO, 
BEXAR COUNTY, TEXAS, FOR THE PURPOSE OF ELECTING 
THE MEMBERS TO THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF 
SAN ANTONIO AND ON A PROPOSED BOND ISSUE FOR 
RESTORING MUNICIPAL AUDITORIUM, SO AS TO CORRECT 
THE AMOUNT OF BONDS AUTHORIZED TO BE ISSUED. 

* * * 

WHEREAS, the City Council of the City of San Antonio adopted 
Ordinance No. ~3288 on January 22, 1981, calling the regular 
municipal election and a bond election to be held on April 4, 
1981, in the City of San Antonio, Bexar County, Texas, for the 
purpose of electing the members to the City Council of the City 
of San Antonio and on a proposed bond issue for restoring Munici­
pal Auditorium; and, 

WHEREAS, at said election all resident, qualified electors 
of the City of San Antonio shall be entitled to vote "For" or "Against" 
authorizing the issuance of $9,100,000 of Municipal Auditorium 
restoration bonds by the City Council of the City of San Antonio; 
NOW, THEREFORE, 

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN ANTONIO: 

SECTION 1. Section 2 of Ordinance No. 53288 be and the same is 
hereby amended by deleting"$9,412,000" and inserting"$9,100,000" 
so that said section shall hereafter be and read as follows: 

SECTION 2. That at said election the following PROPOSI­
TION shall be submitted in accordance with law: 

PROPOS ITION NO.1 

Shall the City Council of the City of San 
Antonio be authorized to issue the bonds of 
said City, in one or more series or issues, 
in the aggregate prinicipal amount of $9,100,000 
with the bonds of each such series or issue, 
respectively to mature serially within not to 
exceed forty years from their date, and to be 
sold at such prices and bear interest at such 
rates, not to exceed the maximum rates permitted 
by law, as shall be determined within the dis­
cretion of the City Council, for the purpose of 
making improvements for public purposes, to-wit: 
restoring the Municipal Auditorium; and shall 
said City Council be authorized to levy, and 
cause to be assessed and collected annual ad 
valorem taxes in an amount sufficient to pay the 
annual interest on said bonds and provide a sink­
ing fund to pay said bonds at maturity? 

SECTION 2. Section 3 of Ordinance No. 53288 be and the same is 
hereby amended by deleting "$9,412 ,000" and inserting "$9,100,000" 
so that said section shall hereafter be and read as follows: 



SECTION 3. The official ballots for said election 
shall be prepared in accordance with the Texas Election 
Code so as to permit the electors to vote "FOR" or 
"AGAINST" the aforesaid PROPOSITION, with the ballots 
to contain such provisions, markings, and language as 
required by law, and with such PROPOSITION to be 
expressed substantially as follows: 

FOR 

AGAINST 

x 
X 
X 

PROPOSITION NO.1 

THE ISSUANCE OF $9,100,000 OF MUNICIPAL 
AUDITORIUM RESTORATION BONDS 

PASSED AND APPROVED this ) t.J:l 
__ ~oL~~/ _____ day of January, 1981. 

• 

ATTEST: MAY 0 R. 

APPROVED AS TO FORM: __ +~!';fnz~tc~-/t~;da=:""",'!f/"--__ 
f'§~0 

81-04 



4dd-ol') 
CITY OF SAN ANTONIO 

tnienJepartment Corresponde,..ce Sheet 

TO : ______ ~C~i~t~yL-C~o~u~n~c~l~·l~~t~h~r~o~u~gLh~~tnh~e~C~lL·ttyY-~M~a~nlia~g~e~r~ __________________________ __ 

FROM : ____ ~C_l~·t~y~Aut~t~o~rkn~e~y~ ____________________________________________________ ___ 

COPIESTO: __ F~j~l~e~ ________________________________________________________________ _ 

SUBJEcT: __ ~A~n~o~r~d~iun~a~n~c~e~a~m~e~n~d~j~n~g~o~r~d~i~n~a~n~c~e~N~0~.~5~3~2]8~8~c~a~11l1iinn~gLJt~h~e~ ________ __ 
Regular Municipal Election and Bond Elec-
tion on April 4, 1981 Date.Janllary 29 1981 

SUMMARY 

Thi~ ordinan~e would amend Ordinance No. 53288 adopted 
by ~he Clty Cou~cll on January 22, 1981, calling the regular 
mU~lclpal electlon and a bond election on April 4, 1981. 
ThlS amendment involves correcting an error in the amount of 
bonds authorized to be issued for the restoration of Municipal 
Auditorium should the bond proposition be approved by the 
voters of San Antonio. 

BACKGROUND 

The City Council adopted Ordinance No. 53288 calling 
the regular municipal election and a bond election to be 
held on April 4, 1981, for the purpose of electing the 
members to the City Council of the City of San Antonio and 
on a proposed bond issue for restoring Municipal Auditorium. 
Due to a cleri-::al error the ordinance approved January 22, 
1981 authorized the City Council to issue up to $9,412,000 
of Municipal Auditorium restoration bonds upon approval of 
the bond proposition by the voters of San Antonio . 

The proposed ordinance corrects this error by amending 
Ordinance No . . 53288 to allow for the issuance of $9,100,000 
in restoration bonds upon passage by the voters on April 4, 
1981. 

RECOMMENDATION 

It is recommended that this ordinance be proved. 
~---< 

Attorney 



DISlRlBUTI ON 

AVIATION 

BUDGET & RESEARCH I 
BUILDING & ZONING 

CITY WATER BOARD 

CITIZEN ACTION & PUBLIC INFORMAT ION 

COf+ERC IAL RECOROER 

CONVENTI ON BUREAU 

CONVENTION CENTER 

ECONOM IC & EMPLOYMENT DEVELOPMENT 

EQUAL EMPLOYMENT OPPORTUN ITY 

FINANCE DIRECTOR 

ASSESSOR 

CONlROLL!':R I 
lREASURY DIVIS ION 

FINANCE - GRANT SECTION 

INTERNA L AUD IT 

PROPERTY RECORDS 

FIRE CHIEF 

HEALTH DIRECTOR 

h£MISFA IR PLAZA 

HUMAN RESOURCES 

LEGAL - CITY ATTORNEY 

LI BRAR Y DIRECTOR 

MARKET SQUARE 

MUNICIPAL COURTS 

PARKS & RECR EATION DEPT. 

PERSONNEL DIRECTOR l 
PLANN ING 

POLICE CH IEF 

PRESS ROOM 

PUBLIC WORKS DIRECTOR 

ENGINEERING DIVISION 

ENG INEER ING - SEWERS 

RIGHT OF WAY & LA.ND ACQU IS IT ION 

PURCHASING 

lRAFFIC & lRANSPORTATION 

'ii~" 
"I. 

ITE~ NO. 4z, 
04EET 

"HI 

ING OF TI£ CITY COUNC il 

ONB~ 
JAN 291981 

DATE: 

SECONDED BY:~~ 
53344 

ORo. NO. _____ _ ZON ING ClSE 

RFSO l. _______ _ PETITION _______ _ 

COUNC IL MEIoIlER ROLL CALL AYE NAY 

1£ ~Y G. CISNEROS 
LACE 1 P 

J) E WEBB 
LACE 2 P 

1£ LEN DUTl£R 
LACE 3 P 

FR ANK D. WING 
LACE 4 P 

B 
P 

ERNARDD EURESTE 
LACE 5 

B 
P 

OB THOMPSON 
LACE 6 

P 
JOE ALDERETE ,.F. 

LACE 7 

G 
P 

ENE CANAVAN 
LACE 8 

V 
P 

AN ARCHER 
LACE 9 

JOHN STEEN 
LACE 10 P 

L ILA COCKRELL 
LACE 11 (MAYOR) / p 

( fA 

"'-
81-04 

.-t ~ 1 . J ' 

. l -

) 


