
#37 TS 
7122/04 

AN ORDINANCE 99481 
ADOPTING THE 2003 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE AND 
AMENDMENTS. 

* * * * * 

WHEREAS, the Department of Development Services currently enforces the 1997 
Edition of the Uniform Building Code published by the International Code Council, Inc. 
and the local amendments thereto; and 

WHEREAS, the 2003 edition of the International Building Code (mC) has been 
published; and 

WHEREAS, the Building and Fire Board of Appeals and city staff have conducted 
public meetings regarding the adoption of the 2003 mc and amendments thereto; and 

WHEREAS, the Building and Fire Board of Appeals and the Department of 
Development Services recommend approval and adoption of the 2003 mc and its local 
amendments; and 

WHEREAS, all prerequisites required by state statute and the City Charter for adoption 
of this code and its amendments have been satisfied; NOW THEREFORE 

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN 
ANTONIO: 

SECTION 1. The 2003 edition of the International Building Code (mC) is hereby 
adopted to replace the 1997 edition of the Uniform Building Code. To reflect the 
adoption of the mc, Section 6-36 of the City Code is amended by adding the language 
that is underlined (added) and deleting the language that is stricken (deleted) as follows: 

Sec. 6-36. Uniform International Building Code adopted. 
The building code of the city is hereby revised and amended to conform to the 
Uniform International Building Code, -l-99+ 2003 edition, as amended hereby, and 
same as amended is hereby adopted as the building code of the city from the effective 
date hereof and shall govern all activities specified therein within the city. Three (3) 
copies of the International Building Code, with corrections, are incorporated by 
reference in this article and have been filed in the office of the city clerk, pursuant to 
section 17 of the Charter, for permanent record and inspection. 



.. 

SECTION 2. The local amendments of the 2003 edition of the International Building 
Code are hereby adopted and Chapter 6, section 6-37 of the City Code is hereby amended 
to read as follows to reflect such amendments: 

Sec. 6-37. Amendments. 
Certain portions of the International Building Code are hereby amended as they apply 
to activities within the city. The amendments to the International Building Code, 
which are hereby approved and adopted, additions, deletions and changes in wording 
of certain sections, are set out below as follows: 

Section 104.6 of the International Building Code is amended by adding Section 104.6.1 
to read as follows: 

104.6.1 The building official shall examine or cause to be examined every 
building or structure or portion thereof reported as dangerous or damaged. If 
such is found to be an unsafe building as defined in this section, the building 
official shall give to the owner of such building or structure written notice 
stating the defects thereof. This notice shall require the owner or person in 
charge of the building or premise, within 48 hours to commence either the 
required repairs or improvements or demolition and removal of the building or 
structure or portions thereof. All such work shall be completed within 30 days 
from the date of notice, unless otherwise stipulated by the building official. 
Proper service of such notice shall be by certified mail made upon the owner or 
his agent. The designated period within which said owner or agent is required to 
comply with the order of the building official shall begin as of the date he 
received such notice. 

Section 105.2 Items 2 and 6 of the International Building Code are amended to read as 
follows: 

2. Minor repairs to fences not over 6 feet high. Up to 25% of the overall 
contiguous length of a fence shall constitute minor repair. 

6. Walks and driveways not more than 30 inches above grade, not constructed 
of concrete, and not over any basement or story below. 

Section 105.3.1 of the International Building Code is amended to read as follows: 

105.3.1 Action on Application. The application, plans, specifications, 
computations and other data filed by an applicant for a permit shall be reviewed 
by the building official. Such plans may be reviewed by other departments of 
this jurisdiction to verify compliance with any applicable laws under their 
jurisdiction. If the building official finds that the work described in an 
application or a permit and the plans, specifications and other data filed 
therewith conform to the requirements of this code and other pertinent laws and 



ordinances, and that the fees specified in Section 108 have been paid, the 
building official shall issue a permit therefore to the applicant. No permit shall 
be issued where there is not a supply of approved water for domestic or fire 
protection use and adequate to the purposes for which the property is intended to 
be used. 

Section 108 of the International Building Code is amended by adding Section 108.1.1 to 
read as follows: 

108.1.1 Preliminary Plan Review Fees. Preliminary plan reviews may be made 
when requested. A fee for such review shall be assessed in accordance with the 
fee schedule adopted by the City of San Antonio. Applicants shall submit 
written comments summarizing building code interpretations agreed upon in the 
preliminary plan review, as soon as reasonably possible following the review. 
The Development Services Department will approve or disapprove such 
comments and return to applicant as soon as reasonably possible. 

Section 108 of the International Building Code is amended by adding Section 108.7 to 
read as follows: 

108.7 Work requiring a permit shall not be commenced until the permit holder 
or his agent has posted the building permit in a conspicuous place on the 
premise. Where work for which a permit is required by this code is started, prior 
to obtaining said permit, the specified fees may be doubled. The payment of 
such double fee shall not relieve any person from fully complying with the 
requirements of this code in the execution of the work nor from any other 
penalties prescribed herein. 

Section 108 of the International Building Code is amended by adding Section 108.8 to 
read as follows: 

108.8 Buildings Being Moved. Inspection of structures located outside city 
limits. An inspection to determine compliance with city requirements shall be 
made of any building or structure that is located not more than five miles from 
the city limits and on which an application to move same into the city is pending 
before the zoning board of adjustment. A fee shall be charged in accordance 
with the fee schedule adopted by the City of San Antonio. 

Section 108 of the International Building Code is amended by adding Section 108.9 to 
read as follows: 

108.9 Reinspection Fees. The reinspection fee charged shall be in accordance 
with the fee schedule Adopted by the City of San Antonio. 



In instances where reinspection fees have been assessed, all fees shall be paid 
before release of the utilities. 

Section 109 of the International Building Code is amended by adding Section 109.3.7.1 
to read as follows: 

109.3.7.1 Insulation Inspection. To be made after plumbing, electrical rough in 
and the framing inspection has been approved and an approved insulating 
material has been installed. A certification from the installer on hislher 
letterhead is acceptable in lieu of an inspection. 

Section 110.1 of the International Building Code is amended to read as follows: 

110.1 Use and Occupancy. No building or structure shall be used or occupied, 
and no change in the existing occupancy classification or physical change 
of occupant of a building or structure or portion thereof shall be made 
until the building official has issued a certificate of occupancy therefor as 
provided herein. Issuance of a Certificate of Occupancy shall not be 
construed as an approval of a violation of the provisions of this code or of 
other ordinances of the Jurisdiction. 

Section 112.1 of the International Building Code is amended to read as follows: 

Section 112.1 General. In order to hear and decide appeals of orders, decisions 
or determinations made by the building official and fire chief relative to the 
application and interpretation of the building and fire code, and to determine 
appeals regarding the suitability of alternate materials and types of construction, 
there shall be and is hereby created a building and fire code board of appeals 
consisting of eleven persons residing in the city. The findings of the board 
regarding appeals of modifications shall be advisory in nature. The board shall 
consist of two structural engineers, two architects, four builders, two lay persons 
and one person with expertise in fire prevention. The fire chief and building 
official shall be ex officio members. The building official shall be an ex officio 
member. of and shall act as secretary to said board. But the building official or 
fire chief shall have not vote upon any matter before the board. The board of 
appeals shall be appointed by the city council. The term of office shall not 
exceed two (2) years and shall be limited to three (3) consecutive two-year 
terms. All vacancies shall be filled for the unexpired portion of the term only. 
The board shall adopt reasonable rules and regulations for conducting its 
meetings and shall render all decisions and findings in writing to the appellant 
with a duplicate to the building official and fire chief. Each application to the 
board shall be accompanied by a filing fee as set forth in the fee schedule 
adopted by the City of San Antonio. 



Section 112 of the International Building Code is amended by adding Section 112.4 to 
read as follows: 

112.4 Quorums and Majority Vote 

1. Six (6) members shall constitute a quorum. 

2. The vote of a majority of the members present shall be necessary for 
adoption of any matter. Each member of the board of appeals shall have 
one (1) vote. 

Section 113 of the International Building Code is amended by adding Section 113.5 to 
read as follows: 

113.5 Any person, firm or corporation, after being served with written 
notice by the building official, willfully violating any of the provisions of this 
code shall be deemed guilty of a misdemeanor. Each such person shall be 
deemed guilty of a separate offense for each day or portion thereof during which 
any violation of any of the provisions of this code is committed, continued or 
permitted. Each violation shall be punishable by a fine not to exceed five 
hundred ($500.00) dollars. 

Section 113 of the International Building Code is amended by adding Section 113.6 to 
read as follows: 

113.6 Occupancy Violations. Whenever any building or structure or equipment 
therein regulated by this code or other ordinances which are enforced by the 
code enforcement agency is being used contrary to the provisions of this code or 
those ordinances, the building official may order such use discontinued and the 
structure, or portion thereof, vacated by notice served on any person causing 
such use to be continued. Such person shall discontinue the use within the time 
prescribed by the building official after receipt of such notice to make the 
structure, or portion thereof, comply with the requirements of this code, or other 
applicable ordinances. 

Section 202 of the International Building Code is amended by adding the following 
definitions: 

Occupant is any person, agent, firm or corporation that occupies a building or 
part thereof as an owner or a tenant. 

Structure is that which is built or constructed, an edifice or building or fixture, or 
any piece of construction of any kind of a permanent nature, including, but not 
limited to, reinforced concrete slabs and patios, fences, masonry barbecue pits 
and carports. 



Section 406 of the International Building Code is amended by adding Section 406.1.5 to 
read as follows: 

406.1 .5 Private garages which are constructed in conjunction with any Group R 
Divisions 1 through 4 occupancy shall be equipped with fixed louvers or 
screened openings or exhaust ventilation to the outside with exhaust openings 
located no higher than eighteen (18") inches of the floor. The clear area of the 
louver opening or of the openings into the exhaust ducts shall be not less than 
sixty (60 s.i.) square inches per car stored in such private garage. 

Section 501.2 of the International Building Code is amended to read as follows: 

501.2. Premises Identification. Approved numbers or addresses shall be 
provided for all buildings in such a position as to be plainly visible and legible 
from the street or road fronting the property. Said numbers shall contrast with 
their background. Numbers shall be a minimum 4" in height. 

Section 907.2.10 of the International Building Code is amended by adding Section 
907.2.10.5 to read as follows: 

907.2.10.5 One battery operated smoke detector shall be installed adjacent to 
each group of sleeping rooms in every existing residential dwelling. 

Section 1022 of the International Building Code is amended by adding Section 1022.6 to 
read as follows: 

1022.6 Exterior fire escape. Any existing exterior fire escape which is deemed 
to be adequate fire escape under the laws of the state or under the provisions of 
the city fire prevention regulations shall be deemed an adequate means of egress 
for emergency use, as required by this chapter, and the number of existing 
exterior fire escapes shall be provided to comply with the fire escape law of the 
state and the city fire prevention regulations. 

Chapter 11 of the International Building Code is amended by deleting and replacing with 
new Chapter 11 as follows: 

Chapter 11 - Accessibility: All buildings or portions of buildings must comply 
with the accessibility standards adopted by the state of Texas. Projects shall be 
submitted to T.D.L.R. for review, inspection and approval in accordance with 
state law. 



Section 1503.4 of the International Building Code IS amended by adding Section 
1503.4.2 and 1503.4.3 to read as follows: 

1503.4.2 On zero lot line development where roof projections are allowed by 
deed covenant or ingress/egress easements, adequate gutters and down spouts 
shall be provided to direct roof water away from adjacent property. Roof 
projections shall not extend beyond a point 113 the width of the easement or a 
maximum of 24 inches. 

1503.4.3 Any Group R, or Group U occupancy with roof edges less than 3 feet 
to any property line, shall be provided with gutters and down spouts to direct 
roofwater from adjacent property. 

Section 1704.1 through 1704.2.2 ofthe International Building Code is amended to read as 
follows: 

1704.1 General. Where application is made for construction as described in this 
section, the owner or the registered design professional in responsible charge 
acting as the owner's agent shall employ one or more special inspectors to 
provide inspections during construction on the types of work listed under 
Section 1704. The special inspector shall be qualified individuals, approved 
agencies or firms who shall demonstrate competence, to the satisfaction of the 
registered design professional in responsible charge and the building official, for 
inspection of the particular type of construction or operation requiring special 
inspection. These inspections are in addition to the inspections specified in 
Section 109. 

Exceptions: 
1. Special inspections are not required for work of minor nature or as 

warranted by conditions in the jurisdiction as approved by the building 
official. 

2. Special inspections are not required for building components unless the 
design involves the practice of professional engineering or architecture as 
defmed by applicable state statutes and regulations governing the 
professional registration and certification of engineers or architects. 

3. Unless otherwise required by the building official, special inspections are 
not required for occupancies in Group R-3 as applicable in Section 101.2 
and occupancies in Group U that are accessory to a residential occupancy 
including, but not limited to, those listed in Section 312.1. 

1704.1.1 Building permit requirement. The permit applicant shall submit a list 
of special inspections indicated on the permit documents prepared by the 
registered design professional in responsible charge in accordance with Section 
106.1 as a condition for permit issuance. This list shall include a complete list 
of materials and work requiring special inspections by this section, the 



inspections to be performed and required qualifications of the special inspectors 
intended to be retained for conducting such inspections. 

1704.1.2 Report requirement. Special inspectors shall keep records of 
inspections. The special inspector shall furnish inspection reports to the 
building official, upon request, and to the registered design professional in 
responsible charge. Individual special inspection reports shall indicate that work 
inspected was done in conformance to approved construction documents. 
Discrepancies shall be brought to the immediate attention of the contractor for 
correction. If the discrepancies are not corrected, the discrepancies shall be 
brought to the attention of the building official and to the registered design 
professional in responsible charge prior to the completion of that phase of the 
work. A final report written by the registered design professional in responsible 
charge documenting all of the required special inspections, the special inspectors 
and correction of any discrepancies brought to the attention of the building 
official and the registered design professional in responsible charge shall be 
submitted to the building official prior to the building official issuing the 
certificate of occupancy. 

1704.2 Inspection of fabricators. Where fabrication of structural load-bearing 
members and assemblies is being performed on the premises of a fabricator's 
shop, special inspection of the fabricated items shall be required by this section 
and as required elsewhere in this code. 

1704.2.1 Fabrication and implementation procedures. The special inspector 
shall verify that the fabricator maintains detailed fabrication and quality control 
procedures that provide a basis for inspection control of the workmanship and 
the fabricator's ability to conform to approved construction documents and 
referenced standards. The special inspector shall review the procedures for 
completeness and adequacy relative to the code requirements for the 
fabricator's scope of work. 

Exception: Special inspections as required by Section 1704.2 shall not be . 
required where the fabricator is approved in accordance with Section 
1704.2.2. 

1704.2.2 Fabricator approval. Special inspections required by this code are not 
required where the work is done on the premises of a fabricator that is enrolled 
in a nationally accepted inspections program acceptable to the registered design 
professional in responsible charge. At completion of fabrication, the approved 
fabricator shall submit a certificate of compliance to building official upon 
request and to the registered design professional in responsible charge stating 
that the work was performed in accordance with the approved construction 
documents. 



Section 1805.2 of the International Building Code IS amended by revising the first 
sentence to read as follows: 

Footings shall have a minimum depth as indicated in Table No. 1805.4.2 
unless another depth is recommended by a foundation investigation. 

Chapter 18 of the International Building Code is amended by revising Table 1805.4.2 to 
read as follows: 

Table 1805.4.2 Pier Foundation Minimum Requirements (1) 

Number of Depth 
Floors Below 
Supported Min. cross section or diameter Width Thickness Undisturbed 
by Wood, Masonry or of of Ground 
the Concrete Piers Footing Footing Surface 
F oundation( 1 ) Wood Masonry Concrete (In.) (4) (In.) (4) (Inches) 

1 6" 8"(2) 10"(3) 18 6 24 
2 6" 8"(2) 10"(3) 24 10 30 

1. Foundations may support a roof in addition to the stipulated number of 
floors. Foundations supporting roofs only shall be as required for 
supporting one floor. 

2. Masonry units to be fully grouted with 112" reinforcing bar in each cavity. 

3. 2-5/8" reinforcing bar evenly spaced with the pier. 

4. Footing to be reinforced by WWM 6x6-W2.9x W2.9 or minimum four (4) 
3/8" reinforcing bars. Should shimming be required between the pier and 
the sill, shimming shall not exceed one and one half inches (1-112") and be 
of lumber strength equal to the sill. 

Chapter 19 of the International Building Code is amended by adding Section 1917 to 
read as follows: 

1917 - Locally Accepted Minimum Standards. The following are locally 
accepted minimum standards for concrete and reinforcement necessary for grade 
supported foundations. Commercial, residential and additions and detached 
accessory buildings over 600 square feet and less than 5,000 square feet for slab 
on grade foundation unless otherwise required to be designed by an engineer. 



Slab on Grade Foundation Requirements 

1. Residential minimum slab thickness 4 inches and concrete to be a 
minimum of 2500 psi. Commercial minimum slab thickness 5 inches and 
concrete to be a minimum of 3000 psi. 

2. Residential minimum beam width 10 inches exterior, 8 inches interior. 
Commercial minimum beam width 12 inches exterior, 12 inches interior. 

3. Minimum beam depth below natural grade - 6 inches exterior, interior to 
natural grade. 

4. Residential minimum beam depth overall - 24 inches exterior, 18 inches 
interior, from top of slab (12" for commercial). 

5. Concrete to be separated from the earth with no less than 6 mil 
polyethylene or other approved materials. 

6. Base materials shall consist of 6 inches of sand, gravel, or other accepted 
granular materials and the sub grade shall be free of all growth or 
vegetation. 

7. Additions shall be tied to the existing slab by bars of equal size and spacing 
with a minimum of four (4) 3/4" diameter anchor bolts at each beam 
abutting existing slab and 112" diameter compression rods minimum 24" on 
center. 

8. Reinforcing steel in beams shall be placed at mid-height. Tension and 
compression of four (4) 3/4" in diameter reinforcing bars, two at top and 
two at bottom continuous with comer bars. Stirrups 3/8" in diameter. 
Exterior and interior beams, stirrups shall be 18" on center or 3/4 of depth 
of beam, not to exceed 30 inches. 

9. Reinforcing steel in slabs. 

Bar Spacing Maximum 
Diameter Each Way Panel Size 

3/8" 12" 10' 
112" 12" 16' 
112" 10" 20' 

Maximum panel dimension for light weight concrete block or masonry veneer, 16 feet. 

Porch slabs and concrete or masonry steps or stoops. 



Detached Accessory Buildings Less Than 600 Square Feet 

1. Minimum slab thickness 4 inches and concrete to be a minimum of 2500 
pSI. 

2. Minimum reinforcement in slab WWM 4x4-W4.0x4.0 or 3/8" diameter 
reinforcing bars @ 14" on center, placed at mid-height. 

3. Minimum reinforcement in beams for frame construction two (2) 112" 
diameter reinforcing bars, one at top and one at bottom well tied to the 
turned down mesh. For masonry or veneer construction, four (4) 112" 
diameter reinforcing bars, two at top and two at bottom with 3/8" diameter 
stirrups 24" on center. 

4. Beam width 8 inches. Beam depth below natural grade 6 inches. 
Minimum overall depth 12 inches. 

5. Porch slabs and concrete masonry steps shall be supported at the 
intersection with the building by metal anchors, piers, or a supporting ledge 
on the foundation wall, or a beam completely around the slab. 

6. Base material shall consist of a minimum of 2" sand, gravel or other 
accepted material. 

Walks and Driveways 

1. Minimum slab thickness 4 inches and concrete to be a minimum of 2500 
pSI. 

2. Minimum reinforcement WWM 6x6-W2.9xW2.9 welded wire mesh or its 
equivalent, placed at mid-height. 

3. Expansionjoints shall be provided at 80 foot intervals. 

4. A trowel cut at least 112 inch deep in the slab of walks at approximately 4 
foot intervals and 20' for driveways. 

5. Expansion joints shall be provided at garage aprons and between new and 
existing concrete. 

6. Minimum of 2 inches of sand or gravel base. 



Patios, Uncovered and Roofed 

1. Minimum slab thickness 4 inches and concrete to be a minimum of 2500 
pSI. 

2. Minimum reinforcing WWM 6x6-W2.9xW2.9 welded wire mesh or its 
equivalent. 

3. Base material to be a minimum of 2 inches for uncovered patios and 6 
inches for roofed patios. 

4. Roofed patio foundations shall be the same as for detached garages. 

Section 3306.7 Exception of the International Building Code is amended by numbering 
the exception to read Exception 1 and by adding Exception 2, to read as follows: 

EXCEPTION 2: Pedestrian canopies for construction or demolition of buildings 
not exceeding thirty-six (36) feet in height or three stories, whichever is less, 
may be constructed of metal scaffolds of two (2) inch tubing adequately braced 
with 1-114 inch tubing. The passageway shall not be less than thirty-nine (39) 
inches in width at any point with a head room not less than eight (8) feet. The 
scaffold ends shall be braced by approved diagonal cross bracing maintaining a 
maxi- mum of eight (8) feet between ends. A solid tightly sheathed cover 
between scaffold and job site to be not less than 112 inch ply board with railing 
when required by this section. The roof shall be tightly sheathed with a 
minimum of 2 inch nominal wood planking or equal. 

SECTION 3. Should any Article, Section, Part, Paragraph, Sentence, Phrase, Clause, or 
Word of this ordinance, or any appendix thereof, for any reason, be held illegal, 
inoperative, or invalid or if any exception to or limitation upon any general provision 
herein contained be held to be unconstitutional or invalid or ineffective, the remainder 
shall, nevertheless, stand effective and valid as if it had been enacted and ordained 
without the portion held to be unconstitutional or invalid or ineffective. 

SECTION 4. No other provision of the City Code is amended hereby. All other 
provisions shall remain in effect. 

SECTION 5. It is officially found, determined, and declared that the meeting at which 
this ordinance is adopted was open to the public and public notice of the time, place, and 
subject matter of the public business to be considered at such meeting, including this 
ordinance, was given, all as required by Texas Revised Civil Statutes Annotated as 
amended Title 5, Chapter 551, Government Code. 

SECTION 6. The City Clerk is directed to publish notice ofthis ordinance in accordance 
with Section 17 of the City Charter. 



SECTION 7. The publishers of the City Code are authorized to amend the City Code to 
reflect the changes adopted herein. 

SECTION 8. This ordinance shall become effective August 21,2004 but in no case less 
than five days from the date of publication, whichever is later. 

PASSED AND APPROVED this 22nd day of July 2004. 

MAYOR 

ATTEST: c1z;mu i. tfi}j 
City Clerk 

APPROVED AS TO FORM:I...L.£::::::::.:r...q~~::::=~C-::~:S:::::C2:::~;d 

04- 25 '~ . 



-" -0 ' ALAMODOME 
MEET OF THE CITY COUNCIL 

ASSET MANAGEMENT 
AVIATION 
CITY ATTORNEY 

MUNICIPAL COURT 
REAL ESTATE (FASSNIDGE) 
REAL ESTATE (WOOD) 
RISK MANAGEMENT 

CITY MANAGER 
SPECIAL PROJECTS 

CITY PUBLIC SERVICE - GENERAL MANAGER 

AGENDA ITEM NUMBER: 

DATE: • JUL 2 2 2004 
MOTION: 1JJ1'/J;(jnuJ~ __ _ 

CITY PUBLIC SERVICE - MAPS AND RECORDS 
CODE COMPLIANCE 9948~ ORDINANCE NUMBER: 

COMMERCIAL RECORDER 
COMMUNITY INITIATIVES 

RESOLUTION NUMBER: 

CONVENTION AND VISITORS BUREAU ZONING CASE NUMBER: 
CONVENTION CENTER EXPANSION OFFICE 
CONVENTION FACILITIES TRAVEL AUTHORIZATION: 
COUNCIL OFFICES 
CULTURAL AFFAIRS 
CUSIDMER SERVICFJ311 SYSTEM NAME, ':'" ROLL AYE NAY 
DEVELOPMENT SERVICES 

HOUSE NUMBERING 
ROGER O. FLORES JR. ~ District 1 

LAND DEVELOPMENT SERVICES 
TRAFFIC & DRAINAGE PLAN REVIEW 

JOEL WILLIAMS 
~ District 2 

ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT 
ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES 

RON SEGOVIA /" District 3 - r 
SOLID WASTE 

EXTERNAL RELATIONS 
RICHARD PEREZ /' District 4 

PUBLIC INFORMATION OFFICE 
FINANCE - DIRECTOR 

PATTI RADLE /' District 5 ci&, 

FINANCE - ASSESSOR 
FINANCE - CONTROLLER 

ENRIQUE M. BARRERA ;, 
~~ District 6 1J-

FINANCE - GRANTS 
FINANCE - PUBLIC UTILITIES SUPERVISOR 

JULIAN CASTRO ,~ 
District 7 I: 

FINANCE- TREASURY 
FIRE DEPARTMENT 

ARTA.HALL l ~~ 
District 8 

HOUSING AND COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT 
HUMAN RESOURCES (pERSONNEL) 
INFORMATION SERVICES 
INTERNAL REVIEW 
INTERNATIONAL AFFAIRS 
LffiRARY 
MANAGEMENT & BUDGET (OFFICE OF) OMB 
MAYOR'S OFFICE 
METROPOLITAN HEALTH DISTRICT 
MUNICIPAL CODE CORPORATION 
MUNICIPAL COURT 

CARROLL SCHUBERT /' District 9 
CHRISTOPHER "CHIP" 
HAASS ./' 
District 10 
EDWARD D. GARZA J Mayor 

/J!rh9P-1 ~. jl~A ·· J ~CJl. ~,. 

_C1 f)~ ,-'1 0 ./ 

NEIGHBORHOOD ACTION 
PARKS AND RECREATION 

MARKET SQUARE 
YOUTH INITIATIVES 

PLANNING DEPARTMENT -NEIGHBORHOOD PLNG; 
URBAN DESIGNIHISTORIC PRESERVATION 
DISABILITY ACCESS OFFICE 

POLICE DEPARTMENT 

-1 
oL\.-20 ~ 

" -GROUND TRANSPORTATION . 
PUBLIC WORKS DIRECTOR 

CAPITAL PROJECTS 
CENTRAL MAPPING 
ENGINEERING 
PARKING DIVISION 
REAL ESTATE DIVISION 
TRAFFIC ENGINEERING 

PURCHASING AND GENERAL SERVICES 
SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEMS (SAWS) 
VIA 



TO: 

FROM: 

CITY OF SAN ANTONIO 
INTERDEPARTMENTAL CORRESPONDENCE 

DEVELOPMENT SERVICES DEPARTMENT 

Mayor and City Council 

Florencio Pefia, Director Development Services 

THROUGH: Terry M. Brechtel, City Manager 

COPY: Christopher J. Brady, Assistant City Manager, File 

SUBJECT: Chapter 6 Building City Code Amendments - 2003 International Building Code 

DATE: July 22,2004 

SUMMARY & RECOMMENDATION 
An ordinance adopting the "2003 International Building Code (IDC)" as published by the 
International Code Council, Inc. The provisions of this document shall apply to the construction, 
alteration, movement, enlargement, replacement, repair, equipment, use and occupancy, location, 
maintenance, removal and demolition of every building or structure. The Building and Fire Code 
Board of Appeals has reviewed the "2003 International Building Code and has proposed 
amendments. The International Building Code, International Fire Code, Uniform Plumbing Code, 
and Uniform Mechanical Code, make up the family of codes for commercial construction in San 
Antonio. The Building and Fire Code Board of Appeals and staff recommend approval of the IDC 
and amendments. 

BACKGROUND INFORMATION 
The purpose of the "2003 International Building Code (IDC)" is to provide minimum requirements 
to safeguard life or limb, health and public welfare. The IDC is considered to be performance 
oriented to stimulate economic development through acceptance of innovative design and 
construction methods and to encourage new materials and new construction technologies 

There are two categories of amendments to the IDC. The first category is administrative. The 
administrative amendments to the IDC establish the Building and Fire Code Board of Appeals as the 
board having responsibility to hear appeals regarding this code. The second category is technical. 
The technical amendments are consistent with the amendments contained in the current Uniform 
Building Code (UBC). 

Some significant changes to the IDC technical requirements are: 
• Defers requirements for Single Family Residences to the International Residential Code. 
• Buildings such as apartments, hotels, and dormitories, have a reduction for corridors in 

sprinklered buildings to II2-hour rating. 



• There are significant sprinkler trade offs such as: 
Area increase from 100% to 200% for 2 story structures or more and 200% to 300% 
increase for I-story structures. Provides for structural fire resistance reductions for 
high-rise buildings. 

Significant local amendments to the IBC are: 
• Local amendment requires registered design professional to prepare drawings for projects 

over 5,000 square feet (excluding single family residences). 
• Local amendment requires the registered design professional to submit drawings for pennit 

and be the point of contact during the review process. 
Local amendment requires the registered design professional in charge to review and sign off 
on special inspections, and to submit them to the building official prior to the issuance of the 
Certificate of Occupancy. 

The Building and Fire Board of Appeals, and staff conducted public meetings on this matter and 
recommend approval of IBC and the amendments. 

POLICY ANALYSIS 
The adoption of this code and amendments is consistent with the council policy to safeguard public 
health, safety and welfare. 

FINANCIAL IMPACT 
There is no anticipated financial impact. Enforcement of this ordinance will be accomplished with 
existing staffing. 

COORDINATION 
This ordinance has been coordinated with the Building and Fire Code Board of Appeals, the Fire 
Department and t ity Attorney's Office. 

APPROVED 

~Yv.Q,l~ 
Terry Brechtel 
City Manager 



Affidavit of Publisher 

STATE OF TEXAS 

COUNTY OF BEXAR 

CITY OF SAN ANTONIO 

~UBLIC NOTICE 

M 0BgtfAN<!e ,., 

. ADOPTING THt! 2003 
INTERNATIONAL BUILl)1NG 
CODE AND ADMENDMENts. 

• • • 
PASSED AND APPROVED 

this 22ND day of JULY, 2004. 
IslEDWARD D. GARZA 

ATTEST: 
lsi LETlC.1A M. VACEK 
City Clerk 
812 

Mayor 

Before me, the undersigned authority, on this day personally appeared Helen I. Lutz, who being 

by me duly sworn, says on oath that she is Publisher of the Commercial Recorder, a newspaper of general 

circulation in the City of San Antonio, in the State and County aforesaid, and that the 

City of San Antonio-City Clerk-Ordinance 99481 hereto attached has been published in every issue of 

said newspaper on the following day, to-wit: August 2, 2004. 

Sworn to and subscribed before me this 2nd day of August, 2004 . 

... ~~~~.:.~?; .... INA S. SCHAFER 
i ~/ .... !J~';;f(co; N ocr'ARY PUB II C 

\; ... 7A. . ...-il STATE OF TeXAS 
•• •• ~·op··i$·· My Comm. Exp. 11-04-2007 ....... . . 



CITY OF SAN ANTONIO 

Request For Ordinance/Resolution 

Date: Department: Contact Person/Phone #: 

June 16, 2004 Development Services Michael Clack 207-8165 

Date Requested: Deadline Action: 

July 22, 2004 

SUMMARY OF RESOLUTION 
An Ordinance adopting the 2003 International Building Code and Amendments. 

Council Memorandum Must be Attached To 
Other Depts., Boards, Committees Involved (please specify): 
Building and Fire Code Board of Appeals, Fire Department, City Attorney's Office 

Contract signed by other party 
YesD No D 

Fund No. Amt. Expended Funds/Staffing Budgeted Yes 
D 

Activity No. SID No. Positions Currently 
Authorized 

Index Code Project No. Impact of future 0 & 
M 

Object Code 

Comments: class and no. 

No D 

Coordinator - White 
Legal - Green 

Budget - Canary 
Finance - Pink 

- Gold 



TO: 

FROM: 

CITY OF SAN ANTONIO 
INTERDEPARTMENTAL CORRESPONDENCE 

DEVELOPMENT SERVICES DEPARTMENT 

Mayor and City Council 

Florencio Pefia, Director Development Services 

THROUGH: Terry M. Brechtel, City Manager 

COPY: Christopher J. Brady, Assistant City Manager, File 

SUBJECT: Chapter 6 Building City Code Amendments - 2003 International Building Code 

DATE: July 22,2004 

SUMMARY & RECOMMENDATION 
An ordinance adopting the "2003 International Building Code (mC)" as published by the 
International Code Council, Inc. The provisions of this document shall apply to the construction, 
alteration, movement, enlargement, replacement, repair, equipment, use and occupancy, location, 
maintenance, removal and demolition of every building or structure. The Building and Fire Code 
Board of Appeals has reviewed the "2003 International Building Code and has proposed 
amendments. The International Building Code, International Fire Code, Uniform Plumbing Code, 
and Uniform Mechanical Code, make up the family of codes for commercial construction in San 
Antonio. The Building and Fire Code Board of Appeals and staff recommend approval of the mc 
and amendments. 

BACKGROUND INFORMATION 
The purpose of the "2003 International Building Code (mC)" is to provide minimum requirements 
to safeguard life or limb, health and public welfare. The mc is considered to be performance 
oriented to stimulate economic development through acceptance of innovative design and 
construction methods and to encourage new materials and new construction technologies 

There are two categories of amendments to the me. The first category is administrative. The 
administrative amendments to the mc establish the Building and Fire Code Board of Appeals as the 
board having responsibility to hear appeals regarding this code. The second category is technical. 
The technical amendments are consistent with the amendments contained in the current Uniform 
Building Code (UBC). 

Some significant changes to the mc technical requirements are: 
• Defers requirements for Single Family Residences to the International Residential Code. 
• Buildings such as apartments, hotels, and dormitories, have a reduction for corridors in 

sprinklered buildings to I/2-hour rating. 



, < 

• There are significant sprinkler trade offs such as: 
Area increase from 100% to 200% for 2 story structures or more and 200% to 300% 
increase for I-story structures. Provides for structural fire resistance reductions for 
high-rise buildings. 

Significant local amendments to the IBC are: 
• Local amendment requires registered design professional to prepare drawings for projects 

over 5,000 square feet (excluding single family residences). 
• Local amendment requires the registered design professional to submit drawings for permit 

and be the point of contact during the review process. 
Local amendment requires the registered design professional in charge to review and sign off 
on special inspections, and to submit them to the building official prior to the issuance of the 
Certificate of Occupancy. 

The Building and Fire Board of Appeals, and staff conducted public meetings on this matter and 
recommend approval of mc and the amendments. 

POLICY ANALYSIS 
The adoption of this code and amendments is consistent with the council policy to safeguard public 
health, safety and welfare. 

FINANCIAL IMPACT 
There is no anticipated financial impact. Enforcement of this ordinance will be accomplished with 
existing staffing. 

COORDINATION 
This ordinance has been coordinated with the Building and Fire Code Board of Appeals, the Fire 
Department and t ity Attorney's Office. 

APPROVED 

Terry Brechtel 
City Manager 



Revised 2-3-04 

DRAFT 

AMENDMENTS TO THE 

2003 EDITION OF THE 

INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE 

CITY OF SAN ANTONIO 



Section 104.6 ofthe International Building Code is amended by adding Section 104.6.1 to read 
as follows: 

104.6.1 The building official shall examine or cause to be examined every building or 
structure or portion thereof reported as dangerous or damaged. If such is found to be an 
unsafe building as defined in this section, the building official shall give to the owner of 
such building or structure written notice stating the defects thereof. This notice shall 
require the owner or person in charge of the building or premise, within 48 hours to 
commence either the required repairs or improvements or demolition and removal of the 
building or structure or portions thereof. All such work shall be completed within 30 
days from the date of notice, unless otherwise stipulated by the building official. Proper 
service of such notice shall be by certified mail made upon the owner or his agent. The 
designated period within which said owner or agent is required to comply with the order 
of the building official shall begin as of the date he received such notice. 

Section 105.2 Items 2 and 60fthe International Building Code are amended to read as follows: 

2. Minor repairs to fences not over 6 feet high. Up to 25% of the overall contiguous 
length of a fence shall constitute minor repair. 

6. Walks and driveways not more than 30 inches above grade, not constructed of 
concrete, and not over any basement or story below. 

Section 105.3.10fthe International Building Code is amended to read as follows: 

105.3.1 Action on Application. The application, plans, specifications, computations and 
other data filed by an applicant for a permit shall be reviewed by the building official. 
Such plans may be reviewed by other departments of this jurisdiction to verify 
compliance with any applicable laws under their jurisdiction. If the building official 
finds that the work described in an application or a permit and the plans, specifications 
and other data filed therewith conform to the requirements of this code and other 
pertinent laws and ordinances, and that the fees specified in Section 108 have been 
paid, the building official shall issue a pennit therefore to the applicant. No pennit shall 
be issued where there is not a supply of approved water for domestic or fire protection 
use and adequate to the purposes for which the property is intended to be used. 

Section 108 of the International Building Code is amended by adding Section 108.1.1 to read as 
follows: 

108.1.1 Preliminary Plan Review Fees. Preliminary plan reviews may be made when 
requested. A fee for such review shall be assessed in accordance with the fee schedule 
adopted by the City of San Antonio. Applicants shall submit written comments 
summarizing building code interpretations agreed upon in the preliminary plan review, 
as soon as reasonably possible following the review. The Development Services 
Department will approve or disapprove such comments and return to applicant as soon 
as reasonably possible. 

Revised 2-3-04 



Section 108 of the International Building Code is amended by adding Section 108.7 to read as 
follows: 

108.7 Work requiring a permit shall not be commenced until the permit holder or his 
agent has posted the building permit in a conspicuous place on the premise. Where 
work for which a permit is required by this code is started, prior to obtaining said 
permit, the specified fees may be doubled. The payment of such double fee shall not 
relieve any person from fully complying with the requirements of this code in the 
execution of the work nor from any other penalties prescribed herein. 

Section 108 of the International Building Code is amended by adding Section 108.8 to read as 
follows: 

108.8 Buildings Being Moved. Inspection of structures located outside city limits. An 
inspection to determine compliance with city requirements shall be made of any 
building or structure that is located not more than five miles from the city limits and on 
which an application to move same into the city is pending before the zoning board of 
adjustment. A fee shall be charged in accordance with the fee schedule adopted by the 
City of San Antonio. 

Section 108 of the International Building Code is amended by adding Section 108.9 to read as 
follows: 

108.9 Reinspection Fees. The reinspection fee charged shall be in accordance with the 
fee schedule Adopted by the City of San Antonio. 

In instances where reinspection fees have been assessed, all fees shall be paid before 
release of the utilities. 

Section 109 of the International Building Code is amended by adding Section 109.3.7.1 to read 
as follows: 

109.3.7.1 Insulation Inspection. To be made after plumbing, electrical rough in and the 
framing inspection has been approved and an approved insulating material has been 
installed. A certification from the installer on hislher letterhead is acceptable in lieu of 
an inspection. 

Section 110.1 of the International Building Code is amended to read as follows: 

110.1 Use and Occupancy. No building or structure shall be used or occupied, and no 
change in the existing occupancy classification or physical change of occupant of 
a building or structure or portion thereof shall be made until the building official 
has issued a certificate of occupancy therefor as provided herein. Issuance of a 
Certificate of Occupancy shall not be construed as an approval of a violation of 
the provisions of this code or of other ordinances of the Jurisdiction. 

Revised 2-3-04 2 



Section 112.1 of the International Building Code is amended to read as follows: 

Section 112.1 General. In order to hear and decide appeals of orders, decisions or 
determinations made by the building official and fire chief relative to the application 
and interpretation of the building and fire code, and to determine appeals regarding the 
suitability of alternate materials and types of construction, there shall be and is hereby 
created a building and fire code board of appeals consisting of eleven persons residing 
in the city. The findings of the board regarding appeals of modifications shall be 
advisory in nature. The board shall consist of two structural engineers, two architects, 
four builders, two lay persons and one person with expertise in fire prevention. The fire 
chief and building official shall be ex officio members. The building official shall be an 
ex officio member of and shall act as secretary to said board. But the building official or 
fire chief shall have not vote upon any matter before the board. The board of appeals 
shall be appointed by the city council. The term of office should not exceed two (2) 
years and shall be limited to three (3) consecutive two-year terms. All vacancies shall 
be filled for the unexpired portion of the term only. The board shall adopt reasonable 
rules and regulations for conducting its meetings and shall render all decisions and 
findings in writing to the appellant with a duplicate to the building official and fire 
chief. Each application to the board shall be accompanied by a filing fee as set forth in 
the fee schedule adopted by the City of San Antonio. 

Section 112 of the International Building Code is amended by adding Section 112.4 to read as 
follows: 

112.4 Quorums and Majority Vote 

1. Six (6) members shall constitute a quorum. 

2. The vote of a majority of the members present shall be necessary for adoption 
of any matter. Each member of the board of appeals shall have one (1) vote. 

Section 113 of the International Building Code is amended by adding Section 113.5 to read as 
follows: 

113.5 Any person, firm or corporation, after being served with written notice by 
the building official, willfully violating any of the provisions of this code shall be 
deemed guilty of a misdemeanor. Each such person shall be deemed guilty of a separate 
offense for each day or portion thereof during which any violation of any of the 
provisions of this code is committed, continued or permitted. Each violation shall be 
punishable by a fine not to exceed five hundred ($500.00) dollars. 

Revised 2-3-04 3 



Section 113 of the International Building Code is amended by adding Section 113.6 to read as 
follows: 

113.6 Occupancy Violations. Whenever any building or structure or equipment therein 
regulated by this code or other ordinances which are enforced by the code enforcement 
agency is being used contrary to the provisions of this code or those ordinances, the 
building official may order such use discontinued and the structure, or portion thereof, 
vacated by notice served on any person causing such use to be continued. Such person 
shall discontinue the use within the time prescribed by the building official after receipt 
of such notice to make the structure, or portion thereof, comply with the requirements of 
this code, or other applicable ordinances. 

Section 202 of the International Building Code is amended by adding the following definitions: 

Occupant is any person, agent, firm or corporation that occupies a building or part 
thereof as an owner or a tenant. 

Structure is that which is built or constructed, an edifice or building or fixture, or any 
piece of construction of any kind of a permanent nature, including, but not limited to, 
reinforced concrete slabs and patios, fences, masonry barbecue pits and carports. 

Section 406 of the International Building Code is amended by adding Section 406.1.5 to read as 
follows: 

406.1.5 Private garages which are constructed in conjunction with any Group R 
Divisions 1 through 4 occupancy shall be equipped with fixed louvers or screened 
openings or exhaust ventilation to the outside with exhaust openings located no higher 
than eighteen (18") inches of the floor. The clear area of the louver opening or of the 
openings into the exhaust ducts shall be not less than sixty (60 s.i.) square inches per car 
stored in such private garage. 

Section 501.20fthe International Building Code is amended to read as follows: 

501.2. Premises Identification. Approved numbers or addresses shall be provided for all 
buildings in such a position as to be plainly visible and legible from the street or road 
fronting the property. Said numbers shall contrast with their background. Numbers 
shall be a minimum 4" in height. 

Section 907.2.10 of the International Building Code is amended by adding Section 907.2.10.5 to 
read as follows: 

907.2.10.5 One battery operated smoke detector shall be installed adjacent to each group 
of sleeping rooms in every existing residential dwelling. 

Revised 2-3-04 4 



Section 1022 of the International Building Code is amended by adding Section 1022.6 to read as 
follows: 

1022.6 Exterior fire escape. Any existing exterior fire escape which is deemed to be 
adequate fire escape under the laws of the state or under the provisions of the city fire 
prevention regulations shall be deemed an adequate means of egress for emergency use, 
as required by this chapter, and the number of existing exterior fire escapes shall be 
provided to comply with the fire escape law of the state and the city fire prevention 
regulations. 

Chapter 11 is amended by deleting and replacing with new Chapter 11 as follows: 

Chapter 11 - Accessibility: All buildings or portions of buildings must comply with the 
accessibility standards adopted by the state of Texas. Projects shall be submitted to 
T.D.L.R. for review, inspection and approval in accordance with state law. 

Section 1503.4 of the International Building Code is amended by adding Section 1503.4.2 and 
1503.4.3 to read as follows: 

1503.4.2 On zero lot line development where roof projections are allowed by deed 
covenant or ingress/egress easements, adequate gutters and down spouts shall be 
provided to direct roof water away from adjacent property. Roof projections shall not 
extend beyond a point 1/3 the width of the easement or a maximum of 24 inches. 

1503.4.3 Any Group R, or Group U occupancy with roof edges less than 3 feet to any 
property line, shall be provided with gutters and down spouts to direct roof water from 
adjacent property. 

Section 1704.1 through 1704.2.2 of the International Building Code is amended to read as 
follows: 

1704.1 General. Where application is made for construction as described in this section, 
the owner or the registered design professional in responsible charge acting as the 
owner's agent shall employ one or more special inspectors to provide inspections during 
construction on the types of work listed under Section 1704. The special inspector shall 
be qualified individuals, approved agencies or firms who shall demonstrate competence, 
to the satisfaction of the registered design professional in responsible charge and the 
building official, for inspection of the particular type of construction or operation 
requiring special inspection. These inspections are in addition to the inspections 
specified in Section 109. 

Revised 2-3-04 5 



Exceptions: 
1. Special inspections are not required for work of minor nature or as warranted by 

conditions in the jurisdiction as approved by the building official. 
2. Special inspections are not required for building components unless the design 

involves the practice of professional engineering or architecture as defined by 
applicable state statutes and regulations governing the professional registration 
and certification of engineers or architects. 

3. Unless otherwise required by the building official, special inspections are not 
required for occupancies in Group R-3 as applicable in Section 101.2 and 
occupancies in Group U that are accessory to a residential occupancy including, 
but not limited to, those listed in Section 312.1. 

1704.1.1 Building permit requirement. The permit applicant shall submit a list of 
special inspections indicated on the permit documents prepared by the registered design 
professional in responsible charge in accordance with Section 106.1 as a condition for 
permit issuance. This list shall include a complete list of materials and work requiring 
special inspections by this section, the inspections to be performed and required 
qualifications of the special inspectors intended to be retained for conducting such 
inspections. 

1704.1.2 Report requirement. Special inspectors shall keep records of inspections. The 
special inspector shall furnish inspection reports to the building official, upon request, 
and to the registered design professional in responsible charge. Individual special 
inspection reports shall indicate that work inspected was done in conformance to 
approved construction documents. Discrepancies shall be brought to the immediate 
attention of the contractor for correction. If the discrepancies are not corrected, the 
discrepancies shall be brought to the attention of the building official and to the 
registered design professional in responsible charge prior to the completion of that 
phase of the work. A final report written by the registered design professional in 
responsible charge documenting all of the required special inspections, the special 
inspectors and correction of any discrepancies brought to the attention of the building 
official and the registered design professional in responsible charge shall be submitted 
to the building official prior to the building official issuing the certificate of occupancy. 

1704.2 Inspection of fabricators. Where fabrication of structural load-bearing members 
and assemblies is being performed on the premises of a fabricator's shop, special 
inspection of the fabricated items shall be required by this section and as required 
elsewhere in this code. 

Revised 2-3-04 6 



1704.2.1 Fabrication and implementation procedures. The special inspector shall 
verify that the fabricator maintains detailed fabrication and quality control procedures 
that provide a basis for inspection control of the workmanship and the fabricator's 
ability to conform to approved construction documents and referenced standards. The 
special inspector shall review the procedures for completeness and adequacy relative 
to the code requirements for the fabricator' s scope of work. 

Exception: Special inspections as required by Section 1704.2 shall not be required 
where the fabricator is approved in accordance with Section 1704.2.2. 

1704.2.2 Fabricator approval. Special inspections required by this code are not required 
where the work is done on the premises of a fabricator that is enrolled in a nationally 
accepted inspections program acceptable to the registered design professional in 
responsible charge. At completion of fabrication, the approved fabricator shall submit a 
certificate of compliance to building official upon request and to the registered design 
professional in responsible charge stating that the work was performed in accordance 
with the approved construction documents. 

Section 1805.2 of the International Building Code is amended by revising the first sentence to 
read as follows: 

Footings shall have a minimum depth as indicated in Table No. 1805.4.2 unless 
another depth is recommended by a foundation investigation. 

Chapter 18 of the International Building Code is amended by revising Table 1805.4.2 to read as 
follows: 

Table 1805.4.2 Pier Foundation Minimum Requirements (1) 

Number of Depth 
Floors Below 
Supported Min. cross section or diameter Width Thickness Undisturbed 
by Wood,Masonryor of of Ground 
the Concrete Piers Footing Footing Surface 
F oundation(1 ) Wood Masonry Concrete (In.) (4) (In.) (4) (Inches) 

1 6" 8"(2) 10"(3) 18 6 24 
2 6" 8"(2) 10"(3) 24 10 30 

1. Foundations may support a roof in addition to the stipulated number of floors. 
Foundations supporting roofs only shall be as required for supporting one floor. 

2. Masonry units to be fully grouted with 112" reinforcing bar in each cavity. 

3. 2-5/8" reinforcing bar evenly spaced with the pier. 

Revised 2-3-04 7 



4. Footing to be reinforced by WWM 6x6-W2.9x W2.9 or minimum four (4) 3/8" 
reinforcing bars. Should shimming be required between the pier and the sill, 
shimming shall not exceed one and one half inches (1-112") and be of lumber 
strength equal to the sill. 

Chapter 19 of the International Building Code is amended by adding Section 1917 to read as 
follows: 

1917 - Locally Accepted Minimum Standards. The following are locally accepted 
minimum standards for concrete and reinforcement necessary for grade supported 
foundations. Commercial, residential and additions and detached accessory buildings 
over 600 square feet and less than 5,000 square feet for slab on grade foundation unless 
otherwise required to be designed by an engineer. 

Slab on Grade Foundation Requirements 

1. Residential minimum slab thickness 4 inches and concrete to be a minimum of 
2500 psi. Commercial minimum slab thickness 5 inches and concrete to be a 
minimum of 3000 psi. 

2. Residential minimum beam width 10 inches exterior, 8 inches interior. 
Commercial minimum beam width 12 inches exterior, 12 inches interior. 

3. Minimum beam depth below natural grade - 6 inches exterior, interior to natural 
grade. 

4. Residential minimum beam depth overall - 24 inches exterior, 18 inches interior, 
from top of slab (12" for commercial). 

5. Concrete to be separated from the earth with no less than 6 mil polyethylene or 
other approved materials. 

6. Base materials shall consist of 6 inches of sand, gravel, or other accepted granular 
materials and the sub grade shall be free of all growth or vegetation. 

7. Additions shall be tied to the existing slab by bars of equal size and spacing with a 
minimum of four (4) 3/4" diameter anchor bolts at each beam abutting existing 
slab and 112" diameter compression rods minimum 24" on center. 

8. Reinforcing steel in beams shall be placed at mid-height. Tension and 
compression of four (4) 3/4" in diameter reinforcing bars, two at top and two at 
bottom continuous with comer bars. Stirrups 3/8" in diameter. Exterior and 
interior beams, stirrups shall be 18" on center or 3/4 of depth of beam, not to 
exceed 30 inches. 

Revised 2-3-04 8 



9. Reinforcing steel in slabs. 

Bar Spacing Maximum 
Diameter Each Way Panel Size 

3/8" 12" 10' 
112" 12" 16' 
112" 10" 20' 

Maximum panel dimension for light weight concrete block or masonry veneer, 16 feet. 

Porch slabs and concrete or masonry steps or stoops. 

Detached Accessory Buildings Less Than 600 Square Feet 

1. Minimum slab thickness 4 inches and concrete to be a minimum of 2500 psi. 

2. Minimum reinforcement in slab WWM 4x4-W4.0x4.0 or 3/8" diameter reinforcing 
bars @ 14" on center, placed at mid-height. 

3. Minimum reinforcement in beams for frame construction two (2) 112" diameter 
reinforcing bars, one at top and one at bottom well tied to the turned down mesh. 
For masonry or veneer construction, four (4) 112" diameter reinforcing bars, two at 
top and two at bottom with 3/8" diameter stirrups 24" on center. 

4. Beam width 8 inches. Beam depth below natural grade 6 inches. Minimum 
overall depth 12 inches. 

5. Porch slabs and concrete masonry steps shall be supported at the intersection with 
the building by metal anchors, piers, or a supporting ledge on the foundation wall, 
or a beam completely around the slab. 

6. Base material shall consist of a minimum of 2" sand, gravel or other accepted 
material. 

Walks and Driveways 

1. Minimum slab thickness 4 inches and concrete to be a minimum of2500 psi. 

2. Minimum reinforcement WWM 6x6-W2.9xW2.9 welded wire mesh or its 
equivalent, placed at mid-height. 

3. Expansion joints shall be provided at 80 foot intervals. 

Revised 2-3-04 9 



4. A trowel cut at least 112 inch deep in the slab of walks at approximately 4 foot 
intervals and 20' for driveways. 

5. Expansion joints shall be provided at garage aprons and between new and existing 
concrete. 

6. Minimum of 2 inches of sand or gravel base. 

Patios, Uncovered and Roofed 

1. Minimum slab thickness 4 inches and concrete to be a minimum of 2500 psi. 

2. Minimum reinforcing WWM 6x6-W2.9xW2.9 welded wire mesh or its equivalent. 

3. Base material to be a minimum of 2 inches for uncovered patios and 6 inches for 
roofed patios. 

4. Roofed patio foundations shall be the same as for detached garages. 

Section 3306.7 Exception of the International Building Code is amended by numbering the 
exception to read Exception 1 and by adding Exception 2, to read as follows: 

EXCEPTION 2: Pedestrian canopies for construction or demolition of buildings not 
exceeding thirty-six (36) feet in height or three stories, whichever is less, may be 
constructed of metal scaffolds of two (2) inch tubing adequately braced with 1-1/4 inch 
tubing. The passageway shall not be less than thirty-nine (39) inches in width at any 
point with a head room not less than eight (8) feet. The scaffold ends shall be braced by 
approved diagonal cross bracing maintaining a maxi- mum of eight (8) feet between 
ends. A solid tightly sheathed cover between scaffold and job site to be not less than 
112 inch ply board with railing when required by this section. The roof shall be tightly 
sheathed with a minimum of 2 inch nominal wood planking or equal. 

Revised 2-3-04 10 



o 

Commercial 
2003 Building Code 

2003 Fire Code 
2003 Mechanical Code 

B & 
B, lmendments to the Plumbing Code 
B Items 31, 38, 39 and 40 

Development Services Department 

Fire Department 

July 22, 2004 

CITY OF SAN ANTONIO 

Introduction 
• The International Building, and Fire 

Codes are published by the 
"International Code Council (ICC)" . 

• The Uniform Plumbing Code and 
Mechanical Codes are published by the 
"International Association of Plumbing 
and Mechanical Officials (IAPMO)". 

2 

1 
1 



Current Codes 
• 1997 Uniform Building Code 

o ... Formerly published by International Conference of 
o Building Officials (ICBO) 
o 
o • 1997 Uniform Fire Code 
o 
o ... Formerly published by International Conference of 
B Building Officials (ICBO) 

o 
o 
o 
o 
o 
o 

• 1997 Uniform Mechanical Code 
... Published by IAPMO 

• 2003 Uniform Plumbing Code 
... Published by IAPMO 

Purpose of the Codes 
• Establish minimum standardsJo 

safeguard life or limb, health, property 
and public welfare. 

• The codes are based on generally 
accepted standards of construction. 

• Code organizations update codes every 
3 years in response to changes in 
construction technology. 

3 

4 

2 
2 



.. 

Code Adoption Review Process 

• Staff conducted numerous stakeholder 
meetings with members of the 
development and construction industry, 
including architects, engineers, 
contractors, home builders, building 
owners, and users. 

Code Adoption Review Process 

• Public hearing was held on April 13, 
2004 

• The codes and local amendments are 
the result of staff, public and advisory 
board input. 

6 

3 
3 



Building Code 
Signilicant Changes 
• More performance-oriented as opposed to 

prescriptive . 
.... An alternative material, design, or method of 

construction shall be approved where the building 
official finds that the proposal complies with the 
intent of the code. 

• Defers requirements for Single Family 
Residences to the International Residential 
Code 

Building Code 
Signilicant Changes 
• Reduces fire resistive rating for 

corridors in sprinklered buildings to 1/2-
hour (apartments, hotels, and 
dormitories ). 

• Clarifies the type of separation that is 
necessary between anchor buildings 
and the covered rna" building. 

7 

8 

4 
4 



o 
o 
o 
o 
o 
o 
o 

Building Code 
Significant Changes 
• There are significant sprinkler trade offs 

such as: 
..... Allows greater increase in allowable 

construction area for 1 and 2 story 
buildings and provides structural fire 
resistance reductions for high rise 
buildings. 

Building Code 
Significant Changes local Amendments 
• A special inspections report written by 

the registered design professional in 
responsible charge shall be submitted 
to the building official prior to the 
issuance of the certificate of occupancy. 

10 

9 

5 
5 



o 
o 
D ­
O 
o 
o 

Building Code 
Sign incant Changes local Amendments 
• Requires registered design professional 

to prepare drawings for projects over 
5,000 square feet. 

• Requires the registered design 
professional to submit drawings for 
permit and be the point of contact 
during the review process. 

Fire Code 
Significant Changes 

• Added specific language clarifying that it is 
the intent of the code to provide safety to fire 

fighters and other emergency responders. 

• Added performance based criteria for the 

storage, use or handling of hazardous 

materials. 

• Added section that defines and regulates 

hazards presented by new stationary battery 

technology. 

11 

12 

6 
6 



Fire Code 
Significant Changes 
• Establishes the maintenance of 

emergency escape openings . 

• Increases the Fire marshal's ability to 
prohibit overcrowding. 

Mechanical Code 
Significant Changes 
• Provides specific language regarding 

protective barriers to mechanical 
systems . 

• Buildings more than 15 ft. in height 
requires permanent access to 
mechanical equipment. 

13 

14 

7 
7 



o 
o 
o 
o 
o 
o 
o 
o 
o 

Mechanical Code 
Signincant Changes 
• Smoke detectors that are factory 

installed in listed air moving equipment 
may be used in lieu of smoke detectors 
installed in the main supply air duct 
served by the equipment. 

Plumbing Code 
Signilicant Changes local Amendments 
• Table 4-1 regarding minimum fixture 

requirements better defines the fixture 

requirements for occupancy types such as 

"retail spaces, dance studios and other 

similar occupancies". 

• The minimum material for a sewer line has 

been upgraded from SDR 35 to SCH 40. 

15 

16 

8 
8 



Plumbing Code 
Significant Changes local Amendments 

Requires a directional clean out at the 

property line to facilitate repairs and service 

by SAWS on the portion of the sewer lateral 

that SAWS is responsible for maintaining. 

' * SA WS has requested that this item, code 

section 719. 1. 1, be withdrawn at this time for 

further review 

suppon 

• The American Institute of Architects 

• Professional Engineers in Private 
Practice 

• American Backflow Prevention 
Association 

• Associated Plumbing Heating and 
Cooling Contractors 

17 

18 

9 
9 



o 
o 
o 
o 
o 
o 
o 
D 
o 

Recommendations 

• The Plumbing Appeals and Advisory 
Board and staff recommend approval of 
the Amendments to the 2003 Uniform 
Plumbing Code. 

, • The Building and Fire Code Board of 
Appeals recommend approval of the 
2003 International Building and Fire 
Code and amendments 

Recommendations 
. • The Mechanical Board of Appeals was 

not able to make a recommendation 

19 

20 

10 
10 



.' , 

Stan Recommendation 

• Staff recommends approval of all the 
aforementioned codes. 

Commercial 
2003 Building Code 

2003 Fire Code 
2003 Mechanical Code 

& 
B Amendments to the Plumbing Code 

Items 31, 38, 39 and 40 
Development Services Department 

Fire Department 

July 22, 2004 

CITY OF SAN ANTONIO 

21 

22 

11 
11 




