
LOC; cah 
04116/09 
Item No.9 

AN ORDINANCE 2 0 0 9 - 0 4 - 1 6 - 0 2 8 8 

ACCEPTING THE BIDS FROM ANCIRA MOTOR COMPANY, 
CALDWELL COUNTRY CHEVROLET, HENNA CHEVROLET, INC., 
NORTH PARK TOYOTA OF SAN ANTONIO, AND TOM BENSON 
CHEVROLET TO PROVIDE THE CITY WITH 37 REPLACEMENT 
AND 31 NEW VEHICLES FOR VARIOUS CITY DEPARTMENTS 
FOR A TOTAL COST OF $1,294,358.50. 

* * * * * 

WHEREAS, bids were submitted to provide the City of San Antonio ("City") with 
administrative sedans in response to Invitation for Bid ("IFB") 09-074 SC; and 

WHEREAS, the low bids for administrative sedans were submitted by Ancira Motor Company 
(Item: 1), Tom Benson Chevrolet (Item: 2), and North Park Toyota of San Antonio (Item: 3); and 

WHEREAS, bids were submitted to provide the City with police specialty vehicles in response 
to IFB 09-075 DDG; and 

WHEREAS, the low bids for police specialty vehicles were submitted by Ancira Motor 
Company (Item: 4), Caldwell Country Chevrolet (Item: 5), and Henna Chevrolet (Item: 6); 
NOW THEREFORE: 

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN ANTONIO: 

SECTION 1. The bids submitted by Ancira Motor Company (Item: 1) for $553,866.25, Tom 
Benson Chevrolet (Item: 2) for $362,865, and North Park Toyota of San Antonio (Item: 3) for 
$218,841.75 in response in response to IFB 09-074 SC, and the bids submitted by Ancira Motor 
Company (Item: 4) for $42,843.50, Caldwell Country Chevrolet (Item: 5) for $40,780.00, and 
Henna Chevrolet (Item: 6) for $75,162.00 in response in response to IFB 09-075 DDG, are 
hereby accepted, subject to and contingent upon the deposit of all required bonds, performance 
deposits, insurance certificates and endorsements, and complete appropriation of funds. Attached 
hereto and incorporated herein for all purposes as Exhibit I are the bid tabulation sheets. 

SECTION 2. Funding for IFB 09-075 DDG as approved by this ordinance is available per the 
table below as part of the FY09 Budget: 

Amount Cost Center General Ledger Fund 
$138,395.50 1503200001 5709090 72001000 
$20,390.00 3302080001 5709090 51001000 
Total: $158,785.50 

SECTION 3. Payment not to exceed the budgeted amount is authorized to vendors per the table 
below and should be encumbered with a purchase order(s) for IFB 09-075 DDG. Additional 
payments are authorized, if requisitioned, in an amount not to exceed that stated in Section 1 
above, subject to availability of funds. 
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SECTION 4. Funding for IFB 09-074 SC as approved by this ordinance is available per the 
table below as part of the FY09 Budget: 

Amount Cost Center General Led er Fund 
$599,500.26 1503200001 5709090 72001000 
$271,335.25 1703090001 5709090 11001000 

SECTION 5. Payment is authorized per the table below and should be encumbered with a 
purchase order. Additional payments are authorized, if requisitioned, in an amount not to exceed 
that stated in Section 1 above, subject to availability of funds. 

SECTION 6. It has been found and declared that the bids of Gunn Chevrolet (Item 3), Tom 
Benson Chevrolet (Item 3), Caldwell Country Chevrolet (Item 3), Frank Parra Autoplex (Item 3) 
and Domingo Vara Chevrolet (Bid #1, Item 3) for IFB 09-074 SC for administrative sedans 
failed to meet the City'S specifications. 

SECTION 7. The financial allocations in this Ordinance are subject to approval by the Director 
of Finance, City of San Antonio. The Director may, subject to concurrence by the City Manager 
or the City Manager's designee, correct allocations to specific Cost Centers and Fund Numbers 
as necessary to carry out the purpose of this Ordinance. 

SECTION 8. This ordinance shall take effect on April 26, 2009. 

PASSED AND APPROVED this 16th day of:ril~~ 

M A ~vJ 
PHIL HAROBERGER

ATTEST: 
cX~.·£;;j 
City Clerk 

APPROVED AS TO FORM: ~~M y City tto ey 7 



 
 

Agenda Item: 9   ( in consent vote:  8, 9, 10, 12, 13, 14, 17, 19, 20, 21, 22, 26 )

Date: 04/16/2009

Time: 11:32:23 AM

Vote Type: Motion to Approve

Description: An Ordinance accepting the bids from Ancira Motor Company, Caldwell Country Chevrolet, Henna 
Chevrolet, Inc., North Park Toyota of San Antonio, and Tom Benson Chevrolet to provide the City 
with 37 replacement and 31 new vehicles for various City departments for a total cost of 
$1,294,358.50. [Sharon De La Garza, Assistant City Manager; Janie Cantu, Director, Purchasing & 
General Services]

Result: Passed

Voter Group
Not 

Present Yea Nay Abstain Motion Second

Phil Hardberger Mayor  x     

Mary Alice P. Cisneros District 1  x     

Sheila D. McNeil District 2  x    x

Jennifer V. Ramos District 3  x     

Philip A. Cortez District 4  x     

Lourdes Galvan District 5  x     

Delicia Herrera District 6  x   x  

Justin Rodriguez District 7  x     

Diane G. Cibrian District 8  x     

Louis E. Rowe District 9  x     

John G. Clamp District 10  x     
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Exhibit I 

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: February 17, 2000 

Bid iI1 .Bld#2For: Sedans & Specialty Vehicles Andfa MalDr Compatly Tom Benson Chevrolet North Park Toyota of Brasada Ford L TO Caldwell Countly Domingo Vera Domingo Vara Chevrolet
SanAntoniQ Northside Ford Chevrolet Chevrolet

09-074 SC 10807 IH 10 West 9400 San Pedro 10703 SW Loop 410 12301) San Pedro PO Box 27 8011 IH 35 Soolh a011 111 35 South 

San AnlDnlo, TX San AnlDnio, TX San Antonlo, TX San AnlDnlo, TX Caldwell, TX San Antonlo, TX San Anlonio, TX 76230 78213 78211 78216 77838 76224 78224Item D~cripllon Qty 21 t\..!lAA.i !!nn 210-341-3311 210-635-5000
1 Administralive Four Door Sedans, 35 

Gasoline Powered 
PfiooEach $15,924.75 $18,191.71 $21,523.75 S16,179.00 $16,790.00 $17,147.65 $16,840.63PmeTo1a1 $553,866.2~ $636,712.3 $753,331.25 $566.265JlO $581,650.00 $600,174.75 $582,422.05Make & Model 2000 Dodge Ayenge Chevrolet Malibu Toyota Camry 2552 2010 Ford Fusion SE Chevrolet Impal;; 2009 Chevrolet Impal 2009 Chevrolet MaIIblJSX IWB19 40R SON LS 1WB 1! SON lS Wl1Fl lZOO' 

Delivery 120 Day! :30-61} Days 150 Day! 90·120 Days 90-120 Days 60-90 Days 45-110 Days 

2 Adminlslnltlve Four Door Sedans, 17 
Compact Sized, GasolinelEfectric 
Powered Hybrid 
Price Each NOBtd $21,345Jl~ $22,811.7~ $24,855.01} No Bid No BkI No BidPrice Total 

$362,1I65,0Il $387, 799. 7~ $422,586.OC
Make & Model Honda Civic Toyota: Prius 1224 2010 Ford Fusioo 

13 ()ayf 
Hybric

Delivery 
150 Days 90-180 Days 

:3 Ad minlstrative Four Door Sedans. 9 
Mid Size, GasolinelElectric Powered 
Hybrid NAS NAS NASPrfoeEach No Bid $22,502.8, $24,315.7.5 No Bid $23,752.00 $24,096.52 No BidPrfce Toial 

$202,525.47 $218.841.75 $213,76l1_oo $216,887.58
Make&Modet Chevrolet Malibu Hybric Toyola camry l1ybri< Chevrolet Malibu Hybrid 2009 Chevrolet Malibu 

2561 1ZFG9 4DR SDN Hybrid IIDeUvery 30-4GD~ 1S0Days 90-120 Days 45-90 Days 

Toials $S53,666.25 $362,aas.o( $218,641.15 $98B,8St.OC $801,418.00 $817,062.3 $562.422.0~ 
Estimaled Total Award $553,866.25 $362855.00 5216,841.75 

Acme AUlD Leasing: No BkI 



City of San Antonio Hid Tabulation 

Opened: FebruaJy 17, 2009 
Sid #3 BidiH Bidt12 Bid#:!For: Sedans & SpedaltyVehicles Domingo Vara Chevrolet Fernandez Honda Frank Parra Autoplex Frank Parra Autoplex Frank Parra Autoplex Grand Prallie Ford 

09-074 se 8011 IH 35 South alli5 IH 35 So:Jlh 1[JOO East A1rpert 1000 East Airport 1000 East Airport 7111 E. Palace Pkwy.
Freeway' Freeway Freeway

San Anlnnio, TX San AnIooio, TX 78224 Irving, TX lIVing, TX lIVing, TX Grand Prairie; TX
78224 15062 75002 75062 75050Item Description Qty 

1 Administrative Four Door Sedans, 35 
Gasoline Powered 

Price Each 
 $17,322.1B »DBIli $16,441.00 $20,000.00 $20,713.00 $17,395,00
Price Total $606,276.30 $57'5,645.00 $731,SOO.00 $724,9&5.00 $508,825,00
Make &Model 2009 Chellmlet Malil>! 2009 Dodge Avenge 2009 Dodge Charge 2009 Chevrolet Ma~b\ 201 0 Ford Fusion SE

4DR SON' LS Wf1 FL SX1 
lZG69 

Delivery 45-90 Days 6()"120 Days 60-120 Days 6()..12O Days 6()..90 Days 

2 Administrative Four Door sedans, 17 

Compact Sized, GasolinefElectric 

Powered Hybfid 

Prica Each $21,318,00NoBic NaBid No Bid $23,769.00 1110 Bid
I'I'ice Total $3'.;$,426. OC $404,413.01
Make & Model 2009 Honda Civic Hybrid 2009 Chevrolet Malibu 

DeliveJy 10 Days 6M20 Cays 

3 f4dmlnls1ra1ive Four Door Se<lans, 9 

Mid Size, GasoIlneJeled!ic Powered 

Hybrid 

HAS
Prlce Each No Bid No Bid NoBjd No Bid $23,789.00 $26,657.00
PriceTota! 

$214,101.00 $239,913.00
Make&MOOeI 

2009 Chevrolet Mafibu 201 0 Ford Fusion "Hybrid 
Hybrfd

DeiNet'y 
60-120 Days 70-120 Days 

Totals $606,276.3D $363,426.0( $575.645.~C $731,500.0C $1.343,469,0( $S48,738.C! 
Estimated Total Award 

Acme Aulo Leasing: No Bill 

'­
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: FebJUalY 17, 2000 

For: Sedans 8. Specially Vehicles Gunn Chevrolet Jordan Ford Longo Toyola PhilPOtt ford Planet Ford Red McCombs Toyola Saturn or Aggieland 

09-074 SC 12602135 H 18010 IH 35 N 3534 K Peck Rd. 1400HWy.69 211403 145 North 8333 IH 10 West PO Box 330a 

San Antonio, rx San AnlDnio, TX EIMonte,CA Nedelland, TX Spring, TX San Antonio, TX 8ryan.TX18233 78233 91731 17627 77368 111230 11805Item Oelll:liptioll Qty 
1 Administrative Four Door Sedans, 35 


Gasoline Powered 

PIiceEacll 
 $11,829.28 $16,427.00 $23,880,00 $16,576.98 $18.960.00 No BidU3,,259.00Price Total $624,024.80 $574,945.00 $835,800.00 $580,194.30 $663.600.00 $614,06500Make & Mode( 2009 Chevrolet MaI}bl 2010 Foro Fusion SE Toyota Camry LE V-E 2{l1 0 Fool Fusion S[ Ford TalJlUl Toycla Camry 255: 

1ZG69 

Defrvery 4!l-50 Days 120 Days <1)0 Days 9(] Days 90-12IJ Days 60-130 DaYli 

2 Administra1ive four Door Sedans, 17 

Compact St.ted, Gasoilne/EIec1ric 

Powered Hybrid 

PI1ceEaCh 
 $22,157.8. No Bid $22,960.00 $21,60S.n $24.861.00 $24.987.00$2:I,9B5.00PI1ceTotaJ $376,663.11 $390.660.0C $370,597.7! $422,637.0C $407,745.0( $424,439.01Make & Model 2009 Chevrolet Malibt ToyolllPrius 2009 Toyoolll POOl Ford Fusion Hybrid POL Toyota Prius 2011 Satum Vue Hybrid1ZF69Hyblid 

Delivery 
 45-50 Days <1200ays 30 Days Fall 2009 90-120 Days 60·130 [lays 

3 Administrative Four Door SedaM, 9 
Mid Siza, GasolineIE lectric Powered 

Hybrid 
 NAS 

Price Each 
 $22,157.83 $26,061.00 $25.580.00 $25,842.75 $24.861.00 $24,759.00 $24,967.00Price Tolal $1911,420.47 $234,549.00 $230,22() ,00 $230.704.75 $223.749.00 $222,831.00 $224,703.00
Make & Model 2009 Chevrolet Malib~ Fold FIJ1lion Hybrid Toyota Camry H)tJrid 2009 T1l}'(lta caml) 2IJ10 fllfd Fusion Hybrid Toyola Camry Hybrid Sa\JJm Vue Hybric

1ZRl9 Hybrk Hybrid POL 2560Delivery 4!H>ODays 120 Days <90 Days 30 Days Fall 2009 60-13() Days 90-120 Days 

Tolais $1.200,128.!E $809,494.0{ $1,456.saO.OC $1,181,675.81 S1,300,986.0C $1,444.641.00 $649.142.1K 
Estimated Total Award 

Acme Auto Leasing: No Bid 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: February 24, 2009 

For: Sedans & Specialty Vehicles . Ancira Motor Company Caldwell Counlry Henna Chevrolet Inc. Planel Dodge Frank Parra Auloplex Tom Benson C hevrol et 
Cllevrolet 

0S-075 DOG 10B07 IH 10 West PO BoxZl PO Box 15347 18555 Hv.y 59 North 1000 East Airport 94 00 san Pedro Ave. 
Freeway 

San Antonio, TX Caldwel~ TX Aus~n, TX Humble, TX lIVing, TX San Antonio, TX
78230 77836 78781 77338 75062 78216ft&m Description Qty 210·588-1500 979-567·611 6 512-832-1868 

4 Police Package Sedan, Rear Wheel 2 
Drive, va 
Price Eac:h $21,421.75 No Bid No Bid $22,539.00 $24,35{).00 NoBkJ
Prtca Total $42,843.50 $45,078.00 $48,700.00
Make & Model 2009 Dodge ChargeJ Dad~Charge 2009 Doc!ge Charge 

Police LXDH48 
Delivery 120D~ 120 Days 6()...120 Days 

5 Police Packag e Sedan 2 
Price Each No Bid $20,390.00 $21,869.00 No Bid $23,177.75 Wrthdl"lMPrice Total $40,780.0( $43,736.00 $46,355.5(
Make & Model Chevrolet Impala Po~Cf C hevrolel Impala 2009 Chevrolet Impale 

9CIIIWSH 
Delivery 90·120 Days 9a Days 6()...120 Days 

6 Police Package Sport U~lity Vehicle 3 
Price Eacfl No Bid $25,964.00 $25,054.00 No Bid $25,451.18 $26,907.23
Price Total $77,892.00 $75.162.00 $76,353.54 $80,721.69
Make & Model Chevrolet TahO! Chevrolet TahOE 2009 Chevrolet TahoE Chevrolet Tahoe 

P?VCC107OE . . PolicE 
DelM!ry 60-90 Days 98 Days 60-120 Days 60-00 Dar. 

Tolal $42,843.5C $118,672.~ $11S,QOO.0! $45,078.00 $171,409.1l' . $B0,721.6' 
Estimated Total Award $42,S43.50 $4O,7S0.00 $75162.00 


