LOC/fpr
09/08/11
Item No. 6

ANORDINANCE 2011-09-08-0732

ACCEPTING THE BIDS FROM ANCIRA MOTOR COMPANY,
CALDWELL COUNTRY FORD, GRANDE TRUCK CENTER,
GRAPEVINE DODGE, CHRYSLER, JEEP, AND PHILPOTT MOTORS
TO PROVIDE ANIMAL CARE SERVICES, CONVENTION SPORTS
AND ENTERTAINMENT FACILITIES, CODE ENFORCEMENT
SERVICES, DOWNTOWN OPERATIONS, FIRE, HEALTH, PARKS
AND RECREATION, POLICE, PUBLIC WORKS, PURCHASING AND
GENERAL SERVICES, AND SOLID WASTE MANAGEMENT
DEPARTMENTS WITH UP TO NINETY-ONE (91) VARIOUS LIGHT
DUTY TRUCKS AND VANS FOR A TOTAL COST OF $2,827,751.68;
FUNDED BY THE EQUIPMENT RENEWAL AND REPLACEMENT
FUND.

WHEREAS, bids were submitted to furnish the City with up to 91 light duty trucks and vans;
and

WHEREAS, the low bids were submitted by Ancira Motor Company, Caldwell Country Ford,
Grande Truck Center, Grapevine Dodge, Chrysler, Jeep, and Philpott Motors as shown on the
attached bid tabulations sheets; NOW THEREFORE.:

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN ANTONIO:

SECTION 1. The bids submitted by Ancira Motor Company, Caldwell Country Ford, Grande
Truck Center, Grapevine Dodge, Chrysler, Jeep, and Philpott Motors to provide the City with 91
various light duty trucks and vans for a total cost of $2,827,751.68, as shown on the attached bid
tabulation sheets, are hereby accepted, subject to and contingent upon the deposit of all required
bonds, pertormance deposits, insurance certificates and endorsements. The bid tabulation sheets
are attached hereto and incorporated herein for all purposes as Exhibit I. Copies of the bids are
available for inspection in the offices of the Purchasing & General Services Department.

SECTION 2. Funding in the amount of $2,827,751.68 for this ordinance is available in Fund
72001000, Cost Center 1503200000 and General Ledger 5501050, as part of the Fiscal Year
2011 Budget.

SECTION 3. Payment not to exceed the budgeted amount of $1,638,902.93 is authorized to
Philpott Motors and should be encumbered with a purchase order.

SECTION 4. Payment not to exceed the budgeted ampunt of $447,779.00 is authorized to
Grande Truck Center and should be encumbered with a purchase order.

SECTION 5. Payment not to exceed the budgeted amount of $323,175.75 is authorized to
Ancira Motor Company and should be encumbered with a purchase order.
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SECTION 6. Payment not to exceed the budgeted amount of $34,561.00 is authorized to
Grapevine Dodge, Chrysler, Jeep and should be encumbered with a purchase order.

SECTION 7. Payment not to exceed the budgeted amount of $383,333.00 is authorized to
Caldwell Country Ford and should be encumbered with a purchase order.

SECTION 8. The financial allocations in this Ordinance are subject to approval by the Chief
Financial Officer (CFQ), City of San Antonio. The CFO may, subject to concurrence by the City
Manager or the City Manager’s designee, correct allocations to specific Cost Centers, WBS
Elements, Internal Orders, General Ledger Accounts, and Fund Numbers as necessary to carry
out the purpose of this Ordinance.

SECTION 9. This ordinance shall be effective immediately upon passage by eight affirmative
votes; otherwise it shall be etfective on the tenth day after passage hereof.

PASSED AND APPROVED this 8" day of September, 2011.

M A R
Julidn Castro

ATTEST: APPROVED AS TO FORM:

r\fmh ¥ A Tt

“—ticia M. Vatek City Clerk (XJMichael D. Bernard, City/Attorney

.
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Name:

6

Date:

09/08/2011

Time:

11:10:47 AM

Vote Type:

Motion to Approve

Description:

An Ordinance accepting the bids from Ancira Motor Company, Caldwell
Country Ford, Grande Truck Center, Grapevine Dodge, Chrysler, Jeep, and
Philpott Motors to provide Animal Care Services, Convention Sports and
Entertainment Facilities, Code Enforcement Services, Downtown Operations,
Fire, Health, Parks and Recreation, Police, Public Works, Purchasing and
General Services, and Solid Waste Management departments with up to
ninety-one (91) various light duty trucks and vans for a total cost of §
2,827,751.68; funded by the Equipment Renewal and Replacement Fund.
[Ben Gorzell, Chief Financial Officer]

Result: | Passed
Not % N

Voter Group Present ea ay | Abstain Motion Second

Julian Castro Mayor X
Diego Bernal District 1 X
Ivy R. Taylor District 2 X

Jennifer V. Ramos| District 3 X X

Rey Saldafa District 4 X X

David Medina Jr. | District 5 X
Ray Lopez District 6 X
Cris Medina District 7 X
W. Reed Williams| District 8 X
Elisa Chan District 9 X
Carlton Soules | District 10 X

http://cosaweb/agendabuilder/votingresults.aspx?ItemId=8187&Src=RFCA

9/12/2011



Exhibit I

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened. June 22,2011 Bid 1 Bid 2 Bid 2 8id 1
For: Light Duty Trucks Philpott Motors Grande Truck Center |Ancira Motor Company|Grapevine Dodge, Caldwell Country Ford |Grande Truck Center |Grapevine Dodge, Gunn Chevrolet
Chrysler, Jeep Chrysler, Jeep
6100000292 LD 1400 N, Hwy 69 4562 |H 10 East 10807 [H 10 West 2601 William D Tate  |P.O. Box 27 4562 IH 10 East 2601 William D Tate 12602 I1H 35 North
Ave.
Nederland, San Antonio, San Antonio, TX|Grapevine, Caldwell, San Antonio, Grapevine, Live Qak,
TX 77627 TX 78219 78230 TX 76051 TX 77836 TX 78219 TX 76051 TX 78233
ltem Description Qty {409-727-3564 210-666-7112 210-558-2612 817-410-7541 973-567-6116
Withdrew
1A 3/4 Ton truck, Regular Cab 6
Price Each $18,266.30] $19,765.00 No Bid| $22,869.00 $18,088.00) No Bidi $25,394.00 $18,416.00]
Price Total $109,597.80) $118,580.00 $137.214.00! $114,528.00 $152,364.00| $110,496.00]
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford F250] 2012 F2A Ford R/IC 2012 Dedge Ram| 2012 Ford F250 Reg 2012 Dodge Ram 201112 Chey|
F2504 2500 Cab 4X2, F2A Gasj 2500 CC20903|
Production Cut-Off Date 5-2012] May 2012 4/15/12] Spring 2012 (April); 4/15/12 711411
Last day order can be placed 5-2012] 12/31/2011 4/15/12] 5/1/12] 4715112 Not Provided|
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after Yes] No| No| Yes| No Not Provided|
cut-off date
Delivery 90 Days] 90-120 Days 60 Days| 120 Days; 60 Days| 75 Days|
1B 3/4 Ton Truck, Regular Cab, 4X4, 1
Diesel, Tool Boxes wi/Slide-out
Cargo Tray & Cover
Price Each $28,646.23 $35,808.00 No Bid| No Bid| $33,116.00, No Bid| No Bid| $31,160.00]
Price Total $28.646.23 $35,809.00} $33,116.00, $31,160.00]
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford F250 $/C] 2012 F2B Ford R/C; 2012 Ford F250 Reg Chev
4X4 F250/ Cab 4x4, F2B DSL|
Production Cut-Off Date 5-2012 May 2012 Spring 2012 (April) 714711
Last day order can be placed 5-2012] 1213172011 5/1/12] Not Provided)
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after \CE N Yés; NGt Proviged]
cut-off date
Delivery 90 Day 90-120 Days| 120 Days| 75 Days;
ic 3/4 Ton Trucks, Extended Cab. 9
Short Bed
Price Each $20,714.30§ $21,513.00 No Bid| $22,529.00] $20,940.00) No Bid| $24,854.00| $20,114.00
Price Total $186,428.70] $193.617.00 $202,761.00 $188,460.00] $223,686.00| $181,026.00
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford F250 S/C§ 2012 X2A Ford F250 2012 Dodge Ram} 2012 Ford F250 S/C 2012 Dodge Ram: 201112 Chey,
Super Cab 2500 Crew Cab)| SWB-X2A Gas| 2500 Crew Cab)| CC20753:
Production Cut-Off Date 5-2012] May 2012 04/15/12] Spring 2012 (April)} 04/15/12 7114111
Last day order can be placed 5-2012] 12/31/2011 04115112 5/1/12] 04/15/12] Net Provided
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after Yes) No| No| Yes No Not Provided
cut-off date
Delivery 80 Days] 90-120 Days| 60 Days| 120 Days 60 Days| 75 Days|
10 3/4 Ton Trucks, Extended Cab, 1
Diesel. Short Bed
Price Each $27.059.99] $28,085.00 No Bid! $32,007.00 $27,320.00] No Bid| No Bid| $27,237.00/
Price Total $27,059.90] $28.085.00 $32,007.00 $27,320.00 $27,237.00]
Make, Mode! & Year 2012 Ford F250 S/C] 2012 X2A Ford F250 2012 Dodge Ram| 2012 Ford F250 $/C 2011-12 Cheyv,
Super Cab)| 2500 Crew Cab SWB-X2A DSL, CC20753]
Production Cut-Off Date 5-2012] May 2012] 04115112 Spring 2012 {Aprii); 7114/2011
Last day order can be placed 5-2012] 12/31/2011 04/15112] 5/1/12 Not Provided
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid tems after Yes No No Yes Not Provided|
cut-off date
Delivery 90 Days] 90-120 Days 60 Days| 120 Days| 75 Days|

Prepared by Purchasing 8/23/2011
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 22, 2011 8id 1 Bid 2 Bid2 Bid 1
For Light Duty Trucks Philpott Motors Grande Truck Center [Ancira Motar Company|Grapevine Dodge, Caldwell Country Ford |Grande Truck Center [Grapevine Dadge. Gunn Chevrolet
Chrysler, Jeep Chrysler, Jeep
5100000292 Lo 1400 N. Hwy 69 4562 [H 10 East 10807 [H 10 West 2601 William D Tate  |P.Q. Box 27 4562 IH 10 East 2601 William D Tate  |12602 IH 35 North
Ave,
Nederland, San Antonio, San Antonio, TXGrapevine, Caldwell, San Antonio, Grapevine, Live Oak,
TX 77627 TX 78219 768230 TX 76061 TX 77836 TX 78219 TX 76051 TX 78233
Item Description Qty |409-727-3564 210-666-7112 210-558-2612 817-410-7541 979-567-6116
1E 3/4 Ten Truck, Crew Cab, Short 17
Bed
Price Each $21,665.30)] $23,265.00 No Bid| $22,087.00 $22,391.00 No Bid $24,854.00 $21,883,00
Price Total $368,310.10] $395,505.00 $375.479.00 $380.647.00; $422,518.00 $372,011.00
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford F250 CC| 2012 W2A Ford F250 2012 Dedge Ram| 2012 Ford F250 Crew} 2012 Dodge Ram 2011-12 Chev
Crew Cab) 2500| Cab -SWB-W2A Gas| 2500 CC20743
Production Cut-Off Date 5-2012] May 2012] 4/15/12] Spring 2012 (April) 411512 7114111
Last day arder can be placed 5-2012] 12/31/2011 4/15/12] 5/1/12 4115112 Not Provided)
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after Yesf No| No Yes| No| Not Provided
cut-off date
Delivery 90 Days 90-120 Days; 60 Days| 120 Days| 60 Days| 75 Days|
1F 3/4 Ton Truck, Crew Cab, Diesel, 4
Short Bed
Price Each $27,934.90 $29,233.00| No Bid| $28,374.00| $28,740.00 No Bid| No Bid $31,508.001
Price Total $111,739.60] $116,932.00 $117.496.00 $114.960.00 $126,032.00
Make. Model & Year 2012 Ford F250 CC| 2012 W2A Ford F250 2012 Dodge Ram| 2012 Ford F250 Crew] 2011-12 Cheyv|
Crew Cab)| 2500 Cab-SWB-W2A AS1 CK20743
Production Cut-Off Date 5-2012 May 2012 416/121 - Spring 2012-(April) A4
Last day order can be placed 5-2012] 121312011 4115112, 511112 Not Provided|
without missing cut-off date
‘Can bidder provide bid items after Yes] No No| Yes; Not Provided|
cut-off date
Delivery 90 Days] 90-120 Days| 60 Days| 120 Days 75 Daysj
16 3/4 Ton Truck. Crew Cab. Short 1
Bed, Toolbox
Price Each $22.445.70) $23,769.00 No Bid| $23.330.00 $23,382.00] No Bid| $25,853.00] $22,528.00]
Price Totat $22,445,70) $23,768.00 $23,330.00 §23,382.00 $25,853.00 $22,528.00]
Make. Model & Year 2012 Ford F250 CC| 2012 W2A Ford F250 2012 Dodge Ram| 2012 Ford F250 Crew| 2012 Dodge Ram 2011-12 Chev
Crew Cab, 2500] Cab-SWB-W2A Gas 2500 CC20743
Production Cut-Off Date 5-2012 May 20124 4715112 Spring 2012 {(April) 4115112 7114111
Last day order can be placed 5-2012 12/3172011 4715112, 5/1/12] 4115112 Not Provided]
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after Yes] Noj Ng, Yes| No| Not Provided]
cut-off date
Delivery 90 Days] 90-120 Days| 60 Daysi 120 Days| 60 Days| 75 Days|
H 3/4 Tan Truck. Crew Cab. 4X4 3
Long Bed
Price Each $24,048.30 $25.721.00 No Bid| $24,991.00 $25,253.00 No Bid| $27.516.00 $24,550.00
Price Total $72,144.90] $77.163.00 $74.973.00 $75,759.00 $82.548.00| $73.650.00)
Make. Model & Year 2012 Ford F250 CC| 2012 W2B Ford F250 2012 Dodge Ram| 2012 Ford F250 Crew 2012 Dodge Ram 2011-12 Chev
Crew Cab 4X4 2500] Cab - 4x4 -W2B Gas 2500, CK20943|
Production Cul-Ci Date 5-2012y May 2012 415412 Spiing 2612 (April) GI5412, a4
Last day order can be placed 5-2012] 12/31/2011 4/1512 51112, 4115112 Not Pravided]
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after Yes No. No| Yes No Not Provided|
cut-off date
Delivery 90 Daysf $0-120 Days] €0 Days, 120 Days| 60 Days| Not Provided]

Prepared by Purchasing 8/23/2071



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Prepared by Purchasing 8/23/2011

Opened: June 22, 2011 Bid 1 Bid2 Bid 2 Bid 1
For: Light Duty Trucks Philpott Motors Grande Truck Center |Ancira Mcotor Company pevine Dodge, Caldwell Country Ford |Grande Truck Center |Grapevine Dodge, Gunn Chevrolet
Chrysler, Jeep Chrysler, Jeep
6100000292 LD 1400 N. Hwy 69 4562 IH 10 East 10807 IH 10 West 2601 William D Tate  |P.Q. Box 27 4562 |H 10 East 2601 William D Tate {12602 IH 35 North
Ave.
A $an Antonio, San Antonio, TXGrapevine, Caldwell, San Antonio, pevine, Live Oak,
TX 77627 TX 78219 78230 TX 76051 TX 77836 TX 78219 TX 76051 TX 78233
Item Description Qty [409-727-3564 210-666-7112 210-558-2612 817-410-7541 979-567-6116
10 3/4 Ton Truck, Crew Cab, Diesel, 2
4X4. Long Bed
Price Each $30,568.90] $31,993.00 No Bid| $31,627.00] $31,480.00] No Bid] No Bid $31,949.00]
Price Total $61,137.80 $63,986.00) $63,254.00, $62,980.00) $63,898.00]
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford F250 CCf 2012 W2B Ferd F250 2012 Dodge Ram| 2012 Ford F250 Crew| 2011-12 Chev|
Crew Cab 4X4 2500f Cab - 4X4 -LWB W2B CK20943]
DsL
Production Cut-Off Date 5-2012) May 2012 415112 Spring 2012 (Apri) 7114111
Last day order can be placed 5-2012; 12/31/2011% 4115112 5/1112 Not Provided|
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after Yes] Nof No| Yesl Not Provided
cut-off date
Delivery 90 Days] 90-120 Days| 60 Days| 120 Days| 75 days
1 3/4 Ton Truck, Regular Cab, 1
Camper Top, Strobe
Price Each $20,701.30| $22,321.00| No Bid| No Bid| No Bid| No Bid| No Bid| No Bid|
Price Total $20,701.30] $22,321.00]
Make. Model & Year 2012 Ford F250 Reg] 2102 F2A Ford F250
Cab R/C|
Production Cut-Off Date 5-2012 May 2012,
Last day order can be placed 5-2012] 12/31/2011
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after Yes] No|
cut-off date
Delivery 80 Days 90-120 Days
2 3/4 Ton Cab & Chassis. Regular 2
Cab, 56" Cab to Axle, SRW with 8
Cages and 1 Storage
Compartment Animal Control Unit
Body
Price Each $39,584.30] $41.387.00 No Bid No Bid| $40,575.00] No Bid| No Bid| No Bid,
Price Total $73 168.60) $82,774.00 $81.150.00
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford F250 Cab & 2012 F2A Ford wi 2012 Ford F250 R/C -
Chassis] Mavron Body, Animal -F2A|
Production Cut-Off Date 5-2012] May 2012] Spring 2012 {April}
t.ast day order can be placed 5-2012] 117152011 511112
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after Yes] No| Yes|
cut-off date
Delivery 120 Days| 180-250 Days; 180 Days|
34 3/4 Ton Cab & Chassis. Regular 2
Cab, 56" Cab to Axle chassis
SRW, Service Body W/Pipe Rack
Price Each $26.873.30f $28,275.00 No Bid No Bid $27.961.00 No Bid No Bid $26.252.00]
Price Total $53.746.60| $56.550.00| $55 922.00 25250400
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford F250 R/C| 2012 F2A Ford wi| 2012 Ford F250 R/C ] 2011-12 Chev
Service Body. wf Pipq Utllity -F2A) CC20903
Rack|
Production Cut-Off Date 5-2012] May 2012| Spring 2012 (April} 5/15/2011
Last day order can be placed 5-2012 1115201 511112 Naot Provided;
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after Yes] No| Yes| Not Provideq)
cut-off date
L Delivery 120 Days] ¥0-120 Days 180 Days 75 days|




Opened:
For:

6100000292

June 22, 2011
Light Duty Trucks

LD

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Bid 1

Bid 2

Bid 2

Bid 1

Philpott Motors

1400 N. Hwy 69

Item

Description

aty

TX 77627
409-727-3564

Grande Truck Center
4562 tH 10 East
San Antonio,

TX 78219
210-666-7112

Ancira Motor Company
10807 IH 10 West
San Antonio, T

78230
210-558-2612

apevine Dodge,
Chrysler, Jeep
2601 William D Tate

Grapevine,
TX 76051
817-410-7541

Caldwelt Country Ford
P.0. Box 27
Caldwell,

TX 77836
979-567-6116

Grande Truck Center
4562 IH 10 East

San Antonio,

Grapevine Dodge,

Chrysler, Jeep

2601 William D Tate

Ave.

TX 78219

P ,
TX 76051

Gunn Chevrolet
12602 tH 35 North

Live Oak,
TX 78233

3B

3C

4A

4B

3/4 Ton Cab & Chassis. Regular
Cab, 56" Cab to Axle chassis,
SRW, Service Body wiTelescopic
Roof and Ladder Rack

Price Each
Price Total
Make, Model & Year

Production Cut-Off Date

Last day order can be placed
without missing cut-off date

Can bidder provide bid items after
cut-off date

Delivery

3/4 Ton Cab & Chassis, Regular
Cab, 56" Cab to Axte chassis,
SRW, Service Bady

Price Each

Price Total

Make, Modei & Year

Production Cut-Off Date

L.ast day order can be placed
without missing cut-off date

Can bidder provide bid items after
cut-off date

Delivery

Dodge Ram 3500, Cab &
Chassis, 56" Cab to Axie, Crew
Cab, Diesel, SRW with KUV body,
Bucket Seats

Price Each

Price Total

Make, Model & Year

Production Cut-Off Date

Last day order can be placed
without missing cut-off date

Can bidder provide bid items after
cut-off date

Delivery

Dodge Ram 3500 Truck, Crew
Cab. Diesel, 4X4, Long Bed
SRW, wiCamper Top and Front
Bumper wiWinch, Bucket Seats
Price Each

Price Total

Make. Model & Year

$44,049.304
$88,098.60)
2012 Ford F250|

§-2012,
§-2012f
Yes

120 Days

$27,923.00]
$55,846.00]

2012 F2A Ford wf
Service Body Tele]
Roo

May 2012]
1141512011

No

90-120 Days]

$25,178.30)
$50,356.60]
2012 Ford F250

5-2012]
5-2012

Yes]

120 Days]

No Bid|

No Bid|

$26,413.00

$52.826.00]

2012 F2A Ford wi|
Service Bod)

May 2012
11/15/2011

No|

90-150 Days|

No Bid|

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid|

$42,685.75

$170,743.001

2012 Dodge Ram!

3500, Chassis & Cab}
4x2 Diesel SRW/KU
Bod

April 2012}

April 2012

No|

120 Days

$37,998.00]
$37,996.00

2012 Dodge Ram
3500 Crew Cab 4X4|
wf Camper Top, Fr|
Butnper wf Winch

No Bid|

No Bid|

No Bid|

No Bid|

$28,376.00,
$56,752.00
2012 Ford F250 R/C -|
Utility -F2A]

Spring 2012 (April)
5/1/12

Yes|

180 Days|

$26,337.00
$52,674.00
2012 Ford F250 RIC -

Utility -F2A|

Spring 2012 {April)|
511112

Yes|

180 Days

No Big;

No 8id

No Bid|

No Bid|

No Bidf

No 8id|

Production Cut-Off Date April 2012}
| ast day order can be placad April 2012]
without missing

Can bidder provide bid Nof
cut-off date

Delivery 120 Day:

No Bid|

No Bid|

No Bid|

No Bid|

No Bid|

$24,682.00|
$49,364.00
201112 Chey)
CC20803
711472011

Not Provided

ot Provided|

7% days|

No Bid|

No Bid|

Prepared by Purchasing 8/23/2011
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Qpened:
Faor:

6100000292

June 22, 2011
Light Duty Trucks

LD

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Bid 1

Bid 2

Bid 2

Bid 1

Philpott Motors

1400 N, Hwy 69

tem

Description

Qty

Nederland,
TX 77627
409-727-3564

Grande Truck Center
4562 IH 10 East
San Antonio,

TX 78219
210-666-7112

10807 IH 10 West

78230
210-558-2612

Ancira Motor Company|Grapevine Dodge,

Chrysler, Jeep
2601 William D Tate

San Antonio, TXGrapevine,

TX 76051
817-410-7541

Caidwell Country Ford
P.0. Box 27
Caldwell,

TX 77836
979-567-6116

Grande Truck Center
4562 1H 10 East

San Antonio,
TX 78219

Grapevine Dodge,
Chrysier. Jeep
2601 William D Tate
Ave,

Grapevine,

TX 76051

Gunn Chevrolet
12602 IH 35 North

Live Qak,
TX 78233

4C

4D

4E

4F

Dodge Ram 3500 Truck, Crew
Cab, Diesel, 4X4, Long Bed,
SRW, wiCamper Top and Pull-
Out Bed, Bucket Seats

Price Each

Price Totat

Make, Model & Year

Production Cut-Off Date

Last day order can be placed
without missing cut-off date

Can bidder provide bid items after
cut-off date

Delivery

1 Ton Truck, Crew Cab, Diesel.
Long Bed, DRW, Lifigate

Price Each

Price Total

Make, Model & Year

Production Cut-Gff Date

Last day order can be placed
'without missing cut-off date

Can bidder provide bid items after
cut-off date

Delivery

1 Ton Truck. Crew Cab, Diesel,
4X4, Long Bed, DRW, Toolbox
Price Each

Price Total

Make, Model & Year

Production Cut-Off Date

Last day order can be placed
without missing cut-off date

Can bidder provide bid items after
cut-off date

Delivery

Dodge Ram 3500, Cab &
Chassis. 56" Cab ta Axie, Crew
Cab. Diesel, 4x4, SRW with KUV
body, Bucket Seats

Price Fach

Price Total
Make, Mode| & Year

Production Cut-Cff Date

Last day order can be placed
without missing cut-off date

Can bidder provide bid items after

cut-oft date

Delivery

No Bid

No Bid|

$32,194.90|
$32,194.90|
2012 Ford F350)

5-2012]
5-2012]

Yes

120 Days}

$40,286.66
$40,286.66
2012 Ford F350

5-2012]
5-2012

Yes

120 Days]

No Bid:

$33,495.00
$33,495.00
2012 W3C Ford Crew|
Cab DRW w/ Lift Gate!

May 2012
111672011

No

90-120 Days

$35,197.00
§35,197.00
2012 W3D Ford Crew
Cab 4X4 w/ Tool Box|

May 2012]
1171572011

No

90-120 Days;

2012 Dodge Ram|
wi Camper Top, Pull

April 2012
April 2012

Noj

No Bid|

No Bid|

$35,496.00|
$70,992.00)

3500 Crew Cab 4X4|

Out Bed|

120 Days|

No Bid|

$34,458.00;
$34,458.00]

2012 Dodge Ram
3500

04/15/12|
04/15/12]

No|

75 Days|

No Bid|

$33,337.00
$33,337.00

2012 Ford F350 Crew|
Cab W3C

Spring 2012 {April)
511112

Yes|

120-150 Days

$34,561.00]
$34,561.00,

2012 Dodge Ram;
3500

4115112
4715112

Nol

60 Days;

No Bid|

$43.444.75}

$43,444.75)

2012 Dodge Ram

3500 Crew Cabj

Chassis Dieset 4X4,

KUV Bed:

April 2012

April 2012}

No

120 Days|

No Bidl

$35.216.00
$35,216.00)

2012 Ford F350 4X4|
Crew Cab W3D

Spring 2012 (April)
5/1112)

Yes|

120 Days

No Bid

No Bid|

No Bid|

No Bid|

No Bic

No Bid|

No 8id

No Bid!

No Bid|

No Bidj]

$33,546.00
$33,546.00
2011-2012 Chev|
CC30943,

6/15/2011
Not Provided

Naot Provided|

75 daysl

$33,730.00
$33,730.00
2011-12 Chev,
CK30943!

71411
Not Provided|

Naot Provided|

75 days|

No Bid|

Prepaied by Furchasing 8/23/2011
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 22,2011 Bid 1 Bid 2 Bid 2 Bid 1
For: Light Duty Trucks Philpott Motors. Grande Truck Center {Ancira Motor Company|Grapevine Dodge, Caldwell Country Ford JGrande Truck Center Grapevine Dodge, Gunn Chevrolet
Chrysler, Jeep Chrysler, Jeep
6100000292 LD 1400 N. Hwy 69 4562 {H 10 East 10807 IH 10 West 2601 William D Tate  |P.0. Box 27 4562 |H 10 East 2601 William D Tate |12602 IH 35 North
Ave.
San Antonio, San Antonio, TX{Grapevine, Caldwell, San Antonio, Grapevine, Live Oak,
TX 77627 TX 76219 78230 TX 76051 TX 77836 TX 78219 TX 76051 TX 78233
Item Description Qty [409-727-3564 210-668-7112 210-558-2612 817-410-7541 979-567-6116
5A 1 Ton Truck, Crew Cab. Diesel, 2
Long Bed, DRW, Toolbox
Price Each $30,752.50] $32,067.00! No Bid $31,625.00 $30,776.00| No Bid| No Bid $31,045.00
Price Total $61,505.00] $64,134.00| $63,250.00 $61,552.00 $62,090.00
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford F350 CC|| 2012 Ford W3C Crew| 2012 Dodge Ram|] 2012 Ford F350 Crew| 2011-12 Chey
Cab w/ Toot Box| 3500 Cab DRW - W3C CC30843
Production Cut-Off Date 5-2012f May 2012 4/15/12] Spring 2012 (April)| 711411
Last day order can be placed 5-2012 11/15/2011 415012 5112 Not Provided|
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after Yes No No Yes; Not Provided|
cut-off date
Delivery 90-120 days} 90-12C Days| 60 Days| 120 Days| 75 days]
5B 4 Ton Truck, Regular Cab, Diesel, 2
4X4, Long Bed
Price Each $27,825.90| $29,243.00, No Bid| No Bid $29,717.00] No Bid| No Bid| $28,735.00
Price Total $55,8651.80| $58,486.00] $59,434,00 $57,470.00
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford F350] 2012 F38 Ford F350| 2012 Ford F350 4x4 2011-12 Chey
RIC 4X4 Reg F38 CK30903
Production Cut-Off Date 5-2012] May 2012} Spring 2012 (April) 81572011
Last day order can be placed 5-2012] 12/31/2011 51112 Not Provided|
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after Yesf No| Yes| Not Provided|
cut-off date
Delivery 90 DayH 90-120 Days| 120 Days; 75 days|
B8A 1 Ton Cab & Chassis, Regular 2
Cab, 60" Cab to Axle chassis,
Diesel, SRW, Service Body
wiTelescepic Roof and Ladder
Rack
Price Each $36,797.90) $36,861.00] No Bid| No Bid| $37.887.00] No Bidy No Bid| $36,840.00
Price Total $73,595.80| $73,722.00 $75,774.00] $73,680.00
Make. Model & Year 2012 Ford F350 CCf 2012 F3E Ford F350 2012 Ford F350 Reg 2011-12 Chey;
wi Service Body, Tele| 60CA - SRW - F3E CK30903,
Roof & Ladder Rack
Production Cut-Off Date 5-2012] May 2012 Spring 2012 (April)} 6/15/2011
Last day order can be placed 5-2012] 111152011 511112 Not Provided|
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after Yes] No Yes| Not Provided)
cut-off date
Celivery 30-120 days| 90-150 Days| 180 Days; 75 days|
6B 1 Ton Cab & Chassis. Regular 1
Cab, 60" Cab to Axle chassis,
Diesel. SRW. Service Body
wil.adder Rack
Price Each $35,517.90] $35,615.00 No Big| o Bigl $36,488.00] No B MNo Bid $36,013.00
Price Total $35,517.90 $35 816.00| $36,488.00 $36.013.09
2012 Ford 7350 2012 3L Mord 17358 2012 Fud 7350 Rey 20ii-12 Chey,
w/ Service Body B60CA - SRW - F3E CK30903
Ladder Rack
Produgtion Cut-Off Date 5-2012] May 2012, Spring 2012 (April) 74
L.ast day order can be placed 5-2012 11/15/2011 511712 Not Provided|
'without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after Yesf Nol Vasg| Mat Previded)|
cut-off date
Delivery 120 Da 90-150 Days| 180 Days| l 75 days|
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 22, 2011 Bid 1 Bid 2 Bid 2 Bid 1
For: Light Duty Trucks Philpott Motors Grande Truck Center {Ancira Motor C apevine Dodge, Caldwell Country Ford |Grande Truck Center pevine Dodge, Gunn Chevrolet
Chrysler, Jeep Chrysler, Jeep
6100000292 LD 1400 N. Hwy 69 4562 IH 10 East 10807 IH 10 West 2601 William D Tate  |P.O. Bex 27 4562 {H 10 East 2601 William D Tate  [12802 IH 35 North
Ave,
Nederland, San Antonio, San Antonio, TX|Grapevine, Caldwell, San Antonic, pevine, Live Oak,
TX 77627 TX 78219 78230 TX 76051 TX 77836 TX 78219 TX 76051 TX 78233
Jtem Description Qty |409-727-3564 210-666-7112 210-558-2612 817-410-7541 979-567-6116
6C 1 Ton Cab & Chassis, Regular 1
Cab, 60" Cab to Axle chassis,
Diesel, SRW, Service Body
W/Pipe Rack
Price Each $36,860.90| $37,279.00 No Bid| No Bid| $37,440.00 No Bid| No Bid| $36,483.00]
Price Tatal $36,860.90] $37.278.00 $37,440.00] $36,483,00
Make, Mode| & Year 2012 Ford F350] 2012 F3E Ford F350| 2012 Ford F350 Reg 2011-12 Chev,
w/ Service Body & Pipel B0CA - SRW - F3E| CK30903!
Rack
Preduction Cut-Off Date 5-2012 May 2012 Spring 2012 (April)| 6/15/2011
Last day order can be placed 5-2012 1111512011 5/1/12] Not Provided|
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after Yes] No| Yes| Not Provided;
cut-off date
Delivery 120 Days} 90-150 Days| 180 Days| 75 days|
7A 1 Ton Truck, Crew Cab. 60" Cab 3
to Axle, Diesel, 4X4, DRW, &'
Platform Body W/Tool boxes
Price Each $41,339.90 $41,735.00 No Bid| No Bid| $40,386.00) No Bid Nao Bid| No Bid|
Price Total $124,019.70] $125,205.00 $121,158.00]
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford F350; 2012 W3H Ford F350 2012 Ford F350 4X4|
Crew Cab 4X4 wi/ Crew Cab -176 - W3H
Platform Body & Tool
Box
Production Cut-Off Date 5-2012 May 2012 Spring 2012 (April)|
Last day order can be placed 5-2012; 1111512011 511112
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after Yes| No Yes|
cut-off date
Delivery 120 Days 90-120 Days| 180 Days]
B Minimum 19,500 GVWR, Regular 2
Cab, 84" Cab to Axle, Diesel, 4X4
DRW, 14’ ft Platform Body
W/Herbicide Sprayer
Price Each No Bid] $161,847.00) No Bid| No Bid| No Bid| No Bid| No Bid No Bid|
Price Total $323,694.00]
Make, Model & Year 2012 F5H Ford wi|
Norstar Ind. Herbicide]
Sprayel
Production Cut-Off Date May 2012]
Last day order can be placed 11/15/2011
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after Nof
cut-off date
Delivery ] 180-250 Days|
7c 1 Ton Truck, Crew Cab, 60" Cab 1
to Axte Dieset DRW W/ 9 Stake
Bed
Price Each $37,995.00 $37,577.00 No Bid| Ne Bid} $36,717.00; No Bid| Nao Bid| $38,340.00
Price Total $37,995.00 $37,577.00 $36,717.00] $39,340.00
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford F350! 2012 Ford W3G F350. 2012 Ford F350 Cre 2011-12 Chey|
Crew Cab w/ Stake| Cab -176 - W3G| CC31043
Bed
Production Cit-Off Date 5-2012 May 2012] Spring 2012 {April) 7114
Last day order can be placed 5-2012i 11/15/2011 5112 Not Pravided|
'without missing cut-off date
Can bidder pravice big tems atter Yes! No Yes] Nt Pruvided
cut-off date
Delivery 120 Days| 90-120 Days! 180 Daysf 75 days
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened June 22, 2011 Bid 1 Bid 2 Bid 2 Bid 1
For. Light Duty Trucks Philpott Motors Grande Truck Center |Ancira Motor Company{Grapevine Dodge, Caldwell Country Ford [Grande Truck Center pevine Dodge, Gunn Chevrolet
Chrysler, Jeep Chrysler, Jeep
6100000292 LD 1400 N. Hwy 69 4562 IH 10 East 10807 IH 10 West 2601 William D Tate  |P.O. Box 27 4562 1H 10 East 2601 William D Tate {12602 1H 35 North
Ave.
Nederfand, San Antonio, San Antonio, TXGrapevine, Caidwell, San Antonio, Grapevine, Live Qak,
TX 77627 TX 78218 78230 TX 76051 TX 77836 TX 78219 TX 76051 TX 78233
ftem Description Qty 1409-727-3564 210-866-7112 210-558-2612 817-410-7541 979-567-6116
70 1 Ton Truck, Regutar Cab, 60" 1
Cab to Axte, Diesel, DRW, w/ @'
Stake Bed
Price Each $33,184.00} $34,613.00] No Bid| No Bid| $33,744.00] No Bid)| No Bid| $36,700.00]
Price Total $33,184.00, $34,613.00 $33,744.00] $36,700.00
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford F350] 2012 Ford F3G R/C w/| 2012 Ford F350 Reg 2011-12 Cheyv|
Stake Bed Cab 141 - F3G CC31003
Production Cut-Off Date 5-2012 May 2012] Spring 2012 (April)| 71411
Last day order can be placed 5-2012 11/15/2011 5/1/12] Not Provided
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after Yes] No| Yes Not Provided
cut-off date
Delivery 120 Day| 90-120 Days| 180 Days| 75 days;
7€ 1 Ton Truck, Regular Cab, 60" 1
Cab to Axle, Diesel, DRW, w/ 9'
Stake Bed Wiliftgate
Price Each $35.233.00, $36,043.00] No Bid| No Bid| $36,186.00) No Bid; No Bid| $39,476.00
Price Total $35,233.004 $36,043.00] $36,186.00| $39,476.00;
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford F350) 2012 F3G Ford F350 2012 Ford F350 Reg 2011-12 Chev
wi Stake Bed & Lift Cab 141 - F3G CC31003
Gate
Production Cut-Gff Date. 542012 May 2012 Spring 2012 {Apri 4ant
Last day crder can be placed 5-2012| 11/16/2011 511712} Not Provided|
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after Yes] Noj Yesj Not Provided|
cut-off date
Delivery 120 Daysf 90-120 Days| 180 Days| 75 days|
7 Ton Truck, Regular Cab, ¢0° 1
Cab to Axle, Diesel, DRW, w/ 9'
Platform Body. Tool Boxes
Price Each Nec Bid $37,220.00 No Bid| No Bid] $36,427.00; No Bid| No Bid| $37,499.00
Price Total $37,220.00 $36,427.00] $37,499.00)
Make, Model & Year 2012 F3G Ford F350] 2012 Ford F350 Reg 2011-12 Chey|
wf Platform & Tool Box Cab 141 - F3G| €C31003
Production Cut-Off Date May 2012 Spring 2012 (April) 7ham
Last day order can be placed 11/15/2011 51712 Not Provided|
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder pravide bid items after Noj Yes Not Provided|
cut-off date
Delivery 90-120 Days 180 Days| 75 days;
8 Deleted
9 Step Van. Mininium 14,000 1
GVWR
Price Each $41,082. 18| $38,407.00 No Bid| No Bid] $37.447.00| No Bid| No Bid| No Bid
Price Total $41,082.18] $38.407.00 $37,447.00)

Make, Model & Year

2012 Ford E450

2012 E4k Ford £450
wi Utilimaster Bodyj

2102 Ford E450]
Stepvan - Utilimaster

E4K|
Production Cut-Cff Date 5.2012 May 2012} Spring 2012 {April}
Last day order can be placed 5-2012 11152011 5/1/12
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after Yes| Noj Yes]
cut-off date
Deiivery 160 Days 150-240 Days 180 Days|
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 22, 2011 Bid 1 Bid 2 Bid 2 Bid 1
For: Light Duty Trucks Philpott Motors Grande Truck Center [Ancira Motor Company|Grapevine Dedge, Caldwell Country Ford [Grande Truck Center |Grapevine Dodge. Gunn Chevrolet
Chrysler, Jeep Chrysler. Jeep
6100000292 th 1400 N. Hwy 69 4562 (H 10 East 10807 |H 10 West 2601 William D Tate {P.0. Box 27 4562 IH 10 East 2601 William D Tate  [12602 IH 35 North
Ave.
Nederland, San Antonio, San Antonio, TX{Grapevine, Caldwell, San Antonio, Grapevine, Live Qak,
TX 77627 TX 78219 78230 TX 76051 TX 77836 TX 78219 TX 76051 TX 78233
Item Description Qty 1409-727-3564 210-666-7112 210-558-2612 817-410-7541 979-567-6116
10A Minimum 19,000 GVWR Cab & 1
Chassis Truck with 84" Cab to
Axle, Regular cab, 4x2, Dual Rear
(Wheels, Diesel Engine with
Service Body
Price Each $76,482.00] $68,239.00)] No Bidi Ne Bid $69.887.00 No Bid| No Bidj No Bid|
Price Total $76,482.00] $68,239.00| $69,887.00)
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford F550] 2012 F5G Ford F550] 2012 Ford F550 Regq|
wil Service BodJ Cab - 165 F5G
Production Cut-Off Date 5-2012 May 2012 Spring 2012 (April)|
Last day order can be placed 5-2012 111572011 511112
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after Yes] Nol Yes|
cut-off date
Delivery 160 Days] 90-150 Days) 180 Days|
10B Minimum 19,000 GVWR Cab & 2
Chassis Truck with 60" Cab to
Axle, Crew Cab, 4x2, Dual Rear
Wheels, Diesel Engine. 9 Flatbed
Price Each $41,837.90) $43,767.00| No Bid| No Bid| $44,388.00 No Bid| No Bid| No Bid|
Price Total $83,675.80) $87.534.00] $88,776.00)
Make. Model 8 Year 2012 Ford F550] 2012 W5G Ford F550 2012 Ford F550 Crew|
Crew Cab w/ Flat Bed Cab -176 W5G
Production Cut-Off Date 5-2012] May 2012 Spring 2012 {April}
Last day order can be placed 5-2012 1471572011 5/1112
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder pravide bid ftems after Yes] No Yes|
cut-off date
Delivery 120 Davs] 90-120 Days| 160 Days|
i Minimum 13,000 GCWR, van, 15 1
passenger
Price Each $24,164.18, $24,753.00] No Bid No Bid| $23,186.09) No Bid| No Bid) $24,642.00
Price Total $24.164.18 $24,753.00] $23,186.00] $24,642.00
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford E350 2042 $3B Fard 15| 2012 Ford E350 Pass] 2011-12 Chev
Pass Van| 15 S35 CG33706!
Production Cut-Off Date 5-2012 May 2012 Spring 2012 (April) TN
Last day order can be placed 5-2012 12/31/2011 511712 Not Provided|
'without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after Yes| No Yes Not Provided]
cut-off date
Delivery 90 Days! 90-120 Days 120 Days} 75 days|
12 Minimum 13.000 GCWR, Van. 12 4
|passenger, {
Price Each $23,118.18 $23.305.00 No Bid No Bid] $21,986.00) No Bid| No Bid| $20,043.00
Price Total $92,472.72 $93,220.00 $87,944.00 $80,172.00
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford E350) 2012 E3B Ford 12 2012 Ford Fass-i2 2011128022488
Pass Van E3B
Production Cut-Off Date 5-2012 May 2012 Spring 2012 {April} 77
Last day order can be placed 5-2012] 12/31/2011 501/12) Not Provided|]
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after Yes| No| Yes Not Provided|
cui-off date
Delivery | 90 Days 90-120 Days 120 Daysy 75 days

Prepared by Purchasing 8/23/2011
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 22, 2011t Bid1 Bid 2 Bid 2 Bid 1
For: Light Duty Trucks Philpatt Motors Grande Truck Center [Ancira Motor Company|Grapevine Dadge, Caldwell Country Ford [Grande Truck Center |Grapevine Dadge, Gunn Chevrolet
Chrysler, Jeep Chrysler, Jeep
6100000292 LD 1400 N. Hwy 69 4562 H 10 East 10807 IH 10 West 2601 William D Tate |P.O. Box 27 4562 IH 10 East 2601 William D Tate  [12602 [H 35 North
Ave,
Nederland, San Antonio, San Antonio, TX|Grapevine, Caldwell, San Antonio, Grapevine, Live Oak,
TX 77627 TX 78219 78230 TX 76051 TX 77836 TX 78218 TX 76051 TX 78233
Item Description Qty [409-727-3564 210-666-7112 210-558-2612 817-410-7541 979-567-6116
13 [Minimum GCWR 13,000 Ibs. Van. 2
Cargo
Price Each $20,690.18 $22,187.00| No Bid! No Bidj $20,227.00| No Bid| No Bid| No Bid|
Price Total $41,380.36 $44,374.00) $40,454.00|
Make, Model & Year 2012 Ford E350| 2012 E3E Ford Cargo 2012 Ford E350 Cargo
Van, - E3E

Production Cut-Cff Date 5-2012 May 2012] Spring 2012 (April)
Last day order can be placed 5-2012 1273172011 5/1112
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after Yes| No Ye:
cut-off date
Delivery 90 Days| 80-120 Days| ] 120 Dayf
Payment Terms Net 30| Net 30} Net 30 2%-~10, Net 30 Net 30| Net 30 2%-10, Net 30| Net 30
Total Award $1,638,902.93, $447,779.00, $323,175.75) $34,561.00, $383,333.00

Deleted: ltem 8 will be awarded as an alternative fuel vehicle at a fater date.
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