
City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 30, 2016

For: Veterinarian Vaccines, Pharmaceuticals and Supplies for 
Animal Care Services Bayer Animal Health

Butler Animal Health Supply, 
LLC
dba Henry Schein Animal 

Intervet Inc.,
dba Merck Animal Health Midwest Veterinary Supply

6100007421 VF PO Box 390 400 Metro Place North 2000 Galloping Hill Rd 11240 Grader St., Ste 200

Item Description Est. Annual
Quantity

Shawnee Mission,
KS  66201

Dublin,
OH 43017

Kenilworth,
NJ  07333

Dallas,
TX 75238

1 Accel Concentrate, Ogena Solutions, Gallon 48
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $35.79
Price Total $1,717.92
Manufacturer Phoenix
Product No 193.69000.3
Packaged Gallon Jug

2 Acepromazine Injectable 10mg/ml Vial 12
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.87
Price Total $190.44
Manufacturer Boehringer Ingelheim
Product No 090.00500.3
Packaged Vial 50ml

3 Acepromazine Tablets, 25 mg, 100 Tablets/Bottle 3
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $27.19
Price Total $81.57
Manufacturer Boehringer Ingelheim
Product No 090.00510.3
Packaged Bottle 100 Tablets

4 Albon Oral Suspension, 5%, 16 Ounce Bottle 13
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $62.60
Price Total $813.80
Manufacturer Zoetis
Product No 885.10025.3
Packaged Bottle 16 Oz

5 Aminophylline Injectable, 25x10ml Vial 40
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.47
Price Total $458.80
Manufacturer Hospira
Product No 191.13000.3
Packaged Vial 25x10ml

6 Amoxicillin Oral, 250mg, 100ml Bottle 10
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.69
Price Total $16.90
Manufacturer West-Ward
Product No 191.15440.3
Packaged Bottle 100ml
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7 Amoxicillin/Clavulanate Suspension, 100ml Bottle 60
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.14
Price Total $248.40
Manufacturer West-Ward
Product No 191.15010.3
Packaged Bottle 100ml

8 Amoxicillin/Clavulanate Suspesion, 50ml Bottle 120
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.26
Price Total $271.20
Manufacturer West-Ward
Product No 191.14990.3
Packaged Bottle 50ml

9 Amoxicillin/Clavulanate Suspension, 75ml Bottle 84
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.85
Price Total $239.40
Manufacturer West-Ward
Product No 191.15000.3
Packaged Bottle 75ml

10 Amoxicillin/Clavulanate Suspension, 75ml Bottle 60
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.32
Price Total $379.20
Manufacturer West-Ward
Product No 191.15025.3
Packaged Bottle 100ml

11 Amoxicillin/Clavulanate Suspension, 100ml Bottle 60
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.86
Price Total $231.60
Manufacturer West-Ward
Product No 191.15020.3
Packaged Bottle 50ml

12 Amoxicillin/Clavulanate Suspesion, 75ml Bottle 60
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.81
Price Total $288.60
Manufacturer West-Ward
Product No 191.15040.3
Packaged Bottle 75ml

13 Animax Ointment, 15ml Tube 11
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.32
Price Total $69.52
Manufacturer Dechra
Product No 193.02805.3
Packaged Tube 15ml
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14 Azithromycin Oral, 30ml Vial 120
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.69
Price Total $1,762.80
Manufacturer NDC
Product No 191.19040.3
Packaged Vial 30ml

15 Beuthanasia D - Special RX 100ml C3N Bottle 50
Unit Price No Bid $49.16 $49.16 $57.83
Price Total $2,458.00 $2,458.00 $2,891.50
Manufacturer Merck Merck Merck
Product No HS#001848 67906 349.08500.3
Packaged 100ml 100ml 100ml Vial

16 Bordatella Intra-Trac 3 Intranasal, 150x1 Dose 25,000
Unit Price No Bid $2.42 $2.42 $5.25
Price Total $60,500.00 $60,500.00 $131,250.00
Manufacturer Merck Merck Merck
Product No HS#022340 65313 349.56435.1
Packaged 150x1ds 150x1ds Tray 150 Doses

17 Bordatella Intra-Trac 3 Intranasal, 25x1 Dose 25,000
Unit Price No Bid $2.42 $2.42 $5.35
Price Total $60,500.00 $60,500.00 $133,750.00
Manufacturer Merck Merck Merck
Product No HS#022339 65310 349.56420.1
Packaged 25x1ds 25x1ds Tray 125 Doses

18 Butorphanol Injectable, 50ml C4 Vial 100
Unit Price No Bid $167.91 $167.91 $147.00
Price Total $16,791.00 $16,791.00 $14,700.00
Manufacturer Merck - Dolorex Merck Merck
Product No HS#029088 17070 310.00520.3
Packaged 50ml Bottle 50ml Vial 50ml

19 Canine Droncit, 50 Tablets Bottle 5
Unit Price $182.53 No Bid No Bid $182.53
Price Total $912.65 $912.65
Manufacturer Droncit 34x50 Bayer
Product No 8713157 313.40100.3
Packaged Not Specified Bottle 50 Tabs

20 Carprofen - OstiFen, 100mg, 180 Caplets Bottle 20
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $61.46
Price Total $1,229.20
Manufacturer Putney
Product No 577.31052.3
Packaged Bottle
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21 Carprofen - OstiFen, 25mg, 180 Caplets Bottle 20
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $40.08
Price Total $801.60
Manufacturer Putney
Product No 577.31060.3
Packaged Bottle

22 Carprofen - Ostifen, 75mg, 180 Caplets Bottle 20
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $49.88
Price Total $997.60
Manufacturer Putney
Product No 577.31050.3
Packaged Bottle

23 Carprofen Injectable, 20ml Vial 400
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $108.85
Price Total $43,540.00
Manufacturer Zoetis
Product No 193.10200.3
Packaged Vial

24 Cefpodoxime Proxetil, 100mg, 100 Tablets Bottle 30
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $47.46
Price Total $1,423.80
Manufacturer Putney
Product No 191.31380.3
Packaged Bottle

25 Cefpodoxime Proxetil, 200mg, 200 Tablets Bottle 30
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $92.96
Price Total $2,788.80
Manufacturer Putney
Product No 191.31382.3
Packaged Bottle 100 Tabs

26 Cerenia Injection, 20ml Vial 8
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

27 Chlorhexidine 2% Scrub, Gallon 72
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.55
Price Total $1,047.60
Manufacturer Phoenix 
Product No 193.08848.3
Packaged Gallon Jug
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28 Chlorihexidine Solution, Gallon 100
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.29
Price Total $629.00
Manufacturer Phoenix
Product No 193.08855.3
Packaged Gallon Jug

29 Clavamox, 125mg, 210 Tablet Package 24
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $151.70
Price Total $3,640.80
Manufacturer Zoetis
Product No 193.09510.3
Packaged Box 210 Tablets

30 Clavamox, 250mg, 210 Tablet Package 24
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $249.85
Price Total $5,996.40
Manufacturer Zoetis
Product No 193.09515.3
Packaged Box 210 Tabs

31 Clavamox, 375mg, 210 Tablet Package 18
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $357.00
Price Total $6,426.00
Manufacturer Zoetis
Product No 193.09515.3
Packaged Box 210 Tabs

32 Clavamox Drops Suspensio, 15ml Bottle, 12 Bottle Case 12
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $162.00
Price Total $1,944.00
Manufacturer Zoetis
Product No 193.09500.3
Packaged Bottle 15ml x 12 CT

33 Clindamycin Drops Suspension, 20ml Bottle 120
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.79
Price Total $334.80
Manufacturer Zoetis
Product No 193.09500.3
Packaged Bottle 20ml

34 Convenia, 80mg/ml, 10ml Vial 30
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $248.20
Price Total $7,446.00
Manufacturer Zoetis
Product No 885.10380.3
Packaged Vial 10ml
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35 Dexamethasone Injectable, 100ml Vial 8
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.04
Price Total $32.32
Manufacturer Phoenix
Product No 193.13214.3
Packaged Vial 100ml

36 Dextrose 50% Solution, 500ml Bottle 8
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.85
Price Total $22.80
Manufacturer Phoenix
Product No 193.13340.3
Packaged Vial 500ml

37 Diazepam Injectable 5mg/ml Vial (Singles Only) 8
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $38.67
Price Total $309.36
Manufacturer Hospira
Product No 191.40200.3
Packaged Vial 10ml

38 Doxycycline, 100mg, 500 Tablet Bottle 24
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $142.69
Price Total $3,424.56
Manufacturer Qualitest
Product No 191.42390.3
Packaged Bottle 500 Tabs

39 Enalapril, 20mg, 100 Tablet Bottle 5
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.37
Price Total $71.85
Manufacturer Valeant
Product No 191.42760.3
Packaged Bottle

40 Enalapril, 5mg, 100 Tablet Bottle 5
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.23
Price Total $61.15
Manufacturer Valeant
Product No 191.42720.3
Packaged Bottle 100 CT

41 Enrofloxacin Injectable, 20ml Vial (2.27%) 5
Unit Price $35.24 No Bid No Bid $26.43
Price Total $176.20 $132.15
Manufacturer Baytril Inj. Bayer
Product No 8713254 515.10010.3
Packaged 20ml Vial 20ml
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42 Epi Otic Advanced Ear Cleaner, 8 Ounce Bottle 15
Unit Price No Bid No Bid $9.71 $10.35
Price Total $145.65 $155.25
Manufacturer Merck Virbac
Product No 58671 724.35120.3
Packaged 12 x 7.5g Bottles Bottle 8 Oz

43 Epinephrine MDV, 30ml Vial 20
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.35
Price Total $207.00
Manufacturer Phoenix
Product No 193.17556.3
Packaged Vial 50ml

44 Fatal Plus Solution CII, 250ml Multiple Dose Vial 150
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.42
Price Total $2,013.00
Manufacturer Vortech
Product No 749.20000.3
Packaged Vial 250ml

45 Feline Droncit, 23mg, 50 Tablet Bottle 5
Unit Price $174.60 No Bid No Bid $174.60
Price Total $873.00 $873.00
Manufacturer Droncit 23x50 Bayer
Product No 8713165 313.10200.3
Packaged Not Specified Bottle 50 Tabs

46 Formalin Filled Jar, 120ml Jar 2
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $17.70 / $1.77*
Price Total $3.54
Manufacturer Jorgensen
Product No 350.11146.2
Packaged Jar 120ml (Pack of 10)

47 Formalin Filled Jar, 60ml Jar 2
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $16.80 / $1.68*
Price Total $3.36
Manufacturer Jorgensen
Product No 350.11144.2
Packaged Jar 60ml (Packof 10)

48 Furosemide, 20mg, 100 Tablet Bottle 5
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.41
Price Total $7.05
Manufacturer Qualitest
Product No 191.45400.3
Packaged Bottle 100 CT
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49 Gabapentin Tablets, 100mg, 500 Tablet Bottle 12
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.70
Price Total $128.40
Manufacturer Clipper
Product No 191.45610.3
Packaged Bottle 500 CT

50 Gabapentin Tabets, 300mg, 500 Tablet Bottle 12
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $20.70
Price Total $248.40
Manufacturer Clipper
Product No 191.45630.3
Packaged Bottle 500 CT

51 Generic Nitenpyram 57mg, 60 Tablet Box 50
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $202.50
Price Total $10,125.00
Manufacturer Elanco
Product No 298.22100.3
Packaged Box 60 CT

52 Gentamicin Solution, 100ml Vial 3
Unit Price No Bid No Bid $8.48 / $169.60* $16.81
Price Total $508.80 $50.43
Manufacturer Merck Phoenix
Product No 55134 193.23120.3
Packaged 10 x 5ml Vial 100ml

53 Gloves, Sterile Surgical Gloves, Size 6.5, 40 Pair Box 300
Unit Price No Bid $30.80 / $0.616* No Bid $35.63 / $0.7126*
Price Total $7,392.00 $8,551.20
Manufacturer Henry Schein NDC
Product No HS#036076 001.09032.2
Packaged 50 per Box Box 50 CT

54 Gloves, Sterile Surgical Gloves, Size 7, 40 Pair Box 24
Unit Price No Bid $30.80 / $0.616* No Bid $35.63 / $0.7126*
Price Total $591.36 $684.10
Manufacturer Henry Schein NDC
Product No HS#036077 001.09033.2
Packaged 50 per Box Box 50 CT

55 Gloves, Sterile Surgical Gloves, Size 8.5, 40 Pair Box 200
Unit Price No Bid $30.80 / $0.616* No Bid $35.63 / $0.7126*
Price Total $4,928.00 $5,700.80
Manufacturer Henry Schein NDC
Product No HS#037370 001.09036.2
Packaged 50 per Box Box 50 CT
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56 Glue, Scotch Super Glue, 2 Pack, .07 Oz per Tube 400
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

57 Heparin, 30ml Vial 12
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.25
Price Total $99.00
Manufacturer West-Ward
Product No 191.46720.3
Packaged Vial 30ml

58 HomeAgain Microchip Scanner, Pocket Reader 5
Unit Price No Bid No Bid $325.00 $249.00
Price Total $1,625.00 $1,245.00
Manufacturer Merck Destron Fearing Datamars
Product No 148253 237.80205.2
Packaged 1 Each 1 Scanner

59 Hydrogen Peroxide 3%, Gallon 22
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.87
Price Total $107.14
Manufacturer Phoenix
Product No 193.30352.3
Packaged Gallon Jug

60 Isoflourane WVS 250ml ORM-D Bottle 300
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $23.75
Price Total $7,125.00
Manufacturer Phoenix
Product No 193.33161.3
Packaged Bottle 250ml

61 IV Micro Drip Set, 60 Drops per ML 300
Unit Price No Bid $2.20 No Bid $2.47
Price Total $660.00 $741.00
Manufacturer Private Label Zoetis
Product No HS#039219 004.43060.2
Packaged Not Specified 1 Each

62 K9 Advantix II, Extra Large Dog, 72 Dose Carton 100
Unit Price $753.00 No Bid No Bid $753.00
Price Total $75,300.00 $75,300.00
Manufacturer K9 Advantix II Blue Bayer
Product No 81520429 311.07180.3
Packaged 12-6 pks per Carton Cartom 12x6 Doses
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63 K9 Advantix II, Large Dog, 72 Dose Carton 100
Unit Price $753.00 No Bid No Bid $753.00
Price Total $75,300.00 $75,300.00
Manufacturer K9 Advantix II Red Bayer
Product No 81520402 311.07120.3
Packaged 12-6 pks per Carton Carton 12x6 Doses

64 K9 Advantix II, Medium Dog, 72 Dose Carton 100
Unit Price $753.00 No Bid No Bid $753.00
Price Total $75,300.00 $75,300.00
Manufacturer K9 Advantix II Teal Bayer
Product No 81520380 311.07110.3
Packaged 12-6pks per Carton Carton 12x6 Doses

65 K9 Advantix II, Small Dog, 72 Dose Carton 50
Unit Price $753.00 No Bid No Bid $753.00
Price Total $37,650.00 $37,650.00
Manufacturer K9 Advantix II Green Bayer
Product No 81520364 311.07100.3
Packaged 12-6 pks per Carton Carton 12x6 Doses

66 Ketaocanzaole Tablets, 200mg, 100 Tablet Bottle 12
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $64.27
Price Total $771.24
Manufacturer Clipper
Product No 191.48030.3
Packaged Bottle 100 CT

67 Lactated Ringers Solution, 1000ml Bag, 12 Bag Case 20
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $87.12
Price Total $1,742.40
Manufacturer Hospira
Product No 004.40200.3
Packaged Case 12x1000ml

68 Marcaine MDV 0.5%, 50ml Vial 20
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.67
Price Total $53.40
Manufacturer Hospira
Product No 191.26560.3
Packaged Bottle 50ml

69 Meloxidyl Meloxicam Suspension, 10ml Bottle 3
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.63
Price Total $34.89
Manufacturer CEVA
Product No 153.00936.3
Packaged Vial 10ml
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70 Meloxidyl Meloxicam Suspension, 100ml Bottle 3
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $49.18
Price Total $147.54
Manufacturer CEVA
Product No 153.00940.3
Packaged Bottle 100ml

71 Meloxidyl Meloxicam Suspension, 32ml Bottle 3
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $23.06
Price Total $69.18
Manufacturer CEVA
Product No 153.00938.3
Packaged Bottle 32ml

72 Metronidazole Tablets, 250mg, 250 Tablet Bottle 16
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $20.40
Price Total $326.40
Manufacturer Clipper
Product No 191.52520.3
Packaged Bottle 250ml

73 Metronidazole Tablets, 500mg, 500 Tablet Bottle 16
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $49.19
Price Total $787.04
Manufacturer Clipper
Product No 191.52580.3
Packaged Bottle 500 CT

74 Needles 18 G x 0.75" Needles, 100 Needle Box 100
Unit Price No Bid $4.64 No Bid No Bid
Price Total $464.00
Manufacturer Nipro 18gx1
Product No HS#029470
Packaged 100 per Box

75 Needles 18 G x 1.5" Needles, 100 Needle Box 200
Unit Price No Bid $4.64 No Bid $5.65
Price Total $928.00 $1,130.00
Manufacturer Nipro Terumo
Product No HS#029471 193.52810.2
Packaged 100 per Box Box 100 Ct

76 Neomycin Polymyxin, 3.5gm Tube 200
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.64
Price Total $928.00
Manufacturer Bausch & Lomb
Product No 191.54500.3
Packaged 1/8 Oz Tube
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77 Nobivac 30-Rabies, per Dose 50,000
Unit Price No Bid $0.92 $0.92 $2.45
Price Total $46,000.00 $46,000.00 $122,500.00
Manufacturer Merck Merck Merck
Product No HS#011539 65448 349.56640.7
Packaged 50x1ds per Dose Tray 50 Doses

78 Nobivac Feline 1-HCPCh, per Dose 15,000
Unit Price No Bid $1.89 $1.89 $4.95
Price Total $28,350.00 $28,350.00 $74,250.00
Manufacturer Merck Merck Merck
Product No HS#006427 65266 349.56520.1
Packaged 25x1ds per Dose Tray 25 Doses

79 Ostilox Meloxicam Injectable, 5mg/ml Vial 80
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $54.43
Price Total $4,354.40
Manufacturer Putney
Product No 577.30200.3
Packaged Vial 10ml

80 Panacur Granules, 1lb Tub 5
Unit Price No Bid $297.33 $297.33 $349.80
Price Total $1,486.65 $1,486.65 $1,749.00
Manufacturer Merck Merck Merck
Product No HS#01557 69269 349.65100.3
Packaged 1 lb Tub 1 lb Tub Tub 1 lb

81 Panacur Suspension, 1000ml Vial 15
Unit Price No Bid $107.23 $107.23 $107.23
Price Total $1,608.45 $1,608.45 $1,608.45
Manufacturer Merck Merck Merck
Product No HS#001555 69267 349.65600.3
Packaged 1000ml 1000ml Bottle

82 PenJect Procaine Penicillin G, 250ml Vial 110
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.80
Price Total $858.00
Manufacturer Bimeda
Product No 193.62653.3
Packaged Vial

83 Praziquantel Injectable, 50ml Vial 3 No Bid No Bid
Unit Price $406.54 $287.91
Price Total $1,219.62 $863.73
Manufacturer Droncit 50ml Bimeda
Product No 8713181 193.62406.3
Packaged Not Specified Vial
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84 Prednisone, 5mg, 1000 Tablet Bottle 5
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $104.10
Price Total $520.50
Manufacturer Clipper
Product No 191.57320.3
Packaged Bottle

85 Proviable KP Kit 20
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.99
Price Total $279.80
Manufacturer Nutramax
Product No 193.67700.3
Packaged Tube with Capsules

86 Pyrantel Pamoate Suspension, 32oz Bottle 48
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $21.53
Price Total $1,033.44
Manufacturer Columbia
Product No 191.59034.3
Packaged Bottle

87 Revolution Cats, 15-22 lbs, 6 Pack 500
Unit Price $64.47 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price Total $32,235.00
Manufacturer Advantage Multi Purple
Product No 8891446
Packaged 12-6pk per Carton

88 Revolution Cats, 5-15 lbs, 6 Pack 500
Unit Price $64.47 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price Total $32,235.00
Manufacturer Advantage Multi Orange
Product No 8891438
Packaged 12-6pk per Carton

89 Revolution Kitten, 3 pack 200
Unit Price $27.56 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price Total $5,512.00
Manufacturer Advantage Multi Turquoise
Product No 8890342
Packaged 12-3pk per Carton

90 Robenacoxib Injectable, 20ml Bottle 100
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $104.17
Price Total $10,417.00
Manufacturer Elanco
Product No 298.56005.3
Packaged Vial 20ml



City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 30, 2016

For: Veterinarian Vaccines, Pharmaceuticals and Supplies for 
Animal Care Services Bayer Animal Health

Butler Animal Health Supply, 
LLC
dba Henry Schein Animal 

Intervet Inc.,
dba Merck Animal Health Midwest Veterinary Supply

6100007421 VF PO Box 390 400 Metro Place North 2000 Galloping Hill Rd 11240 Grader St., Ste 200

Item Description Est. Annual
Quantity

Shawnee Mission,
KS  66201

Dublin,
OH 43017

Kenilworth,
NJ  07333

Dallas,
TX 75238

91 Scapel Blades, Size 22, 100 Blade Box 100
Unit Price No Bid $15.48 No Bid $11.88
Price Total $1,548.00 $1,188.00
Manufacturer Henry Schein Jorge
Product No HS#007325 350.11255.2
Packaged 100 per Box Box 100 CT

92 Sentinel Spectrum Blue, Large, 30 Tab Pack 60
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $229.95
Price Total $13,797.00
Manufacturer Virbac
Product No 298.82300.3
Packaged 5 Packs of 6 Tabs

93 Sentinel Spectrum Green, Small, 30 Tab Pack 120
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $156.95
Price Total $18,834.00
Manufacturer Virbac
Product No 298.82100.3
Packaged 5 Packs of 6 Tabs

94 Sentinel Spectrum Orange, Toy, 30 Tab Pack 72
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $151.95
Price Total $10,940.40
Manufacturer Virbac
Product No 298.82000.3
Packaged 5 Packs of 6 Tabs

95 Sentinel Spectrum Yellow, Medium, 30 Tab Pack 110
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $189.95
Price Total $20,894.50
Manufacturer Virbac
Product No 298.82200.3
Packaged 5 Packs of 6 Tabs

96 SNAP Parvo Test, 5 Test Box 40
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $68.75 / $2.75*
Price Total $550.00
Manufacturer Abaxis
Product No 016.01000.2
Packaged Box 25 CT

97 Syringes 3cc, Luer Lock, No Needle, 100 per Box 300
Unit Price No Bid $7.00 No Bid $10.60
Price Total $2,100.00 $3,180.00
Manufacturer Nipro Covidien
Product No HS#029505 366.61000.4
Packaged 100 per Box Box 100 CT



City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 30, 2016

For: Veterinarian Vaccines, Pharmaceuticals and Supplies for 
Animal Care Services Bayer Animal Health

Butler Animal Health Supply, 
LLC
dba Henry Schein Animal 

Intervet Inc.,
dba Merck Animal Health Midwest Veterinary Supply

6100007421 VF PO Box 390 400 Metro Place North 2000 Galloping Hill Rd 11240 Grader St., Ste 200

Item Description Est. Annual
Quantity

Shawnee Mission,
KS  66201

Dublin,
OH 43017

Kenilworth,
NJ  07333

Dallas,
TX 75238

98 Syringes 6cc, Luer Lock, No Needle, 50 per Box 500
Unit Price No Bid $13.00 No Bid $8.88
Price Total $6,500.00 $4,440.00
Manufacturer HS#009960 Covidien
Product No 50 per Box 366.64000.4
Packaged Box 50 CT

99 Terramycin Ointment, 1/8 Ounce Tube 200
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.45
Price Total $2,290.00
Manufacturer Zoetis
Product No 555.00250.3
Packaged Tube 1/8 Oz

100 Thermometer, Digital, 10-Second Read Time 30
Unit Price No Bid $11.50 No Bid $7.84
Price Total $345.00 $235.20
Manufacturer AMC HealthTeam
Product No HS#023892 290.00030.2
Packaged Each Each

101 Tramadol, 50mg, 500 per Bottle 200
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.10
Price Total $2,220.00
Manufacturer Clipper
Product No 191.635070.3
Packaged Bottle 500 CT

102 UltraEdge AGC Super 2-Speed Clipper with Blade 15
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $142.46
Price Total $2,136.90
Manufacturer Andis
Product No 046.80100.2
Packaged Each

103 Vanguard Plus 5 DHPP Vaccine 30,000
Unit Price No Bid $2.35 $2.35 $148.75 / $5.25*
Price Total $70,500.00 $70,500.00 $178,500.00
Manufacturer Merck Merck Zoetis
Product No HS#011276 Nobivac DaPPV 65288 275.88040.1
Packaged 25x1ds 25x1ds Tray 25 Doses

104 IV Macro Drip Set, 103", 15 drops 200
Unit Price No Bid $1.95 No Bid $2.53
Price Total $390.00 $506.00
Manufacturer Private Label Zoetis
Product No HS#03218 004.44000.2
Packaged Each 1 Set



City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 30, 2016

For: Veterinarian Vaccines, Pharmaceuticals and Supplies for 
Animal Care Services Bayer Animal Health

Butler Animal Health Supply, 
LLC
dba Henry Schein Animal 

Intervet Inc.,
dba Merck Animal Health Midwest Veterinary Supply

6100007421 VF PO Box 390 400 Metro Place North 2000 Galloping Hill Rd 11240 Grader St., Ste 200

Item Description Est. Annual
Quantity

Shawnee Mission,
KS  66201

Dublin,
OH 43017

Kenilworth,
NJ  07333

Dallas,
TX 75238

105 Vitamin B-12, 100ml, 5000mcg/ml Vial 3
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.44
Price Total $43.32
Manufacturer Phoenix
Product No 193.86266.3
Packaged Vial 100ml

106 Vitamin K-1 Injectable, 100ml, 10mg/ml Vial 4
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.55
Price Total $34.20
Manufacturer Bimeda
Product No 193.84500.3
Packaged Vial 100ml

107 Zenequin, 100mg, 50 per Bottle 12
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $207.15
Price Total $2,485.80
Manufacturer Zoetis
Product No 193.98000.3
Packaged Bottle 50 CT

108 Zenequin, 25mg, 100 per Bottle 12
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $119.40
Price Total $1,432.80
Manufacturer Zoetis
Product No 193.98004.3
Packaged Bottle 100 CT

109 Zetamine Ketamine, 100mg/ml, 10ml C3N Vial 1,575
Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.25
Price Total $9,843.75
Manufacturer Lloyd
Product No 193.85100.3
Packaged Vial 10ml

Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30

Estimated Annual Total

Estimated Annual Award

*Adjusted for Evaluation Purposes Only



City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 30, 2016

For: Veterinarian Vaccines, Pharmaceuticals and Supplies for 
Animal Care Services

6100007421 VF

Item Description Est. Annual
Quantity

1 Accel Concentrate, Ogena Solutions, Gallon 48
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

2 Acepromazine Injectable 10mg/ml Vial 12
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

3 Acepromazine Tablets, 25 mg, 100 Tablets/Bottle 3
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

4 Albon Oral Suspension, 5%, 16 Ounce Bottle 13
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

5 Aminophylline Injectable, 25x10ml Vial 40
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

6 Amoxicillin Oral, 250mg, 100ml Bottle 10
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

MWI Veterinary Supply Patterson Veterinary

3041 W. Pasadena Dr 303 E. San Antonio

Boise,
ID 83705

Marion,
TX 78124

$32.79 $35.79
$1,573.92 $1,717.92

Ogena Ogena Sol
62407 78927020
Each Each

$14.45 $16.55
$173.40 $198.60
VetOne Vedco
501075 78697632

50cc Each

$38.39 $41.60
$115.17 $124.80
VetOne Vedco
501071 78697608

B100 Each

No Bid $62.60
$813.80

Zoetis
78925730

Each

No Bid $12.40
$496.00

WVG
78904767

Each

No Bid $2.35
$23.50
WVG

78058155
Each



City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 30, 2016

For: Veterinarian Vaccines, Pharmaceuticals and Supplies for 
Animal Care Services

6100007421 VF

Item Description Est. Annual
Quantity

7 Amoxicillin/Clavulanate Suspension, 100ml Bottle 60
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

8 Amoxicillin/Clavulanate Suspesion, 50ml Bottle 120
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

9 Amoxicillin/Clavulanate Suspension, 75ml Bottle 84
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

10 Amoxicillin/Clavulanate Suspension, 75ml Bottle 60
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

11 Amoxicillin/Clavulanate Suspension, 100ml Bottle 60
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

12 Amoxicillin/Clavulanate Suspesion, 75ml Bottle 60
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

13 Animax Ointment, 15ml Tube 11
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

MWI Veterinary Supply Patterson Veterinary

3041 W. Pasadena Dr 303 E. San Antonio

Boise,
ID 83705

Marion,
TX 78124

No Bid $2.35
$141.00

WVG
78058155

Each

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid $5.65
$62.15

Dermalone
78683526

Each



City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 30, 2016

For: Veterinarian Vaccines, Pharmaceuticals and Supplies for 
Animal Care Services

6100007421 VF

Item Description Est. Annual
Quantity

14 Azithromycin Oral, 30ml Vial 120
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

15 Beuthanasia D - Special RX 100ml C3N Bottle 50
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

16 Bordatella Intra-Trac 3 Intranasal, 150x1 Dose 25,000
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

17 Bordatella Intra-Trac 3 Intranasal, 25x1 Dose 25,000
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

18 Butorphanol Injectable, 50ml C4 Vial 100
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

19 Canine Droncit, 50 Tablets Bottle 5
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

20 Carprofen - OstiFen, 100mg, 180 Caplets Bottle 20
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

MWI Veterinary Supply Patterson Veterinary

3041 W. Pasadena Dr 303 E. San Antonio

Boise,
ID 83705

Marion,
TX 78124

No Bid $15.10
$1,812.00

WVG
78507223

Each

No Bid $45.42
$2,271.00

Intervet Merck
78073463

Each

No Bid $787.50 / $5.25*
$131,250.00

Intervet Merck
78354586

150x1 Dose

No Bid $51.74 / $2.0696*
$51,740.00

Intervet Merck
78354594

25x1 Dose

No Bid $147.00
$14,700.00

Bayer
78919590

Each

No Bid $182.53
$912.65

Bayer
78912786

Each - Agency

$61.61 $67.84
$1,232.20 $1,356.80

VetOne Norbrook
510500 78925773

B180 Each



City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 30, 2016

For: Veterinarian Vaccines, Pharmaceuticals and Supplies for 
Animal Care Services

6100007421 VF

Item Description Est. Annual
Quantity

21 Carprofen - OstiFen, 25mg, 180 Caplets Bottle 20
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

22 Carprofen - Ostifen, 75mg, 180 Caplets Bottle 20
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

23 Carprofen Injectable, 20ml Vial 400
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

24 Cefpodoxime Proxetil, 100mg, 100 Tablets Bottle 30
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

25 Cefpodoxime Proxetil, 200mg, 200 Tablets Bottle 30
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

26 Cerenia Injection, 20ml Vial 8
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

27 Chlorhexidine 2% Scrub, Gallon 72
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

MWI Veterinary Supply Patterson Veterinary

3041 W. Pasadena Dr 303 E. San Antonio

Boise,
ID 83705

Marion,
TX 78124

$40.71 $44.84
$814.20 $896.80
VetOne Norbrook
510506 78925777

B180 Each

$55.44 $55.44
$1,108.80 $1,108.80

VetOne Norbrook
510503 78925780

B180 Each

No Bid $100.45
$40,180.00

Zoetis
78447425

Each

No Bid $57.00
$1,710.00

WVG
78907216

Each

No Bid $112.00
$3,360.00

WVG
78907217

Each

No Bid No Bid

$16.95 $14.10
$1,220.40 $1,015.20

VetOne Aspen
510050 78924241
Gallon Each



City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 30, 2016

For: Veterinarian Vaccines, Pharmaceuticals and Supplies for 
Animal Care Services

6100007421 VF

Item Description Est. Annual
Quantity

28 Chlorihexidine Solution, Gallon 100
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

29 Clavamox, 125mg, 210 Tablet Package 24
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

30 Clavamox, 250mg, 210 Tablet Package 24
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

31 Clavamox, 375mg, 210 Tablet Package 18
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

32 Clavamox Drops Suspensio, 15ml Bottle, 12 Bottle Case 12
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

33 Clindamycin Drops Suspension, 20ml Bottle 120
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

34 Convenia, 80mg/ml, 10ml Vial 30
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

MWI Veterinary Supply Patterson Veterinary

3041 W. Pasadena Dr 303 E. San Antonio

Boise,
ID 83705

Marion,
TX 78124

$6.84 $6.40
$684.00 $640.00
VetOne Aspen
510027 78924243
Gallon Each

No Bid $151.70
$3,640.80

Zoetis
78564728

Each

No Bid $249.85
$5,996.40

Zoetis
78564136

Each

No Bid $357.00
$6,426.00

Zoetis
78564144

Each

No Bid $162.00
$1,944.00

Zoetis
78564102

Each

No Bid $3.00
$360.00

Aspen
78924244

Each

No Bid $268.20
$8,046.00

Zoetis
78925672

Each



City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 30, 2016

For: Veterinarian Vaccines, Pharmaceuticals and Supplies for 
Animal Care Services

6100007421 VF

Item Description Est. Annual
Quantity

35 Dexamethasone Injectable, 100ml Vial 8
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

36 Dextrose 50% Solution, 500ml Bottle 8
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

37 Diazepam Injectable 5mg/ml Vial (Singles Only) 8
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

38 Doxycycline, 100mg, 500 Tablet Bottle 24
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

39 Enalapril, 20mg, 100 Tablet Bottle 5
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

40 Enalapril, 5mg, 100 Tablet Bottle 5
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

41 Enrofloxacin Injectable, 20ml Vial (2.27%) 5
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

MWI Veterinary Supply Patterson Veterinary

3041 W. Pasadena Dr 303 E. San Antonio

Boise,
ID 83705

Marion,
TX 78124

$3.74 $3.95
$29.92 $31.60

VetOne Aspen
501012 78924248
100CC Each

$2.56 $2.95
$20.48 $23.60

VetOne Aspen
501053 78924249
500CC Each

No Bid $38.67
$309.36

WVG
78014951

Each

No Bid $11.90 / $119.00*
$2,856.00

WVG
78920368

Bottle 50 Tabs

No Bid $17.40
$87.00
WVG

78914813
Each

No Bid $14.15
$70.75
WVG

78914809
Each

No Bid $26.43
$132.15

Norbrook
78915936

Each



City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 30, 2016

For: Veterinarian Vaccines, Pharmaceuticals and Supplies for 
Animal Care Services

6100007421 VF

Item Description Est. Annual
Quantity

42 Epi Otic Advanced Ear Cleaner, 8 Ounce Bottle 15
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

43 Epinephrine MDV, 30ml Vial 20
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

44 Fatal Plus Solution CII, 250ml Multiple Dose Vial 150
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

45 Feline Droncit, 23mg, 50 Tablet Bottle 5
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

46 Formalin Filled Jar, 120ml Jar 2
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

47 Formalin Filled Jar, 60ml Jar 2
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

48 Furosemide, 20mg, 100 Tablet Bottle 5
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

MWI Veterinary Supply Patterson Veterinary

3041 W. Pasadena Dr 303 E. San Antonio

Boise,
ID 83705

Marion,
TX 78124

No Bid $8.28
$124.20

Virbac
78502322

Each

No Bid $41.15
$823.00

WVG
78427947

Not Specified

No Bid No Bid

No Bid $174.60
$873.00

Bayer
78912708

Each

$13.56 / $1.356* $14.75 / $1.475*
$2.71 $2.95

Jorvet Jorg
25039 78334182

Box of 10 Pack of 10

$12.87 / $1.287* $14.00 / $1.40*
$2.57 $2.80

Jorvet Jorg
23048 78325357

Box of 10 Pack of 10

No Bid $1.20
$6.00
WVG

78883739
Each



City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 30, 2016

For: Veterinarian Vaccines, Pharmaceuticals and Supplies for 
Animal Care Services

6100007421 VF

Item Description Est. Annual
Quantity

49 Gabapentin Tablets, 100mg, 500 Tablet Bottle 12
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

50 Gabapentin Tabets, 300mg, 500 Tablet Bottle 12
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

51 Generic Nitenpyram 57mg, 60 Tablet Box 50
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

52 Gentamicin Solution, 100ml Vial 3
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

53 Gloves, Sterile Surgical Gloves, Size 6.5, 40 Pair Box 300
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

54 Gloves, Sterile Surgical Gloves, Size 7, 40 Pair Box 24
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

55 Gloves, Sterile Surgical Gloves, Size 8.5, 40 Pair Box 200
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

MWI Veterinary Supply Patterson Veterinary

3041 W. Pasadena Dr 303 E. San Antonio

Boise,
ID 83705

Marion,
TX 78124

No Bid $15.05
$180.60

WVG
78484637

Each

No Bid $26.00
$312.00

WVG
78484645

Each

No Bid No Bid

$16.54 $17.70
$49.62 $53.10

VetOne Phoenix
510209 78008853
100CC Each

No Bid $34.40 / $1.376*
$16,512.00

Sun Surgical
78433103

Box 25 CT

$50.80 $34.40 / $1.376*
$1,219.20 $1,320.96

Medline Sun Surgical
26875 78433848

50 per Box Box 25 CT

$50.80 $24.65 / $0.493*
$10,160.00 $3,944.00

Medline Ansell Perry
26886 78064519

50 per Box Box 50 CT



City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 30, 2016

For: Veterinarian Vaccines, Pharmaceuticals and Supplies for 
Animal Care Services

6100007421 VF

Item Description Est. Annual
Quantity

56 Glue, Scotch Super Glue, 2 Pack, .07 Oz per Tube 400
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

57 Heparin, 30ml Vial 12
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

58 HomeAgain Microchip Scanner, Pocket Reader 5
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

59 Hydrogen Peroxide 3%, Gallon 22
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

60 Isoflourane WVS 250ml ORM-D Bottle 300
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

61 IV Micro Drip Set, 60 Drops per ML 300
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

62 K9 Advantix II, Extra Large Dog, 72 Dose Carton 100
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

MWI Veterinary Supply Patterson Veterinary

3041 W. Pasadena Dr 303 E. San Antonio

Boise,
ID 83705

Marion,
TX 78124

$50.80 / $1.016* $10.25
$812.80 $4,100.00
Medline WVP

26890 78910065
50 per Box Each - 2ml

No Bid $7.95
$95.40
WVG

78834924
Each

No Bid $249.00
$1,245.00

Datamar
78921616

Each

$3.86 $4.00
$84.92 $88.00
Vedco Vedco

7976 78690293
Gallon Each

$20.80 $21.90
$6,240.00 $6,570.00

VetOne Piramal
502017 78908115
250CC Each

$2.13 $2.35
$639.00 $705.00

Abbott Abbott
38081 78824933
Each Each

No Bid $62.75 / $753.00*
$75,300.00

Bayer
78912679

6 Pack - Agency



City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 30, 2016

For: Veterinarian Vaccines, Pharmaceuticals and Supplies for 
Animal Care Services

6100007421 VF

Item Description Est. Annual
Quantity

63 K9 Advantix II, Large Dog, 72 Dose Carton 100
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

64 K9 Advantix II, Medium Dog, 72 Dose Carton 100
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

65 K9 Advantix II, Small Dog, 72 Dose Carton 50
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

66 Ketaocanzaole Tablets, 200mg, 100 Tablet Bottle 12
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

67 Lactated Ringers Solution, 1000ml Bag, 12 Bag Case 20
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

68 Marcaine MDV 0.5%, 50ml Vial 20
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

69 Meloxidyl Meloxicam Suspension, 10ml Bottle 3
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

MWI Veterinary Supply Patterson Veterinary

3041 W. Pasadena Dr 303 E. San Antonio

Boise,
ID 83705

Marion,
TX 78124

No Bid $62.75 / $753.00*
$75,300.00

Bayer
78913015

6 Pack - Agency

No Bid $62.75 / $753.00*
$75,300.00

Bayer
78912677

6 Pack - Agency

No Bid $62.75 / $753.00*
$37,650.00

Bayer
78912676

6 Pack - Agency

No Bid $88.75
$1,065.00

WVG
78777603

Each

No Bid $80.00
$1,600.00

Hospira
78009713

CA 12

No Bid $5.25
$105.00
Hospira

78089382
CA12

No Bid $12.62
$37.86
CEVA

78914714
Each



City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 30, 2016

For: Veterinarian Vaccines, Pharmaceuticals and Supplies for 
Animal Care Services

6100007421 VF

Item Description Est. Annual
Quantity

70 Meloxidyl Meloxicam Suspension, 100ml Bottle 3
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

71 Meloxidyl Meloxicam Suspension, 32ml Bottle 3
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

72 Metronidazole Tablets, 250mg, 250 Tablet Bottle 16
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

73 Metronidazole Tablets, 500mg, 500 Tablet Bottle 16
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

74 Needles 18 G x 0.75" Needles, 100 Needle Box 100
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

75 Needles 18 G x 1.5" Needles, 100 Needle Box 200
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

76 Neomycin Polymyxin, 3.5gm Tube 200
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

MWI Veterinary Supply Patterson Veterinary

3041 W. Pasadena Dr 303 E. San Antonio

Boise,
ID 83705

Marion,
TX 78124

No Bid $53.05
$159.15

CEVA
78914712

Each

No Bid $24.87
$74.61
CEVA

78974711
Each

No Bid $18.35
$293.60

WVG
78920054

Each

No Bid $65.33
$1,045.28

WVG
78917510

Each

$6.17 $12.15
$617.00 $1,215.00

Ideal Exel
62841 78691210

100 per Box Each

$5.57 $5.95
$1,114.00 $1,190.00

Terumo Terumo
9293 78067003

100 per Box Each

No Bid $5.05
$1,010.00

WVG
78820271

Each



City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 30, 2016

For: Veterinarian Vaccines, Pharmaceuticals and Supplies for 
Animal Care Services

6100007421 VF

Item Description Est. Annual
Quantity

77 Nobivac 30-Rabies, per Dose 50,000
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

78 Nobivac Feline 1-HCPCh, per Dose 15,000
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

79 Ostilox Meloxicam Injectable, 5mg/ml Vial 80
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

80 Panacur Granules, 1lb Tub 5
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

81 Panacur Suspension, 1000ml Vial 15
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

82 PenJect Procaine Penicillin G, 250ml Vial 110
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

83 Praziquantel Injectable, 50ml Vial 3
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

MWI Veterinary Supply Patterson Veterinary

3041 W. Pasadena Dr 303 E. San Antonio

Boise,
ID 83705

Marion,
TX 78124

No Bid $45.00 / $0.90*
$45,000.00

Merck
78071716

50x1ds

No Bid $40.25 / $1.61*
$24,150.00

Merck
78006671

25x1ds

$70.65 $70.65
$5,652.00 $5,652.00

VetOne Norbrook
501080 78907337

10CC Each

No Bid $252.34
$1,261.70

Intervet Merck
78056502

Each

No Bid $107.23
$1,608.45

Intervet/Merck
78056544

Each

$7.83 $7.25
$861.30 $797.50
502061 Norbrook
502061 78013978
250CC Each

No Bid
$290.55
$871.65
Bimeda

78909517
Each



City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 30, 2016

For: Veterinarian Vaccines, Pharmaceuticals and Supplies for 
Animal Care Services

6100007421 VF

Item Description Est. Annual
Quantity

84 Prednisone, 5mg, 1000 Tablet Bottle 5
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

85 Proviable KP Kit 20
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

86 Pyrantel Pamoate Suspension, 32oz Bottle 48
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

87 Revolution Cats, 15-22 lbs, 6 Pack 500
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

88 Revolution Cats, 5-15 lbs, 6 Pack 500
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

89 Revolution Kitten, 3 pack 200
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

90 Robenacoxib Injectable, 20ml Bottle 100
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

MWI Veterinary Supply Patterson Veterinary

3041 W. Pasadena Dr 303 E. San Antonio

Boise,
ID 83705

Marion,
TX 78124

No Bid $108.65
$543.25

WVG
78914792

Each

No Bid $13.99
$279.80

Nutramax
78598315

Each

$20.06 $23.35
$962.88 $1,120.80
Neogen Neogen

35103 78906702
32 Oz Each

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid $104.17
$10,417.00

Elanco
78923330

Each



City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 30, 2016

For: Veterinarian Vaccines, Pharmaceuticals and Supplies for 
Animal Care Services

6100007421 VF

Item Description Est. Annual
Quantity

91 Scapel Blades, Size 22, 100 Blade Box 100
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

92 Sentinel Spectrum Blue, Large, 30 Tab Pack 60
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

93 Sentinel Spectrum Green, Small, 30 Tab Pack 120
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

94 Sentinel Spectrum Orange, Toy, 30 Tab Pack 72
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

95 Sentinel Spectrum Yellow, Medium, 30 Tab Pack 110
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

96 SNAP Parvo Test, 5 Test Box 40
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

97 Syringes 3cc, Luer Lock, No Needle, 100 per Box 300
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

MWI Veterinary Supply Patterson Veterinary

3041 W. Pasadena Dr 303 E. San Antonio

Boise,
ID 83705

Marion,
TX 78124

$18.71 $15.70
$1,871.00 $1,570.00

Cincinatti Surg WVP
11392 78367551
B100 Each

No Bid $183.96
$11,037.60

Virbac
78926487

Each

No Bid $121.56
$14,587.20

Virbac
78926485

Each

No Bid $121.56
$8,752.32

Virbac
78926484

Each

No Bid $151.96
$16,715.60

Virbac
78926486

Each

No Bid $116.55 / $11.665*
$2,331.00

Abaxis
78917281

Each 10 pk

$7.01 $5.25
$2,103.00 $1,575.00

Exel Exel
24203 78683906
B100 Each



City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 30, 2016

For: Veterinarian Vaccines, Pharmaceuticals and Supplies for 
Animal Care Services

6100007421 VF

Item Description Est. Annual
Quantity

98 Syringes 6cc, Luer Lock, No Needle, 50 per Box 500
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

99 Terramycin Ointment, 1/8 Ounce Tube 200
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

100 Thermometer, Digital, 10-Second Read Time 30
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

101 Tramadol, 50mg, 500 per Bottle 200
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

102 UltraEdge AGC Super 2-Speed Clipper with Blade 15
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

103 Vanguard Plus 5 DHPP Vaccine 30,000
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

104 IV Macro Drip Set, 103", 15 drops 200
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

MWI Veterinary Supply Patterson Veterinary

3041 W. Pasadena Dr 303 E. San Antonio

Boise,
ID 83705

Marion,
TX 78124

$14.35 $11.00
$7,175.00 $5,500.00

Exel Exel
24213 78684039
B100 Each

No Bid $11.45
$2,290.00

Zoetis
78406285

Each

$3.01 $4.15
$90.30 $124.50

VetOne Genetco
601013 78379691

Each Each

No Bid $13.71
$2,742.00

WVG
78916324

Each

$17.02 $150.00
$255.30 $2,250.00

Andis Andis
21805 78364726
Each Each

No Bid $148.75 / $5.95*
$178,500.00

Zoetis
78925687

Each 25x1ds

$1.29 $2.24
$258.00 $448.00
VetOne Millpledge
670011 78914622

Each Each



City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 30, 2016

For: Veterinarian Vaccines, Pharmaceuticals and Supplies for 
Animal Care Services

6100007421 VF

Item Description Est. Annual
Quantity

105 Vitamin B-12, 100ml, 5000mcg/ml Vial 3
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

106 Vitamin K-1 Injectable, 100ml, 10mg/ml Vial 4
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

107 Zenequin, 100mg, 50 per Bottle 12
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

108 Zenequin, 25mg, 100 per Bottle 12
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

109 Zetamine Ketamine, 100mg/ml, 10ml C3N Vial 1,575
Unit Price
Price Total
Manufacturer
Product No
Packaged

Payment Terms

Estimated Annual Total

Estimated Annual Award

*Adjusted for Evaluation Purposes Only

MWI Veterinary Supply Patterson Veterinary

3041 W. Pasadena Dr 303 E. San Antonio

Boise,
ID 83705

Marion,
TX 78124

$12.51 $15.70
$37.53 $47.10

VetOne Neogen
502052 78917972
100CC Each

$8.54 $12.90
$34.16 $51.60

VetOne Vedco
501051 78686749
100CC Each

No Bid $207.15
$2,485.80

Zoetis
78925754

Each

No Bid $119.40
$1,432.80

Zoetis
78925750

Each

$4.89 $5.09
$7,701.75 $8,016.75

VetOne Vedco
501072 78908598

10CC Each

Net 30 Net 30
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