
Draft Bid Tab

Opened: August 24, 2016

For: Annual Contract for John Deere Tractor Parts & 

Service

Ag-Pro Texas LLC RDO Equipment 

Company

6100007633 GG
3030 N. Austin St. 19275 IH 35 North

Item Description

Estimated 

Annual 

Usage

Seguin, 

TX, 78155

New Braunfels, 

TX, 78132

1A John Deere Agriculture Tractor Parts

Percent of Discount Offered 0% 0%

Product Identification (Manufacturer) John Deere John Deere

Type of Price Schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) Dealer Manufacture

Price Schedule Number JD001

Date of Price Schedule Weekly

Price Schedule Column on Which Discount Net

is based (i.e. distributer, net, wholesale, etc.)

Warranty

90 Day 

Reman Products 1 

year 90 Days

1B

Specified Items - John Deere Agriculture Tractor 

Parts

1 Manufacturer: John Deere 1

Manuf Offered John Deere John Deere

Part Number Offered LW11494049 LW11494049

Price Per Each $2,710.81 $2,608.52

$ Discount $153.44 $0.00

Price Per Each after Discount $2,557.37 $2,608.52

Extended Price $2,557.37 $2,608.52

2 Manufacturer: John Deere 19

Manuf Offered John Deere John Deere

Part Number Offered RE273078 RE273078

Price Per Each $1,560.90 $1,502.00

$ Discount $88.35 $0.00

Price Per Each after Discount $1,472.55 $1,502.00

Extended Price $27,978.45 $28,538.00

3 Manufacturer: John Deere 4 No Bid No Bid

Manuf Offered John Deere John Deere

Part Number Offered 480/80R34 480/80R34

Price Per Each $0.00 $0.00

$ Discount $0.00 $0.00

Price Per Each after Discount $0.00 $0.00

Extended Price $0.00 $0.00

4 Manufacturer: John Deere 1

Manuf Offered John Deere John Deere

Part Number Offered SE502287 SE502287

Price Per Each $1,399.18 $1,399.18

$ Discount $0.00 $0.00
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Price Per Each after Discount $1,399.18 $1,399.18

Extended Price $1,399.18 $1,399.18

5 Manufacturer: John Deere 1

Manuf Offered John Deere John Deere

Part Number Offered LW9415251 LW9415251

Price Per Each $1,505.98 $1,420.74

$ Discount $85.24 $0.00

Price Per Each after Discount $1,420.74 $1,420.74

Extended Price $1,420.74 $1,420.74

6 Manufacturer: John Deere 4 No Bid No Bid

Manuf Offered John Deere John Deere

Part Number Offered 400/80R24 400/80R24

Price Per Each $0.00 $0.00

$ Discount $0.00 $0.00

Price Per Each after Discount $0.00 $0.00

Extended Price $0.00 $0.00

7 Manufacturer: John Deere 1

Manuf Offered John Deere John Deere

Part Number Offered LW11114956 LW11114956

Price Per Each $1,261.94 $1,214.32

$ Discount $71.43 $0.00

Price Per Each after Discount $1,190.51 $1,214.32

Extended Price $1,190.51 $1,214.32

8 Manufacturer: John Deere 1

Manuf Offered John Deere John Deere

Part Number Offered LW1111495 LW1111495

Price Per Each $1,083.86 $1,042.96

$ Discount $61.35 $0.00

Price Per Each after Discount $1,022.51 $1,042.96

Extended Price $1,022.51 $1,042.96

9 Manufacturer: John Deere 2

Manuf Offered John Deere John Deere

Part Number Offered LW9409828 LW9409828

Price Per Each $938.98 $895.85

$ Discount $60.70 $0.00

Price Per Each after Discount $878.28 $895.85

Extended Price $1,756.56 $1,791.70

10 Manufacturer: John Deere 1

Manuf Offered John Deere John Deere

Part Number Offered 2981381 2981381

Price Per Each $815.62 $959.56

$ Discount $0.00 $0.00

Price Per Each after Discount $815.62 $959.56

Extended Price $815.62 $959.56

1C Labor and Service

Labor - Regular Rate 1 $100.00 $125.00

Labor - Expedited Rate 1 $110.00 $140.00

Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30
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