
City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 8, 2016  
Bid # 1 Bid # 2

For: Purchase of Light, Medium, Heavy Duty 
Trucks, Vans and Heavy Equipment

Ag-Pro Texas Bane Machinery Cooper Equipment 
Co.

Doggett Equipment 
Services Group LTD

Doggett Freightliner 
of South Texas, LLC

Ewald Kubota Grande Truck Center Grande Truck Center

6100007554 LD 3030 N Austin 2449 Manana Drive 17474 Judson RD. 4001 N. PanAm 
Expressway

8700 IH 10 East 1900 W. I-10 4562 IH-10 East 4562 IH-10 East

Item Description QTY Seguin,                         
TX 78155

Dallas,                         
TX 75220

San Antonio,                
TX 78247

San Antonio,                
TX 78219

Converse,                     
TX 78109

Seguin,                       
TX 78255

San Antonio,                
TX 78219

San Antonio,                
TX 78219

1 10, 001- 14,000 GVW Turnkey Regular 
Cab 4x4 Flatbed Herbicide Truck:

1

Price Each: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $47,821.00
Total:  $47,821.00
Year, Make & Model Cab & Chassis 
Offered:

     2017 F350 R/C SRW 
56" CA

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE net HP): 

     Ford Diesel 6.7 L 440 
HP, 860 lb. ft. Torque 

Transmission Offered: Ford Automatic 6 
Speed Torque Shift

Cab & Chassis Warranty:      36 Month or 36,000 
Miles

Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider 
Facility Name:

     Grande Truck Center

Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider 
Facility Address:

     4562 I 10 East, San 
Antonio, TX 78219

Year, Make & Model Flatbed Body Offered: Not Provided

Flatbed Body Warranty: 12 Months

Flatbed Body Warranty Service Provider 
Facility Name:

Ranch Hand

Flatbed Body Warranty Service Provider 
Facility Address:

2625 Broadway St., 
San Antonio, TX 

78215
Delivery: 120-150 Days
Production Cut-off Date:      10/1/2015

Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date:

     9/30/2016

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date:

     No 
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 8, 2016  
Bid # 1 Bid # 2

For: Purchase of Light, Medium, Heavy Duty 
Trucks, Vans and Heavy Equipment

Ag-Pro Texas Bane Machinery Cooper Equipment 
Co.

Doggett Equipment 
Services Group LTD

Doggett Freightliner 
of South Texas, LLC

Ewald Kubota Grande Truck Center Grande Truck Center

6100007554 LD 3030 N Austin 2449 Manana Drive 17474 Judson RD. 4001 N. PanAm 
Expressway

8700 IH 10 East 1900 W. I-10 4562 IH-10 East 4562 IH-10 East

Item Description QTY Seguin,                         
TX 78155

Dallas,                         
TX 75220

San Antonio,                
TX 78247

San Antonio,                
TX 78219

Converse,                     
TX 78109

Seguin,                       
TX 78255

San Antonio,                
TX 78219

San Antonio,                
TX 78219

2 Brush Tub Grinder with Loader: 1
Price Each: No Bid $686,081.41 No Bid $612,196.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total: $686,081.41 $612,196.00
Year, Make & Model Offered:  2016 Diamond Z 

DZT1352B
 2016, Morbark Model 

1100 shipped new 
direct from factory

 

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE net HP): 

 Caterpillar C27 / Tier 
IV Interim / 875 HP

 Caterpillar Model C-
18 F4 630 HP

 

Warranty:  Structural warranty 
Expires 1 Year or 

1,000 Hours, 
Components warranty 

Expires 1 Year or 
1,000 Hours

 1 Year unlimited 
hours on tub grinder 

assembly, trailer, 
hammer mill assembly 

and clutch.  2 years 
on engine, 3 years 
major components 

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:  Not Provided  Doggett Equipment 
Services Group, Inc.

Warranty Service Provider Facility 
Address:

 Not Provided  4001 N. PanAm 
Expressway, San 

Antonio, TX 78219
Delivery: 140 Days 30-90 Days
Production Cut-off Date: 8/22/2016 January 1st, 2017
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date:

 8/22/2016   December 20th, 2017

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date:

 Prices are good for 45 
days

 No  

3 Pneumatic, Tired Roller: 1
Price Each: No Bid No Bid $66,107.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total: $66,107.00  
Year, Make & Model Offered:   2016 Altas-Copac 

Dynapac CP1200 
  

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE net HP): 

  Cummins QSF 2.8 
T4F

  

Warranty:   1 Year on the Roll/2 
Year on  Engine

 

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:   Cooper Equipment 
Co.

 

Warranty Service Provider Facility 
Address:

  17474 Judson Rd., 
San Antonio, TX 

78247

 

Delivery: 45-60 Days
Production Cut-off Date: Not Provided
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date:

  Dec-16  

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date:

  Yes   
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 8, 2016  
Bid # 1 Bid # 2

For: Purchase of Light, Medium, Heavy Duty 
Trucks, Vans and Heavy Equipment

Ag-Pro Texas Bane Machinery Cooper Equipment 
Co.

Doggett Equipment 
Services Group LTD

Doggett Freightliner 
of South Texas, LLC

Ewald Kubota Grande Truck Center Grande Truck Center

6100007554 LD 3030 N Austin 2449 Manana Drive 17474 Judson RD. 4001 N. PanAm 
Expressway

8700 IH 10 East 1900 W. I-10 4562 IH-10 East 4562 IH-10 East

Item Description QTY Seguin,                         
TX 78155

Dallas,                         
TX 75220

San Antonio,                
TX 78247

San Antonio,                
TX 78219

Converse,                     
TX 78109

Seguin,                       
TX 78255

San Antonio,                
TX 78219

San Antonio,                
TX 78219

4 19,501-26,000 GVW Utility Bed Crane 
Truck:

1

Price Each: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $115,791.00 No Bid $114,573.00 No Bid
Total:  $115,791.00 $114,573.00
Year, Make & Model Cab & Chassis 
Offered:

    2017 Freightliner 
M2-106

 2017 Ford F750 R/C 
25,999 GVW

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE net HP): 

    Cummins ISB 6.7, 260 
HP / 660 TQ

 6.7 Ford Diesel 270 
H.P. 675 lb. ft. Torque

Transmission Offered: Allison 3000 RDS Ford Torq Shift H.D. 6 
Speed Automatic

Cab & Chassis Warranty:     2 years Unlimited - 
Miles

 24 Months Engine & 
Transmission 60 

Month or 250,000 
Miles

Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider 
Facility Name:

    Doggett Freightliner 
of South Texas, LLC

 Grande Truck Center

Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Facility 
Address:

    8700 IH 10 East, 
Converse, TX 78109

 4562 I 10 East, San 
Antonio, TX 78219

Year, Make & Model Utility Bed & Crane 
Offered:

2016 Warner Bodies - 
WS2132 - Stellar 

EC6000 Crane with 
Telescopic Boom

2016 Warren Select II 
Body, Stellar Model 

EC6000 Crane

Utility Bed & Crane Warranty: 1 Year 12 months

Utility Bed & Crane Warranty Service 
Provider Facility Name:

Cobalt Truck 
Equipment

Cobalt Truck 
Equipment

Utility Bed & Crane Warranty Service 
Provider Facility Address:

11218 IH 10 East, 
Converse, TX 78109 

11218 IH 10 East, 
Converse, TX 78109 

Delivery:  120-180 Day 150-180 Days
Production Cut-off Date:  12/31/2016 12/30/2016
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date:

    12/31/2016  12/30/2016

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date:

    Yes  No
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 8, 2016  
Bid # 1 Bid # 2

For: Purchase of Light, Medium, Heavy Duty 
Trucks, Vans and Heavy Equipment

Ag-Pro Texas Bane Machinery Cooper Equipment 
Co.

Doggett Equipment 
Services Group LTD

Doggett Freightliner 
of South Texas, LLC

Ewald Kubota Grande Truck Center Grande Truck Center

6100007554 LD 3030 N Austin 2449 Manana Drive 17474 Judson RD. 4001 N. PanAm 
Expressway

8700 IH 10 East 1900 W. I-10 4562 IH-10 East 4562 IH-10 East

Item Description QTY Seguin,                         
TX 78155

Dallas,                         
TX 75220

San Antonio,                
TX 78247

San Antonio,                
TX 78219

Converse,                     
TX 78109

Seguin,                       
TX 78255

San Antonio,                
TX 78219

San Antonio,                
TX 78219

5 19,501-26,000 GVW Utility Bed Crane 
Truck:

1

Price Each: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $113,234.00 No Bid $111,179.00 No Bid
Total: $113,234.00 $111,179.00
Year, Make & Model Cab & Chassis 
Offered:

  2017 Freightliner 
M2-106

2017 Ford F750 Reg 
Cab 25,999 GVW

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE net HP): 

  Cummins ISB 6.7, 260 
HP / 660 TQ

6.7 Ford Diesel 270 
H.P. 675 lb. ft. Torque

Transmission Offered:   Allison 3000 RDS Ford Torq Shift H.D. 6 
Speed

Cab & Chassis Warranty:   2 years - Unlimited 
Miles

24 Months Engine & 
Transmission 60 

Month or 250,000 
Miles

Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider 
Facility Name:

  Doggett Freightliner 
of South Texas, LLC

Grande Truck Center

Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider 
Facility Address:

8700 IH 10 East, 
Converse, TX 78109

4562 I 10 East, San 
Antonio, TX 78219

Year, Make & Model Utility Bed & Crane 
Offered:

2016 Warner FBA - 
Stellar EC6000 

Telescopic Crane

Warner Flatbed and 
Stellar Model EC6000

Utility Bed & Crane Warranty: 1 Year 12 months
Utility Bed & Crane Warranty Service 
Provider Facility Name:

Cobalt Truck 
Equipment

Cobalt Truck 
Equipment

Utility Bed & Crane Warranty Service 
Provider Facility Address:

11218 IH 10 East, 
Converse, TX 78109 

11218 IH 10 East, 
Converse, TX 78109 

Delivery: 120-180 Day 150-180 Days
Production Cut-off Date: 12/31/2016 12/30/2016
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date:

  12/31/2016 12/30/2016

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date:

  Yes No
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 8, 2016  
Bid # 1 Bid # 2

For: Purchase of Light, Medium, Heavy Duty 
Trucks, Vans and Heavy Equipment

Ag-Pro Texas Bane Machinery Cooper Equipment 
Co.

Doggett Equipment 
Services Group LTD

Doggett Freightliner 
of South Texas, LLC

Ewald Kubota Grande Truck Center Grande Truck Center

6100007554 LD 3030 N Austin 2449 Manana Drive 17474 Judson RD. 4001 N. PanAm 
Expressway

8700 IH 10 East 1900 W. I-10 4562 IH-10 East 4562 IH-10 East

Item Description QTY Seguin,                         
TX 78155

Dallas,                         
TX 75220

San Antonio,                
TX 78247

San Antonio,                
TX 78219

Converse,                     
TX 78109

Seguin,                       
TX 78255

San Antonio,                
TX 78219

San Antonio,                
TX 78219

6 19,501-26,000 GVW Chipper Truck: 1

Price Each: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $92,464.00 No Bid $97,340.00 No Bid
Total:  $92,464.00 $97,340.00
Year, Make & Model Cab & Chassis 
Offered:

   2017 Freightliner 
M2-106

 2017 Ford F750 Reg 
Cab 25,999 GVW

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE net HP): 

   Cummins ISB 6.7, 260 
HP / 660 TQ

 6.7 Ford Diesel 270 
H.P. 675 lb. ft. Torque

Transmission Offered:    Allison 3000 RDS  Ford Torq Shift H.D. 6 
Speed Automatic

Cab & Chassis Warranty:    2 years - Unlimited 
Miles

 24 Months Engine & 
Transmission 60 

Month or 250,000 
Miles

Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider 
Facility Name:

   Doggett Freightliner 
of South Texas, LLC

 Grande Truck Center

Cab & Chassis Warranty Provider Facility 
Address:

8700 IH 10 East, 
Converse, TX 78109

4562 I 10 East, San 
Antonio, TX 78219

Year, Make & Model Catch Body/Box 
Offered:

2016 Arbortech 2016 Stahl Chipper 
Truck Body

Catch Body/Box Warranty: 1 Year 12 months

Catch Body/Box Warranty Service Provider 
Facility Name:

Cobalt Truck 
Equipment

Axton Fleet Service

Catch Body/Box Warranty Service Provider 
Facility Address:

11218 IH 10 East, 
Converse, TX 78109 

4844 Whirlwind Dr. 
San Antonio, TX 

78217
Delivery:  120-180 Day 150-180 Days
Production Cut-off Date:  12/31/2016 12/30/2016
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date:

   12/31/2016  12/30/2016

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date:

   Yes  No
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 8, 2016  
Bid # 1 Bid # 2

For: Purchase of Light, Medium, Heavy Duty 
Trucks, Vans and Heavy Equipment

Ag-Pro Texas Bane Machinery Cooper Equipment 
Co.

Doggett Equipment 
Services Group LTD

Doggett Freightliner 
of South Texas, LLC

Ewald Kubota Grande Truck Center Grande Truck Center

6100007554 LD 3030 N Austin 2449 Manana Drive 17474 Judson RD. 4001 N. PanAm 
Expressway

8700 IH 10 East 1900 W. I-10 4562 IH-10 East 4562 IH-10 East

Item Description QTY Seguin,                         
TX 78155

Dallas,                         
TX 75220

San Antonio,                
TX 78247

San Antonio,                
TX 78219

Converse,                     
TX 78109

Seguin,                       
TX 78255

San Antonio,                
TX 78219

San Antonio,                
TX 78219

7 4x4 Utility Tractors: 2
Base Unit Price (Each): $60,918.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $58,488.32 No Bid No Bid
Total: $121,836.00  $116,976.64

Additional Cost:
Optional Protective Cage: 2 $1,000.00
Additional Cost Total: $2,000.00

Year, Make & Model Offered: 2016 John Deere 
5100M

   2016 Kubota Model 
M5-111

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE net HP): 

John Deere Power 
Tech PWL (100 HP)

   Kubota V 3800 CR 
Tier 4, 105,6 HP

Warranty: 2 Year or 2000 Hrs    2 Years or 2000 
Hours

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Ag-Pro Texas  Ewald Kubota
Warranty Service Provider Facility 
Address:

3030 N. Austin, 
Seguin, TX 78155 

   1900 W. I-10, Seguin, 
TX 78255

Delivery: 180 Days  45 Days
Production Cut-off Date: July 22, 2016  N/A
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date:

July 22    N/A

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date:

No    7/31/2016

8 2,000 Gallon Trailer Mounted Water 
Tanker: 2
Price Each: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $18,860.05 No Bid No Bid
Total:  $37,720.10
Year, Make & Model Offered:      2016 Wylie D2020 

10T - IH - BLK

Warranty:      I Yr Excluding Pump 
Seal 3 Yrs on tank

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:      Wylie Sprayers of 
El Campo

Warranty Service Provider Facility 
Address:

     Wylie Trailers,  
2820 N. Mechanic, 

El Campo, TX 77437
Delivery:  4 Wks
Production Cut-off Date:  N/A
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date:

     1-Sep-16

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date:

     Not Provided
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 8, 2016  
Bid # 1 Bid # 2

For: Purchase of Light, Medium, Heavy Duty 
Trucks, Vans and Heavy Equipment

Ag-Pro Texas Bane Machinery Cooper Equipment 
Co.

Doggett Equipment 
Services Group LTD

Doggett Freightliner 
of South Texas, LLC

Ewald Kubota Grande Truck Center Grande Truck Center

6100007554 LD 3030 N Austin 2449 Manana Drive 17474 Judson RD. 4001 N. PanAm 
Expressway

8700 IH 10 East 1900 W. I-10 4562 IH-10 East 4562 IH-10 East

Item Description QTY Seguin,                         
TX 78155

Dallas,                         
TX 75220

San Antonio,                
TX 78247

San Antonio,                
TX 78219

Converse,                     
TX 78109

Seguin,                       
TX 78255

San Antonio,                
TX 78219

San Antonio,                
TX 78219

9 >33,000 GVW Utility Bed 65’ Ground 
Reach Aerial Truck:

2

Base Unit Price (Each): No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $197,653.00 No Bid $186,867.00 No Bid
Total: $395,306.00 $373,734.00

Additional Cost:
Optional Bucket Rotator to Dump Water 
and Debris:

Option 1: Manual Rotator Additional Cost: 
2 Not suitable for  2 

Man Bucket
N/A

Total: 
Option 2: Hydraulic Controlled Rotator 
Additional Cost: 

2 $1,875.00 Included

Total: $3,750.00

Additional Cost:
Optional bucket cover:
Option 1: Canvas Bucket Cover Additional 
Cost: 

2 $45.00 Not Available, 
Vinyl Only

Total: $90.00
Option 2: Hard Bucket Cover Additional 
Cost: 

2 $95.00 $350.00

Total: $190.00 $700.00

Year, Make & Model Cab & Chassis 
Offered:

2017 Freightliner 
M2-106

2017 Ford F750 Reg 
Cab 34,200 GVW

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE net HP): 

Cummins ISL 9, 270 
HP / 800 TQ

6.7 Ford Diesel 330 
H.P. 725 lb. ft. Torque

Transmission Offered: Allison 3000 RDS Ford Torq Shift H.D. 6 
Speed

Cab & Chassis Warranty: 2 years - Unlimited 
Miles

24 Months Diesel & 
Transmission 60 

Month or 250,000 
Miles

Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider 
Facility Name:

Doggett Freightliner 
of South Texas, LLC

Grande Truck Center

Cab & Chassis Warranty Provider Facility 
Address:

8700 IH 10 East, 
Converse, TX 78109

4562 I 10 East, San 
Antonio, TX 78219

Year, Make & Model Catch Body/Box 
Offered:

2016 Altec AA67 2016 TC65 Terex 
Aerial Hi-Ranger

Aerial Lift and Platform Warranty: 1 Year Parts & Labor 12 months
Aerial Lift and Platform Warranty Service 
Provider Facility Name:

Altec Field Support / 
Doggett Freightliner

Terex

Aerial Lift and Platform Warranty Service 
Provider Facility Address:

8700 IH 10 East, 
Converse, TX 78109

142 Gembler Road, 
San Antonio, TX 

78219

Delivery: 270-330 210-250 Days
Production Cut-off Date: 12/31/2016 12/30/2016
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date:

12/31/2016 12/30/2016

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date:

No No
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 8, 2016  
Bid # 1 Bid # 2

For: Purchase of Light, Medium, Heavy Duty 
Trucks, Vans and Heavy Equipment

Ag-Pro Texas Bane Machinery Cooper Equipment 
Co.

Doggett Equipment 
Services Group LTD

Doggett Freightliner 
of South Texas, LLC

Ewald Kubota Grande Truck Center Grande Truck Center

6100007554 LD 3030 N Austin 2449 Manana Drive 17474 Judson RD. 4001 N. PanAm 
Expressway

8700 IH 10 East 1900 W. I-10 4562 IH-10 East 4562 IH-10 East

Item Description QTY Seguin,                         
TX 78155

Dallas,                         
TX 75220

San Antonio,                
TX 78247

San Antonio,                
TX 78219

Converse,                     
TX 78109

Seguin,                       
TX 78255

San Antonio,                
TX 78219

San Antonio,                
TX 78219

10 DELETED:

11 Sprinter Van with Auxiliary AC Unit, Diesel: 1
Price Each: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total:
Year, Make & Model Offered:
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE net HP): 
Warranty:
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:
Warranty Service Provider Facility 
Address:
Delivery:
Production Cut-off Date:
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date:

12 Mini Van (Cargo) 2
Price Each: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total:
Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE net HP): 

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility 
Address:

Delivery:
Production Cut-off Date:

Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date:
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 8, 2016  
Bid # 1 Bid # 2

For: Purchase of Light, Medium, Heavy Duty 
Trucks, Vans and Heavy Equipment

Ag-Pro Texas Bane Machinery Cooper Equipment 
Co.

Doggett Equipment 
Services Group LTD

Doggett Freightliner 
of South Texas, LLC

Ewald Kubota Grande Truck Center Grande Truck Center

6100007554 LD 3030 N Austin 2449 Manana Drive 17474 Judson RD. 4001 N. PanAm 
Expressway

8700 IH 10 East 1900 W. I-10 4562 IH-10 East 4562 IH-10 East

Item Description QTY Seguin,                         
TX 78155

Dallas,                         
TX 75220

San Antonio,                
TX 78247

San Antonio,                
TX 78219

Converse,                     
TX 78109

Seguin,                       
TX 78255

San Antonio,                
TX 78219

San Antonio,                
TX 78219

13 1 Ton Cargo Van: 1
Price Each: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total:
Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE net HP): 
Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:
Warranty Service Provider Facility 
Address:
Delivery:
Production Cut-off Date:
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date:

14 ½ Ton Full Size Regular Cab 4x2: 3
Price Each: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $24,048.00
Total: $72,144.00
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2017 Ford F150 R/C 

4x2 6-1/2 ft. bed

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE net HP): 

Ford V6, 282 H.P.

Warranty: 36 Month or 36,000 
Miles

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Grande Truck Center

Warranty Service Provider Facility 
Address:

4562 I 10 East, San 
Antonio, TX 78219

Delivery: 150-180 Days
Production Cut-off Date: 12/31/2016

Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date:

12/31/2016

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date:

No

Payment Terms: Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 8, 2016

For: Purchase of Light, Medium, Heavy Duty 
Trucks, Vans and Heavy Equipment

6100007554 LD

Item Description QTY

1 10, 001- 14,000 GVW Turnkey Regular 
Cab 4x4 Flatbed Herbicide Truck:

1

Price Each:
Total:
Year, Make & Model Cab & Chassis 
Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE net HP): 

Transmission Offered:

Cab & Chassis Warranty:

Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider 
Facility Name:

Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider 
Facility Address:

Year, Make & Model Flatbed Body Offered:

Flatbed Body Warranty:

Flatbed Body Warranty Service Provider 
Facility Name:

Flatbed Body Warranty Service Provider 
Facility Address:

Delivery:
Production Cut-off Date:

Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date:

Grapevine DCJ, LLC. Griffith Ford Seguin, 
LLC.

Gunn Chevrolet, LTD H & E Equipment 
Services

RDO Equipment Co. Rush Truck Center Silsbee Ford Vermeer Texas - 
Louisiana

Waukesha-Pearce 
Industries, Inc.

2601 William Tate 1880 W. IH-10 16550 IH 35 N. 5327 Tex -Con Rd. 19275 N. IH 35 8922 I.H 10 East 1211 US Hwy 96 N. 16593 IH-35 North 3740 S. E. Loop 410

Grapevine,                   
TX 76051

Seguin,                         
TX 78155

Selma,                          
TX 78154

San Antonio,                
TX 78220

New Braunfels,            
TX 78132

Converse,                     
TX 78109

Silsbee,                        
TX 77656

Selma,                          
TX 78154

San Antonio,                
TX 78222

$60,685.00 No Bid $44,877.72 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
$60,685.00 $44,877.72  

2017 Ram 3500 
DD8L63

2017, Chevrolet CK 
35903 4X4 1 Ton Reg 

Cab

  

Cummins 6.7 L I6 
Turbo Diesel 325 hp

LML Duramax 6.6 
Turbo Diesel V8, 397 

HP

  

Aisen AS69 RC 6 Spd Automatic 
Transmission Allison 

1000 LML
3 Yr / 36,000 Miles, 5 

Yr / 1000,000 mile 
limited powertrain 

3 Yr or 36,000K BTB. 
5 Yr or 100K 

Powertrain

  

Any Dodge Chrysler, 
Jeep, Ram Dealership

Chevrolet, Gunn LTD   

Any Dodge Chrysler, 
Jeep, Ram Dealership

16550 IH 35 N., 
Selma, TX 78154

  

Axton Flatbed Intelli 
Spray 5 SPE 150 Skid 

Unit

Bedrock, Diamond, 
*exception (1) wheel 

base 133.6 (2) 56" 
CA, Chevrolet SRW 

only 56" CA
1 Yr Parts / Labor 3 Yr or 36 K

Axton Fleet Ranch Hand Truck 
Access

4848 Whirlwind, San 
Antonio, TX 78217

2625 Broadway St., 
San Antonio, TX 

78215
120 Days 110 Days  

April 2017 6/2017 (2017 Start Up 
Date 9/17/17)

  

est. 4/15/2017 6/2017   

No Not Provided   
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 8, 2016

For: Purchase of Light, Medium, Heavy Duty 
Trucks, Vans and Heavy Equipment

6100007554 LD

Item Description QTY

2 Brush Tub Grinder with Loader: 1
Price Each:
Total:
Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE net HP): 

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility 
Address:

Delivery:
Production Cut-off Date:
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date:

3 Pneumatic, Tired Roller: 1
Price Each:
Total:
Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE net HP): 
Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility 
Address:

Delivery:
Production Cut-off Date:
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date:

Grapevine DCJ, LLC. Griffith Ford Seguin, 
LLC.

Gunn Chevrolet, LTD H & E Equipment 
Services

RDO Equipment Co. Rush Truck Center Silsbee Ford Vermeer Texas - 
Louisiana

Waukesha-Pearce 
Industries, Inc.

2601 William Tate 1880 W. IH-10 16550 IH 35 N. 5327 Tex -Con Rd. 19275 N. IH 35 8922 I.H 10 East 1211 US Hwy 96 N. 16593 IH-35 North 3740 S. E. Loop 410

Grapevine,                   
TX 76051

Seguin,                         
TX 78155

Selma,                          
TX 78154

San Antonio,                
TX 78220

New Braunfels,            
TX 78132

Converse,                     
TX 78109

Silsbee,                        
TX 77656

Selma,                          
TX 78154

San Antonio,                
TX 78222

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $651,135.00 No Bid
$651,135.00  

2016 Vermeer 
TG5000L

 

cat C15 Tier 4 Final 
540 hp Turbo 

Charged after Cooled 
SAE J1995 

 

1 Year or 1,000 
Hours

 

Vermeer Texas - 
Louisiana

 

16593 IH-35 North, 
Selma, TX 78154

 

90 Days  
12-31-16  

9-30-16  

 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $103,921.00
$103,921.00

 2016 Bomag 
BW11RH5

 Kubota V3307, 74 hp

 1 Year Standard, 
Engine 2 Years

 Waukesha-Pearce 
Industries, Inc.

 3740 S. E. Loop 410, 
San Antonio, 

TX 78222
90-120 Days

October 1, 2016
 October 1, 2016

 No 
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 8, 2016

For: Purchase of Light, Medium, Heavy Duty 
Trucks, Vans and Heavy Equipment

6100007554 LD

Item Description QTY

4 19,501-26,000 GVW Utility Bed Crane 
Truck:

1

Price Each:
Total:
Year, Make & Model Cab & Chassis 
Offered:
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE net HP): 

Transmission Offered:

Cab & Chassis Warranty:

Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider 
Facility Name:

Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Facility 
Address:

Year, Make & Model Utility Bed & Crane 
Offered:

Utility Bed & Crane Warranty:

Utility Bed & Crane Warranty Service 
Provider Facility Name:

Utility Bed & Crane Warranty Service 
Provider Facility Address:

Delivery:
Production Cut-off Date:
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date:

Grapevine DCJ, LLC. Griffith Ford Seguin, 
LLC.

Gunn Chevrolet, LTD H & E Equipment 
Services

RDO Equipment Co. Rush Truck Center Silsbee Ford Vermeer Texas - 
Louisiana

Waukesha-Pearce 
Industries, Inc.

2601 William Tate 1880 W. IH-10 16550 IH 35 N. 5327 Tex -Con Rd. 19275 N. IH 35 8922 I.H 10 East 1211 US Hwy 96 N. 16593 IH-35 North 3740 S. E. Loop 410

Grapevine,                   
TX 76051

Seguin,                         
TX 78155

Selma,                          
TX 78154

San Antonio,                
TX 78220

New Braunfels,            
TX 78132

Converse,                     
TX 78109

Silsbee,                        
TX 77656

Selma,                          
TX 78154

San Antonio,                
TX 78222

No Bid Not Provided No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
 

2017 Ford F650  

6.7 Power Stroke, 270 
H.P., 675 lb. Torque 

 

Ford Torq Shift 6 Spd. 
Automatic - Double 

Overdrive
Basic Unlimited 

Miles/24 Months, 
Diesel Engine Trans, 

250,000 Miles - 60 
Months

Griffith Ford Seguin, 
or any Authorized 

Ford Dealership
1880 W. IH-10, 

Seguin, TX 78155

Not Provided

Not Provided

Not Provided

Not Provided

180 days  
TBD  
TBD

No  
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 8, 2016

For: Purchase of Light, Medium, Heavy Duty 
Trucks, Vans and Heavy Equipment

6100007554 LD

Item Description QTY

5 19,501-26,000 GVW Utility Bed Crane 
Truck:

1

Price Each:
Total:
Year, Make & Model Cab & Chassis 
Offered:
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE net HP): 

Transmission Offered:

Cab & Chassis Warranty:

Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider 
Facility Name:

Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider 
Facility Address:
Year, Make & Model Utility Bed & Crane 
Offered:

Utility Bed & Crane Warranty:
Utility Bed & Crane Warranty Service 
Provider Facility Name:
Utility Bed & Crane Warranty Service 
Provider Facility Address:
Delivery:
Production Cut-off Date:
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date:

Grapevine DCJ, LLC. Griffith Ford Seguin, 
LLC.

Gunn Chevrolet, LTD H & E Equipment 
Services

RDO Equipment Co. Rush Truck Center Silsbee Ford Vermeer Texas - 
Louisiana

Waukesha-Pearce 
Industries, Inc.

2601 William Tate 1880 W. IH-10 16550 IH 35 N. 5327 Tex -Con Rd. 19275 N. IH 35 8922 I.H 10 East 1211 US Hwy 96 N. 16593 IH-35 North 3740 S. E. Loop 410

Grapevine,                   
TX 76051

Seguin,                         
TX 78155

Selma,                          
TX 78154

San Antonio,                
TX 78220

New Braunfels,            
TX 78132

Converse,                     
TX 78109

Silsbee,                        
TX 77656

Selma,                          
TX 78154

San Antonio,                
TX 78222

No Bid Not Provided No Bid No Bid No Bid $119,446.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
$119,446.00  

2017 Ford F650 2017 Hino 338  

6.7 Power Stroke, 270 
H.P., 675 lb. Torque 

Hino JO8E-VC, 260 
HP

 

Ford Torq Shift 6 Spd. 
Automatic - Double 

Allison 3000 RDS  

Basic Unlimited 
Miles/24 Months, 

Diesel Engine Trans, 
250 000 Miles - 60

5 Year Limited  

Griffith Ford Seguin, 
or any Authorized 

Ford Dealership

Rush Truck Center  

1880 W. IH-10, 
Seguin, TX 78155

8922 I.H. 10 East, 
Converse, TX 78109

Not Provided 2017 Warner Body & 
Stellar Model EC6000 

Telescopic Crane

Not Provided 5 Year Limited
Not Provided Cobalt Truck 

Equipment
Not Provided 11218 IH 10 East, 

Converse, TX 78109 
Not Provided 120 Days  
Not Provided None  
Not Provided None  

Not Provided Yes  
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 8, 2016

For: Purchase of Light, Medium, Heavy Duty 
Trucks, Vans and Heavy Equipment

6100007554 LD

Item Description QTY

6 19,501-26,000 GVW Chipper Truck: 1

Price Each:
Total:
Year, Make & Model Cab & Chassis 
Offered:
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE net HP): 

Transmission Offered:

Cab & Chassis Warranty:

Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider 
Facility Name:

Cab & Chassis Warranty Provider Facility 
Address:

Year, Make & Model Catch Body/Box 
Offered:

Catch Body/Box Warranty:

Catch Body/Box Warranty Service Provider 
Facility Name:

Catch Body/Box Warranty Service Provider 
Facility Address:

Delivery:
Production Cut-off Date:
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date:

Grapevine DCJ, LLC. Griffith Ford Seguin, 
LLC.

Gunn Chevrolet, LTD H & E Equipment 
Services

RDO Equipment Co. Rush Truck Center Silsbee Ford Vermeer Texas - 
Louisiana

Waukesha-Pearce 
Industries, Inc.

2601 William Tate 1880 W. IH-10 16550 IH 35 N. 5327 Tex -Con Rd. 19275 N. IH 35 8922 I.H 10 East 1211 US Hwy 96 N. 16593 IH-35 North 3740 S. E. Loop 410

Grapevine,                   
TX 76051

Seguin,                         
TX 78155

Selma,                          
TX 78154

San Antonio,                
TX 78220

New Braunfels,            
TX 78132

Converse,                     
TX 78109

Silsbee,                        
TX 77656

Selma,                          
TX 78154

San Antonio,                
TX 78222

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 8, 2016

For: Purchase of Light, Medium, Heavy Duty 
Trucks, Vans and Heavy Equipment

6100007554 LD

Item Description QTY

7 4x4 Utility Tractors: 2
Base Unit Price (Each):
Total:

Additional Cost:
Optional Protective Cage: 2
Additional Cost Total:

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE net HP): 
Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:
Warranty Service Provider Facility 
Address:
Delivery:
Production Cut-off Date:
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date:

8 2,000 Gallon Trailer Mounted Water 
Tanker: 2
Price Each:
Total:
Year, Make & Model Offered:

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility 
Address:

Delivery:
Production Cut-off Date:
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date:

Grapevine DCJ, LLC. Griffith Ford Seguin, 
LLC.

Gunn Chevrolet, LTD H & E Equipment 
Services

RDO Equipment Co. Rush Truck Center Silsbee Ford Vermeer Texas - 
Louisiana

Waukesha-Pearce 
Industries, Inc.

2601 William Tate 1880 W. IH-10 16550 IH 35 N. 5327 Tex -Con Rd. 19275 N. IH 35 8922 I.H 10 East 1211 US Hwy 96 N. 16593 IH-35 North 3740 S. E. Loop 410

Grapevine,                   
TX 76051

Seguin,                         
TX 78155

Selma,                          
TX 78154

San Antonio,                
TX 78220

New Braunfels,            
TX 78132

Converse,                     
TX 78109

Silsbee,                        
TX 77656

Selma,                          
TX 78154

San Antonio,                
TX 78222

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

  

 

 

 

 

 

No Bid No Bid No Bid $25,874.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
$51,748.00  

2016 C&I Equipment, 
2035 Big Dog

  

1 Year on trailer, 2 
years on pump, 3 

years on tank

  

H & E Equipment 
Services

  

5327 Tex-Con Rd., 
San Antonio TX 

78220

  

30 Days  
12-1-16  
12-1-16   

No   
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 8, 2016

For: Purchase of Light, Medium, Heavy Duty 
Trucks, Vans and Heavy Equipment

6100007554 LD

Item Description QTY

9 >33,000 GVW Utility Bed 65’ Ground 
Reach Aerial Truck:

2

Base Unit Price (Each):
Total:

Additional Cost:
Optional Bucket Rotator to Dump Water 
and Debris:

Option 1: Manual Rotator Additional Cost: 
2

Total: 
Option 2: Hydraulic Controlled Rotator 
Additional Cost: 

2

Total: 

Additional Cost:
Optional bucket cover:
Option 1: Canvas Bucket Cover Additional 
Cost: 

2

Total:
Option 2: Hard Bucket Cover Additional 
Cost: 

2

Total:

Year, Make & Model Cab & Chassis 
Offered:
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE net HP): 

Transmission Offered:

Cab & Chassis Warranty:

Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider 
Facility Name:

Cab & Chassis Warranty Provider Facility 
Address:
Year, Make & Model Catch Body/Box 
Offered:
Aerial Lift and Platform Warranty:
Aerial Lift and Platform Warranty Service 
Provider Facility Name:
Aerial Lift and Platform Warranty Service 
Provider Facility Address:

Delivery:
Production Cut-off Date:
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date:

Grapevine DCJ, LLC. Griffith Ford Seguin, 
LLC.

Gunn Chevrolet, LTD H & E Equipment 
Services

RDO Equipment Co. Rush Truck Center Silsbee Ford Vermeer Texas - 
Louisiana

Waukesha-Pearce 
Industries, Inc.

2601 William Tate 1880 W. IH-10 16550 IH 35 N. 5327 Tex -Con Rd. 19275 N. IH 35 8922 I.H 10 East 1211 US Hwy 96 N. 16593 IH-35 North 3740 S. E. Loop 410

Grapevine,                   
TX 76051

Seguin,                         
TX 78155

Selma,                          
TX 78154

San Antonio,                
TX 78220

New Braunfels,            
TX 78132

Converse,                     
TX 78109

Silsbee,                        
TX 77656

Selma,                          
TX 78154

San Antonio,                
TX 78222

No Bid $184,494.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $183,860.00 No Bid No Bid
$368,988.00 $367,720.00

N/A Inc.

Included  

Included Inc

1

2017 Ford F750 2017 Ford F750 Reg 
Cab

Ford Power Stroke 
6.7 Liter. 330 hp/ 725 

ft. lb. Torque

Ford 6.7 Power 
Stroke V8 Diesel 330 

H.P.
Ford TorqShift  6- Spd 

Automatic w/power 
takeoff provision

Ford Torq Shift H.D. 6 
Spd

Basic Unlimited 
Miles/24 Months, 
Diesel Engine & 

Trans, 250,000 Miles -
60 Months

36 Mo/36,000 Miles 
Bumper to Bumper, 

5 Yr or 250,000 
Powertrain

Griffith Ford Seguin, 
or any Authorized 

Ford Dealership

Red McCombs

1880 W. IH-10, 
Seguin, TX 78155

8333 I-10 Frontage 
Rd., San Antonio, TX

2016 Versalift VST 
6600-1 Aerial

2017 Versalift 

Not Provided 1 Year
Versalift Southwest, 

LLC
Versalift Southwest

1200 Texas Central 
Parkway, Waco, TX 

76702

1200 Texas Central 
Parkway, Waco, TX 
Drive Service Picks 

Up vehicle at San 
Antonio

340 Days 310-360
Cab/Chassis TBA 4-15-17

TBA 4-15-17

No No
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 8, 2016

For: Purchase of Light, Medium, Heavy Duty 
Trucks, Vans and Heavy Equipment

6100007554 LD

Item Description QTY

10 DELETED:

11 Sprinter Van with Auxiliary AC Unit, Diesel: 1
Price Each:
Total:
Year, Make & Model Offered:
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE net HP): 
Warranty:
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:
Warranty Service Provider Facility 
Address:
Delivery:
Production Cut-off Date:
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date:

12 Mini Van (Cargo) 2
Price Each:
Total:
Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE net HP): 

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility 
Address:

Delivery:
Production Cut-off Date:

Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date:

Grapevine DCJ, LLC. Griffith Ford Seguin, 
LLC.

Gunn Chevrolet, LTD H & E Equipment 
Services

RDO Equipment Co. Rush Truck Center Silsbee Ford Vermeer Texas - 
Louisiana

Waukesha-Pearce 
Industries, Inc.

2601 William Tate 1880 W. IH-10 16550 IH 35 N. 5327 Tex -Con Rd. 19275 N. IH 35 8922 I.H 10 East 1211 US Hwy 96 N. 16593 IH-35 North 3740 S. E. Loop 410

Grapevine,                   
TX 76051

Seguin,                         
TX 78155

Selma,                          
TX 78154

San Antonio,                
TX 78220

New Braunfels,            
TX 78132

Converse,                     
TX 78109

Silsbee,                        
TX 77656

Selma,                          
TX 78154

San Antonio,                
TX 78222

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$23,332.00 $22,736.10 $21,411.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid $22,995.00 No Bid No Bid
$46,664.00 $45,472.20 $42,823.60 $45,990.00

2017 ram Promaster 
City

2017 Ford Transit 
Connect (57E)

2017 Chevrolet City 
Express LT 

2017 Ford Transit 
Connect

2.4 L, I 4, 178 hp Ford 2.5 L- DOHC I-4 
169 hp

LQA, 2.0 Liter Gas I4, 
131 HP 

* exception GVWR 
4751

Ford 2.5 L

3 yr. / 36,000 Mile, 
5yr/100,000 Mile 

Limited Powertrain

Basic 3 Yr/36,000 
miles, Powertrain 5 

Yr/ 60 000 Mile

3 Yr or 36K BTB. 5 Yr 
or 100K Powertrain

 36 Mo/36,000 Miles 
Bumper to Bumper,

Any Dodge Chrysler, 
Jeep, Ram Dealership

Griffith Ford Seguin, 
or any Authorized 

Ford Dealership

Gunn Chevrolet. LTD Red McCombs

Any Dodge Chrysler, 
Jeep, Ram Dealership

1880 W. IH-10, 
Seguin, TX 78155

16550 IH 35 N., 
Selma, TX 78154

8333 I-10, 
San Antonio, TX

120 Days 180 Days 110 Days 180-200 Days
June 2017 TBD 5/17 Start of 2017 

Production 9/17
4-15-17

Est. 4/15/17 TBD 5/17 4-15-17

No No No No
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 8, 2016

For: Purchase of Light, Medium, Heavy Duty 
Trucks, Vans and Heavy Equipment

6100007554 LD

Item Description QTY

13 1 Ton Cargo Van: 1
Price Each:
Total:
Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE net HP): 
Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:
Warranty Service Provider Facility 
Address:
Delivery:
Production Cut-off Date:
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date:

14 ½ Ton Full Size Regular Cab 4x2: 3
Price Each:
Total:
Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE net HP): 
Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility 
Address:

Delivery:
Production Cut-off Date:

Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date:

Payment Terms:

Grapevine DCJ, LLC. Griffith Ford Seguin, 
LLC.

Gunn Chevrolet, LTD H & E Equipment 
Services

RDO Equipment Co. Rush Truck Center Silsbee Ford Vermeer Texas - 
Louisiana

Waukesha-Pearce 
Industries, Inc.

2601 William Tate 1880 W. IH-10 16550 IH 35 N. 5327 Tex -Con Rd. 19275 N. IH 35 8922 I.H 10 East 1211 US Hwy 96 N. 16593 IH-35 North 3740 S. E. Loop 410

Grapevine,                   
TX 76051

Seguin,                         
TX 78155

Selma,                          
TX 78154

San Antonio,                
TX 78220

New Braunfels,            
TX 78132

Converse,                     
TX 78109

Silsbee,                        
TX 77656

Selma,                          
TX 78154

San Antonio,                
TX 78222

No Bid No Bid $25,880.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid $26,766.00 No Bid No Bid
$25,880.60 $26,766.00

2017 Chevrolet 
CG33405 Express 1 

Ton Cargo 
* Exception GVWR 

9600 lbs

2017 Ford Transit 350

GM L20 4.8 L, 295 HP Ford 3.7 L V6

3 Yr or 36K BTB. 5 Yr 
or 100K Powertrain

36 Mo/36,000 Miles 
Bumper to Bumper,

Gunn Chevrolet. LTD Red McCombs
16550 IH 35 N., 

Selma, TX 78154
8333 I-10, 

San Antonio, TX
110 Days 120-150 Days

2/17 4-15-17
2/17 4-15-17

No No

$21,531.00 $21,397.75 $21,157.57 No Bid No Bid No Bid $21,996.00 No Bid No Bid
$64,593.00 $64,193.25 $63,472.71 $65,988.00

2017 Ram 1500 
DSiL61, 

Bedliner/Hitch Delete

2016 Ford F150 Reg 
Cab

2017 Chevrolet 
CC15703, 2WD 1/2 

Ton Reg Cab

2017 Ford F150 Reg 
Cab

Dodge 3.6 L V6, 305 
Hp

Ford 3.5 Liter DOHC 
V6, 282 hp

GM LV3 V6, 285 HP 
Net

Ford 3.5 L V6

3 yr. / 36,000 Mile, 
5yr/100,000 Mile 

Limited Powertrain

Basic 3 Yr/36,000 
miles - Powertrain 5 

Yr/ 60 000 Mile

3 Yr or 36K BTB. 5 Yr 
or 100K Powertrain

36 Mo/36,000 Miles 
Bumper to Bumper,

Any Dodge Chrysler, 
Jeep, Ram Dealership

Griffith Ford Seguin, 
or any Authorized 

Ford Dealership

Gunn Chevrolet. LTD Red McCombs

Any Dodge Chrysler, 
Jeep, Ram Dealership

1880 W. IH-10, 
Seguin, TX 78155

16550 IH 35 N., 
Selma, TX 78154

8333 I-10, 
San Antonio, TX

75-90 Days 90 days 90-110 Days 120-150 Days
June 2017 7/15/2016 6/17 (2017 Start of 

Production 9/12/17)
4-15-17

Est. 4/15/17 7/14/2016 6/17 4-15-17

Not Provided No No No

2% Net 10 Days Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
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