City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 11, 2016
For: Horticultural Supplies & Tools for SAT Adams Wholesale Supply, Inc  |A.M Leonard BWI - San Antonio KBW Supply
6100007458 MB 1434 E. Bitters Rd. 241 Fox Dr. 10600 Sentinel 102 N 13th St
Annual
Item Description Estimated |San Antonio, Piqua, San Antonio, Donna,
Quantity [TX 78216 OH 45356 TX, 78217 TX 78537
la Fafard Red Bag or approved equal 336 cu.ft
Unit Price/ cu.ft $5.4607 No Bid $4.27 $6.47
Total Cost $1,834.80 $1,434.72 $2,173.92
Product# 8023028 (AWSI#FF2) FA2B 2392668CFL0028P
Product name: Fafard Red Bag Fafard 2B Sunshine Mvp
Cu.ft per bag: 2.8 cu. ft./bag 2.8 cu. ft./bag 2.8 cu. ft./bag
1b Ferti-lome Peat Moss or approved equal 342 cu.ft No Bid
Unit Price/cu.ft. $4.2079 $3.41 $3.93
Total Cost $1,439.10 $1,166.22 $1,344.06
Product# 02775 (AWSI#LA02775) FLO2775 02775
Product name: Ferti-lome Peat Moss Ferti-lome Peatmoss FL Peat Moss
Cu.ft per bag: 3.8 cu. ft./bag 3.8 cu. ft./bag 3.8 cu. ft./bag
1c Landspapers pride 4-Way Mix- Wholesale- blend of organic 240 cu.ft
materials or approved equal
Unit Price/cu.ft. $2.235 No Bid $1.75 $1.76
Total Cost $536.40 $420.00 $422.40
Product# 2-42-02 (AWSI#LP24202) KULSMX 2-55-02
. Landscapers pride Landscape Landscaper pride 4 way mix LP Soil Conditioner
Product name: Mix
Cu.ft per bag: 2 cu.ft./ bag 2 cu.ft./ bag 2 cu.ft./ bag
2a Carl Pool Blood Meal 20# or approved equal 800 Ibs
Unit Price/lb $1.9995 No Bid $1.37 No Bid
Total Cost $1,599.60 $1,096.00
Product# 52817 (AWSI#VE52817) FH32142
Product name: Carl Pool Blood Meal Hi Yield Blood Meal
Lbs per bag: 20Ibs./ bag 8Ibs./ bag
2b Maestro-Gro Rose Glo 6-8-4 30# or approved equal 225 Ibs
Unit Price/lb $0.733 No Bid $0.62 No Bid
Total Cost $164.93 $139.50
Product# MG68430 (AWSI#MG68430) NAMROSE30
Product name: Maestro-Gro Rose Glo 6-8-4 Maestro-Gro Rose Glo
Lbs per bag: 30lbs./bag 30lbs./bag
2c Total Gro 20+20+20 ALL PURPOSE 25# or approved equal 500 Ibs
Unit Price/lb $1.5996 $1.419 $1.02 $1.26
Total Cost $799.80 $709.50 $510.00 $630.00
Product# AWSI#TG202020 G202020 PR200 Peters 99290
) Total Gro 20-20-20 All Purpose Peter's Professional ICL Gen Purpose Peters 20-20-20GP
Product name:
Lbs per bag: 25lbs./bag 25lbs./bag 25lbs./bag 25lbs./bag
2d Multicotel4-14-16 50# or approved equal 2000 Ibs
Unit Price/lb $1.1758 No Bid $0.65 $1.24
Total Cost $2,351.60 $1,300.00 $2,480.00
Product# 3119014(AWSI#HA1597) RI51 Everris 90550
Product name: Multicote14-14-16 BCF-Slo-cote 14-14-14 Osmocote 14-14-14
Lbs per bag: 50lbs./bag 50lbs./bag 50lbs./bag
2e Agritab 20-10-5 21 gram tablet or approved equal 5000 tablets
Unit Price/tab $0.11398 $0.105 $0.073 $0.091
Total Cost $569.90 $525.00 $365.00 $455.00
Product# P101 (AWSI#AS101) LPT21 0S90026 Everris 90026
. Agritab 20-10-5 21 gram tablet Leonard Fertilizer Tabs 20-10-5, 20-10-5 ICL Agriform 21 gram
Product name: 21 grams
Tablets per box: 500tablets/box 500tablets/box 500tablets/box 500tablets/box
2f NutriStar Crape Myrtle 25# or approved equal 375 Ibs
Unit Price/lb $1.278 No Bid $1.00 No Bid
Total Cost $479.25 $375.00
Product# AWSI#NPCM25 RINCM25
Product name: NutriStar Crape Myrtle same
Lbs per bag: 25Ibs./bag 25Ibs./bag
29 American plant food 15-0-5 2%FE&TP 50# or approved equal 4000 Ibs
Unit Price/lb $0.2742 No Bid $0.17 No Bid
Total Cost $1,096.80 $680.00
Product# AWSI#AF15010 RI795
Product name: American plant food 15-0-10 15-5-10 2% APF
Lbs per bag: 50Ibs./bag 50lbs./bag
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For: Horticultural Supplies & Tools for SAT Adams Wholesale Supply, Inc  |A.M Leonard BWI - San Antonio KBW Supply
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Annual
Item Description Estimated [San Antonio, Piqua, San Antonio, Donna,
Quantity [TX 78216 OH 45356 TX, 78217 TX 78537
3a Merit .5 G Insecticide 30# or approved equal 300 Ibs
Unit Price/lb $1.333 $1.416 $0.73 No Bid
Total Cost $399.90 $424.80 $219.00
Product# AWSI#MCMT30 Merit BYTP 3843894
Product name: Merit .5G Insecticide Merit 0.5G Insecticide Zenith
Lbs per bag: 30lbs./bag 30lbs./bag 30lbs./bag
3b Snapshot 2.5TG 50# or approved equal 1500Ibs
Unit Price/lb $1.6998 $2.0398 $1.63 $1.93
Total Cost $2,549.70 $3,059.70 $2,445.00 $2,895.00
Product# AWSI#MCSNAP50 SS50 EL20120 AELSNAP DG
Product name: Snapshot Snapshot same Snapshot DG
Lbs per bag: 50lbs./bag 50Ibs./bag 50lbs./bag 25Ibs./bag
3c Monterey Sluggo Plus 10# or approved equal 150lbs
Unit Price/lb $5.346 $4.4990 $4.60 No Bid
Total Cost $801.90 $674.85 $690.00
Product# LG6585 (AW SI#MOLG6585) 6510 ZZMY6580
Product name: Monterey Sluggo Plus Sluggo Snail &Slug Bait Sluggo Plus
Lbs per bag: 10lbs./bag 10lbs./bag 5lbs/bags
3d Deadline Raintough 3# or approved equal 90Ibs
Unit Price/lb $3.33 No Bid $2.09 No Bid
Total Cost $299.70 $188.10
Product# 100099015 (AW SI#MC703) FH32070
Product name: Deadline Raintough Hi Yield bug & snail
Lbs per bag: 3Ibs./bag 2.5Ibs./bag
3e Hi-Yield 55% Malathion Insect Spray or approved equal 5gals
Unit Price/gal $51.57 $51.99 $42.00 $53.60
Total Cost $257.85 $259.95 $210.00 $268.00
Product# 31083(AWSI#VPG31083) Malathion-5E FH31083 82004466
i o .
) Hi-Yield 55% Malathion Insect Malathion-5E insecticide CS Malathion 57%
Product name: Spray same
Gal per container: 1gal./container 1gal./container 1gal./container 1gal./container
3f Syngenta Fusilade 1l 24.5% or approved equal 2qts
Unit Price/qt $77.50 $96.99 $58.25 $69.96
Total Cost $155.00 $193.98 $116.50 $139.92
Product# AWSI#MCFTO32 FUS2 SY3215 73215
. Fuilade Il Turf and Ornament .
0,
Product name: Syngenta Fusilade Il 24.5% Post Emergent same Syngenta Fusilade Il
Quart per container: 1qt/container 1qt/container 1qt/container 1qgt/container
4a Corona 1" Bypass Pruner or approved equal 12
Unit Price/Ea $22.11 $22.49 $16.00 $23.58
Total Cost $265.32 $269.88 $192.00 $282.96
Product# BP3180(AWSI#CCBP3180) 8oco CRBP3180 BP3138
Product name: Corona 1" Bypass Pruner Corona Pruner, 1" Corona 1" Bypass Pruner Corona 3138
4b Corona 10.5" Forged Hedge shear or approved equal 6
Unit Price/Ea $45.87 $46.49 $17.15 No Bid
Total Cost $275.22 $278.94 $102.90
Product# AH6970 (AWSI#CCAH6970) AH6970 (AWSI#CCAH6970) CRAH4250
Corona Forged Head Shear Corona 10.5" blade hedge
Product name: 10.5" shear, 26.5" overall same
4c Ettore Nifty Nabber Tools 36" or approved equal 15
Unit Price/Ea $19.95 $17.99 $32.00 No Bid
Total Cost $299.25 $269.85 $480.00
Product# 49036 (AWSI#STNN9O0) 361PS 36" Nifty Nabber
Product name: Ettore Nifty Nabber Tools 36" Pik Stik classic pick-up tool, 36
4d Corona Transplanter with Narrow Blade or approved equal 12
Unit Price/Ea $4.52 $5.15 $2.50 No Bid
Total Cost $54.24 $61.80 $30.00
Product# CT3020(AWSI#CCCT3020) AT20 CRCT3020I
Corona Transplanter with| Leonard Transplanter cast alum same

Product name:

Narrow Blade

w/ gel arip
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de Flex-tech 5/8" x 100' Green hose MxF or approved equal 15
Unit Price/Ea $59.99 $54.25 $34.15 $88.60
Total Cost $899.85 $813.75 $512.25 $1,329.00
Product ARTW6256R100MF(AWGS||?#1A(;|;)I Flex58100 AASNCG58100 12303 Dramm
oroduct name: Flex-tech 5/8" x 100" Green T\ziﬁ Apex Flexalloy Ho;:zlirfgg Swan 5/8x100 Dramm color storm Hose
4f Dramm 30" Color Mark Rain Wands or approved equal 12
Unit Price/Ea $27.99 $26.99 $10.50 No Bid
Total Cost $335.88 $323.88 $126.00
Product# 10-10000 (AWSI#DM1010000) CM51 DM1010012
Dramm 30" Color Mark Rain] Dramm 30" Color Mark Water same
Product name: Wands Wands
4 Corona Folding pruning saw 10.5" Blade with wood handle or 6
9 approved equal
Unit Price/Ea $11.48 $20.75 $19.50 $38.69
Total Cost $68.88 $124.50 $117.00 $232.14
Product# PS4050 (AW SI#CCPS4050) RS7265 ZZCRRS7060 64670
Corona 10.5" Folding saw wood Corona Razor Tooth Folding Berger 9" Folding Saw
Product name: handle Saw, 10"
4h Truper Scoop-aluminum #14 D- Handle or approved equal 8
Unit Price/Ea $36.99 $41.99 $19.75 No Bid
Total Cost $295.92 $335.92 $158.00
Product# 31294 (AWSIH#TTPALY14) AMA12 BOTVT707707
Truper aluminum Scoop- #14 D Leonard Aluminum Scoop
Product name: handle Shovel Bond Terra Verde
4 Corona Leaf rake 19" or approved equal 12
Unit Price/Ea $13.44 $9.69 $9.50 $14.34
Total Cost $161.28 $116.28 $114.00 $172.08
Product# RK62061 (AWSI#CCRK62061) PSR24 CRRK24003 RK62061
Product name: Corona Leaf rake 19" Leonard Poly Steel Rake, 22" Corona Rake 19" 25 tine leaf rake
4j Garage Broom 24" or approved equal 15
Unit Price/Ea $22.99 $36.49 $33.50 $44.10
Total Cost $344.85 $547.35 $502.50 $661.50
Productt 1424(AWSI#MB1424) $2,424.00 MI82624 BM 61002
Magnolia Brush 24" Palmyra Leonard Broom 24" w/ Steel 24" push Broom
Product name: Garage Broom handle Midwest
4k .o 18
Corona 32" High-Performance Orchard lopper or approved equal
Unit Price/Ea $56.53 $57.89 $21.00 $38.44
Total Cost $1,017.54 $1,042.02 $378.00 $691.92
Product# AL8462 (AWSI#CCAL8462) WL6450 CRFL3470 SL6500
Product name: performancecg:gt?:rfjolrgsgekr"gg" corenaforged C|aSSI»:)Cp|SZ|?2§ 32" Forged SD Lopper
4l Truper 4 tine forged Cultivator - fiberglass handle or approved 15
equal
Unit Price/Ea $19.99 $35.99 $11.15 $36.16
Total Cost $299.85 $539.85 $167.25 $542.40
Product# 30030 (AWSI#TTCULF) SC4 CRCV20004 CV70004 Corona
Truper 4 tine forged Cultivator Cultivator, 4 tines, union orona cultivator
Product name: w/ fiberglass handle Razorback prong
Truper 15 Gauge tempered steel blade long handle round point
4m 15
Shovel or approved equal
Unit Price/Ea $12.99 $18.99 $11.00 No Bid
Total Cost $194.85 $284.85 $165.00
Product# 31184 (AWSI#TTPRLE) AMLF CRSS26020
Truper 5 gauge tempered steel|{Leonard closed back round point Corona shovel
Product name: blade long handle round point shovel
4n DeWitt 10’ x 12’ 80% woven shade tarp or approved equal 8
Unit Price/Ea $55.99 $33.60 $48.25 No Bid
Total Cost $447.92 $268.80 $386.00
Product# WT10 (AWSI#DWWT10) Shade80 WT10X12
DeWitt 10’ x 12° 80% woven Custom woven shade, 80% .
Dewitt
Product name: shade tarp shade
40 Chapin 63900 4 gallon self-cleaning backpack sprayer or 8
approved equal
Unit Price/Ea $109.99 $106.75 $85.00 No Bid
Total Cost $879.92 $854.00 $680.00
Product# 63900 (AWSI#CI163900) $63,900.00 CH63900
Chapin 63900 4 gal self| Chapin jetclean commercial, 4
. same
Product name: cleaning back pack sprayer gal
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4p Truper 5 tine Manure Fork or approved equal 15
Unit Price/Ea $28.99 $31.99 $25.90 $48.52
Total Cost $434.85 $479.85 $388.50 $727.80
Product# 30314 (AWSI#TTBPJ5E) AMF6 MI149276 Corona FK72005
Product name: Truper 5 tine Manure Fork Leonard Manure Fork 6 tine Midwest Manure Fork Five Tine
4q Burlap square 8’ x 8’ or approved equal 20
Unit Price/Ea $5.75 $35.99 $1.00 No Bid
Total Cost $115.00 $719.80 $90.40
Product# L96(AWSI#DWL96) 9696U PUNBG6
Product name: Burlap square 8 x 8 Plain Burlap squares 96"x96" 6x250 Bulk Dewitt
5a Bermuda Hulled - Common 50# or approved equal 1750lbs
Unit Price/lb $5.78 No Bid $4.10 $6.5600
Total Cost $10,115.00 $7,175.00 $11,480.00
Product# HB50 (DK6740) FS20 non-coated Excell 95/85
Product name: Hulled Bermuda - Common Hulled Valley Seed Hulled Bermuda
Lbs per bag: 50Ibs./bag 50lbs./bag 50lbs./bag
5b Turf Sense Fescue 50# or approved equal 1750lbs
Unit Price/lb $1.2398 No Bid $1.06 No Bid
Total Cost $2,169.65 $1,855.00
Product# F50 ( AWSI#DKF50) FSTUS
Product name: Turf Sense Fescue Turf five Star
Lbs per bag: 50lbs./bag 50lbs./bag
5c Top Flight Perrenial Rye Grass 50# or approved equal 1750lbs
Unit Price/lb $1.3998 No Bid $1.06 No Bid
Total Cost $2,449.65 $1,855.00
Product# TF50 (AWSI#DFTF50) FS934
Product name: Top Flight Perrenial Rye Grass Futura 2,000
Lbs per bag: 50lbs./bag 50lbs./bag
Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30




