
City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 2, 2016

For: Auto Light Duty Trucks Drums & Brake Parts Carlisle Auto Air Full Service Auto 

Parts

Genuine Parts 

Company

North Park Lincoln O'Reilly Automotive 

Enterprises LLC                   

dba O'Reilly Auto 

Parts

Poppe Automotive 

Warehouse

Westway Ford

6100007380 AJ 6411 San Pedro 4737 Broom Street 6374 Rittiman Rd 9207 San Pedro Ave 233 S. Patterson 716 S. Frio Street 801 W. Airport Frwy

Item

                                                                                                       

Description

Estimated 

Annual 

Quantity

San Antonio,                                  

TX 78216                                          

San Antonio,                                  

TX 78217                                           

San Antonio, 

TX 78218

San Antonio, 

TX 78216

Springfield, 

MO 65802

San Antonio, 

TX 78207

Irving, 

TX 75062

1 Master Cylinders 

A Percent of discount offered 35%

AC Delco 50%; 

Motorcraft 45% 30% Cost + 8% 41% or better 40% 40%

B Catalog/List Title and/or Number Computer printouts

Napa Master 

Cylinders (Cardone) FPS-3642 N/A online DOR-7380 FPS3642/turboii.com

C

Price schedule column on which discount is based 

(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.) List Price Jobber Cost list Jobber list

D Date of Price Schedule 4/1/2016 4/2016 4-1-16 N/A online 4/1/16 4-1-16

E Warranty

24 months/24,000 

miles 36 months

2 year replacement/  

unlimited mileage limited lifetime 2 yr 2 year unlimited

B Specified Items - Master Cylinders

1 Manufacturer: AC Delco/GM 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Part Number:  19209269

Manufacturer Offered: Dorman

AC Delco,       OEM 

Part Napa (Cardone) Dorman

Part number offered: M630034 174-780 P3509 M630034

Net Price $68.18 $185.46 $46.23 $40.01

Extended Price $272.72 $741.84 $184.92 $160.04

Prompt Payment Discount 0% 2% 2% 2%

Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $272.72 $727.00 $181.22 $156.84

2 Manufacturer: AC Delco/GM 4 No Bid No Bid

Part Number: 19209325

Manufacturer Offered: Dorman

AC Delco,       OEM 

Part Napa (Cardone) Dorman Delco

Part number offered: M630826 174-1169 P5203 M630826 19209325

Net Price $110.93 $126.28 $69.10 $73.41 $131.54

Extended Price $443.72 $505.12 $276.40 $293.64 $526.16

Prompt Payment Discount 0% 2% 2% 2% 0%

Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $443.72 $495.02 $270.87 $287.77 $526.16

3 Manufacturer: Raybesto 3 No Bid No Bid

Part Number:  MC390183

Manufacturer Offered: Dorman

AC Delco,       OEM 

Part Napa (Cardone) Brake Best Dorman

Part number offered: M390183 18M1755 P3242 10-2690 M390183

Net Price $56.43 $41.79 $24.66 $31.55 $31.18

Extended Price $169.29 $125.37 $73.98 $94.65 $93.54

Prompt Payment Discount 0% 2% 2% 2% 2%

Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $169.29 $122.86 $72.50 $92.76 $91.67

4 Manufacturer: Motorcraft/Ford 5

Part Number:  3F1Z2140AA

Manufacturer Offered: Dorman Motorcraft Napa (Cardone) Brake Best Dorman Ford

Part number offered: M390370 BRMC 18 P3665 3F1Z2140AA 10-3114 M390370 3F122140AA

Net Price $46.11 $119.90 $34.05 $141.26 $39.22 $27.08 $130.80

Extended Price $230.55 $599.50 $170.25 $706.30 $196.10 $135.40 $654.00

Prompt Payment Discount 0% 2% 2% 0% 2% 2% 0%

Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $230.55 $587.51 $166.85 $706.30 $192.18 $132.69 $654.00
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 2, 2016

For: Auto Light Duty Trucks Drums & Brake Parts Carlisle Auto Air Full Service Auto 

Parts

Genuine Parts 

Company

North Park Lincoln O'Reilly Automotive 

Enterprises LLC                   

dba O'Reilly Auto 

Parts

Poppe Automotive 

Warehouse

Westway Ford

6100007380 AJ 6411 San Pedro 4737 Broom Street 6374 Rittiman Rd 9207 San Pedro Ave 233 S. Patterson 716 S. Frio Street 801 W. Airport Frwy

Item

                                                                                                       

Description

Estimated 

Annual 

Quantity

San Antonio,                                  

TX 78216                                          

San Antonio,                                  

TX 78217                                           

San Antonio, 

TX 78218

San Antonio, 

TX 78216

Springfield, 

MO 65802

San Antonio, 

TX 78207

Irving, 

TX 75062

2 Wheel Cylinders

A Percent of discount offered 40%

Centric 60%; 

Motorcraft 45%; AC 

Delco 50% 40% 41% or better 40% 40%

B Catalog/List Title and/or Number Computer Printout Napa (Cardone) N/A online DOR-7380 FPS3642/turboii.com

C

Price schedule column on which discount is based 

(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.) List Price Jobber list Jobber list

D Date of Price Schedule 4/1/2016 4/2016 N/A online 4/1/16 4-1-16

E Warranty

24,000 miles/24 

months 12 months

1 year limited 

warranty 2 yr 2 year unlimited

B Specified Items - Wheel Cylinders

1 Manufacturer: Raybestos 15 No Bid No Bid

Part Number:  WC37857

Manufacturer Offered: Beck/Arnley Centric Napa Brake Best Dorman

Part number offered: 072-8880 135.61041 37857 WC37857 W37857

Net Price $9.20 $5.76 $4.86 $9.49 $4.39

Extended Price $138.00 $86.40 $72.90 $142.35 $65.85

Prompt Payment Discount 0% 2% 2% 2% 2%

Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $138.00 $84.67 $71.44 $139.50 $64.53

2 Manufacturer: Raybestos 7 No Bid No Bid

Part Number:  WC370061

Manufacturer Offered: Beck/Arnley Centric Napa Brake Best Dorman

Part number offered: 135.65018 370061 WC370061 W370061

Net Price $10.07 $7.60 $5.30 $12.84 $5.88

Extended Price $70.49 $53.20 $37.10 $89.88 $41.16

Prompt Payment Discount 0% 2% 2% 2% 2%

Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $70.49 $52.14 $36.36 $88.08 $40.34

3 Manufacturer: AC Delco/GM 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Part Number:  19213348

Manufacturer Offered: Dorman AC Delco OEM Napa Dorman

Part number offered: W610121 172-1662 370148 W610121

Net Price $16.30 $55.24 $8.40 $9.00

Extended Price $48.90 $165.72 $25.20 $27.00

Prompt Payment Discount 0% 2% 2% 2%

Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $48.90 $162.41 $24.70 $26.46

4 Manufacturer: Motorcraft/Ford 3 No Bid

Part Number:  3L5Z2262DB

Manufacturer Offered: Dorman Motorcraft Napa Brake Best Dorman Ford

Part number offered: W370061 BRWC39A 370061 WC370061 W370061 3L52-2262DB

Net Price $13.46 $22.24 $5.30 $12.84 $5.88 $63.05

Extended Price $40.38 $66.72 $15.90 $38.52 $17.64 $189.15

Prompt Payment Discount 0% 2% 2% 2% 2% 0%

Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $40.38 $65.39 $15.58 $37.75 $17.29 $189.15
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 2, 2016

For: Auto Light Duty Trucks Drums & Brake Parts Carlisle Auto Air Full Service Auto 

Parts

Genuine Parts 

Company

North Park Lincoln O'Reilly Automotive 

Enterprises LLC                   

dba O'Reilly Auto 

Parts

Poppe Automotive 

Warehouse

Westway Ford

6100007380 AJ 6411 San Pedro 4737 Broom Street 6374 Rittiman Rd 9207 San Pedro Ave 233 S. Patterson 716 S. Frio Street 801 W. Airport Frwy

Item

                                                                                                       

Description

Estimated 

Annual 

Quantity

San Antonio,                                  

TX 78216                                          

San Antonio,                                  

TX 78217                                           

San Antonio, 

TX 78218

San Antonio, 

TX 78216

Springfield, 

MO 65802

San Antonio, 

TX 78207

Irving, 

TX 75062

3 Brake Hoses

A Percent of discount offered 35%

AC Delco 50%; 

Motorcraft 45%; 

Centric 60% 40% Cost + 8% 41% or better 40% 40%

B Catalog/List Title and/or Number Computer printouts Napa FPS-3642 N/A online SSH-7380 FPS3642

C

Price schedule column on which discount is based 

(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.) List Price Jobber Cost list Jobber list

D Date of Price Schedule 4/1/2016 4/2016 4-1-16 N/A online 4/1/16 4-1-16

E Warranty 24/24 Limited Lifetime

2 year/unlimited 

mileage

1 year limited 

warranty 2 yr 2 year unlimited

B Specified Items - Brake Hoses

1 Manufacturer: Motorcraft/Ford 3 No Bid

Part Number:  AL1Z2282A

Manufacturer Offered: Dorman Motorcraft Napa Sun Sony Ford

Part number offered: H621010 BRHR93 610019 AL1Z2282A 2201915 AL1Z2282-A

Net Price $25.25 $18.47 $11.94 $21.88 $12.25 $20.26

Extended Price $75.75 $55.41 $35.82 $65.64 $36.75 $60.78

Prompt Payment Discount 0% 2% 2% 0% 2% 0%

Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $75.75 $54.30 $35.10 $65.64 $36.02 $60.78

2 Manufacturer: Toyota/OEM 3 No Bid No Bid

Part Number:  90947A2016

Manufacturer Offered: Dorman Centric Napa Brake Best Sun Sony

Part number offered: H621096 150.44141 610105 BH621096 2206712

Net Price $13.85 $11.60 $8.46 $21.69 $10.62

Extended Price $41.55 $34.80 $25.38 $65.07 $31.86

Prompt Payment Discount 0% 2% 2% 2% 2%

Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $41.55 $34.10 $24.87 $63.77 $31.22

3 Manufacturer: AC Delco/GM 4 No Bid No Bid

Part Number:  19173262

Manufacturer Offered: Dorman AC Delco Napa Sun Sony Delco

Part number offered: H38184 18J293 38622 2203066 19173262

Net Price $15.27 $12.14 $9.83 $8.64 $12.64

Extended Price $61.08 $48.56 $39.32 $34.56 $50.56

Prompt Payment Discount 0% 2% 2% 2% 0%

Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $61.08 $47.59 $38.53 $33.87 $50.56

4 Manufacturer: AC Delco/GM 4 No Bid No Bid

Part Number:  19173263

Manufacturer Offered: Dorman AC Delco Napa Sun Sony Delco

Part number offered: H38185 18J294 38623 2203067 19173263

Net Price $15.27 $12.39 $9.83 $8.64 $12.90

Extended Price $61.08 $49.56 $39.32 $34.56 $51.60

Prompt Payment Discount 0% 2% 2% 2% 0%

Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $61.08 $48.57 $38.53 $33.87 $51.60
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 2, 2016

For: Auto Light Duty Trucks Drums & Brake Parts Carlisle Auto Air Full Service Auto 

Parts

Genuine Parts 

Company

North Park Lincoln O'Reilly Automotive 

Enterprises LLC                   

dba O'Reilly Auto 

Parts

Poppe Automotive 

Warehouse

Westway Ford

6100007380 AJ 6411 San Pedro 4737 Broom Street 6374 Rittiman Rd 9207 San Pedro Ave 233 S. Patterson 716 S. Frio Street 801 W. Airport Frwy

Item

                                                                                                       

Description

Estimated 

Annual 

Quantity

San Antonio,                                  

TX 78216                                          

San Antonio,                                  

TX 78217                                           

San Antonio, 

TX 78218

San Antonio, 

TX 78216

Springfield, 

MO 65802

San Antonio, 

TX 78207

Irving, 

TX 75062

4 Calipers

A Percent of discount offered 35%

Motorcraft 45%; 

Centric 60%; Mopar 

35% 30% Cost +8% 41% or better

UCX-40% /          FMP-

20% 40%

B Catalog/List Title and/or Number

Advantage price sheet; A-

1 Cardone

Centric Computer 

Printout - Mopar - 

Moto

Napa Brakes 

(Cardone) FPS-3642 N/A online

UCX-7380 /              

FMP-7380 FPS3642

C

Price schedule column on which discount is based 

(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.) List price List Price Jobber Cost list Jobber / Jobber list

D Date of Price Schedule September 15, 2015 4/1/2016 4/2016 4-1-16 N/A online 4/1/16; 4/1/16 4-1-16

E Warranty 24/24 Limited Lifetime

2 year/unlimited 

mileage limited lifetime 2 yr / 2 yr 2 year unlimited

B Specified Items - Calipers

1a Manufacturer: AC Delco/GM 4 No Bid No Bid

Part Number:  15904195 / with brackets

Manufacturer Offered: Cardone/A-1 Centric (22842351) Napa (Cardone) Brake Best UCX

Part number offered: 18-4918A 141.66051 SE5469A 18B4918 10-4439S

Net Price $103.90 $47.12 $40.98 $50.78 $30.79

Extended Price $415.60 $188.48 $163.92 $203.12 $123.16

Prompt Payment Discount 0% 2% 2% 2% 2%

Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $415.60 $184.71 $160.64 $199.06 $120.70

1b Manufacturer: AC Delco/GM 4 No Bid No Bid

Part Number:  15904195 / without brackets

Manufacturer Offered: Cardone/A-1 AC Delco new Napa (Cardone) Brake Best UCX

Part number offered: 18B4918 172-2600 SE5469 18-4918 10-4439S

Net Price $108.78 $123.60 $36.32 $38.99 $30.79

Extended Price $435.12 $494.40 $145.28 $155.96 $123.16

Prompt Payment Discount 0% 2% 2% 2% 2%

Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $435.12 $484.51 $142.37 $152.84 $120.70

2a Manufacturer: Motorcraft/Ford 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Part Number:  DG1Z2B120A / with brackets

Manufacturer Offered: Cardone A-1 Centric Napa (Cardone) Motorcraft

Part number offered: 18B5215 141.61173 SE6020A BRCP208

Net Price $100.08 $55.92 $54.42 $31.19

Extended Price $400.32 $223.68 $217.68 $124.76

Prompt Payment Discount 0% 2% 2% 2%

Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $400.32 $219.21 $213.33 $122.26

2b Manufacturer: Motorcraft/Ford 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Part Number:  DG1Z2B120A / without brackets

Manufacturer Offered: Cardone A-1 Motorcraft new Napa (Cardone) Motorcraft

Part number offered: 18-5215 BRCF208 SE60204 BRCP208

Net Price $64.39 $25.70 $54.42 $31.19

Extended Price $257.56 $102.80 $217.68 $124.76

Prompt Payment Discount 0% 2% 2% 2%

Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $257.56 $100.74 $213.33 $122.26

3a Manufacturer: Toyota/OEM 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Part Number:  477300C030 / with brackets

Manufacturer Offered: Cardone A-1 Centric Napa (Cardone) UCX

Part number offered: 19-3270 141.44269 SE3825 10-9394S

Net Price $181.03 $80.28 $70.77 $48.87

Extended Price $543.09 $240.84 $212.31 $146.61

Prompt Payment Discount 0% 2% 2% 2%

Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $543.09 $236.02 $208.06 $143.68
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 2, 2016

For: Auto Light Duty Trucks Drums & Brake Parts Carlisle Auto Air Full Service Auto 

Parts

Genuine Parts 

Company

North Park Lincoln O'Reilly Automotive 

Enterprises LLC                   

dba O'Reilly Auto 

Parts

Poppe Automotive 

Warehouse

Westway Ford

6100007380 AJ 6411 San Pedro 4737 Broom Street 6374 Rittiman Rd 9207 San Pedro Ave 233 S. Patterson 716 S. Frio Street 801 W. Airport Frwy

Item

                                                                                                       

Description

Estimated 

Annual 

Quantity

San Antonio,                                  

TX 78216                                          

San Antonio,                                  

TX 78217                                           

San Antonio, 

TX 78218

San Antonio, 

TX 78216

Springfield, 

MO 65802

San Antonio, 

TX 78207

Irving, 

TX 75062

3b Manufacturer: Toyota/OEM 3 No bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Part Number:  477300C030 / without brackets

Manufacturer Offered: Napa (Cardone) Brake Best UCX

Part number offered: SE3825 19-3274 10-9394S

Net Price $70.77 $87.84 $48.87

Extended Price $212.31 $263.52 $146.61

Prompt Payment Discount 2% 2% 2%

Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $208.06 $258.25 $143.68

4a Manufacturer: A-1 Cardone 3 No Bid No Bid

Part Number:  18B4988 / with brackets

Manufacturer Offered: Cardone A-1 Centric Napa (Cardone) Brake Best UCX

Part number offered: 18B4988 141.62160 SE5539A 18B4988 10-4334S

Net Price $114.60 $42.60 $43.76 $56.86 $30.18

Extended Price $343.80 $127.80 $131.28 $170.58 $90.54

Prompt Payment Discount 0% 2% 2% 2% 2%

Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $343.80 $125.24 $128.65 $167.17 $88.73

4b Manufacturer: A-1 Cardone 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Part Number:  18B4988 / without brackets

Manufacturer Offered: Cardone A-1 Napa (Cardone) Brake Best UCX

Part number offered: 18-4988 SE5539 18-4988 10-4334S

Net Price $109.77 $40.79 $43.09 $30.18

Extended Price $329.31 $122.37 $129.27 $90.54

Prompt Payment Discount 0% 2% 2% 2%

Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $329.31 $119.92 $126.68 $88.73

5 Brake Shoes 

A Percent of discount offered 35%

Centric 60%; Bendix 

60% 20% Cost +8% 41% or better

Bendix-40% /     FMP-

20% 40%

B Catalog/List Title and/or Number

Computer Printout Napa Brakes FPS-3642 N/A online Ben-7380 /         FMP-

7380

FPS 3642 / Parts 

Online

C Price schedule column on which discount is based 

(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.) List Price Jobber Cost Plus list Jobber / Jobber List / Retail

D Date of Price Schedule 4/1/2016 4/2016 4-1-16 N/A online 4/1/16; 4/1/16 4-1-16

E Warranty 24/24 Limited Lifetime

2 year/unlimited 

mileage

limited lifetime 

warranty 1 yr / 2 yr 2 year unlimited

B Specified Items - Brakes Shoes 

1 Manufacturer: Bendix 25 No Bid No Bid

Part Number:  781

Manufacturer Offered: Auto Extra Centric Napa Brake Best Bendix

Part number offered: AXS 781 111.07810 UP10781PB 781 781

Net Price $33.66 $19.96 $45.81 $21.26 $45.25

Extended Price $841.50 $499.00 $1,145.25 $531.50 $1,131.25

Prompt Payment Discount 0% 2% 2% 2% 2%

Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $841.50 $489.02 $1,122.35 $520.87 $1,108.63
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 2, 2016

For: Auto Light Duty Trucks Drums & Brake Parts Carlisle Auto Air Full Service Auto 

Parts

Genuine Parts 

Company

North Park Lincoln O'Reilly Automotive 

Enterprises LLC                   

dba O'Reilly Auto 

Parts

Poppe Automotive 

Warehouse

Westway Ford

6100007380 AJ 6411 San Pedro 4737 Broom Street 6374 Rittiman Rd 9207 San Pedro Ave 233 S. Patterson 716 S. Frio Street 801 W. Airport Frwy

Item

                                                                                                       

Description

Estimated 

Annual 

Quantity

San Antonio,                                  

TX 78216                                          

San Antonio,                                  

TX 78217                                           

San Antonio, 

TX 78218

San Antonio, 

TX 78216

Springfield, 

MO 65802

San Antonio, 

TX 78207

Irving, 

TX 75062

2 Manufacturer: Motorcraft/Ford 10 No Bid

Part Number:  6W1Z2N712A

Manufacturer Offered: Wagner Centric Napa Bendix Ford

Part number offered: PAB 920 111.08090 UP10920PB 6W1Z2N712A 920 6W1Z2N712A

Net Price $29.03 $13.73 $44.93 $109.07 $15.11 $106.04

Extended Price $290.30 $137.30 $449.30 $1,090.70 $151.10 $1,060.40

Prompt Payment Discount 0% 2% 2% 0% 2% 0%

Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $290.30 $134.55 $440.31 $1,090.70 $148.08 $1,060.40

3 Manufacturer: AC Delco/GM 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Part Number:  15016010

Manufacturer Offered: Napa GM

Part number offered: UP10784PB 15016010

Net Price $50.57 $75.99

Extended Price $151.71 $227.97

Prompt Payment Discount 2% 2%

Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $148.68 $223.41

4 Manufacturer: Bendix 8 No Bid No Bid

Part Number:  R599

Manufacturer Offered: Auto Extra Bendix Napa Bendix Bendix

Part number offered: AXS 599 R599 UP599R R599 BXAF599

Net Price $14.40 $33.51 $26.81 $27.07 $38.98

Extended Price $115.20 $268.08 $214.48 $216.56 $311.84

Prompt Payment Discount 0% 2% 2% 2% 0%

Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $115.20 $262.72 $210.19 $212.23 $311.84

6 Brake Rotors

A Percent of discount offered 35%

Motorcraft 45%; 

Centric 60%; Mopar 

35% 27% Cost +8% 41% or better 40% 40%

B Catalog/List Title and/or Number

Auto Extra Drums & 

Rotors Computer Printout Napa Brakes

FPS-3642 Price List 

April 1, 2016 N/A online BEN-7380

FPS3642/Parts 

Online

C

Price schedule column on which discount is based 

(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.) Jobber List Price Jobber Cost Plus list Jobber List/Retail

D Date of Price Schedule April 09 4/1/2016 4/2016 April 1, 2016 N/A online 4/1/16 4-1-16

E Warranty 24/24 12 months

2 year/unlimited 

mileage

2 year limited 

warranty 1 yr 2 year unlimited

B Specified Items - Brake Rotors

1 Manufacturer: Motorcraft/Ford 20 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Part Number:  3W1Z1125AB

Manufacturer Offered: Auto Extra Motorcraft Napa Bendix

Part number offered: AX 54103 BRRF266 48880110 PRT5326

Net Price $33.26 $98.26 $30.87 $24.92

Extended Price $665.20 $1,965.20 $617.40 $498.40

Prompt Payment Discount 0% 2% 2% 2%

Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $665.20 $1,925.90 $605.05 $488.43

2 Manufacturer: Bendix 147 No Bid

Part Number:  PRT5326

Manufacturer Offered: Auto Extra Centric Napa Brake Best Bendix Bendix

Part number offered: AX 54103 121-61072 48880110 680110RGS PRT-5326 BX145326

Net Price $33.26 $31.85 $30.87 $37.09 $24.92 $74.32

Extended Price $4,889.22 $4,681.95 $4,537.89 $5,452.23 $3,663.24 $10,925.04

Prompt Payment Discount 0% 2% 2% 2% 2% 0%

Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $4,889.22 $4,588.31 $4,447.13 $5,343.19 $3,589.98 $10,925.04
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 2, 2016

For: Auto Light Duty Trucks Drums & Brake Parts Carlisle Auto Air Full Service Auto 

Parts

Genuine Parts 

Company

North Park Lincoln O'Reilly Automotive 

Enterprises LLC                   

dba O'Reilly Auto 

Parts

Poppe Automotive 

Warehouse

Westway Ford

6100007380 AJ 6411 San Pedro 4737 Broom Street 6374 Rittiman Rd 9207 San Pedro Ave 233 S. Patterson 716 S. Frio Street 801 W. Airport Frwy

Item

                                                                                                       

Description

Estimated 

Annual 

Quantity

San Antonio,                                  

TX 78216                                          

San Antonio,                                  

TX 78217                                           

San Antonio, 

TX 78218

San Antonio, 

TX 78216

Springfield, 

MO 65802

San Antonio, 

TX 78207

Irving, 

TX 75062

3 Manufacturer: Volkswagen/OEM 3 No Bid No Bid

Part Number:  34431

Manufacturer Offered: Auto Extra Centric Napa Brake Best Bendix

Part number offered: AX 900 930 121.33057 48880798 PRT6086

Net Price $10.11 $15.86 $30.63 $17.85

Extended Price $30.33 $47.58 $91.89 $53.55

Prompt Payment Discount 2% 2% 2% 2%

Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $29.72 $46.63 $90.05 $52.48

4 Manufacturer: Mopar 7 No Bid No Bid

Part Number:  52009968AC

Manufacturer Offered: Auto Extra Mopar Napa Brake Best Bendix

Part number offered: AX 900 698 52009968AC 48880082 780082RGS PRT5381

Net Price $83.54 $85.80 $21.64 $24.49 $28.50

Extended Price $584.78 $600.60 $151.48 $171.43 $199.50

Prompt Payment Discount 0% 2% 2% 2% 2%

Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $584.78 $588.59 $148.45 $168.00 $195.51

7 Brake Pads

A Percent of discount offered

35% Centric 60%; 

Motorcraft 45%; 

Mopar 35%

25% Cost +8% 41% or better 40% 40%

B Catalog/List Title and/or Number

Auto Extra Advantage / 

Friction Computer Printout

Napa Brakes/    

Napa Fleet FPS-3642 N/A online BEN-7380 FPS3642

C

Price schedule column on which discount is based 

(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.) Suggested List List Price Jobber Cost list Jobber List

D Date of Price Schedule January 18, 2016 4/1/2016 4/2016 4-1-16 N/A online 4/1/16 4-1-16

E Warranty 24/24 24 months

2 year/unlimited 

mileage

limited lifetime 

warranty 1 yr 2 year unlimited

B Specified Items - Brake Pads

1 Manufacturer: Toyota/OEM 6 No Bid No Bid

Part Number:  044660C010

Manufacturer Offered: Auto Extra Centric Napa Brakes Brake Best Bendix

Part number offered: AXCD 1304 106.13040 558420X SC1304 CFC1304

Net Price $27.85 $29.66 $26.63 $28.23 $26.79

Extended Price $167.10 $177.96 $159.78 $169.38 $160.74

Prompt Payment Discount 0% 2% 2% 2% 2%

Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $167.10 $174.40 $156.58 $165.99 $157.53

2 Manufacturer: Mopar 3 No Bid No Bid

Part Number:  68052369AA

Manufacturer Offered: Wagner Mopar Napa Brakes Brake Best Bendix

Part number offered: QC 7455 68052369AA 558655X SC1455 CFC1629

Net Price $61.70 $84.50 $40.96 $35.33 $29.54

Extended Price $185.10 $253.50 $122.88 $105.99 $88.62

Prompt Payment Discount 0% 2% 2% 2% 2%

Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $185.10 $248.43 $120.42 $103.87 $86.85

3 Manufacturer: Motorcraft/Ford 14

Part Number:  8C2Z2200A

Manufacturer Offered: Wagner Motorcraft Napa Brakes Drums Brake Best Bendix Ford

Part number offered: MX 1328 BRF1329 558441M 8C2Z2200A SM1329 CFM1329 8C2Z2200A

Net Price $57.30 $36.65 $38.04 $43.18 $48.99 $28.50 $39.98

Extended Price $802.20 $513.10 $532.56 $604.52 $685.86 $399.00 $559.72

Prompt Payment Discount 0% 2% 2% 0% 2% 2% 0%

Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $802.20 $502.84 $521.91 $604.52 $672.14 $391.02 $559.72
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 2, 2016

For: Auto Light Duty Trucks Drums & Brake Parts Carlisle Auto Air Full Service Auto 

Parts

Genuine Parts 

Company

North Park Lincoln O'Reilly Automotive 

Enterprises LLC                   

dba O'Reilly Auto 

Parts

Poppe Automotive 

Warehouse

Westway Ford

6100007380 AJ 6411 San Pedro 4737 Broom Street 6374 Rittiman Rd 9207 San Pedro Ave 233 S. Patterson 716 S. Frio Street 801 W. Airport Frwy

Item

                                                                                                       

Description

Estimated 

Annual 

Quantity

San Antonio,                                  

TX 78216                                          

San Antonio,                                  

TX 78217                                           

San Antonio, 

TX 78218

San Antonio, 

TX 78216

Springfield, 

MO 65802

San Antonio, 

TX 78207

Irving, 

TX 75062

4 Manufacturer: Bendix 118 No Bid

Part Number:  MKD1367FM

Manufacturer Offered: Auto Extra Centric Napa Brake Best Bendix Bendix

Part number offered: AXED 1367 106.13630 5584-72X SC1363 MKD1367FM BXMKD367

Net Price $27.85 47.66 $35.11 $36.94 $33.85 $34.53

Extended Price $3,286.30 $5,623.88 $4,142.98 $4,358.92 $3,994.30 $4,074.54

Prompt Payment Discount 0% 2% 2% 2% 2% 0%

Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $3,286.30 $5,511.40 $4,060.12 $4,271.74 $3,914.41 $4,074.54

5 Manufacturer: Motorcraft/Ford 76 No Bid No Bid

Part Number:  DG1Z2001F

Manufacturer Offered: Wagner Motorcraft Napa Fleet Brake Best Bendix

Part number offered: MX 1611 A BRF1475 FT8855 C1611 MKD1611

Net Price $75.41 $36.65 $42.06 $35.36 $28.50

Extended Price $5,731.16 $2,785.40 $3,196.56 $2,687.36 $2,166.00

Prompt Payment Discount 0% 2% 2% 2% 2%

Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $5,731.16 $2,729.69 $3,132.63 $2,633.61 $2,122.68

6 Manufacturer: Motorcraft/Ford 49 No Bid No Bid

Part Number:  DG1Z2000B

Manufacturer Offered: Wagner Motorcraft Napa Fleet Brake Best Bendix

Part number offered: SX 1612 BRF1383 FT8825 SM1612 CFM1612

Net Price $40.59 $42.34 $42.07 $40.15 $28.50

Extended Price $1,988.91 $2,074.66 $2,061.43 $1,967.35 $1,396.50

Prompt Payment Discount 0% 2% 2% 2% 2%

Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $1,988.91 $2,033.17 $2,020.20 $1,928.00 $1,368.57

8 Brake Drums

A Percent of discount offered 35%

Centric 60%;       AC 

Delco 50%; 

Motorcraft 45% 27% Cost +8% 41% or better 40% 40%

B Catalog/List Title and/or Number

Auto Extra Drums & 

Rotors Computer Printout Napa Brake Drums FPS-3642 N/A online BEN-7380

Parts online / 

turboii.com

C

Price schedule column on which discount is based 

(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.) Jobber List Price Jobber Cost list Jobber List Retail

D Date of Price Schedule April 09, 2015 4/1/2016 4-2016 4-1-16 N/A online 4/1/16 4-1-16

E Warranty 24/24 12 months

2 year/unlimited 

mileage

2 year limited 

warranty 1  yr 2 year unlimited

B Specified Items -Brake Drums

1 Manufacturer: Bendix 5 No Bid

Part Number:  PDR0610

Manufacturer Offered: Auto Extra Centric Napa Brake Drums Brake Best Bendix Bendix

Part number offered: AX 8988 123.66028 440-1653 2585DGS PDR0610 BX140610

Net Price $35.22 $27.51 $19.94 $27.99 $21.77 $61.47

Extended Price $176.10 $137.55 $99.70 $139.95 $108.85 $307.35

Prompt Payment Discount 0% 2% 2% 2% 2% 0%

Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $176.10 $134.80 $97.71 $137.15 $106.67 $307.35

2 Manufacturer: Bendix 11 No Bid No Bid

Part Number:  PDR0800

Manufacturer Offered: Auto Extra Centric Napa Brake Drums Brake Best Bendix

Part number offered: AX80118 123.66044 440-1815 9764DGS PDR0800

Net Price $43.33 $39.96 $39.38 $51.09 $35.08

Extended Price $476.63 $439.56 $433.18 $561.99 $385.88

Prompt Payment Discount 0% 2% 2% 2% 2%

Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $476.63 $430.77 $424.52 $550.75 $378.16
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 2, 2016

For: Auto Light Duty Trucks Drums & Brake Parts Carlisle Auto Air Full Service Auto 

Parts

Genuine Parts 

Company

North Park Lincoln O'Reilly Automotive 

Enterprises LLC                   

dba O'Reilly Auto 

Parts

Poppe Automotive 

Warehouse

Westway Ford

6100007380 AJ 6411 San Pedro 4737 Broom Street 6374 Rittiman Rd 9207 San Pedro Ave 233 S. Patterson 716 S. Frio Street 801 W. Airport Frwy

Item

                                                                                                       

Description

Estimated 

Annual 

Quantity

San Antonio,                                  

TX 78216                                          

San Antonio,                                  

TX 78217                                           

San Antonio, 

TX 78218

San Antonio, 

TX 78216

Springfield, 

MO 65802

San Antonio, 

TX 78207

Irving, 

TX 75062

3 Manufacturer: Motorcraft/Ford 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Part Number:  YH140794

Manufacturer Offered: Auto Extra Napa Brake Drums Brake Best Bendix

Part number offered: AX 80113 440-1811 9760DGS PDR0794

Net Price $28.92 $16.80 $17.49 $26.77

Extended Price $86.76 $50.40 $52.47 $80.31

Prompt Payment Discount 0% 2% 2% 2% 2%

Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $86.76 $0.00 $49.39 $51.42 $78.70

4 Manufacturer: AC Delco/GM 3 No Bid

Part Number:  15230627

Manufacturer Offered: Auto Extra AC Delco OEM Napa Brake Drums Brake Best Bendix

Part number offered: AX 80120 177-0943 440-1820 9769DGS PDR0798

Net Price $34.65 $68.00 $35.70 $46.19 $29.03 $71.64

Extended Price $103.95 $204.00 $107.10 $138.57 $87.09 $214.92

Prompt Payment Discount 0% 2% 2% 2% 2% 0%

Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $103.95 $199.92 $104.96 $135.80 $85.35 $214.92

9 Brake Hardware Kits

A Percent of discount offered 35%

Centric 60%; 

Motorcraft 45%; 

Mopar 35% 35% Cost +8% 41% or better 40% 40%

B Catalog/List Title and/or Number Computer Printout Napa Brakes FPS-3642 N/A online DOR-7380 FPS-3642

C

Price schedule column on which discount is based 

(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.) List Price Jobber Cost list Jobber List

D Date of Price Schedule 4/1/2016 4/2016 4-1-16 N/A online 4/16/16 4-9-16

E Warranty 24/24 12 months

2 year/unlimited 

mileage

1 year limited 

warranty 2  yr 2 year unlimited

B Specified Items -Brake Hardware Kits

1 Manufacturer: Motorcraft/Ford 6

Part Number:  3W1Z2A225AA

Manufacturer Offered: Beck Arnley Centric Napa Brake Best Dorman Ford

Part number offered: 084-1835 118.61038 2985 3W1Z2A225AA H7302 HW7302 3W1Z-2A225AA

Net Price $19.22 $15.12 $9.48 $18.89 $12.63 $11.83 $18.36

Extended Price $115.32 $90.72 $56.88 $113.34 $75.78 $70.98 $110.16

Prompt Payment Discount 0% 2% 2% 0% 2% 2% 0%

Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $115.32 $88.91 $55.74 $113.34 $74.26 $69.56 $110.16

2 Manufacturer: Raybesto 3 No Bid No Bid

Part Number:  H5092

Manufacturer Offered: Dorman AC Delco Napa Brake Best Dorman

Part number offered: HW 5768 18K2105X 83600 H5092 HW5072

Net Price $22.25 $25.98 $14.00 $9.59 $5.58

Extended Price $66.75 $77.94 $42.00 $28.77 $16.74

Prompt Payment Discount 0% 2% 2% 2% 2%

Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $66.75 $76.38 $41.16 $28.19 $16.41

3 Manufacturer: Brakebest 3 No Bid No Bid

Part Number:  14197

Manufacturer Offered: Centric Napa Brake Best Dorman

Part number offered: 117.67016 83682 14197 HW14197

Net Price $20.19 $7.16 $6.71 $10.53 $7.86

Extended Price $60.57 $21.48 $20.13 $31.59 $23.58

Prompt Payment Discount 0% 2% 2% 2% 2%

Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $60.57 $21.05 $19.73 $30.96 $23.11
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 2, 2016

For: Auto Light Duty Trucks Drums & Brake Parts Carlisle Auto Air Full Service Auto 

Parts

Genuine Parts 

Company

North Park Lincoln O'Reilly Automotive 

Enterprises LLC                   

dba O'Reilly Auto 

Parts

Poppe Automotive 

Warehouse

Westway Ford

6100007380 AJ 6411 San Pedro 4737 Broom Street 6374 Rittiman Rd 9207 San Pedro Ave 233 S. Patterson 716 S. Frio Street 801 W. Airport Frwy

Item

                                                                                                       

Description

Estimated 

Annual 

Quantity

San Antonio,                                  

TX 78216                                          

San Antonio,                                  

TX 78217                                           

San Antonio, 

TX 78218

San Antonio, 

TX 78216

Springfield, 

MO 65802

San Antonio, 

TX 78207

Irving, 

TX 75062

4 Manufacturer: Brakebest 3 No Bid No Bid

Part Number:  16108

Manufacturer Offered: AC Delco Napa Brake Best Dorman

Part number offered: 18K1747X 83417 16108 HW16173

Net Price $13.06 $9.72 $5.60 $9.54 $4.14

Extended Price $39.18 $29.16 $16.80 $28.62 $12.42

Prompt Payment Discount 0% 2% 2% 2% 2%

Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $39.18 $28.58 $16.46 $28.05 $12.17

10 Brake Boosters

A Percent of discount offered 35%

AC Delco 50%;    A1 

Cardone 60% 30% Cost +8% 41% or better 40% 35%

B Catalog/List Title and/or Number Computer Printout

Napa Brakes 

(Cardone) FPS-3642 N/A online AA1-7380 FPS3642/turboii.com

C

Price schedule column on which discount is based 

(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.) List Price Jobber Cost list Jobber List

D Date of Price Schedule 4/1/2016 4/2016 4-1-16 N/A online 4/1/16 4-1-16

E Warranty 24/24 Limited Lifetime

2 year/unlimited 

mileage

 limited lifetime 

warranty 2 yr 2 year unlimited

B Specified Items -Brake Boosters

1 Manufacturer: A-1 Cardone 3 No Bid

Part Number:  5471910

Manufacturer Offered: Cardone A1 A-1 Cardone Napa (Cardone) Brake Best A1 Cordone

Part number offered: 54-71910 54-71910 54-71910 54-71910 54-71910

Net Price $111.35 $60.07 $51.09 $48.89 $51.25 $66.36

Extended Price $334.05 $180.21 $153.27 $146.67 $153.75 $199.08

Prompt Payment Discount 0% 2% 2% 2% 2% 0%

Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $334.05 $176.61 $150.20 $143.74 $150.68 $199.08

2 Manufacturer: AC Delco/GM 3 No Bid No Bid

Part Number:  19209324

Manufacturer Offered: Cardone A1 AC Delco Napa (Cardone) A1 Cordone Delco

Part number offered: 54-74829 178-0795 54-74829 54-74829 19209324

Net Price $182.24 $126.52 $107.29 $96.25 $131.80

Extended Price $546.72 $379.56 $321.87 $288.75 $395.40

Prompt Payment Discount 0% 2% 2% 2% 0%

Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $546.72 $371.97 $315.43 $282.98 $395.40

3 Manufacturer: Motorcraft/Ford 2 No Bid No Bid

Part Number:  5F1Z2005A

Manufacturer Offered: Cardone A1 Motorcraft Napa (Cardone) Brake Best A1 Cordone

Part number offered: 54-74300 BRB9 54-74300 54-74300 54-74300

Net Price $123.99 $157.04 $38.63 $47.98 $38.75

Extended Price $247.98 $314.08 $77.26 $95.96 $77.50

Prompt Payment Discount 0% 2% 2% 2% 2%

Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $247.98 $307.80 $75.71 $94.04 $75.95

4 Manufacturer: Motorcraft/Ford 3

Part Number:  BC3Z2005A

Manufacturer Offered: Cardone A1 A-1 Cardone Napa (Cardone) Brake Best A1 Cordone

Part number offered: 52-7410 52-7410 52-7410 BC3Z2005A 52-7410 52-7410

Net Price $240.18 $166.29 $148.48 $398.73 $144.33 $141.88 $387.65

Extended Price $720.54 $498.87 $445.44 $1,196.19 $432.99 $425.64 $1,162.95

Prompt Payment Discount 0% 2% 2% 0% 2% 2% 0%

Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $720.54 $488.89 $436.53 $1,196.19 $424.33 $417.13 $1,162.95
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 2, 2016

For: Auto Light Duty Trucks Drums & Brake Parts Carlisle Auto Air Full Service Auto 

Parts

Genuine Parts 

Company

North Park Lincoln O'Reilly Automotive 

Enterprises LLC                   

dba O'Reilly Auto 

Parts

Poppe Automotive 

Warehouse

Westway Ford

6100007380 AJ 6411 San Pedro 4737 Broom Street 6374 Rittiman Rd 9207 San Pedro Ave 233 S. Patterson 716 S. Frio Street 801 W. Airport Frwy

Item

                                                                                                       

Description

Estimated 

Annual 

Quantity

San Antonio,                                  

TX 78216                                          

San Antonio,                                  

TX 78217                                           

San Antonio, 

TX 78218

San Antonio, 

TX 78216

Springfield, 

MO 65802

San Antonio, 

TX 78207

Irving, 

TX 75062

11 Delivery & Service

A

Specified items listed in this bid must be delivered 

one (1) day after receipt of order, any other related 

items must be delivered within three (3) working 

days.  Please indicate if you can comply with lead 

times stated. Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Payment Terms Net 30 2% 10 Days 2% 10 Days Net 30 2% 10 Days 2% 10 Days Net 30
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