
City of San Antonio
Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: March 30, 2016 Metro Fire Apparatus 
Specialists

Frazer Ltd. Siddons Martin 
Emergency Group, LLC

For: 17350 SH 249 7227 Rampart Street, 
Building A

5511 Binz Engleman Rd.

6100007128 SC

Item Description Est. Annual 
Quantity

Houston,                             
TX 77064

Houston,                             
TX 77081

Kirby,                                  
TX 78219

1 Emergency Parts

1A. E-One Fire Truck Parts No Bid No Bid No Bid

Percent of Discount Offered

Product  Identification

Type of price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.)

Price schedule number

Date of price schedule

Price schedule column on which discount is based (ie: 
distributor, net, wholesale, etc)

E-One Specified Parts

Cyclone Floor Comp Latch 10

Unit Price

Discount

COSA Net Price

Dash control Module 10

Unit Price

Discount

COSA Net Price

Module Jack 10

Unit Price

Discount

COSA Net Price

Gauge - Fuel Level 10

Unit Price

Discount

COSA Net Price

Exterior Chrome Door Handle 40

Unit Price

Discount

COSA Net Price

1B. Ferrara Fire Truck Parts No Bid No Bid No Bid

Percent of Discount Offered

Product  Identification

Type of price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.)
Price schedule number

Date of price schedule

distributor, net, wholesale, etc)

Ferrara Specified Parts

Outer Headlight Bezel 10

Unit Price

Discount

COSA Net Price

Inner Headlight Bezel 10

Unit Price

Discount

COSA Net Price

Speedometer Gauge 15

Unit Price

Discount

COSA Net Price

Master Switch 10

Unit Price

Discount

COSA Net Price

Cab Tilt Control Box 10

Unit Price

Discount

COSA Net Price

1C. Pierce Fire Truck Parts No Bid No Bid

Percent of Discount Offered Cost * $1.88

Product  Identification N/A

Type of price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) N/A

Price schedule number N/A

Date of price schedule N/A

distributor, net, wholesale, etc)

SAFD-Annual Contract for Emergency Vehicle Parts & Service
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Houston,                             
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Houston,                             
TX 77081
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SAFD-Annual Contract for Emergency Vehicle Parts & Service

Pierce Specified Parts

A/C Evaporator Drain 12

Unit Price

Discount

COSA Net Price

Module – Input/Output 10

Unit Price

Discount

COSA Net Price

Module - Power 17

Unit Price

Discount

COSA Net Price

Turn Signal Switch 10

Unit Price

Discount

COSA Net Price

Speed lay Netting 12

Unit Price

Discount

COSA Net Price

1D. Spartan Fire Truck Parts

Percent of Discount Offered COST + 22% No Bid No Bid

Product  Identification Spartan Parts

Type of price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) N/A

Price schedule number N/A

Date of price schedule N/A

distributor, net, wholesale, etc)

Spartan Specified Parts

Right Hand Rear Door Panel 10

Unit Price $311.49

Discount COST + 22%

COSA Net Price $380.02

Extended Price $3,800.20

Left Hand Rear Door Panel 10

Unit Price $505.02

Discount COST + 22%

COSA Net Price $616.12

Extended Price $6,161.20

Window Channel 10

Unit Price Not Found

Discount

COSA Net Price

Door Strap 20

Unit Price $55.54

Discount COST + 22%
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Houston,                             
TX 77064

Houston,                             
TX 77081

Kirby,                                  
TX 78219

SAFD-Annual Contract for Emergency Vehicle Parts & Service

COSA Net Price $67.76

Extended Price $1,355.20

Stanchion Light 15

Unit Price Not Found

Discount

COSA Net Price

1E. Frazer Ambulance Parts No Bid No Bid

Percent of Discount Offered 3%

Product  Identification Frazer Item/Part Number

Type of price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) OEM

Price schedule number 2016-01

Date of price schedule 3/30/2016

distributor, net, wholesale, etc) SAFD Pricing

Frazer Specified Parts

12” Air Horn 12

Unit Price $203.25

Discount 3%

COSA Net Price $197.15

Extended Price $2,365.80

Air Compressor Suspension 15

Unit Price $890.81

Discount 3%

COSA Net Price $864.09

Extended Price $12,961.35

Compressor for Horn 15

Unit Price $1,106.00

Discount 3%

COSA Net Price $1,072.82

Extended Price $16,092.30

Step Motor 150

Unit Price $66.57

Discount 3%

COSA Net Price $64.57

Extended Price $9,685.50

Rubber Bumper Mounts 15

Unit Price $5.33

Discount 3%

COSA Net Price $5.17

Extended Price $77.55

Item 2 Labor

2A. E-One Fire Truck Service No Bid No Bid

Labor Rate per Hour $111.50

2B. Ferrara Fire Truck Service No Bid No Bid

Labor Rate per Hour $111.50

2C. Pierce Fire Truck Service No Bid No Bid

Labor Rate per Hour $111.50

2D. Spartan Fire Truck Service No Bid

Labor Rate per Hour $125.00 $111.50

2E. Frazer Ambulance Service No Bid

Labor Rate per Hour $90.00 $111.50

Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
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