City of San Antonlo Draft Bid Tabulation

Openead: November 30, 2015
For: Landscaping Equipment
Ag-Pro Ewald Kubota Tractor H & V Equlpment Services, In¢. Holt Texas Ltd. dba Holt Cat
£100006833 DS |3030 N. Austin 1000 W, IH-10 3307 S.E. Loop 410 3302 8. WW White Rd.
Saquin, Seguin, San Antonio, San-Antonio,
ITEM DESCRIPTION Qty |TX 78158 TX 78155 TX 78222 TX 78220
1 Ground Mower Altachments 2]
Price Each: $4,580.00 No Bid $4,541.72 No Bld
Total Price: $36,400.00 $36,333.76
Year, Make & Model Cfferech: New, 2018, Modern AG Prodouts
LTD. 7' Predator WH Front Chair
2016 Modemn 7' Supar Predator
Equigmment Warranty: 1 yaar/5 year on Gearbox/10 year 5 year limited warranty on gear
rust through deck| box/10 vear limited on Deck Rust
Thrit
Watranty Service Provider Name: Ag-Pro Modern AG Products LTD & H&V
Warranty Facilty Address: 3030 N, Austin . H&VY Equipment Sarvices, Inc.
Sequin, TX 78156 3307 S.E. Loop 410, San Antonic,
Texas 78222
Production Cut-Off-Date: 3/1/2018|
Last day can place orders withou! missing
wroductlon cut-oft date: 3/1/2018
Delivery: 180 days 60 days or less:
2 84" Mower Dack 1
Price Each: Na Bld $2,589.00 $4,798.72 No Bid
Total Price: $3,580.00 $4,708.72
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2015 Landpride RCR 1884| New, 2016, Madern AG products
LTD, 7 Predator W/H Front &
. Rear Chain
Equlpment Waranty: - 24 Months or 2,000 hrs 5 year Imited warranty on gear;
box/ 10 year limited on deck rust
thru
Warranty Service Provider Mame: Ewald Kubota Tractor| Modern AG Products LTD, & H&V
Equiprhant, Inc.
Warranly Facility Addrass: 1800 W. 110G Sequin, TX H & V Equipment Services Inc.
78155 3307 S.E. Loop 410,
San Antenle, TX 78222
Production Cut-Qff-Date: Nona Planned 3172016
Last day can plage orders without missing
production cut-off date: 12{31/2018 31172016
Can Bidder provide bld ltems, at the bid prica No
after praduction cut off date?
Dalivery: 80 days 80 days orless
3 Ground Aerator 1
Price Each: No Bid Mo Bid Ne Bid
Tetal Prica:
Year, Make 8 Modal Offered:
Engine Offered:

Equipment Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Name:
Warranty Facllity Address:

Production Cut-Off-Date:

Last day can place orders without missing
production cut-off date;

Dsilivary:

Preparad by Purchasing
12/8/2015

Page 1



City of San Antonlo Draft Bid Tabkulatlon

Openad: November 30, 2015
For: Landscaping Equipment
Ag-Pro Ewald Kubota Tractor H & V Equipment Services, Inc. Holt Texas Ltd, dba Holt Cat
6100006833 DS 3030 N. Austin 1900 W. IH-10 3307 S.E.Loop 410 3302 5. WW White Rd.
Sequin, Seguin, San Antonio, San Antonlo,
ITEM DESCRIPTION Qty TX 78165 X 78158 TX 78222 TX 78220
4 4X4 Utllity Tractors 7
Price Each: - §75417.67 $51,351.00 No Bid $78,500.00
Tetal Price: $627,023.69 . $358,457.00 $649,500.00
Year, Make & Modal Offered: 2016 John Deere 81100M| 2015/2016 Kubota Model M5-111 2016 Chaltenger MT4550
HDC12
Engine Offered: 4,50 John Deere Power Tech PSS Kubeta Diesal V 3800 AGCO Power 49AW 4,90
Equipment Warranty: 2 years or 2000 Hours 2 Yrf 2,000 Hours whichever 2 year; 2000 hour Total Machine
aecurs first
Warranty Service Provider Name: Ag-Pro - Seguin Ewald Kubota Tractor| ABCO Gorp via Holt Cat
3030 N. Austin, Seguin, TX 76155,
Warranty Facility Address: Ag-Pro = Seguln| 1900 1-10 3302 §, WW White Rd.
3030 N. Austin, Seguin, TX 78156 W. Seguin, TX 781565 San Antonlo, TX 78222
Production Cut-Off-Date: None Planned 12/31/2015
Last day can place orders without missing
production cut-off date: 12{24/2015 12/31/2015 12/31/2015
Can Bldder provide bid ltems, at the bid price
after production cul off date? ) Yes No
Dellvery: 180 days 80 days 140 days
& 15' Batwing Mower Deck )
Price Each: $15,382.07 $11,967.00 $15,728.27 $18,600.00
Total Price: $76,810.35 $50,836.00 $78,841.35 $92,600.00
Year, Make & Mode! Offered: 2015 John Desre HX15 2015/2016 Landpride RC 4015| 2016, Modem AG Products LTD.,; 2015, Woods MFG BW180XHD
15' Raptor;
Equipment Warranty: 1 year/5 year on Gear Box| 4 yr 1 year imited comprehensive
: 5 years limlted warranty on gear| warranty + & year limited gear box
boxes, 10 year limifec on Deck warranty + 10 year deck rust
Rust Thru through wairantly {Shredder)
Warranly Service Provider Name! Modern AG Products LTD &
H & V Equipment Services Inc,
Ag-Pro’- Sequin Ewald Kubeta Tractor| {as servicing dealer) Woods Mfg. via Holt Catl
H & V Equipment services, Ing.
3030 N. Austin Seguin, 1900 1-10 W, 3307, S.E. Loop 410, 3307 S, WW White Rd.
TX 78155 Sequin, Texas 78155 San Antonie, TX 78222 San Antonlo, TX 78222
Produgtion Cut-Otf-Date: None Planned 3172016 January ist, 2016,
Last day can place orders without missing
production cut-off date: 12/24/2015 12131/2015 31172016 December 31st, 2015
Can Bidder provide bld items, at the bid prics :
after production cut off date? Yes No No
Dellvery; 180 days: 60 davs B0 days or less! 80 davs
] tdulcher Attachment for Skidd Steer 1 .
Price Each: No Bld $27,751.00 No Bid No Bid
Total Price: $27,751.00
Year, Make & Modal Offared: 2015 Bradco MME0S
Equipment Warranty: 1 year
Warranty Service Providar Name: Ewald Kubota Tractor
Warranty Facliity Address: 1600 -10W, Sequin,
TX 78185
Production Cut-Cff-Date: Nene Planned
Last day can place orders without missing
praduction cut-off date: 1213112015
4 Can Biddar provide bid itams, at the bid price )
after praduction cut off date? . Yes|
Delivery: 80 days
Prepared by Purchasing
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QOpened:

For:

6100006833

November 30, 2015

Landscaping Equipment

DS

Clty of San Antonie Draft Bid Tabulation

ITEM

DESCRIPTION

Qty

Ag-Pro

3030 N. Austin

Sequin,
TX 78155

Ewald Kubota Tractor

1900 W. iH-10

Seguin,
TX 78155

H & V Equipment Services, Ing.

3307 S.E. Loop 410

San Antenio,
TX 78222

Halt Texas Ltd. dba Holt Cat

3302 5. WW White Rd.

San Antonio,
TX 78220

3-Wheeled Infieid Maintenance Tracior
Prce Each:

Total Price:

Year, Make & Mode| Offered:
Eauinment Warranty:

Warranty Service Providar Name:

Warranly Faclilty Address:

Production Cut-Off-Date:

Last day can place orders without missing
productlon cut-off date:

Payment Tarms:

No Bid

Net 30

Ne Bid

Net 30

Ne Bid

Net 30

No Bid

Net 30
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