City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

‘|[Opened; tday 22, 2015
For: Type 170E Gomrolier Gabinat Agsembfles & Equipmeni.
Brown Traffic Products, Inc. McCaln Ing. Paracigm Traffc Systems, Inc. |Peek Tratlic Corporatian Trafficware Group, InG. Texas Highway Producls
5100005858 bs 109 W, 55th Streal 2365 Oak Rlage Way 2201 E. Diviston St. 5401 M. Sam Houstor: Plwy {522 Gillingham 1309 Claek
B E’ imaied ' . ' .
I Description Annual  {Davenpor, - Vista, Arllnglon, Houston, Sugariand, Reund Rock,
Quantity ||A 52808 Ca 92081 TX 76011 TX 77086 TX 77478 TX, 78681
1 Tyoe 332 Cabinet 40
Brand and Macel: Eafle 33254 MgCain 332 M30154 Salatran 332 Pagk 332 Traffleware P.332-CF-ALUM Henka Epterprises 332
Prige per liem $5,000.00 ,250.001 $6,344.00 $4,999.00 $6,605.00 . BB7BEO00
Extended Price $200,000.00 $210,000 00 $253,760.00 §199,560.00, $267.800.00[ $350,000.00
2 [Type 336 Cabingt 1 . ' : _
Brand and Model: . Eagle 3358A McGaln 336 M2gi7e| Safatran 33§ Peak 338| Trafficwara P.336-GF-ALUM-01]’ Herika Enterprises 336
Price per Hem &4,500.00 $4,40260] " $5,187.00 %4,089.00 $6,342.00 £8.400.00
Extendad Prica $180,000.00 $176,080.00 $207,480.00 $163,960.00 $253,680.00 $336,000.00
3 Load Switches 100 ; ‘ ]
Brand and Model POC $55-88| G01 Model 20 PBC Madel 200 Feek PDC S55-88 ED-200
Prige per ftesm $22.00 $16.50 §17.00 $25.00 $20.00 £18.00
Extanded Price $2,200.00 $1,650.00] $1,700.00 $2,500.00 $2,000.00 $1,800.00
4 EDGO Strge Protector #P0 642C-0200,
of approved equal 50
Brand and Modeh EDGO PLE42C-020D EDCO 642C-0200 EDCO PC 542C-0200 . Hegeo HE1750 ERCO PO 642C-020D
Price per ltem 2400 ©$32.00 $35,00 Mo Bid £102.50: $45.00
Extended Price $1,200.00 $1,600.00 $1,750.00 §5,125.00 $2.260.00
5 Controllar Cabinet Fan, Axal, Safetren
0721810210, or approved equal 160 . .
Globe Metoss Ad7-815A-15T3- . .
Brand and Modek 000 Fan 113vaL 100CFU Safetran 072180210 . Trafficware P.332-1161 Henke Enferprises
Price per Hem $1c.0e $8.50/ $9.00 No‘Bld 519.00 $16.50
Extended Price $1,000,00] $850.00 $900.001 ’ 51.800.60 $1,650.00
6 Flasher Unfi, GDI 204, o approved equal 50
Brand and Modgel PRC 55788, GDE 204 POC Mods! 204 FDC S5F-84 EDI-204
Price per ltem $2200 3860 $12.00] Mo Bid $20.00 $18.00
Extanded Price $1,100.00 382500 $850.00 $1,000.00 $600.00
7 DG lsolators GDI 242, or appmved equet 50 ' .
Brand and Model: - PDC Moxdei 242 G0 RIM2A2 PDC Mook 242 PG Modal 242 EDH42
Price par Ham $25.00 $24.50 - 26,00 We Bict $30.00 $33.00
Extended Frica $1,250.00 $1,225.00 $1,360.00 i $1,500.00 $1,650.00
8 Basa for DGO Isolator4PC BIRAWKEY, ar
approved egual 100
Brand arx] Mode!: EDGO PGBIBIVKEY EDCORIB EDCO#PC BIBIWKEY] HESGO HE 1750-BASE EDCQ BIBwkay,
Brics per Tiem $9:00 §11.50 $20.00 ‘No Bid ~ $26.00 $12.00
[Exfencied Price $900.00 §1,150,00] $2,000.00} $2.500,00 $1,200.00
e EDGO #CXE5-BNCYL, or approved squal 50
. . ERCO CX08-A1 replansd CXO5|
Erand and Model: EDGO GXOG-M! EDCO CX-08-1) . BNGYL
Frice per fem $43.00 No Bid §64.00 Mo Bl Ne Bld 57,00
Extenadet! Prica $2,150.00 $3,2066.00 $2,856.00
10 EDCO #CX06-M, or approved equal 50 .
Brand and Modek: ERGO CXO6-M EDCQ CXOGH EDCQ.CX0E-M; EDCO CXQ6-M
Fricexper tem $30.00 $42.80 $59.00 No Bid No Bid 354.00
Exlended Price $1,506.001 $2,525.00 $2,750.00 $2,700.00
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City of San Antondo Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 22, 2018
For Type 170E Confmller Gabinet Assombties & Equipment K
!_émWn Traiflc Prociects, Ing. MecCain ne. Paracigtn Trafflc Systems, I, |Peek Trafic Comporatian Trafficwars Group, Inc. | Texas Highway Products
&1G0005858 - DS 109 W 55th Sireet 2365 Qak Ridga Way 2201 E. Division St 5401 N. Sam Houston Pkwy 1522 Gilingham 1399 Clark
V.
Estimated
Item Descriptien Annual Davenport, Vista, Arlinglon, Houston, Sugarland, Raund Rock,
Quantity [IA 52806 GA $2081 TX 76011 TR 77088 TXTI4T8 TX, 78681
" P Base Adapler, lo 332 Cabinet Foundation,
AQICT11BEPIDM, or approved equal 10 . -
R Henke Enterprises 87 Adapler|
Brang grd Modal: Eagle AQCT1186P004 McCain M6028BH Safetran (838500332-00}F Traffloware 12" P'to 332 Base
Price per ltem $215.00] $208.00 $235.00 No Bidt 380,00, $950.00
Extended Price $2,150.60 $2,080.00 $2,350.00 $3,500.001 $9,500.00
12 AC [solators, Model 252 or Approved aqual 100
Brand #nd Motel: EDC AC! 88-252 PDC AGT-88 POC Model 252 PRC Mode! 252 PDC-ACT-80-252
Price per tem $30.00 $26.50 $31.00 Mo BigH $35.00 $33.00
Exlendad Price $3.000.00 $2,650.00 $3,100.00 $3,500.00 $3,300.00
13 Econolita 2070-4 ¥ME 10 AMP Powar Supply
PR 3510061 or approved equal 30
Intefight INT-YCT-4APS-2070-
Brand and Mook Slamens 2070-4 McCalr 2070-4A Econellte 35190G1| Trafflcware 2070-4A 4A Modise
Price par 1B 5275.00 $450.60 $322.00 No Bl $320.00 4397.00
Exiended Prica $6,250.00 $13,500.00 $9,660.00 $9,600.00 511,290.00
14 Class-ltern 550-81, Type 2070-10 CPU ’
Modire Board {Fully compliant with ATC
Standard versior 5.2b, w/ §4 MB of RAM and
84 ME of Aash memory) 1,000
. Econofite Exception 32MB Flash ineghd INT-YCT-1CTX-CP4|
Brand and Modal: Siamens 20701C MeCain 2070-ATC N Memory| * Peek Trafficware 51232-2100(1c) 2070-1C CPU Module
Price per ltef $530.00 $700.00 $480.00|. $875.00 $822.00 $535.00
Extended Price $630,000.00 $700,060.00 $480,000.00 $875,000.00 $822,000.0¢ §535,000.00
15 .
151 year anly - Pelco Products {No Exceptions)
Proprietary Cly of San Antenio Laok 3,900 . .
. Peledr SM-1026-0K-SPXX0C Pelco SM-T026-0K-SPXO0X-
Brand and Model: Peico SM-1026-SK-BRS-SA Pelco SM-1026 8RS . Pelco SN-1026-0K] BRS
Pidce par hem $35.00 $34.50 §35.25 Mo Bl $47.0¢ $38.17
iExtended Price $136,500.00 $134,550.00 $137 475,00 $183,300.00 $142.863.00
158 Aftar 15t year only, Peloo Products (No
exceplions) Propriztary Gty of San Antonio s
Lock 05 . .
i Peico SM-0188-2-SPX000- Palco 5M-1028-OK-8P XU -
Brand and Modeh Palco SM-1026-5K-BRS-5A Peloo SM-1026 BRS Pelo SM-1026-0K] BRS)
Price: per e $50.00 $38.00 $36.00 No Bid $44.50 $40,40
Extended Price $1,250.00 $900.00 906,00 $1,212.50 $1,010.60
18 18t year only additions] keys for Peleo
Products (No Exceptions) Propriztary City of
San Antonla Lock 00
- Palco SM-1026-03¢-SPXI0N- Pefco SivHI98-2-8PX0KK.
Brand and Model: Peice 5M-0198-2-CRM-5A Pelco SM-0138 BRE Peloo 5M-1088-2
Prive par Hem $20.00 $4.80 $4.75 Neo Bld $6.45 $5.25
* {Exiended Price $2,600.00 $480.00 §475.00 364500 $525,00
16a |After 4st yearonly, Addlienal Keys for Pelco
Products {No Exceptions) Proprietary City of
San Antonic Lock 25 ]
Pelon SM-0198-2-8PKKXX- Pelog SM-0198-2-5FX0XX-
Brand snd Modek Pgleo Si-0198-CRM-SA| Pelco SM-0198]- BRS| Pelco SM-0198-2 BRS|
Prigs per lem ? 4$20.00 $5.00 3800 Mo Bid $6.80 $5.50
Extanded Frice 350000 $126.00 $125.90 $170,00 $137.50
Defivery 45 days 45 days 45 days 45 days 45 days 45 days:
Payment Tesms Met 30 Net 30 Nat 30 et 30 Net 30 Met 30,
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