
City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 18, 2014

For: Video Imaging Vehicle Detection System

AJ

Item Description

Estimated 

Annual 

Quantity

1 Processor, One (1) Channel 34

Supplier Part Number 7250-117 90-180-05

Manufacturer Flir/Traficon Peek

Manufacturer Part Number 10-4370 90-180-05

Unit Price: $1,450.00 $1,400.00

Extended Price: $49,300.00 $47,600.00

2 Processor, Two (2) Channel 166

Supplier Part Number 7250-113 90-180-06

Manufacturer Flir/Traficon Peek

Manufacturer Part Number 10-4320 90-180-06

Unit Price: $2,150.00 $2,290.00

Extended Price: $356,900.00 $380,140.00

3 Camera with Hardware 203

Supplier Part Number 2050-102MI 82-1773

Manufacturer Control Technologies Peek

Manufacturer Part Number 2050-102 MI 82-1773

Unit Price: $900.00 $999.00

Extended Price: $182,700.00 $202,797.00

4 Remote Access Module 29

Supplier Part Number 7250-210

Manufacturer Flir/Traficon

Manufacturer Part Number 10-4545

Unit Price: $2,000.00 No Bid

Extended Price: $58,000.00

5 Keypad, Field Set Up 6

Supplier Part Number 7250-50T

Manufacturer Flir/Traficon

Manufacturer Part Number 10-0023

Unit Price: $170.00 No Bid

Extended Price: $1,020.00

6 Five (5) Coax Cable 1,000' feet 140

Supplier Part Number WIRE-VC-RG 18/6 991-63SFE

Manufacturer ISOTEC Advanced Digital Cable

Manufacturer Part Number Cable VC RG 18/6 991-63SFE

Unit Price: $700.00 $770.00

Extended Price: $98,000.00 $107,800.00

7 Video Connector 1,000

Supplier Part Number CON-BNC-CP882 2K71-0024

Manufacturer Ampernohol or equal Peek

Manufacturer Part Number BNC-CP882 2K71-0024

Unit Price: $2.00 $4.00

Extended Price: $2,000.00 $4,000.00

8 Video Camera Cable 204

Supplier Part Number CON-BNC-PE9908 81-1080-006

Manufacturer Control Technologies Peek

Manufacturer Part Number CON-BNC-PE9908 81-1081-006

Unit Price: $5.00 $110.00

Extended Price: $1,020.00 $22,440.00

9 Video Camera Suppression 203

Supplier Part Number SUR-VI-CCTV-SP-NI 81-1073

Manufacturer EDCO or Equal Peek

Manufacturer Part Number CX06MI-BNC 81-1073

Unit Price: $70.00 $90.00

Extended Price: $14,210.00 $18,270.00

6100004370 Control Technologies, Inc     

702 South Persimmon St. 1B    

Tomball, TX   77375

Wildcat Electric Supply, Inc   

5535 Harvey Wilson    

Houston, TX   77020
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10 Repair of Camera or Processor 10

Supplier Part Number RMA-REPAIR

Manufacturer Control Technologies

Manufacturer Part Number RMA-REPAIR

Unit Price: $500.00 No Bid

Extended Price: $5,000.00

11 Processor, Two (2) Channel 155

Supplier Part Number 7250-113 90-180-06

Manufacturer Flir/Traficon Peek

Manufacturer Part Number 1043-20 90-180-06

Unit Price: $2,150.00 $2,290.00

Extended Price: $333,250.00 $354,950.00

12 Vehicle Video Camera Assembly 179

Supplier Part Number 2050-102MI 82-1773

Manufacturer Control Technologies, Inc Peek

Manufacturer Part Number 2050-102MI 82-1773

Unit Price: $900.00 $999.00

Extended Price: $161,100.00 $178,821.00

13 Video Monitor 21

Supplier Part Number 2M20-0046

Manufacturer Peek

Manufacturer Part Number 2M20-0046

Unit Price:  No Bid $230.00

Extended Price: $4,830.00

14 Connector Kit 130

Supplier Part Number 2K71-0024

Manufacturer Peek

Manufacturer Part Number 2K71-0024

Unit Price: No Bid $4.00

Extended Price: $520.00

15 Suppression Panel 39

Supplier Part Number 2285-104C 82-1661-05

Manufacturer Control Technologies Peek

Manufacturer Part Number 2285-104C 82-1661-05

Unit Price: $215.00 $550.00

Extended Price: $8,385.00 $21,450.00

16 Repair of Camera or Processor 155

Supplier Part Number 

Manufacturer

Manufacturer Part Number

Unit Price: No Bid No Bid

Extended Price:

Delivery 30 calendar days 60 calendar days

Payment Terms 2% 10 days Net 30
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